Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 17 September 2019 5:30 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKD 5849 J & XD 4626 M on 05/09/2019 [External
Confidential]

Attachments: 17092019172738.pdf

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Shu Pei,

Attached copy of insured’s report for your attention

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all TN |[onpac.com.sg

Experience It Mow

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 17 September, 2019 5:15 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKD 5849 J & XD 4626 M on 05/09/2019 [External Confidential]
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle SKD 5849] at M/s Focus Auto Pte Ltd on a WP basis and TP repairer proposed for a
direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP’s GIA report

Please be informed that estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice is not ready yet.

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
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Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 13 September 2019 9:47 AM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN' <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKD 5849 J & XD 4626 M on 05/09/2019 [External Confidential]

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com]

Sent: Thursday, 12 September 2019 3:14 PM

To: assignments@lkkauto.com; LKK <lkk@|kkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: FW: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKD 5849 J & XD 4626 M on 05/09/2019 [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Our Ref : 19/19/19/VC10/022347

Dear Nivitha,

Kindly proceed as requested.

Best Regards
Gerald Poh



Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: claims@focusauto.com.sg [mailto:claims@focusauto.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 12 September, 2019 2:20 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: Re: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKD 5849 J & XD 4626 M on 05/09/2019 [External General]

good day gerald

kindly arrange marcus toward the survey
regards

lau LC

On 2019-09-12 13:39, GERALD POH WEE BIN wrote:

Lonpac External - General

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our Ref : 19/19/19/VvC10/022347

Dear Lau,

Our list of Motor surveyors are appended below :-

| 1| Sharan Bin Sharif




Jackson Quek

Paul Thanapal

Aw Po Huat (Andrew)
Nicholas Tey

Mohd Taufik

Bryan Ang

Marcus Chua

Steve Chen

Adrian Ling

Vo |N|[ojun|bh|WIN

[
o

Please let us hear from you within the next 2 working days

Best Regards
Gerald Poh
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555

Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.

From: claims@focusauto.com.sg [mailto:claims@focusauto.com.sq]
Sent: Thursday, 12 September, 2019 12:43 PM

To: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKD 5849 ] & XD 4626 M on 05/09/2019

Dear Officer-In-Charge,



Good day.

Please send a list of surveyor name to arrange the surveyor down our workshop regarding as
below.We are instructed by our client to notify you of a road traffic accident on 05/09/2019 at
about 1630 hours along Buroh St. into Jalan Buroh involving our client's SKD 5849 J & XD 4626
M driven by your insured or your insured's authorized driver at the material time.

As a result of the accident, our client's vehicle has been damaged. Before our client/ we proceed to
repair the damaged vehicle, please let us know within 2 working days of your receipt of this notice
whether you or your insurer would like to conduct a pre-repair survey of the vehicle. If we do not
receive any reply from you within the stipulated timeline, our client /we shall proceed to repair the
vehicle without further reference to you.

Please be informed that the said vehicle can be inspected at:
Name of workshop : FOCUS AUTO PTE LTD

Address: No.1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6
AutoBay #02-50
Singapore 417883

Telephone no. : 6886 9097
Best Regards,

Lau LC

Focus Auto Pte Ltd

No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6

#02-50 AutoBay Singapore 417883
Tel: 6886 9097 Fax: 6481 9095

Office Hours : Mon ~ Sat, 0900 ~ 1800

Focus Auto Pte Ltd

No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6

#02-50 AutoBay Singapore 417883
Tel: 6886 9097 Fax: 6481 9095

Office Hours : Mon ~ Sat, 0900 ~ 1800
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