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PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry Page 1 of |

"> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type: Company
Owner ID: 645M
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.: PC7592G
Vehicle to be Exported: No
Intended Deregistration Date: 16 Sep 2019
Vehicle Make: TOYOTA
Vehicle Model: HIACE COMMUTER GL 28 AUTO
Primary Colour: Silver
Manufacturing Year: 2018
Engine No.: 1GD8322446
Chassis No.: GDH2232000824
Maximum Power Output: -
Open Market Value: $46,988.00
Original Registration Date: 22 Nov 2018
First Registration Date: 22 Nov 2018
Transfer Count: 0
Actual ARF Paid: $2,350.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility: No
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -
PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date: 21 Nov 2028
COE Category: C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
COE Period(Years): 10
PQP Paid: $15,805.00
COE Rebate Amount: $14,509.00
Total Rebate Amount: $14,509.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 16 Sep 2019

OK

https://vrllta.gov.sg/la/vrl/action/enquireRebate ByPublicBeforeDereglnput 7FUNCTION _[D=F030...  16-Sep-19



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Motor Claim - Ill <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 12\September 2019 10:56 AM

To: Unimotor; ‘sul@lkkauto.com’; Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Cc: Zuhaidah Samsuri

Subject: RE: OUR REF: AW-INS-U7-PC7592G -19,jgv & YR REF: SHC 8481G
Dear Sir / Mdm,

Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle PC7592G and let us have your report urgently,
This claim will be handled by Ms Aida,
*Kindly upload this survey request email lo merimen.

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee

o |npia
. . IHTE RANATIONAL
InsurancE

PiINGAPFDRID
frrving (Re rrge By [0
64 Cecil Street; #05 - 10B Bullding
Singapare 049711

Tel: 6347 6100, Ext — 248

From: Unimotar [mailto:unimotorco@singnet.com.sg)
Sent: 12 September, 2019 10:07 AM

To: Motor Claim - [l emotorclaim@iil.com.sg>
Subject: RE: OUR REF: AW-IN5-U7-PC7592G -19.jgv & ¥R REF: SHC 8481G
Hi
LKK

Thank

From: Motor Claim - 1ll <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 11 September 2019 9:06 AM

To: Jennifer Guay <jenniferguay@visionlawllc.com>
Cc: 'Unimotor' <unimotorco@singnet.com.sg>
Subject: RE: OUR REF: AW-INS-U7-PC7592G -19.jgv & ¥R REF: SHC 8481G

Dear Sir / Mdm,
We acknowledge receipt of your email.

We proprose using one aof the following motor surveyers:




* LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
* \icom Assessment Centre Pte Ltd

Please notify us within 02 days of receipt of this letter for surveyor agreed on or if you have any objections to the
above list.

Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee

o InDIA
... . ]HTHNM'IDHM.
( InsurANCE
1l N C A F [+ 1 W
Nervimy tha rrgme ancw §BE

b4 Cecil Street; #05 - 108 Building
Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext - 248

From: Jennifer Guay [mailto:jenniferguay @visionlawllc.com]
Sent: 10 September, 2019 6:58 PM

To: Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim@ii.com.sg>

Cc: "Unimotor’ <unimotorco @singnel.com.sg>

Subject: OUR REF: AW-INS-U7-PC7592G -19.jgv & YR REF: SHC 8481G
Importance: High

PRE - REPAIR SURVEY

CLAIMANT: STARISLAND TRAVEL PTELTD

ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 7592 G & SHC 8481G ON 9 SEPTEMBER 2019 ALONG JALAN BESAR X SYED
ALWI ROAD

Dear Sirs

We are Instructed STARISLAND TRAVEL PTELTD by to notify you of a road accident on 9 SEPTEMER 2019 at
about 10.12hr ALONG JALAN BESAR X SYED ALWIRD involving our client's PC7592G & SHC8481G  driven
by your driver at the material time

As a result of the accident, our client's vehicle has been damage. Before our client proceed to repair the damage vehicle,
piease let us know within 2 working days of your receipt of this notice whether you or your insurer would like to conduct
a pre-repair survey of the vehicle. If we do not receive any reply from you within the stipulated timeline, our client shall
proceed to repair the vehicle without further reference to you.

Far Sureyar
Regards
Please initial here after completion of pre-repair survey
Thank you.
Jennifer Guay
(Secretary)
VISION LAW LLC Appolinted Surveyor:
133 New Bridge Road #18-01 Name &Signature
Chinatown Paint
Singapore 058413 Contact:
Tel - 6534 2811 (Ext 116)
Fax @ 65356802 Date &Time

Surveyor during repair:

Date &Time:




VISION LAW LLC

Advocates & Solicitors

(Incorporated with limited liability)

Unique Entity No. 200721148H

Head Office: 133 New Bridge Road #18-01/02 Chinatown Point, Singapore 059413
Branch: 490 Lorong 6 Toa Payoh #03-11 HDB Hub (Biz 3 Lobby 1), Singapore 310490

DISCLAIMER:

The contents of this email (including any attachments) are confidential and privileged and only intended for
the recipient(s) addressed above. If you received this email

by error, please notify the sender immediately and destroy it (and all attachments) without reading, storing
and/or disseminating any of its contents (in any form) to any

person. Email communication is not secure. Vision Law LLC is not liable for any losses arising out of any
errors or omissions in the contents resulting from email

transmission or any illegal or unauthorised usage or tampering of its email system.

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using, disclosing and
processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located both inside and
outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including the General Insurance
Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling and/or dealing with your claim,
which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable laws. If you do not agree to the same,
kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Lid.

Registration No. 198703792-K

Virus-free www avg com

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling

3



and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim. and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K



 Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 18 December 2012 5:24 PM

To: Zuhaidah Samsuri

Subject: RE: 1l REF: MCT19090214 | ACD INVL SHCB481G & PC7592G 09.09.2019 - PLEASE
UPLOAD SURVEY REPORT

Dear Aidah,

Naoted with many thanks,
Will submit WP report and close off the case at our end,
Thanks

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020

Best Regords,
Ceeilia Chong | Case Handler
LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | emall: CecilinChong @lkkauto.com! fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Puya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408033)

From: Zuhaidah Samsuri [mailto:aida@iii.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 18 December 2019 5:12 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Il REF: MCT19090214 | ACD INVL SHC8481G & PC7592G 09.09.2019 - PLEASE UPLOAD SURVEY REPORT

Hi Cecilia,
As per Stanley's emall below, we have received LOD from TP Lawyer.
50 just submit your WP survey report.

Best Regards

Alda Samsuri

Motor & Work Injury Claims ["'c}"l
India International Insurance Pte Ltd
64 Ceal Street #04/#05 10B Bullding
singapore 049711 1
Tel: 6347 6100 Ext 257 Fax. 6224 4174

Email aida@liicom 2

Lo Keg Number 198703T92K

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mallto:CeciliaChong @lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 18 December, 2019 5:09 PM
1



To: Zuhaidah Samsuri <alda@iil.com.sg>
Subject: RE: Il REF: MCT19090214 | ACD INVL SHC8481G & PC7592G 09.09.2019 - PLEASE UPLOAD SURVEY REPORT

Dear Aidah,
We are still pending for TP confirmation after informing them that the settlement is base on 50/50.
Thanks

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 20207

Best Regards,

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd

Phone; 6749-q4274 | email: CeciliaChiong @ lkkauto.com! fax: 6741-q108

Bk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S(408933)

From: Zuhaidah Samsuri [mailto:aida@iil.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 18 December 2019 4:50 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@|kkauto.com>; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

<CeclliaCho lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <adm o >

Subject: RE: Il REF: MCT19090214 | ACD INVL SHCB481G & PC7592G 09.09.2019 - PLEASE UPLOAD SURVEY REPORT

Hi Cecilia,
Please upload the survey report asap.
Thanks.

Best Regands

Alda Samsuri

Motor & Work [nfury Claims Pept
India International Insurance Ple Ltd
64 Cecil Street #04/#05 IOB Building
dingapore 049711

Tel: 6347 6100 Ext 257 Fax: 6224 4174

Ermatl: aidag®iji o9

g Number 198705792K

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-di@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 4 December, 2019 2:59 PM
To: Zuhaidah Samsuri <aida@iii.com.sg>; sur@Ikkauto.com; ‘Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)' <CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Il REF: MCT19090214 | ACD INVL SHC8481G & PC7592G 09.09.2019 - PLEASE UPLOAD SURVEY REPORT
Dear Alda,

Thank you for the email,



Mernmen e-Claims Page 1 of 1

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)
we

| CLATM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
| Tase |Notified | Est Submitted | Ad) Assgned Adj Rpt Ad| Submitted | Ins Auth'sd Status

|13 500 2018 ' s $$1,000.00 | 553,000.00 m Sor Survey
' e Ean Adj Rox | — | | v e | Cancel x|

Hain

| CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS

Insurnd ; COMFORT TRANSPORTATION FTE LTD, Co. Reg. Moo 195303821R
;‘.’:‘mm, STARISLAMD TRAVEL PTELTD, Co Reg. No.: 2015D6645M
Vehicle Reg. _ | ayoay2019 22:00 - :59
Mo PIBSIS Date of LosS: |19 Manths and 18 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r)]
Claim Type: | TP / MCT19090214 poscyover | mcomoo1s
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Policy No.
[ SHCE4E1G 4 GA420130
[Insured): l[chmm.
; | Exgess:

Regairer- | Unimotor Company (HQ) 1, Kaki Bukit Avenve 6, Autobay@Kakl Bukit, #01-94, 417883 Eunos - Tel:

r::l']‘:ﬂ? India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: £3476100 ... [Handied by Zuhaidah Bie Samsurd - 5347 6070)
Claimants E
h g AXA Insurance Pte Lid (HQ) - Tel: GESD 4888

| Adjuster: LIOK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ] - Tel: 6256-3561 . [Handied by MARCUS CHUA] ... [Final Rpt due 23/09/2015]

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view All |  Compose Case mai |

+ [I1_5G [06/12/2015): Alert - Adj Mandate Maintalned - PCT581G - Claim Handler: Zuhaldah Bte Samsur
« [I_SG (21/11/2019): Alert - Ad] Mandate w (5$0.00) - PCTS92G - Claim Handler: Zuhaidah Bte Sa...
* I11_SG [11/10/2010): Alert - Adj Mandate Maintalned - PCT592G - Clalm Handler: Zuhaidah Bie Samauri

|mmmuurmﬁ View All | Search Tasks | Croate Wew Task | compiete |

Due Date Priarity Typa Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?
Ne results.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 31/12/2019



Mermen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*pC7592G (MCT19090214)
[SHCB481G]
TR
STARISLAND TRAVEL PTE LTD
Sep 9 2019 10:00PM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
Unimotor Company

Wml unlndﬁlumll :hmpn-mwl.ﬂml

Page 1 of 2
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https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp... 31/12/2019



Merimen e-Claims Page 2 of 2
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregno1sseorissa)

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Qur Flle No: CC4mnMaN18205/UGA302

Date: MN22018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: India Inlernational Insurance Ple Lid  Policy No: MCOMO015
Claimant "
Vehicle No : PC7592G Insured Vehicle No : SHCB481G
Date of Loss. 09/09/2019 Mature of Claim: TP Claim No: MCT19080214
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: PC7592G
Make & Model: TOYOTA HIACE, 2.8 D GL (A) Engine No: 1GDB322446
Req, Date: 22/11/2018 (Man, Year: 2018) Chassis No: GDH2232000824
Colour Silver Odometer: 77324 km
Engine Capacity: 2754 cc
Market Valua/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (S$): Market Valus/New Car Price
CONMDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition Steering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable). Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accidenl Condilion:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 185 R15 Rear Tyre Size: 185 R15
Front Left Side: Michelin & mm Rear Left Side: Michelin & mm
Front Right Side: Michelin & mm Rear Right Side: Michelin & mm
The above valuea represent the remaiing fyre reeds depih
\COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %]
Parts 2,441.15 1,586.62 854 53 as.m
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 3.610.00 2.180.00 1.430.00 3961
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (5§) 6,051.15 3,766.62 2,284.53 37.75
Approved Total (Overridden) (S$) 3,000.00
Nett Amount (5$) 6,051.15 3,000.00 3,051.15 50.42
Global Sum Settlement (55) 0.00
INSP I
Date of Assignment; 12/08/2019
Date Inspecied: 18/08/2018 Inspecied At Unimator Company (HQ)
1, Kaki Bukit Avenue 6,
Autobay@ Kaki Bukit, #01-84
Singapore 417883
Estimated Period of Repair: 5.0 days
Adjuster: MARCUS CHUA Manager: Chong Pui Lin

NOTE. This report represents our findings af the iime and place of inspection stated hersin. Such inspection has besn camied ouf fo the bes! of cur
krowiadge and iy but any ather labiity undar any athar circumstences i Aersby srpressly srciuded
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REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: MRM-SG Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 26 Dec 2018)

Parts: 213 TOYOTA HIACE 2.8 D GL (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)
luhuur. Repairer's {Price-denominated Standard Lisi)

|Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for PC7502G)
\Validity: ~ These estimales are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages. running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page |

|Further Info: llems/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk ° |

Recommended Parts

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

1 1 *R/H CENTRE BODY PANEL QIS Not Necessary a52 TOFL = FL
2 1 *R/H FRONT BODY PANEL O/S Badly Dented 1453 00FL *1.453.90FL
3 1 *R/H FRONT DOOR CUTTER CENTRE PILLAR O/8 Badly Dented 58160FL *581.60FL
4 1 *R/H EXCURSION BUS STICKER OIS Necessary 2000FS *20.00FS
5 1 *R/H FRONT WINDOW GLASS SEALANT Necessary 80.00FS *40.D0FS
B 1 *R/H CENTRE WINDOW GLASS SEALANT Noi Necessary B0.00FS *-F8
7 L] *R/H REAR WINDOW GLASS SEALANT Nol Necessary BO.00FS ~FS
F=Franchiss part. S=SpcNeit L=ListemDisc

Sub Total (3§) 3,188.20 2,095.50
- List Item Discount on L Items 25.00/25.00% (S§) 747.05 508.88

Total Parts (S§) 2,441.15  1,586.62

Repor was unsubmitied during this print-out. |
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Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

There are no new miscellaneous tems selected.

Recommended Labour

Page 3 of 3

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems

1 TO DISM/REWIRE DAMAGED PORTION New 120.00 0.00

2 TO PANEL BEAT DAMAGED PORTION AND RENEW New 1,500.00 1,200.00
PARTS

3 TO PUTTY AND RESPRAY DAMAGED PORTION New 1,100.00 700.00

4 TO SPRAY UNDERCOATING IN REPAIR New 250.00 60.00

5 TO DISM/REFIX R/H SEAT AND SIDE GARNISH IN REPAIR ~ New 220.00 100.00

;] TO DISM/REFIX R/H 3 WINDOW GLASS IN REPAIR New 420.00 120.00

Gross Labour Cosl (S5§) 3,610.00 2,180.00

Reporl was unsubmitied during this prini-out. J

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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