Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 18 December 2019 5:24 PM

To: Zuhaidah Samsuri

Subject: RE: Ill REF: MCT19090214 | ACD INVL SHC8481G & PC7592G 09.09.2019 - PLEASE

UPLOAD SURVEY REPORT

Dear Aidah,

Noted with many thanks,

Will submit WP report and close off the case at our end.
Thanks

""Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020"

Best Regards,
Cecilia Chong | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong @lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Zuhaidah Samsuri [mailto:aida@iii.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 18 December 2019 5:12 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: IIl REF: MCT19090214 | ACD INVL SHC8481G & PC7592G 09.09.2019 - PLEASE UPLOAD SURVEY REPORT

Hi Cecilia,
As per Stanley’s email below, we have received LOD from TP Lawyer.
So just submit your WP survey report.

Best Regards

Aida Samsuti

Motor & Work Injury Claims Dept
India International Insurance Pte Ltd
64 Cecil Street #04/#05 10B Building
Singapore 049711

Tel: 6347 6100 Ext 257 Fax: 6224 4174
Email: aida@iii.com.sq

Co. Reg Number: 198703792K

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 18 December, 2019 5:09 PM




To: Zuhaidah Samsuri <aida@iii.com.sg>
Subject: RE: Il REF: MCT19090214 | ACD INVL SHC8481G & PC7592G 09.09.2019 - PLEASE UPLOAD SURVEY REPORT

Dear Aidah,
We are still pending for TP confirmation after informing them that the settlement is base on 50/50.
Thanks

""Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020"

Best Regards,
Cecilia Chong | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong @lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Zuhaidah Samsuri [mailto:aida@iii.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 18 December 2019 4:50 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
<CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Il REF: MCT19090214 | ACD INVL SHC8481G & PC7592G 09.09.2019 - PLEASE UPLOAD SURVEY REPORT

Hi Cecilia,
Please upload the survey report asap.
Thanks.

Best Regards

Aida Samsuti

Motor & Work Injury Claims Dept
India International Insurance Pte Ltd
64 Cecil Street #04/#05 10OB Building
Singapore 049711

Tel: 6347 6100 Ext 257 Fax: 6224 4174
Email: aida@iii.com.sq

Co. Reg Number: 198703792K

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 4 December, 2019 2:59 PM

To: Zuhaidah Samsuri <aida@iii.com.sg>; sur@Ikkauto.com; 'Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)' <CeciliaChong@I|kkauto.com>
Cc: 'Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Ill REF: MCT19090214 | ACD INVL SHC8481G & PC7592G 09.09.2019 - PLEASE UPLOAD SURVEY REPORT

Dear Aida,

Thank you for the email.



