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Yvonne Wcmg (LKK Auto)

From: HKL Lim Team Motorsport <hkllimteam@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, November 15, 2019 11:17 AM

To: Merina Chia

Cc ¥vorne Wong (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: FBJ96TTL / SHA9324G D18007767MFSH Liability
Attachments: FBJ9677L 10.jpg; FBJ9ETTL 11.jpg; FBJSGTTL 12,jpg
Dear Merina ,

Please find document attached LOD & process Cheque payment & write Client name Ng Ah Kwee .

On Tue, Nov 12, 2019 at 12:29 PM HKL Lim Team Motorsport <hkllimteam(@gmail.com> wrote:
HI Merina

Our requirement total loss $5200 + towing $40 total $5240

On Wed. Oct 23, 2019 at 12:08 PM CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaimsi@msfirstcapital.com.sg> wrote:
Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/Madam,
Please check with our Surveyor /LKK to finalise the total loss amount .
Thank you.

Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited

From: HKL Lim Team Motorsport [mailto:hkllimteam(@gmail.com]
Sent: Tuesday, October 22, 2019 3:25 PM
To: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirsicapital.com.sg>

Ce: Merina Chia =Merinachiai@msfirsteapital.com.sg=
Subject: Re: FBI9677L / SHA9324G D18007767TMFSH Liability

HI Merina

RESEND

RESEND



Yvonne WunE (LKK Auto)

From: HKL Lim Teamn Motorsport <hkllimteam@gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, September 23, 2019 5:50 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: FBJ2A7TL REPAIR LMIT

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Noted

On Mon, Sep 23, 2019 at 11:03 AM Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Keong,

Please take note repair limit for this motor is $5200.
Regards

Taufikh

Lkk Auto

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.avg.com

Thank You.

Best Regards

James Lim ( Keong )
Tel: +65 9242 3895



BLK 1008 #01-24 Bukit Merah Lane 3, Singapore 159722
Tel: + 65 6275-6656, 6275-6566 Fax: 6272-9291



Yvonne Wnng (LKK Auto)

From: Yvonne Wang (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, September 13, 2019 5:47 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'

Cc: ‘Merina Chia’; SUR

Subject: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007767MFSH/1 FBIS&TTL
Attachments: FBJ9677L DOA 27102019 REVERT.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle FBI9677L
Date of survey : 11/09/2019
Number of days : 6 days

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Yvonne Wong (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: yvonnewong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, September 11, 2019 11:47 AM

To: 'CWS Maotor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Merina Chia' <MerinaChia@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007767MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assipnments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408033)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 11 September 2019 11:00 AM



To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM
Ce: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Merina Chia <MerinaChia@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007767MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.avg.com




MS‘ Firs tca pital M5 First Capital Insurance Limited co®eg e 1950091060 05T Rew Mo H2 00016765

& Raffles Quay 421-00 Singapore Q48580
Tel: (65) G222 2311 Fax (65) 6222 3547
Claisa & Moter Underwriting Dept: 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877

Tel: (65) 6507 3848 Fax (65| G507 3849
whane misfirstcapitalcamosg

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number,

Please submit to

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
29-10-2018 Our Ref No. D18007767MFSH
27-10-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
SHAQ324G Third Party Vehicle. FBJ9B7TL

BLK 1008 #01-24 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3
JAMES LIM { KEONG )
B2756656/ 62727292 Fax No. 62725291

WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MNA Fax No. 68416315
MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Sclicitor

Officer Incharge

oL LI EEAM Attention. NIL
MOTORSPORT ’

MNA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
MERINA CHIA SAN SAN

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required,




SIUBLAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBT INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (D65} 62563561 FAX : (65) E-Z-F-M-dl_ﬂ

Your Ref* D18007767MFSH Date: 13 Sep 2019

Our Ref: CS/FCI19016140/T1yd3

The Motor Claims Department
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. _ FBJ9677L .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 11/09/2019 at HKL LIM TEAM MOTORSPORT. and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :S§ 13.792.00
Revised Estimate Amount 8% 6.427.00
“Check™ Items Amount + 8% 4.810.00
Market Value 1 5%
LTA Reimbursement Value 1 58
Nett Value : 5%

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages
at the front n/s portion

Yours faithfully

Taufikh
Automotive Assessor



Your NCD will be affected due to late reporting
Actual e-Filling Submission Date & Time: 05/09/2019 19:14

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

peed up he Claims process

ar and/or the Authonsed Drver

ul and accurate as possibie Any willul mssepresantabon or wihaldng OF FEengl Taas may 4 AN IMBLUrance corspanes i

nce companes is nal a0 admisson of policy iabdty o0 the part of the inSurance COMpanes

.q..-l.:l..i.3|_=r_~ reporting may be referred to the Police for imvestigation.

MISLrarS fhue (318 FResciwe

(ot 05/092019 18:58
cident 27102018 08:30
Lozaton OF Accident ALONG ENG NEO AVENUE

ate of Loss SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

Jahicle Registration Number FBJOB7TL
Insured/Policyholder
lame Of Registered Owner DAVID NG AH WAH
MBIC N §1736704C

Aridress NOEMAIL
fobile Phone No {LOCAL) +65-96237055
stive Phone No OFFICE-MOPHONE
Vehicle Particulars

AnuiaClure! KYMCD
Iade K-XCT2001-198CC

r which vehicle was being used at

e you ciaiming |* your own insurance policy

Plesse stale action o be {aken REPORTING ONLY
Category MOTORCYCLE
insurance Company
e of Insurance Company AXA INSURANCE PTELTD
Soverage THIRD PARTY FIRE AND/OR THEFT
- et Policy MO

“olicy Number VMZ/P 1867165

Mame of Dnve DAVID NG AH WAH

. 3/11/1986
£ 31 YEARS AND 11 MONTHS
MALE
Mumbe (LOCAL) +65-96237055

DFFICE-NOPHONE

1t Addrese NOEMAIL



Address BLE 15 MASRSILING LANE #07-1649

730015

A as driver an employes of the Insured's Company NO
f W, Relationship of the Dover with the Insured ODWNER

» Reqistration Mumber of Driver's Crwri

5

rsurance Company of Driver's Own \Vehicle

General Information of the Accident

ype Of Accident COLLIDED INTO MOTORCYCLIST
Vi eather Conditions CLEAR

Road Surface DRY

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident™  NO
mumber of vehicies (including own vehicle)
invelved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident? YES

rjured conveyed o hospital by

ambulance?

15 Al

W as any other material or property damaged? YES

have baen approached by unknown personis)
sicitingfoffening accident claims assistance

rMumber of Passengers (Including Driver) 1
Datails of Police Action :

fias the accident repartad to the police? YES
if Yes. Pleass stale which Police Station

Faolice Station Name WOODLANDS WEST N.P.C

=elice Station Address

SINGAPCORE
Palice Slation Contact TEL NO: - FAX NO
Was notice of intended Prosecution given? MO
it Y es aganst whom®
Circumstances of Accident
REFER TO POLICE REPORT (REPORT NO.: T/20181031/2093)
Attachmentis)
Arg accident pholos available for altachment? YES

Was there any video captured by Car Camera? NO

here any audic recorded? MO
DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1

vehicla Reqgistration Mumber SHAO3240G

vehicle Make/Model/Colour

MName 3!- [:"' vl
MNERIC/Passport Number
ot Mumbes

Adress

ROAD: 1 WOODLANDS STREET 12

POSTCODE: 738622

COUNTRY



DAVID NG AH WA

N Pazsanaer {Including Driver)
DETAILS OF INJURED PERSON 1
INEs Sustam
red person in which vehicie’y FBJ9GTTL

imured conveyed o hospital by v

m
(¥



Police Station Of Origin:
Woodlands West N.P.C.

8 Marsiling Lane SINGAPORE 739146

Tel No: 1800-363 9999

REPORT OF A TRAFFIC ACCIDENT

SINGAPORE
POLICE FORCE

A M

T/20181031/2095

1of3
Report No. T/20181031/2095

Date/Time Hepgﬁni.dade:
31!10!2{}13 16 3{}

| Vide Report No.:
D/20181027/0052

| Station Diary No..
| 72

Name of infcrmant:

NUR LILIAN MONIQ BINTI JOHN ﬁxPT ELK 15 MARSILING LANE #07-169 SINGAPORE 730015
ID Type / ID No.: | Contact No.:
FINNO/G6994990N | Home/Office: o Mobile: 87548028
: l~~latu:rn.'allt:q|r o Email:
MALAYSIAN _
Sex: "Age: | Date of Birth: | Type of Informant: o
Female | 29 | 20/03/1989 NEXT OF KIN - B
Race: Language: | Institution / School Name:
Malay - English
Occupation: Driving Licence Information:
Hotel receotionist | Class: Date of Expiry:

| Date/Time of Tpe of Location:

Dirink

|u'|'|;d..d..a. et ot bt - S P T Y e Py
B i f | ; : j |
i Aigfj:nt' i Attended by Police Drive: | Accident: Straight Road |
i e e e MNo | 27M0/2018 08:30 i
| Location:
Aic-ng Foad 1

ENG NEO AVENUE

ALONG ENG NEO AVENUE BY ENG NEO AVENUE TOWARDS BUKIT TIMAH ROAD

_Lamp Post Number: 9
i Weather:

Traffic Flow:

B Type of Collision:

i Road Surface: ' Road Speed Limit:

| Traffic Control- | Traffic Volume:

Anyone conveyed by
ambulance:
Yes o

| FBJ9BTTL

| Motorcycle

[SHA9324G [TAXI |

Any Pedestnan rnvolveﬁ No

| No. of Pedestrians Injured: NIL

[ Use of Pedestrian Crossing: NA




POLICE FORCE L TR

TI20181031/2095

Police Station Of Origin: 3ofd
Woodlands West N.P.C. Report No. T/20181031/2085
9 Marsiling Lane SINGAPORE 739148

Tel No: 1800-363 9999 CONTINUATION OF REPORT

Sketch Plan
Informant is not able to provide sketch plan

IMPORTANT: Please attach a copy of your vehicle's Insurance Certificate to this report. If you don't have
the certificate with you now, please fax a copy to 65474885 stating the report number as reference.

S ! — e — .
Signahhre i Otficer Recording The Report: sy iz7 'Signature Of Infor

IR .'_

ant:

-

Date/Time:
31/10/2018 16:30

Officer In Charge Of Case: | | Classification Of Case:
TP/ FAIT/

SI VILTON HIA WEE SIANG
Contact No.: 65476228

Authentication Sta inp
NE16A



POLICE FORCE UMM T MR

T/20181031/2095

Police Station Of Origin: 2at3
Woodlands West N.F.C.

8 Marsiling Lane SINGAPORE 739146
Tel No: 1800-363 9999

Report No. T/20181031/2095

CONTINUATION OF REPORT

DAVID NG AH WAH

Name

1736794C
| e l

Related Vehicle | FBJ3677L (Motorcycle) : Contact No.| NIL
" Hospital/Clinic | NIL | B | Classof | Class:NIL

| Driving Date of Expiry: NIL
. | Licence & |
[ | e | Expiry Date |

Date Treatment | NIL | Date Discharge | NIL _

'n_ f Da

s granied Medical Leave

INIL____| Degree of Injury | NIL

{ Name

" G6994990N '

NUR LILIAN MONIQ BINT! JOHN |

"Related Vehicle | NIL

| Hospital’'Clinic | NIL
|

| i ——
| Contact No.i 87548028

Class of i Class NIL

| Driving Date of Expiry: NIL
| | Licence & |
! A o | Expiry Date |
"Date Treatment | NIL | Date Discharge | NIL ==
| No. of Days granted Medical Leave | NIL | Degree of Injury | NIL

Brief Details.

On 27/10/2018 at about 1115hrs, | received a call from my husband's number however, on the other line
was an investigation officer by the name of Vilton Hia, to informed me that my husband namely: David Ng
Ah Wah had met with an accident and passed away at the scene. He then informed me to come down to

Traffic Police HQ at Ubi as soon as possible. During that material time, | was not in the right state of mind
thus | send my brother-in-law to go to the TP HQ to meet up with the 10.

| wish to state that as of now | do not know anything about the accident or how it happened as

investigation is still on going. | only received a few information about the accident through social media
Facebook, STOMP.

| am lodging this report for record purpose



POLICE FORCE AN

Tr20181031/2095

Folice Station Of Origin:

Woodlands West N.P.C.

9 Marsiling Lane SINGAPORE 739146
Tel No: 1800-363 9999

10f3
Report No. T/20181031/2095

REPORT OF A TRAFFIC ACCIDENT
Date/Time Report Made: | Vide Report Nc : [ Station Diary No.:

31/10/2018 16-30 | DI20181027/0052 72

i 3 Addss: .

MName of

NUR LILIAN MONIQ BINTI JOHN APT BLK 15 MARSILING LA#}]I% #07-169 SINGAPORE 730015

ID Type / ID No.: Contact No.:

FIN NO / GB994990N Home/Office: _Mobile: 87548028

Nationality: - Email:
_MALAYSIAN ) __i_— - B

Sex: Age: Date of Birth: | Type of Informant:

Female | 29 LEG{QgﬂEIEQ | NEXTOF KIN - o
“Race: - | Language: Institution / School Name:

Malay _ ' English -
'T:)‘c-c_upatiun: , : Driving Licence Information:

Hotel recentionist | Class: Date of Expiry:

| Fatal Drink  |Date/Timeof | Type of Location:

: Attended by Police Drive: Accident: Straight Road
Acadent. { No 27/10/2018 08:30 |

Location:

Along Road 1

ENG NEO AVENUE

ALONG ENG NEO AVENUE BY ENG NEO AVENUE TOWARDS BUKIT TIMAH ROAD '

| Lamp Post Number: 9 S _‘i
| Weather; Road Surface: Road Speed Limit:

| Traffic Flow: Traffic Control: - - Traffic Volume:

_ﬁnyc:-na conveyed by
ambulance:
Yes

| Type of Collision:

| FBJ9677L | Motorcycle | B i T

— 4 s

| = 1 | = I
| SHAG324G | TAXI J 1 | ! ‘0

F‘egﬂszaﬂ.wﬂlvedrﬂu
No. of Pedestrians Injured: NIL

| Use of Pedestrian Crossing: NA







HKL %Eﬂcm%mln'gp%

Blk 1008 #01-24, Bukit Merah Lane 3, Singapore 180722 Tel 6275 6656, B275 6566, 82727292  Fay. 62729291
Email; supportfhklimmotorsport.com.sg  Website: wiarw, hkllimmiorspon. com. sg

meseze” £63 63 L

pozo

1 front fork assy th /rh SEDD.DW?

2 front fork under bracket $350.00 ¢ 4

3 steering cone bearing set $220.00 <

4 body frame alignment Lok 5?m_m2§’

5 front fender $220.00

front wheel rim 5550.00 ¢

6 front wheel shalf $60.00%

7 front wheel bearing 2 pcs 540.00 ¢

B front wheel bearing oil seal $10.00=

9 front brake disc 5290.00~
10 iu unit $180.00°7
11 handle bar $220.00 51~
12 handle bar top cover $90.000-+
13 handle bar low cover 585,000
14 front no plate $12.00 5
15 brake lever lh / rh £160.00 "‘4{#
16 side mirror Lh /rh S1ﬂﬂ,ﬂﬂ"{’q "
17 head cowling lh / rh $400.00 ¢+ "':
18 head cowling plate Lh / rh 5'5(}[}.I[]Ilill_"rﬂ,"'-T 4
19 head cowling inner panel th / rh $50.00 ol —
20 head v cover $150.00 {¢—
21 head v cover panel S80.00 Az .
22 windshield $250.00 iy —
23 windshield panel $55.00 M4~
24 windshield panel guard §25.00 %
25 tailboard lh $290.0057 —
26 side stand $80.00 o —
27 main stand $150.00 76/~
28 top box $180.00% 5 —
29 top box bracket §150.00 &6~ —
30 radiator head $70.00 7
31 radiator cap $35.00 7
32 horn $35.007
33 battery cover $45.007

34 rear foot rest 5110.0[]:54?‘ =
35 usb $55.00%

36 seat lock cable $120.00% 7
37 ignition switch set $380.00 7

38 radiator

$400.00 7



Blk 1008 #01-24, Bukit Merah Lane 3, Singapore 159722 Tel, 8275 6656, 5275 6566, 62727292

Faw: 6272 9291

Email. suppori@hkiimmotorsporlcomsg  Website: www hkliimmotorsport.com.sg

3% seat bar lh
40 towing
41 labour
42 compartment
43 compartment cover
44 compartment box cover
45 compartment box padel
46 compartment center cover
47 inner panel th / rh
48 inner panel th cover
49 fr fork panel
50 intake panel
51 lower lh panel
52 lower lh cowling
53 foot panel lh
54 fuel tank cover
55 meter assy
56 meter panel
57 vbelt cover
58 head light
59 head light socket Lh / rh
60 head light bulb th / rh
61 air box cover
62 brake hose Lh / rh
63 side fairing th th / rh
64 side fairing panel th / rh
65 battery
TOTAL

[owf §tag- €160 P

LKK Auto Consultants hence notify
the F!ﬂ:aa r-dru!ﬂ": follow ing;

_T,-_.- =iy # maged

Slgniature;

$150.00 X
Lot s40.00
[shond $850.00 >=°
$180.00 o~
$90.00 ' Lt
$80.00 L -\~
$35.00 &
$120.00¢"
$180.00
$45.00 &)~
$45.00 wn~"
$120.00 ™4~
$120.00 w1 .~
$150.00A4
$80.00 »+ [ —
$120.00 1S
$680.004i4 —
$120.00404_—
$320.00 cf —
5900.00 ™y y—
$60.00 1/ —
$40.00 o (—
$80.00 ¢/ —
$240.00 7
$440.00 7
$160.00
$1B0.00 »

$13,412.00
AR
b 13645349

W7 ulg e 259~

ps
Nt

Tﬂ g lbeedq wve l’f“ﬂ'}

54 C ([ufpands s
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