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SuTveyor: KENNETH por: 11/0972018
Pre-assign / CCU | FTE
Insured Vehicle No GBA 4087U Claim No.
Nae of limured SANTA BOEKI PTELTD Policy No
Tnuirred Tel Ma HP: Make / Model
Excess Sec 11 :5% D04 . 0410972019 07:25

Is driver the owner?

{ YES 1 fi:;

Nuture of Accident :

10/09/2019
11/09/2018

Dage { Tume :

Hegivered in Merimen:

5226481384SG
2100374289
CITROEN BERLINGO-1.6 D HDI

Place of Accidens .  ALONG BOON LAY AVENUE

If NO, Driver Name / Age: KOH CHAI HUEI Ol GlA REPORT: @Nu TP GIA REFURT@ KO
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[FINALIZATION Date/Time: Confirm with = _ Confirm by:
ir Cost: 55 5,55 days) Reduction. @R % Ematl | 1Call |
FINAL SETTLEMENT _ Duic/Time: 1nE1nEmcmrm with B Gowl e Email
Final Linbility- % 180 (Affedt ! Assesed) BOLA SN No = 1 NO or B 28, Ass. Lia
Repair Cost: (ulg9e) |53 B, 3R . S0 O =WWIse RY)
Loss of Rental (LOR) 58 BOD.00 (| 5 dwy ¥ A\DD. 00 - - N
Lows of Use (LOL): 5 - l!- r daw) T U ikl §
Loss ool Income (LO0) 58 = 1 davs) -[.1:‘%% ﬁr il
LOR only [ LOU anly [ lmn+mt,[_] LOR+ LOIL__| [Tickonlyone] i) _ B
(GIAALTA Search ss _"f- o B
Medical 55 1) Clain status: NV Reject/Private Settle
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Legl Cost 55— 1) Survey fec %3¢c.00
Total: ss £, %0.50 Global Sum S$: =
FINAL PAYMENT Date/ Time: Confirm with: Erml!ﬁ Gl
Payez 1: 55 A 300,50 Nume 1: SN WRG  MITOCAEE G T8 Ko
Payee 2: (Sirike ifN.A) |58 —_— - Nume 2: | —_
Payee 3: (Stike T N.A) |55 p Name 3. | =
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AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD

Sin Ming Autocare BfG Pte Ltd
1 78, Sin Ming Drive 202-05
Sin Ming Autocane Cormple

Tel - (63) 6455 D00

Fax | (h5) B455 G192

Wiehwibe: www.autn ane, com Sg
GST Reg. MNo: 20-0210053-N

Estimate : E19/2511

78 SHENTON 79120 Date : 08/09/2010
78 SHENTON WAY #07-16 079 Al
SINGAPORE oy ATy #  Vehicle Num. - SLI4992R
Make/Model : VOLKSWAGEN GOLF-2010

Attantion - Motor Claim Department
Contact : 6419 3000 Fax No. : BB357416

A’*”V'; Ate Voiny

£t Lny 8 2557). Aecigon o vai0az0T9

Claim No. : BFG
Reference - TP CLAIM
Policy No. : 5097514885-01

d’a’?f

S/IN Quantity  Particular Unit Price  Amount S$
LIST ITEMS : @
T 1PC FRONT FENDER RH » s 525.% :-"'
2. 1PC REAR FEMDER (RH) Lo,
i 1PC FRONT DOOR (RH) [/ 1fo & TH2000 —
4, iPC FRT DOOR TOP HINGE - RH A B200 &
a5 1PC FRT DOOR LOWER HINGE - RH € 20300 4
6. 1PC REAR DOOR - RH / Ay 182000
7. 1PC REAR DOOR TOP HINGE -RH B2.00 £
8 1PC REAR DOOR LOWER HINGE - RH # 20300 x
List TotalSs ; 6,987.00
10.00% Discount S5 : 688.70
6.288.30

SPECIAL NETT ITEMS :

1. 10PCS  FENDER CLIPS 500 ‘& 5000 —
Special Nett Total S8 : 50.00
LABOUR - Foor
TO SPRAY PAINT ALL AFFECTED AREAS 1,500.00
TO PANEL BEATING ALL AFFECTED AREAS 1.000.00 o,
TO TRANSFER ALL DOOR GLASS AND QUARTER GLASS TO NEW e
DOORS " §00.00 X
TO DISMANTLE & REFIX ALL DOORS INNER AND QUTER PARTS TO V7
NEW DOORS 400,00
TO CHECK ALL WIRING FOR PROPER FUNCTION 15000 5,
Labour Tolal 8§ 3.650.00

E&0E Total 55 9,988.30

A T

for Sin Ming Aulocare BFG Pte Ltd
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Your password will empire in 5 days. Click here {o chanee it
*PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION REQUEST - SLJ4802A va GBA4DE7U (O1) on D.O.A DA/D%2019

Fresn:  dsme Vil

To ARBGTETT RIS ST AT A AT A R kAL, CT |

Ce Fong. Andy.5Y, Chin, Les-Ying, Abu Kaswm Hoor Usrisss, Afian Syatardas Chan Yole B L Sheeg vang Mivcosogs  Asshwesmestier Setees Theethan Sutramaram Dy
Senl  @NQUITE T 4B TT PN

Atachmantt 8} irageogLane™ SARPRE

Hi,
Plaase refer 1o the enclosed request from Sin Ming Autocare BFG Pre Lid 2 ﬂﬁlm lb]ﬂllﬂ

Clum no : F1640 ] 3RA 50003
Case Owner  : Foo Chit Yan emond
Il you have any quenesicomserns, plemss lot us know

Kinly assist b assign Kenneth Kong as Simgle Joini Expert as requesied \I'l'ﬁ;(,’ﬂ. Nﬂ""“

Thanks & Regards, GMMGL an -"1\"1)h

Heze ¥l Rud {Viwiams

i

Pl Al |

Smgapoie FHOL | Claivs Ogeranians - Aito

Tl D001 206558 | Est 1000204
LITULNEOSEO.COT | me B g0

From: snmingblg@gmail.com |maiito:sinmingblg@igrmall.com)

Sent: Tuesday, September |0, 2015 11:46 AM

Tos Mor, Yireul

Ce: Fong, Andy-5Y; Chin, Lee-Ying; Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa; Azlan, Syazairdina; Chan, Yoke Shi; Lim, Sheng Yang; Mithoosingh, Aashwesnjestiawr Parthian, Theerthar
Subramaniam, Dneyashni

Subject: RE: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING DUR INSURED VEMITLE GBA40S7U AND SLI4992R ON (4/09/2019

Dear Ms Hor,

Chur selection srveyor is Kenneth Kong (LKK)

Thank you

Regards

Angela Tan

From: Hoe, Yiarul

Sent: Tue, 10 Sep 2019 03:22:19 +0000

To: sinminghipigmail com

Ce: Fong., Andy-3Y, Chin, Lee-Ying, Abu Kasnm, Noor Mariesa, Azlan, Syarmrding, Chan, Yoke Shi, Lim, Sheng Yang, Mithoosingh, Asshweenjeetkaur.

Parthiban, Theerthan, Subremantam, Divyashni
Subject: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING DUR INSURED VEHICLE GBA40STU AND SLIS92R ON 04492019

Wihow Prejusdice

Your Reference SLH99IR

Our Reference  SX2EAR1 IRAS000)
Dear Sir'Madum,

We refor w your Nobice of Aceadent of even dute.

We mieil to conduct & pre-repair survey of the damage to your ollemt"Wyour customer's vehicle jointly with your client/vour motor workahop, We propose to use one of the motoe
marveyors pamned in the sttachod lisl o conduct the joint pre-reparr survey as 8 sangle pome expert

Name ol Surveyer Coampany Name

AIG In House Surveyor AlG Asin Pacific Insurance Pie Lid
Lawrence Ng Chun Kee Priority Services

Tefrey Ong Leng Kiat Prionily Sertices

Tinmy Lee Pricrity Services

EC Lom Automobile lnspection Services Pie Lid
Pang Kiah Keen (Franke) Formtesm Adpusters Pie Lid

Ng You Han Formteam Adjusters Ple Lad

Socn HanXin (Oary) Formizam Adjusters Pie Ll
Chow Bo Xiong Formteum Adjusiers Ple Lul
Chua Soo Teck {Benjamin) Formeam Adjusters Pie Ltd




Kalvin Anl LEKK Auto Cansultamts Pie Ltd
Kng Give Qieng LEE Auo Consaimms Pee Lod
Marcus Chia LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
Mohamad Taulikh LEE Autn Cansultass Pe Lad
Adran Ling LEK Auto Consuliamts Pre Lid
Moharmmed Rasul LEK Auto Consultussis Pte Lid
Kenneth Kong LEE Auto Consultants Pre L1d

Plemse bet ua know within two (1) working devs whelher you agree 1o the appointment of umy of these motor surveyors as 8 single joint expen. You may sclect one of more of the
favted motor surveyors. We will bear the cont of the pre-repair survey carmied oul by the singhe jom expert

Trania & Regardy,

e Vim Wyl |[Viviane)
AN

FHOL Adjestur |
Smgapom FROL | Cleens Dpeahcns - Suin

Tair OO1F0B558 | Sx1 1002208
Zrrgl moe S g o | e S5 gw

From: 51N MING AUTOCARE BFG |malito:sinminghigigmail.com]

Sent: Tuesday, September 10, 2019 10:59 AM

To: AIG SGP, Claims-Survey

Ce: Diea, Marice!

Subject: [EXTERNAL] THIRD PARTY CLAIM SLI40928 & GBAAMDETU ACCIDENT ON 04.09.2019

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with lmks and sitechments,

T AIG Mok Claims Depe [Arrangemen of Surveyor L)
RE: SOTICE TO THIRD PARTY INSURERS TO CONDUCT PRE-REFAIR INSFECTION WITIHIN 2 WORKINGS DAY FURSLANT TD

PARAGRAFH FHOTOCOL FOR SININJURY MOTOR ACCIDENT CLAIME (NIMA)
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLIMSIIR & GBAJONTU ALONG DOON LAY AVE NEAN BUS STOPF BIIWS OX B4 2019

Wir s repaien e JO KOK SENGD the swner of vehicke na S1L14090
Plesse be informed that the sid vehicle oo impecied o the fflwwing semse

Sin Mg Awiscars BFO Me Lid
176 Sim Mang Divec #03-0F Singapor: 575721
Tel 84330400  Fou S356197  Eeeil: motsclaimadgutocare com 1y

Comtact Person. Angela Tan

Plesss slan priviche us @ fiseof |0 surveyoes ss your sonsnated 871 (Single Somt Expen)

Thank you

With Regurds,

Auyela Tan

Clasms & Admin Exzeunve

Error! Filename set ipecifled.

Sin Ming Ausocars TIFG P Ll

178 51N MING DRIVE, s02-0% SINGAPORE 375721

Email: mesgroigimu@isuiocare com g
Tek : #254 0600 | Fax - 6453 6192

Attachments area

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The miormation in this email (and say atachments) s confidential. If you are sot the mtendesd recipicnt, vou must pot use or disseminate the information. If you
have received this email in error, plesse immediately notify me by “Reply” command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof
Albegh this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might alfect any computer system into which it i received and
apened, |1 s the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that il |5 virus free and no responsibility is scoepted by American Intemational Group, Ine. or 1ty subsidisrcs
ar affilintes cither joinily or severally. for nny loss or damage srising in any way from it wee

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

Tha infarmutian in e small {and sny aRschrmarty| s confidontiol. |F you e ot the inEnded recaient, you must nol use o dissermingly the irformabon. I pou have recelved this small ip oo, plesss
immudintaly natify ma by "Rapl” comemand and parmananlly delsts e onginal snd any eopess o pintaus Beeeal, Alough i smail and any stachments s bebesd i be fee of any vine o
e dafect that mighl sfect any cormputier Byalaem inls which i 1§ receved and openad, it 4 he mipeaibdty of tha recipient io ersune that @ m vwus es ana no responsiilly & acceated by Amancen
Intemational Group, nc. or &8 subsidisnes or afEaes sithes jorilly o severaly, Iof BNy K8s or darmage arising in any way fram i use.



* 10182018 Meriman e-Claims

Print Received Message

This mail is associaled with ;

*SLJ4992R (52264813845G)
[GBA4DBTU]
TP

HO KOK SENG
Saep 4 2018 7:00AM
[SANTA BOEKI PTE LTD]
Sin Ming Autocare BFG Ple Lid

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Lid. (Express) (AIG_SG_EXPRESS). sent on 08/10/2019 16:55 PM.
To LKK_HO
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$4300.50) - SLJ4992R - Claim Handler: Foo, Chit Yan

\Approved:4300.50:Please proceed to settle at best

hﬂp;'ﬂﬁiﬂﬂﬂﬂﬂm.n‘m‘-mnn.mn'l.fcln-lmn’hdu:.ﬂm?mmFE\:’CmaﬁEfusammww_PﬂnlﬂCFD!ﬁNE'ITT!&CFTGHEH*IMMHWMH -CA 10



Sin Mmg{ﬁutncare BFG Pte Ltd

176, Sin Ming Divive 20205

Sin Ming Autncare Comples
Singapoire 575721

ll'l Ming Tel ; (65) 6455 DHDD
Fiax ; 1650 Hd55 6192

. -" * L ‘ L * * Wiehsite: www.auocan, com. s
CST Rog, No: 20.0270083-N

Our Ref: BFG/SLI499ZR/AIGTP/AT
Yours Ref: CCAH/AIGI9016129/ KHAS
2] Sepr 2019

AIG Asin Pacific Insurance Pre Lid

78 Shenton Way

#0778

AlG Building

Singapore 079120 Attn: Motor Claims Dept

Dear Sirs/ Mdm

ACC INVLG SLJ4992R & GBAJOSTU ALONG BOON LAY AVE NEAR BUS
STOP B21399 ON 04/09/2019.

We are the repairers of vehicle nos. _SLI4992R und understand that vou were the insurer of
vehicle nos. GBA40RTU involved in the aforesaid accident. Our investigations reveal that the
aceident was caused by the negligence of the vehicle insured by vou. As such, we are looking to
vou for reimbursement calculated as follows;

1) Repair Costs §53,798.50
2) Loss of Rental for 5 days at $110,00per day 5% 550,00
3) GIA search 2.00

TOTAL: S$4.350.50

To substantiate our claim, we enclosed the [ollowing:

a}l Fmal Bill

b} Car Rental Agreement
c] GIA Search receipt

d) Leuter of Authorization
¢] SAS Report

We look forward to your favorable reply in due course.

Mease note vhat it is o condition of any sertlement resched that it shall be without prejudice 1o any persanal
imjory clakm (IF any ) of the owner’ claimant.

Yours faithfully

Serene Lim
Claims Section

Email © sereneilautocare com.sg




Al
! '{_‘{ C:lnsmmnn
a e mna & Pres LIt

1 LI AVE 1, #0125 PAYA DI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408983 TEL () A2E0RASH1 FAN - (3 h250401 2

25 SEPTEMBER 2019

SANTA BOEKI PTELTD
15 CHIN BEE CRESCENT
SINGAPORE 619887

Dear Sir/Madam,

OUR REF : CC4/AIG19016129/Kha3
YOUR REF :GBA 4087U

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBA 4087U AND SLJ 4992R ALONG BOON LAY AVENUE
ON 04.09.2019

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster
appointed by your motor insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid to deal with the third
party claim agains! your policy.

We have received a claim from Body Repairer/Workshop acting on behalf of the owner of
SLJ 4992R against your motor insurance policy.

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had
amongs! other information given us your version ol how the accident had occurred, we as
the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable
seftlement with third party claimant.

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD - it any) may be affected as a
result of the claim against your policy. Unless you have an NCD protector.

We shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according
1o the rights afforded under the policy. Should you nol be seeking the protection of your
policy and seek to take conduct of third party claim(s) arising from this incidenl, at your
own cost and defense, please reply to us within 10 days from the date of this lefter.

To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with
any of the Third Party(s) and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or
settlement without AIG's prior knowledge and consent.

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AIG of their rights to repudiate any
claim because of any breach of policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised
driver may have committed.



Aud
! ‘, "" C‘;jnm:mn

!

LU AVE 1, #0028 PAYA LI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SING APCIRE 40933 TEL 5 (005) 2504301 FAN : (0h5) 62504312

In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), AlG shall keep
you informed of the linal indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).

It you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us at 6841 2096 or email us
at vicalpeh@Ik .CO

Please quote the claim reference when you contacl us that we can assist you more
effectively.

Yours sincerely,

o/

A .-""

.I'f.'l.:'.l
Vic Alpeh
Cgse Handler
DID: 6841 2096
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com

c.c. AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid
{Motor Claims Dept)
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RELEASE VOUCHER
(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

“We/l, SIN MING AUTOCARE BFG PTE LTD (*the workshop”) hereby confirm that we/l have
reached an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asin Pacific Insurance Pie Lid LEK

AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for
$83.798.50 (Repair Cost). $$500.00 (Loss of Rental/Use), $82.00 (Disbursement), for vehicle no.
SL.J 4992R that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 04/09/2019 (date) along
BOON LAY AVENUE (location) involving vehicle no/s GBA 4087U. This is pursuant to the
inspection conducted on 11/09/2019 (date) at “the workshop".

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner HO KOK SENG (“the third party claimant™)
of vehicle no. SLJ 4992R make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l have full
authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/l deem fit. We/l enclose herein the
letter of authority given by “the third party claimant™.

We/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pie Lid for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party claimant™
after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and expenses
suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the damage to SL]
4992R (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party clmimant” pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis,

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have

exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Dated this I®  (day)of cct (month) 2019 (year)

Signed by appointed surveyor



Sin Min%ﬁutucare BFG Pte Ltd

17, Sin Ming

ve 20205

Sin Ming Autocare Compile

Singapoee 575721
Tel 7 65 455 D600
Fax : (65] 455 6192

Webaite; wwwaulnoare. Comi vy

GST Rey, Now 20-0210013-N
AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTELTD Tax Invoice : TP19/660
AIG BUILDING
TB SHENTOM WAY #07-16 079120 Date - 21/08/2019
SINGAPORE Vehicla Num. : SLJ4992R
i Make/Maodel : VOLKSWAGEN GOLF-2010
Attentian : Molor Claim Department Chassis/Eng# : WVWZZZ1KZAW333417
Contact : 6419 3000 Fax No.: 68357416 Accident Date ; 04/09/2019
Claim Mao. : BFG
Reference : TP CLAIM
Policy No. : 5087514885-01
SN Quantity Paricular Unit Pice  Amount 58
LISTITEMS
1, LUMP SUM REPAIR { Paris & Labour inclusive ) 3.550.00
List TotalSs : 3,550.00
E.&0.E. Total S5 : 3,550.00
GST@ 7% 5% : 24850
'8 L Amount Due S5 : 3,798.50
| J \ |~|“\ S=ssss=ses
ALVAY

for Sin Ming Autocare BFG Pte Ltd
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‘ GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raflles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048530

o | GENERAL
& W INSU“EN.&NCE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax +85 6224 0030

Dparating Hours: Motday Lo Friday Sam 1o 5pm

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

GST Registration No: M400DO17735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Qur Raf No; (3R-18-145258

Date of Request: 102019 Your Ref No: Cinline Purchasa
Sin Ming Autocars BF G Pra Lid

178, Sin Ming Drive #0205

Sin Ming Aulocare Complex

Singapora 575721

Dear SiMadam,

Enguiry Dats 100872019

Frguiry By Angela Tan Chin Chin (

Vehicls No. GBASDATL '

Accidan| Dals 04082018

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicle No. Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tal, No. |
GBASADETU AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Fle. Lid, 26/06/2019-25/0872020 65-6418-3000 I
ThHenk You.

The imagea provided o you are taken from the originagl repons forwardsd (o the canire by the mambers of the General Insursnce Associstion of
Singapore and wa take no responsibillty for thair scouracy or contents and shall be under no llabillly whatsosvet for any |oss or damage arlsing out of &

in connaciion with the reports or thair Images.

This Is & computsr generatad document and requires no signature.



Merimen e-Claims

Page 1 of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Fastimne

I

CLATM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
! Case Motifisd Ext Suihrmitted il | Assigned Ad) Rpt Ad) Submitted Ine Auth'ed Status
' ~ 05 Sop 2019 ;g,g;" 018 £$3,550.00 £53,550.00 MMI anding for Survey
b :
| it Bay e 1 Edit Latimptes view Bt | cu i ]

| CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS [Created by adjuster]
| Insured SANTA BDEKI PTE LTD, Co. Reg. Mo.: 199001656R
Main 1
Saimant: HO KDK SENG, 1D: S1695085H
Vehicle Reg _ | 04/09/2019 07:00 - :5%
Moot SLI4992R Date of Loss: |1y ng Months and 24 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r)] |
Claim Type: | TP / 52264813845G PNCYICOVEr | (Third Party Only) |
Vehicie Aeg .
Mo GBALOBTU et ey |5097514885-01
(Inmured): )
Excess:
Repalrer: Sin Ming Autocare BFG Pte Ltd (HQ) 176, Sin Ming Drive #02-05, Sin Ming Autocare Compler, 575721 Sin Ming - Tel: 64550600
;:.T“’:' AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid. (Express) - Tel: 65-6415-3000 . |[Handied by Foa, Chit Yan] Chitvan.Foo@aig.com
I;-.wmr:m NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd (HQ) - Tel:
Adjunter: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tal: 5258-3561 _ [Handied by KENNETH KONG] .. [Final Rpt due 20/09/2019]
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED View Al |  Compose Case Mail |
« AIG_SG_EXPRESS (D6/10/7019); Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (S$4300.50) - SLY4992R - Claim Mandler: Foo, Chit ¥...
ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS= =
Dus Date  Priority Type  Task Group  Subject  Handier
Ho results

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 16/10/2019



Mernmen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*5114992R (522648138456G)
[GBA40DB7U]
TP

HO KOK SENG
Sep 4 2019 7:00AM
[SANTA BOEKI PTE LTD]
Sin Ming Autocare BFG Pte Ltd

Page 1 of 2

Upload Documunts | Upiosd Photos | Compose wew Latser | upiosd vicss | Upoed Aus | View [viwm i Srowser = |
Letters/Correspondences [1perpage |v] )
Ne | Finalzed 0= LKK Aurto Consultants Pte Ltd (HGQ) Thumbnail Print
1 |(Draft) Third Party Express Settlement = Payment Breakdown Eait
No_| Finalized On LKK Autn Consultants Pte Ltd (WQ) Thumbaall Print
1 |35/09/19 17:43 | Adjuster Immediate Advice 0 | Loas HTM
l
|MIII‘HII“ M !"'I B
'we | Relabel/Rearder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Brint
1 |75/@19 17:36 | Odometer Reading 0 | teasiwc | A
7 |25/09/19 1736 | Chassis Number D | tedrc B
3| 25/09/19 17:36 | Genaral View 0| wews | A
a4 |2900/19 17:36 | Genaral View @ | weaws | B |
5 |25/09/19 17:36 | General View 0 | tmaawe (¥}
6 |25/09/1% 17:36 | General View 0| aaws | A
7 |2s/me019 17236 | General View O | wsaws | F
B |25/09/18 17:36 | General View Q| aws |
8 |26/09/1917:38 | Genersl View 0| waws |
10 |25/09/19 17:36 | General View D! oedwrs | A
11 |25/09/1817:36 | Genersl View 0 ieadies | A
12 |25/09/19 1736 | General View 0 | e |
13 |25/09/18 17:36 | General View @ vaws |
14 |25/09/1517:36 | General View 0| eodrs | A
15 |25/09/19 17:38 General View 0 | lodirc | A
16 |25/09/1517:36 | General View 0 | loadies | (A
Documentation [1 per page [«] &
Mo | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pie Lid (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 [11/08/19 15:41 | TP GIA REPORT Load POF
2 |[1109/19 15141 | EMAIL FROM AIG DD 10.09.2019 Load POF
3 [11/09/19 15:41 | ACKNOWLEDGEMENT EMAIL TO AIG DD 10.09.2019 a Luad POF
& [18/06/19 09117 | TP ESTIMATE - MARKED Load POF
s |a%/p9/1917:31  |LETTER TO O s_ Lzad FOF
& |25/09/1917:37 |TPLOD Load POF
|7 |16/10/19 1218 | WORKSHOP INVOICE @ | Loacror
'8 1671071912115 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM 0 | Leaaror
9 | 18/10/19 12118 Release Voucher 0 | losaror
10 |36/10010 12118 | RENTAL RECEIPT ) | iocac POF
11 |16/10/1912:18 | LOD Lead FDF
12 |16/10/19 12118 | GLA SEARCH Load POF
hie | Finalized Gn AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. [SG) | Thumbinall | Print
1 |12/09/191115 | OI GIA REPORT @ | Leacror
2 |Dpasi10/19 16:54 Clear Report ) | Loed Sk

Documents Checklist
DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST Roset | Save | primt |

[There are no docoment chackiists configured,

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp...

16/10/2019



Merimen e-Claims Page 2 of 2

Our Checklist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pie Lid (HG)

Show Remarks To: L] Handling Insurer
bt BErearis gen provsie aoless ged 180w i Do slSer it

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuscaction=dsp... 16/10/2019



Preview

Page 1 of |

NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM
THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT
(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
F-hlr.h No: GBA4087TU (Insd veh) Model: VOLKSWAGEN NEW GOLF
SLJ4992R (TP veh) 1.4 AT 5K13G5 (A)
[Date of Accident: |04/09/2019
Global Sum Settiement| - | [ ] Yes | [X] No
Repair Estimate -] 10,687.48|
Final Repair Cosl 5 3,798.50
Loss of Use 4 days at 50.00 per day
Rental (if any) 5 50000| 5 days
LTA / GIA Search Fee €| 2.00
Others - 0.00
-
Final Settlement Sum 5 4,300.50

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered?

[l 1 YES [X ] NO (Kindlyindicate

below)
A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)
BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No  BOLA Scenario No
B) For GIA Registered Workshop: r i
BOLA Liability. (%) Assessed Liability (*)! (%)
* Assessed Liability to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee’s Breakdown

1) |Sin Ming Autocare BFG Pte Ltd 5 4,300.50
2) : 8§
3) 3
16 Oct
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 2019
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid Daie

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form,
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Autherisation to Act: Survey Report;
Medical Report! Bill (if any)

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc& fuseaction=dsp_... 16/10/2019



Adjuster Report Page 1 of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoresne 1sseor1ser)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 62556-3561 Fax: 68844-8805 Email: sur@Ikkauto.com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Qur File No: CC4/AIG18016129/KHA3Q2

Date: 18102018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid.  Policy No:
Claimant .
Vehicle No : SLJ4892R Insured Vehicle No : GBA40BTU
Dsate of Loss. 04/08/2018 Mature of Claim: TP Claim No: 522648138456
| IFICATION OF I
Reg No. SLJ4992R
Make & Model, VOLKSWAGEN MEW GOLF, 1.4 AT 5K13G5 (A) Engine No: CAXS504187
Reg. Date: 11/08/2010 (Man. Year: 2010) Chassis No: WVWZZZ 1TKZAW333417
Colour Metallic Black Odometer: 187683 km
Engine Capacity: 13%0 cc
Markel Value/New Car NIA
Price
Sum Insured (S%), Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION QF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable). Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 225/40 R18 Rear Tyre Size: 22540 R18
Front Left Side: Bridgestone 4 mm Rear Left Side: Michelin 2 mm
Front Right Side: Bridgestone 4 mm Rear Right Side: Michelin 2 mm
The above values represant e remainng Ire ireads denpth
(COST OF CLAIMS Repairers  Adjuster's  Difference  Diff %)
Parts 6,338.30 2,827.40 3,510.90 55.39
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 3,650.00 1.640.00 2,010.00 55.07
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S5) 9,988.30 4,467.40 5,520.90 55.27
Approved Total (Overridden) (S5) 3,550.00
(S5) 9,988.30 3,550,00 5,438.30 B4 48
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S§) 698.18 248.50 450 B8 B4.46
Nett Amount (55) 10,687.48 3,798.50 6,688.98 64.46
+ Car Rental (5.0 x $5100.00/day) (5%) 500.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (55) 2.00
Nett Liability (55) 4,300.50
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 10/09/2019
Date Inspecied 11/09/2019 Inspected At Sin Ming Autocare BFG Pte Lid (HQ)
176, Sin Ming Drive #02-05, Sin Ming
Autocare Complex
Singapore 575721
Estimated Period of Repair: 6.0 days

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=... 16/10/2019



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Adjuster: KENNETH KONG Manager: VIC ALPEH

NOTE: This report represents our findings al (e lime and place of ingpection staled harein. Such inapection has baan camed ouf fa the bast af our
knowledge and ahilly but any omer lability under any other circumstances is hereby axprassly excluded

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=... 16/10/2019



Adjuster Report

REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

Page 3 of 4

No. Qty PartNo. Parliculars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *FRONT FENDER RH Bent 526.00 FL *526.00 FL
2 1 *REAR FENDER (RH) Repair 2.251.00FL “FL
3 1 *FRONT DOOR (RH) Bent 182000FL  *1.180.00FL
4 1 *FRT DOOR TOP HINGE -RH Repair 82.00FL *FL
5 1 *FRT DOOR LOWER HINGE -RH Repair 203.00FL “FL
6 1 *REAR DOOR -RH Bent 1.820.00FL *1,380.00 FL
7 1 *REAR DOOR TOP HINGE -RH Repair 82.00FL *FL
8 1 *REAR DOOR LOWER HINGE -RH Repair 203.00FL *FL
| 10 *FENDER CLIPS Necessary 50.00FS “50.00F5
F=Franchise pan, S=SpcNefl. L=LatemDiac
Sub Total (SS) 7,037.00 3,136.00
- List Item Discount on L Items 10.00/10.00% (S%) 688.70 308.60
Total Parts {S§) 6,338.30 2,827.40
[ Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |
https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=... 16/10/2019



Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are na new miscellaneous ems selecied.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour items
1 TO SPRAY PAINT ALL AFFECTED AREAS New 1,500.00 700.00
2 TO PANEL BEATING ALL AFFECTED AREAS New 1.000.00 B00.00
3 TO TRANSFER ALL DOOR GLASS AND QUARTER GLASS  New 600.00 0.00
TO NEW DOORS
4 TO DISMANTLE & REFIX ALL DOORS INNER AND OUTER  New 400.00 120.00
PARTS TO NEW DOORS
5  TOCHECK ALL WIRING FOR PROPER FUNCTION New 150.00 20.00
Gross Labour Cost (S$§) 3,650.00 1,640.00
[ Report was unsubmitied during this print-out,
< END OF ESTIMATES >
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 16/10/2019



