Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 1 October 2019 2:29 PM

To: ‘jessicahs@eurokars.com.sg'; Rasul (LKKAuto); Admin A

Cc: sarah.candida@eurokars.com.sg; zul.fadzli@eurokars.com.sg;
jobithomas@eurokars.com.sg; jen.lim@eurokars.com.sg; rickteo@eurokars.com.sg

Subject: RE: FINALIZATION MINI SKT3638E

Dear Jessica,
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Confirmed COR: $7,500 before GST
8 repair days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: jessicahs@eurokars.com.sg <jessicahs@eurokars.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 1 October 2019 2:18 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: sarah.candida@eurokars.com.sg; zul.fadzli@eurokars.com.sg; jobithomas@eurokars.com.sg;
jen.lim@eurokars.com.sg; rickteo@eurokars.com.sg

Subject: FINALIZATION MINI SKT3638E

Dear Rasul,

Please find our computation attached for your agreement.

COR: $7,500 before GST

8 repair days (not including preparation of estimate, wait for liability/wait for

survey/authorization/spare parts, Sat/Sun/PH)

Appreciate your confirmation for this case.

Thank you very much.

Thank you very much.

Regards,
Jessica Shastri



Admin Executive — Insurance Claims

27A, Tanjong Penjuru

Singapore 609042

Dir: +65 6331 0691 |Fax: +65 6331 0690 | Email: jessicahs@eurokars.com.sg
Website: www.eurokarsgroup.com




