Vic (LKKAuto)
e o e e e i i

From: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sqg.cntaiping.com:

Sent: Tuesday, 17 December, 2019 11:51 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A

Cc Tan Kah Leong; Chee So Chow; Alfred Toh; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Vitesse Insurance

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE=> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBE3B08S (O
SNM19D204263C02/8) AND 5LU422% (TP ; LKK REF - CCH/CTI19016039/Aha3) on
07/09/2015

Attachments: LETTER TO OlLpdf

LKK REF - CC6/CTI19016039/Aha3
CTPIS REF - SNM19D204263C02/8(cml/tkl)

Dear Vic
You may proceed to resolve the property damage claim at 511,436.45.
We await your payment advice to enable Kah Leong to act accordingly.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh
Senior Executive
Claims Department
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079309
Email: claimsdepti@sg.cntaiping.com
alfred.toh{@sqg.cntaiping.com
W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: A ¥4 Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential
information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, eithoer in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not
the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Vic [LKKAuto) [mailte:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com)]

Sent: Tuesday, 17 December, 2019 11:26 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com=; Tan Kah Leong <KahLeong.Tan@sg.cntaiping. com>: Alfred Toh
<alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com=; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Chee So Chow
<sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com=

Subject: <SEEK MANDATE= RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBE3808S (01 : CTI - TBA) AND SLJ422X (TP :

LKK REF - CC&/CTI19016039/Aha3) on 07/09/2019

CTI REF-TBA
LKK REF - CC6/CTI19016039/Aha3

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES GBE 38085 (O1) AND S 422X (TP) ON 07/05/20159
We refer to the above matter.

It was reported that Insured vehicle had rear-ended the TP vehicle. A letter was sent out to the Insured to notify TP
claim. No feedback received till date.



In view of the above, we are of the view that liability is not to our Insured’s favour and the damages sustained to TP
vehicle were consistent to the nature of the accident.

Summary to offer to repairer VISION AUTOWORK PTE LTD is as follows:

TP CLAIMED REVISED - TO OFFER
Cost of Repair (w/gst) S 46,376.42 5 10,700.00
Loss of Rental (5180 x 7 days) S 1,260.00 5 700.00 (5100 x 7 days)
LTA / GIA Search Fee S 36.45 5 36.45
TOTAL $47,672.87 $ 11,436.45

TP VEHICLE DETAILS:

MARKET VALUE : $ 53,000.00 (est)
LTAREBATE  :$ 42,700.00 (est)
NETT VALUE  :$ 10,300.00 (est)

Breakdown of days is as follows:

Recommended Days 7 days
TOTAL 7 days

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.
For your approval and/or further instructions please.

Thank you.
"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020"

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto,com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥y LIRS Gl
Mokl - Save the Earth: Print only when necessary:

This e-mail contain canfidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipiant. Use or distibution by an
uninterided recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all atlachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereaf. Thank you.

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 15 October, 2019 2:14 PM

To: Chee So Chow

Ce: Admin A: Tan Kah Leong; Claims Dept of CTI; Alfred Toh; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBE3808S (01 : CTI - TBA) AND SLJ422X (TP : LKK REF -
CCH/CTI12016039/Aha3) on 07/09/2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE



Dear Sir/Madam,
We refer to the above matter.
Enclosed for your perusal are the following:

- Estimated cost of repair
. Preliminary advice

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8(408033)

T "
ELITER SN Sgue the Lorth- Print onle when necessary’

This e-mail cantain confidential and privileged material, and are far the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any coples thereof, Thank you.

From: Chee So Chow [mailto:sochow.chee @sg.cntaiping.com]

sent: Wednesday, 18 September, 2019 9:32 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Cc: C5 A Team; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); Tan Kah Leong

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBE38085 (Ol : CTI - TBA) AND SU422X (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/CTI19016039/Aha3) on 07/09/2019

Dear Mei Kwan
Please see attached insured’s SAS report

Regards

Chee So Chow (Ms)
Deputy Manager
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

Direct (65) 6389 6176

Fax (65)6224 7175/6224 7478

Email : claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com

Website:www.sg.cnlaiping.com

Disclaimer
This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) FPre. Lid, except
where provided for in a written agreement hevween you and China Taiping Inswrance (Singapore) Pre. Led. Any unauthorized



diselosure, use or dissembnation, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If vou are not the intended recipient of the message,
please notify the sender immediately.

Erom: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@kkauto.com]

sent; Monday, September 16, 2019 3:19 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Ce: CS A Team <cs-a@|kkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBE3808S (Ol ; CTI - TBA) AND SLJ422X (TP : LKK REF -
CCB/CTI19016039/Aha3) on 07/09/201%

W T ¢
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle SL] 422X at M/s Vision Autowork Pte Ltd - Kaki Bukit on a WP basis and TP
repairer proposed for a direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP GIA report

Please be informed that the estimated cost of repair is not ready yet.

We will revert to you on preliminary advice in due course.

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured'’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Vic and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2096.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank vou.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@l|kkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www symanteccloud.com




VISION AUTOWORK PTE. LTD.

8 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 4, #08-09, PREMIER @ KAKI BUKIT, S'PORE 415875
Tel: 6341 6789 Fax: 6341 6778
Co. Reg. No: : 201500371E

Letter of Demand

Re : Accident involving my vehicle no. SLT1422X  and vehicle no.
((BE3ECES  on Mes [in at  /o$ HRS PM/AM along

wed fu ! i V@t TOrT oy csued M rmmsd

We refer to the above matter.

Attached copies of the following for your kind perusal :

Vehicle Repair cost / Exeess § (OO
Vehicle Rental Fee for 7/ days @ .
$/E0-CT per day § 260
Loss of use for - days (@

§ ~ perday h) &

Police search-fee/police report fee/LTA search fees $ ol
Others = 3ref perty GIR Refort $ 7

T(}t&l ; $ j 4 | 4 i-

Yours faithfully, _—
ABBY —

HP : 9856 4815
E-mail: visionautowork@gmail.com



Aut
! !{ !- Cf;i'-..-irunfs
i B A Ik Pie Lid

1 UREAYVE 1 #01-25 PAYA UM INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPURE J08958 TEL : (0651 62563501 1 AX :iI0S) A25nd 315

Our Ref: CC6/CTITI9016039/Aha3
02 OCTOBER 2019

OBEDIENCE BY POST & BY EMAIL
3014 UBI ROAD 1

#04-280 KAMPONG UBI INDUSTRIAL ESTATE

SINGAPORE 408702

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVYING GBE 38085 AND SLJ 422X ON 07/0%/2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pie Lid to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under
the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

We have received a claim from Body Repairer/Workshop acting on behalf of the owner
of SLJ 422X against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report, accident scenario and evidence at hand, liability is down
against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the
Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours fa}'II{f:Ll]ly.

Fi
F

/ ,;
%c Alpeh
ID: 6841 2096

FAX: 674] 4108
Email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com

c.c.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)
evencyr @ gmail com
{Email)




Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuUtD)

Sent: Wednesday, 2 October, 2019 10:37 AM

To: evencyv@gmail.com

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: Your Ref: GBE 38085 - ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE 38085 AND SLI 422X ON
07/09/2019

I

i)

Consullants
Pre Lig

7

S1UBIAVE L #01-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : {631 62563561 FAXN a3 62564315

Our Ref: CC6/CTI19016039/Aha3
02 OCTOBER 2019

OBEDIENCE BY POST & BY EMAIL

3014 UBI ROAD 1
#04-280 KAMPONG UBI INDUSTRIAL ESTATE
SINGAPORE 408702

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE 38085 AND SLJ 422X ON 07/09/2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the
claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

We have received a claim from Body Repairer/Workshop acting on behalf of the owner of SLJ 422X against your motor
insurance policy.

Based on the accident report, accident scenario and evidence at hand, liability is down against us. We will therefore
proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further gueries.

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)

¥y RIrS

SesRER NN Save the Earthe Print only when necessary



This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law, If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do nat
read this e-mail or any attached items, Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.



VISION AUTOWORK PTE. LTD.
8 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 4, #08-09, PREMIER @ KAKI BUKIT, S'PORE 415875

Tel: 6341 6789 Fax: 63416778
Co. Reg. No, : 201500371E

Letter of Authorisation & Indeminity

Accident Involving Vehicle no, J ALy and 101 ) oon

At

I IN-’:, I;hl: owner of vehicle o, 0% hersby  instrect  and  awthorize
' f (“the workshop”) to commence repairs to the said
v:hml: Fmdmg :She autcoms ufnr_-,-.-'um claim against the third party, Uwe forthwith pay you the sum of

§ being refundable deposit of the repair to my/our said vehicle.

2. Your are further authorized to appoint solicitors on my/our behalf and give the solicitors full instructions
as if the appointment is made and instructions are given by mefus with respect to the conduct of myfour
claim against the third party driver and/or his insurers including if necessary, to commence legal
proceedings in court in my/our name against the third party.

3. You have mylour full authority to instruet my/our solicitors to negotiate a setlement with the third party
and/er his insurers on such terms es you deem fit

4. Upon resolving myfour claim, you are authorized to agres with my/our solicitors on the amount of their
professional costs and disbursement for acting for mefus and 1o receive payment of the balance of the
settlement sum on my/our behalf directly into your account. In the event that my/our claim or legal costs
of the third party as well as the professional costs and disbursements of myfour solicitors
notwithstanding that my/our solicitors were appointed by you on our behalf.

5. Llwe also hereby instruct and authorize you deduct directly from the claim monies received from the
third party all cutstanding balances that are still owing o you, namely the balance of repair costs and
rental of substitute vehicles.

6. In the event that Ifwe am/ere required to attend st myfour solicitors office or to attend court in
connection with my/our claim, L'we shall render full co-operation.

7. Inthe event that my/our claim against the third party and/or his insurers is not successful or cannot be
procesded with and/or if any Judgement or settlement is not honoured or setisfied by the third party, Uwe
authorise you to revert the claim against my/our own insurers for the cost of repairs and any other losses
recoverable under my/our policy of insurance. In this respect, l'we understand and accept that the excess
amount applicable under policy of insurance shall be bomne by mefus.

8. Iffor whatever reasons, my/four insurers reject my/our claim for indemnity for the cost of repairs andfor
any other losses recoverable under the policy of insurance or meke en offer to pay less than the amount
claimed by you, l'we agree and undertake to pey the full amount of your repair bill and survey fees and
any other expenses reasonably incurred on myfour behalf or to pey you the difference in amount, as the
case may be,

9. Lfwe shell keep you informed of any correspondences andior summons thet | may receive due to this
aclion egreeing to pay or receive any monies due to this claim.

Dated this o) day of 20 0
| ! I .
v !
Signatire of vehicle owneri- s B <:—' i
kY | ks
MName - ! J O ] Witnessed by :

IC KMo a oL & 14 I V)
{Cump:my stamp, if appll:ab[n:] |

Address: DK 214 Sesangor




Vic "My execution of this Discharge
Voucher is only for my claim

for property damage and not
prejudicial to any other claims"

Policy Mo : DMCVSH15523318C3 claim No : SNM19DZ04263C02/8 (eml/ukl)
Claimant ¢ CHHG YONG S00H

Amount : 8511,4365.435
SINCAPORE DOLLARS ELEVEN THOUSAND FOUR HUNDRED THIRTY SIX
AMD CENTS FORTY FIVE ONWLY

I/We agree to accept the above mentioned ampunt Lo be paid te mefus in full &
final settlement of all claims, costs & disbursements for injuries / damages
sustained by me/us through an accident invelving

Claimant Vehicle Mo. : S5LJ 422K

Insured Vehicle Ho. : GBE 3BOBS

Date of Loss s 07/09/2019

Flace of Accident « JUNCTION OF UEPER SERANGOON ROAD AND UPPER ALJUNIED ROAD

IN CONSIDERATION of the payment made to mefus of the aforementicned sum by
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD., I/We agres absolutely to
discharge CHINA TAIPING IMSURANCE (STNGAFORE) PTE. LTD. and/for

Insured HName : CBEDIENCE
Driver Name ; CHIM YEE VUN
from all claims, presest or Zuture in respect of all loss, injury or damage

sustained by mefus arising out of the said accident.

1 acknowledge that this payment is made without admission of liability on the
part of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (8INGAPORE) PTE. LTD.

{1) General Damages 55
(2} Coat of Repair/Excess g5 10,700.00
(3] Loss of Use/Rental/Earning 5% 700.00
(4} GLA/Police Reports/
Investigation Results/Search Fees 55 36.45
(5} Medical Reports/Expenses S5
(€} Survey Fees/P.T. Fees 53
{7} Cost inecluding Disbursement 58
TOTEL m owe om om0 a0 s; #0 w 436.4%

Claimant MName : NRIC Ho

Cfo ]| g0 H
Slgnature E M Date ' r'lr ! bl

] \J o

Chng ﬁt‘-”fq > o) - S168Yd T4 &




VISION AUTOWORK PTE.LTD.

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4,
#08-09 Premier (@ Kaki Bukit,

Singapore 415875 TAX INVOICE

Tel : 6341 6789
Fax : 6341 6778

Invoice # : 00000939
Date : 27.10.19

ROC/ GST REG NO.: 201500371E
Email : visionautowork@gmail.com

Vehicle No : S|J422X

Bill To:
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD
3 ANSON ROAD
#16-00 SPRINGLEAF TOWER
SINGAPORE 079908
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
Carry out lump sum repair on accident vehicle corresponding to $ 10,000.00
supply of spare parts, labour and spray painting charges
Sub Total| § 10,000.00
Add GST 7% | & 700.00
Total Amount | § 10,700.00

PAYMENT BY CHEQUE SHOULD BE CROSSED AND MADE PAYABLE TO
'VISION AUTOWORK PTE.LTD.

PLEASE INDICATE THE INVOICE NO ON THE REVERSE SIDE

Issued By :

ABBY

Authorised Signature




Dynamic Rent A Car Pte.Ltd.

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, #08-09 Premier@Kaki Bukit

Singapore 415875
Tel : 63416789 Fax: 6341 6778
ROC No.: 201627936K

To: CHNG YONG SOON

TAX INVOICE

Invoice No.

: DR1909-0117

BLK 212 SERANGOON AVENUE 4 Date : 16.09.19
#15-52 Vehicle No. - SMD3457X
SINGAPORE 550212 Vehile Model: : MERCEDES
BEMNZ CLA1B0D
DESCRIPTION NO. OF DAYS RATE AMOUNT
RENTAL FROM 7 180.00| $ 1,260.00
07/09/2019 - 14/09/2019
YOUR REF: SLJ 422X
TOTAL:| $ 1,260.00

Payment by cheque should be crossed and made payable to 'Dynamic Rent A Car Pte.Ltd.’

This is computer generated document.
No signature is reguired.




RAPID RENTAL PTE. LTD.

8 KAK| BUKIT AVENUE 4 #08-09 PREMIER @ KAK| BUKIT SINGAPORE 415875

ROC:201627936K

VRANO:_DRITUT =00 4

VEHICLE RENTAL AGREEMENT

HIRER'S PARTICULARS

Hirer's Own Vehicle No:

Driving License No: Passed Date;

Name (as in Ifc): L hng Yo ne G Loan Vehiclea No: 3 1) 3 4e5 3«
NRIC/Passpart No: o | LS 19 E pate of Birth: L PLINIES  InMake & Model: 12/ /.
Address; LIS 21X Ser ) Wi pgm: T4 CHARGES 5 cts
4 4 P s 5! -_)__|Daily T day @S 101 Perday
Name & Address of Employer; Weekly day @5 Per week
Monthly day @5 Per month
Occupation; Driving Exp: Others
Driving License No: Passed Date: CDWS/PAI
D/L Type: Local/Int'| /Others: Delivery/Collection Svc
Tel: (H/P} {O)
DR R'S PAR AR SUB-TOTAL t 2L -
Name (as in 1/C): : Bl T auT [ Tializlval 7
MRIC/Passport Na: Date of Birth: 8 [ J
Address: Age: siiethings N £ lasazlar] F
5 =
Occupation: Driving Exp: =

C/L Type: Lacal fint'l/Others:

Tel: (H/P) (]

EXCESS : Section (1) $2,500.00
Section (2) $2,500.00

Hirer's 5ig nature:

Additional Hirer's Signature:

INDICATE:
A= At
O - Dhrraiy

5§ - Reaaactier
X CiaEk

I have read and agree to the terms and condition on both sides of this agreement. If | have presented a charge for payment. | agree that all amounts payable under
this agreement and for parking and traffic infringements may be billed to that account and my signature above will be considersd to have been made on the charge
woucher. 8ll information | have been glven RAPID RENTAL PTE. LTD. in connaction with this agreement is true,

IMPORTANT

L. The Hirer and the authorized driver must be ower 25 years of age and under
55 years of ages and be helding valid driving Beenses and have 2 menimuem of 2
years regular ang qualified driving sxserience, Failure to observe stipulation may
retwe all damages costs to be borne by the Hirer/the Autharized Driver

2. All vehicles are suppliisd with petrad ind should returred with petro! leve
lleewise. & service charge of 55 on bop of petrol surcharge i payatle by the hirer
should he fail to return the vebicle at line aporopriate petrol level

3, Mo refund for early return of wekicie. The hirer shall be lisble for sdditional
charges for ary |ate return at the rate shown per hour per day, inclusive of COW
and/or PAl where spplicabie. Any returns after cur operation rours will be
charged a: a full day rental

&, Liss of the wehicle for llegal purpose (for instance: in conmection with thafs
drug peddiing or trafficking, srruggling] is strictly prahitited,

5. Wehicle strictly for Singapore use only and may not driven out of Sn gEpare
without prigr written condent of RAMD RENTAL FTE LD, The F
penalty fee of S2000in additicnal 1o sapregriate insurance top us in the case of
ran-gisciosure of Malaytia wape

& The hirer and/or driver shali be responsible for 31l dame Bes or Iosses
nowsoever caused, all traffic violatsons, fires and penalties imposed on the
wehicie for whatspever reason f setpect of orin BEtion with e use o
operation

1. The hirer and/or griver shail be resEOnEiDie for sl claims, dameges

ré&r s llable for s

|Oi%es, INCreased INSUrants Sremisms, non-wialver exceis and cost eperses {including lemal costm
on full indemnity basis), whatioever and howsoever brought agalnst; suflered or incurred by you in
respect of the wehiche or the use or the operation of the vehicle, Eull sxcess amsunt have to pay
imrediately in the event of an eccadent, The cwner recerve the rght rot to replace an
repfacement wehicle if an accident oceurred, Ary darmages 1o the cer will Be repslr st BAPID
AENTAL PTE. LTD. authorites workshop.

8. Smoke or permit smoking and tansport of Cets in the wehicls are nat aliowed. Any offent e
srrell &.g. cigarerte, durlan o per's smell, the héver andlar driver shall bear the eott of reme wing
the offensive smell ar pet's halr between 5200 - 5400

9, The Hirer ggrees That & punciured Tyre, empty petral tank, losrof vehicle's ey or lached keys
irsigie ol vehicle by itse'f, ooes mot conatitute a breakdown and that in event the awner's 24-Hewry
Emergency Secvices i called uoon 1 respand to such coourrence, the Mirer shall beas eost of such
rEEpOnsas &1 5150 per trip

1GU0In case of aecident, the hirer shall repart to renmi office immediately, &n soeidert rgport must
be rade within J4hours. Failure to comply, the hiter will kave to borme 8l lisbiliy from all cartes
ciaim. Full escess amaount hive to be pald immedisrely in the svent of an gocidert

11 The Rirer andfor driver alic have the resoonsibillty (o ensure that the radator water level in
the car i sufficient end do not drive when the venicle s st ang 30t nat have pulfisient weter.
Ary demage to the engine will be bear by the hirer/driver.

11 AR custormers’ date will kept stricthy confidential anc bs scley used for the purpose of

comaleting the seles ransacsion and othes relating matmers

2 lunderstand arc agresd 1o personsl date collection sraterment stated on the Term and
Canditons page

Date / Time OUT Mileage Check By Remark
I \ Prald#389 ey, Winar's/Driver Signature
Date / Time IN Mileage Check By Remark TAN
b o {1 y B [len [ 15T¢ h-.-e-rhl'l'_vwf:i'l_‘ill,.rre.. r




GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raffles Quay #18.-00. Si 048580
INSURANCE F'hv::ane:E iﬁﬁu§£24 oo1o F;:?igtﬁlrgzﬂ 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 8am to Spm
, G3T Registration Na: Ma0001 7735

TAX INVOICE

Our Ref No: GR-18-148637
Date of Reguest: 10/0%9/2019 Your Ref No: VUALK IN LI

VISION AUTOWORK PTE LTD
B KAKI BUKIT AVE 4, #08-09 PREMIER @& KAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE 415875

Dear SirfMadam,
Your Vehicle Mao: SLJ422%
Date of Accident; 07092019

Place of Accident: UPF SERANGOON RD
Involving Vehicle No:  GBE3808%5

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S8) —]
E-File Search Fee (Public) 1402/
GST Amount 0.98!
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) . 15.00/
Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature

For GIARMC Official use
Date
[1 GIRD [X] Cash[] Cheque



GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singa 048580
INSURANC E F‘hcne:eiﬁﬁ 6224 0010 F;x?*goﬁrgzztl 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to S5pm
W - e e GST Registration No: M400017735

ROS MANAGERE!
ROS MANKAGEMEN

TAX INVOICE

Our Ref No; GR-19-143638
Date of Request: 100092019 Your Ref No: WALK IN LI

VISION AUTOWORK PTE LTD
B KAKI BUKIT AVE 4., #08-03 FREMIER @ KAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE 415875

Dear SirfMadam,

Date of Accident: 07/0%2019

Vehicle No: SL422x%

Place of Accident: JUNC OF UPP SERANGOON RD & UPP ALJUNIED RD

Invelving Vehicle No: GBE3808S

With reference to your application for the accident report, we have attached the following accident reports as requested:

DOCUMENTS :ACCIDENT LOCATION PER DOC (S$) QTY |AMOUNT (5%)

GBE3808S |JLJN£: OF UPP SERANGOON RD & UPP ALJUNIED RD 14.00 1 13.08
GST Amount - 0.82
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 14.00

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General Insurance
Association of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whalsoever for
any loss or damage arising out of or in connection with the reports or their images.

Thank You.

This is 2 computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[ 1 GIRO [X] Cash [ ] Cheque



T narng Rasaint

» Back to OneMotoring

Lard Transpon Authodily

A0 Sin Ming Drive

Singapore ST5701

G5T Registrabion Ma. W4 -D0EE23-2

Prnt DataTima - 07 Sep 2019/ 16:1&:37
Recept Date/Time ;07 Sep 2019/ 16:18:37

Tax Invoice/Receipt
Rpcept No. TNET-DDOG-190807-001423
Brevious Recept Mo
S/ Mem Description/ Amount
Business Transaction Reference Bafore
No. GST (85)

Rasul of Insurance Enguiry - GBE3B08S
As al 0T Sep 201810:50:00
Ineurance Co; CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE | SINGAPORE) FTE LTD
1 psurance Enquiry - GEEIB0ES
Enquiry Fee 7.00
20100807181 B022IB624
Sub-Total 700
Total Before Rounding 700
Rounding Differance
Tatal Amount Payabie

Pad By
Cragit Card:
A visaMasterCand

Total

Casn Change

Tandared AMount

Excass Refundatle Amounl

THANK YO AND HAVE & NICE DAY!

G&T Amount
Amount  After GST
(5%} (5%)
fae 745
045 748
0.48 748
0

745

745

TAS

200

745

1.0

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are goed and promptly settled by the payment service
provider [ financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considercd void and late fee

may apply.
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