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Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: Donald Toh <donald.toh@meridianportagencies.com>
Sent: Monday, 14 October 2019 10:05 AM
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLK 323T AND SMC 4527B ON 02/09/2019 ALONG/ AT 

TELOK AYER STREET PARALLEL PARKING IN FRONT SHOP
Attachments: Mutual Settlement Form_AIG (SLK323T-SMC4527B).pdf; Mutual settlement 

cheques.pdf

Dear Carlor, 
 
Sorry for this late reply as I had been away from office for a week. 
 
Attached please find the Mutual Settlement Form that I had signed on my part together with the two cheques which 
will be mailed to LKK Auto Consultants. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards, 
Toh Peng Huat 
Owner of SLK323T 
Office: (65) 6594 2360 
Mobile: (65) 9179 2591 
 

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) [mailto:JiaLe@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, 1 October 2019 5:12 PM 
To: Donald Toh 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLK 323T AND SMC 4527B ON 02/09/2019 ALONG/ AT TELOK AYER STREET 
PARALLEL PARKING IN FRONT SHOP 
 
Dear Mr Toh, 
 
We attached herewith the private settlement form for you to sign. 
 
Please issue the following 2 cheques: 
 
1.            $ 800.00 payable to LIM SHAN WEN 
 
2.            $ 342.40 payable to LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD 
 
You may send your payment by post to: 
 
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD 
51 Ubi Avenue 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park 
Singapore 408933 
 
With the following attachments: 
 
1.            your cheque payment. 
2.            the signed private settlement letter to protect your No Claim Discount (NCD). 
 
Kindly call the undersigned should your need further assistance. 
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Best Regards, 

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto)  
Sent: Monday, 30 September 2019 5:25 PM 
To: Donald Toh 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLK 323T AND SMC 4527B ON 02/09/2019 ALONG/ AT TELOK AYER STREET 
PARALLEL PARKING IN FRONT SHOP 
 
Dear Mr Donald, 
 
As per our tele-conversation earlier, we will inform Third Party that you would like to settle at global sum of 
$800.00(all-in). We will update to you once they have accept the amount. 
 
Thank you. 
 

Best Regards, 

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto)  
Sent: Tuesday, 24 September 2019 4:00 PM 
To: Donald Toh 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLK 323T AND SMC 4527B ON 02/09/2019 ALONG/ AT TELOK AYER STREET 
PARALLEL PARKING IN FRONT SHOP 
 
Dear Mr Donald, 
 
We have spoke to Third Party claimant, they would like to settle at global sum of $1,000.00 all-in(included cost of 
repair & loss of use). Please let me know if you agree to settle. 
 
Please note that we will charge our survey fee at $342.40(w/GST) if you proceed  with private settlement. 
 
Thank you. 
 

Best Regards, 

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

From: Donald Toh [mailto:donald.toh@meridianportagencies.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, 18 September 2019 10:05 AM 
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto) 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLK 323T AND SMC 4527B ON 02/09/2019 ALONG/ AT TELOK AYER STREET 
PARALLEL PARKING IN FRONT SHOP 
 
Dear Jia Le, 
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Many thanks your email with the cost of repair and as spoken, I wish to proceed with private settlement not 
involving my car insurance in this case.  So please advise how shall I go about it and who should I issue the cheque 
payment to. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Toh Peng Huat 
Owner of SLK323T 
Office: (65) 6594 2360 
Mobile: (65) 9179 2591 
 

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) [mailto:JiaLe@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, 17 September 2019 12:46 PM 
To: Donald Toh 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLK 323T AND SMC 4527B ON 02/09/2019 ALONG/ AT TELOK AYER STREET 
PARALLEL PARKING IN FRONT SHOP 
 
Dear Mr Donald, 
 
Our surveyor has finalized the Cost of Repair at $380.00 to the claimant’s vehicle. They did not replace any parts and 
it’s only labour for remove and refit parts and spray paint on the affected areas.  
 
We attached some inspection photos taken by our surveyor for your reference. 
 
Kindly lodge the GIA report as soon as possible if you has yet to lodge. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 

Best Regards, 

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

From: Donald Toh [mailto:donald.toh@meridianportagencies.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, 17 September 2019 11:10 AM 
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto) 
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLK 323T AND SMC 4527B ON 02/09/2019 ALONG/ AT TELOK AYER STREET PARALLEL 
PARKING IN FRONT SHOP 
 
Dear Carlor, 
 
This is to acknowledge receipt of your letter CC6/AIG19016004/Ubd3 pertaining to the subject matter. 
 
As spoken earlier, my car did came into contact with a parked vehicle whilst reserve parking at Telok Ayer Street. I 
came out to check and found that there is no apparent damage to both vehicle then I realise that both cars are not 
in a designated parking lot but instead in a coach bay. After waited for a while, I drove off to find a legit parking lot 
and since there is no damages to both vehicle, I did not make any report as such. 
 
Interesting to know what are damage claim been lodged against my car insurance which please provide for 
consideration of amicable settlement. 
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Thank you. 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Toh Peng Huat 
Owner of SLK323T 
Office: (65) 6594 2360 
Mobile: (65) 9179 2591 


