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Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com

Sent: Monday, 17 August 2020 11:08 am

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: SGW 4473M DOA - 07/09/2019 FINALIZE

Dear Shirley, 

 

We accept your finalisation at $4,800 & 7 days. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Best regards, 

Jake Wee 

Autoworx House  

No.176 Sin Ming Drive 

#02-01 Singapore 575721 

Tel: 64528211 

Fax: 64517423 

 

 

 

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Monday, 11 November 2019 3:28 pm 

To: claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com 

Subject: RE: SGW 4473M DOA - 07/09/2019 FINALIZE 

 

Hi Ms. Lee, 

 

Repair limit $ 4,800.00 

 

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
 

From: claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com <claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com>  

Sent: Monday, 11 November 2019 3:26 pm 

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: SGW 4473M DOA - 07/09/2019 FINALIZE 

 

Dear Shirley, 

 

Based on the marked estimate and our calculation, the Lump Sum should be $5700. 
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Thank you. 

 

 

Best regards, 

Ms. Lee 

Autoworx House 

No.176 Sin Ming Drive 

#02-01 Singapore 575721 

Tel: 96725547 / 87668115 

Fax: 64517423 

 

 

 

 

 

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Friday, November 8, 2019 5:01 PM 

To: admin@supreme.sg 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: SGW 4473M DOA - 07/09/2019 FINALIZE 

 

Hi Winnie, 
 
Please confirm final fig of $ 4,800.00 (lump sum) @ 7 days of repairs before GST. 
 

 

 

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
 


