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RE: Acc involving SJC2452G & SKS642S along junc of Jalan Jurong Kechil and Upper Bt Timah Road on 21 May 2015 - AIG ref: 9685409974SG-003 *** LKK REF:

From: Parthiban, Theerthan

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto), Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Gavallu, Nishalini, Mohd Rizal, Nur Mariah Huibrechts, Lim, Sheng Yang, Kaur, Baljit, Admin A
Sent: Tuesday, 23 July, 2019 10:52:50 AM

Hi Mei Kwan,

We have received LOD from TP in 2016

You may increase the offer as it seems that Ol was trying to go straight in a turn right only lane based on the TP’s video footage

Kindly assist

Thank you

Regards,

Theerthan R Parthiban (Troy)

AIG

Senior Claims Examiner, Auto

Singapore Claims Operations IAIG Shared Services

Theerthan.Parthiban@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by

"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into

which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by AIG for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, July 12, 2019 5:47 PM
To: Parthiban, Theerthan <Theerthan.Parthiban@aig.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Gavallu, Nishalini <Nishalini.Gavallu@aig.com>; Mohd Rizal, Nur Mariah Huibrechts <NurMariahHuibrechts.MohdRizal @aig.com>; Lim, Sheng Yang

<ShengYang.Lim@aig.com>; Kaur, Baljit <Baljit.Kaur@aig.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: Acc involving SJC2452G & SKS642S along junc of Jalan Jurong Kechil and Upper Bt Timah Road on 21 May 2015 - AlG ref: 96854099745G-003 *** LKK REF:

CC6/AIG15009142
This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

TP video has been uploaded in Merimen.

Kindly send back our report and let us have your further instruction..

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email:Meikwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 8 July, 2019 8:16 PM
To: Parthiban, Theerthan <Theerthan.Parthiban@aig.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Gavallu, Nishalini <Nishalini.Gavallu@aig.com>; Mohd Rizal, Nur Mariah Huibrechts <NurMariahHuibrechts.MohdRizal@aig.com>; Lim, Sheng Yang

<ShengYang.Lim@aig.com>; Kaur, Baljit <Baljit.Kaur@aig.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Acc involving SJC2452G & SKS642S along junc of Jalan Jurong Kechil and Upper Bt Timah Road on 21 May 2015 - AIG ref: 9685409974SG-003 *** LKK REF:

CC6/AIG15009142

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for your email.
Kindly advise:-

¢ whether TP has submitted LOD to AIG
¢ whether we can increase offer or maintain 50%

Meanwhile, we will request evidence / LOD from TP.

https://securemail2.aig.com/securercader/read.jsf

9/9/2019
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Hi Vic,
Please follow up.
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email:Meikwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Parthiban, Theerthan

Sent: Mon, 17 Jun 2019 08:35:08 +0000

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Gavallu, Nishalini, Mohd Rizal, Nur Mariah Huibrechts, Lim, Sheng Yang, Kaur, Baljit, Admin A

Subject: Acc involving SJC2452G & SKS642S along junc of Jalan Jurong Kechil and Upper Bt Timah Road on 21 May 2015 - AIG ref: 9685409974SG-003

Hi Vic,

I have spoken to Joey a while ago regarding the reopening of the mentioned claim as | believe previous handler Zayyer is no longer with LKK - refer attachment and email
below

Kindly assist to contact TP as they would like to re-negotiate on the TP settlement

Please let us know if the case needs to be reopened in Merimen

Thank you

Regards,

Theerthan R Parthiban (Troy)

AIG

Senior Claims Examiner, Auto

Singapore Claims Operations IAIG Shared Services

Theerthan.Parthiban@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by AIG for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.
From:margaret@kkimhin.com.sg [mailto:margaret@kkimhin.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, June 12, 2019 4:31 PM

To: AIG SGP, Claims-Survey

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Acc involving SJC2452G & SKS642S along junc of Jalan Jurong Kechil and Upper Bt Timah Road on 21 May 2015

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

Our Ref: 150364/05

Dear Sirs,

We are writing to you for your assistance in the abovementioned claim.

LKK advised that the OIC is no longer with them and that the file has been closed. Could you kindly advise who is the AIG OIC of this case so that we can liaise with.
We have been offered 50% for this claim which we have rejected. Enclosed are correspondence with LKK for your reference.

We look forward to hearing from you.

Tks &regards

Margaret

K. Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd.

From: Parthiban, Theerthan <Theerthan.Parthiban@aig.com>

Sent: Monday, 17 June, 2019 4:35 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@l|kkauto.com>

Cc: Gavallu, Nishalini <Nishalini.Gavallu@aig.com>; Mohd Rizal, Nur Mariah Huibrechts <NurMariahHuibrechts.MohdRizal@aig.com>; Lim, Sheng Yang

<ShengYang.Lim@aig.com>; Kaur, Baljit <Baljit.Kaur@aig.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Acc involving SIC2452G & SKS642S along junc of Jalan Jurong Kechil and Upper Bt Timah Road on 21 May 2015 - AIG ref: 96854099745SG-003

AIG J <Y

This is a secure, encrypted message. To read it, open the
attachment.

Este es un mensaje cifrado y seguro. Para leerlo, abra el archivo
adjunto.

Esta é uma mensagem criptografada segura. Para |é-lo, abra o
anexo.

Ceci est une sécurité, un message crypté. Pour le lire, ouvrez la
piece jointe.

ChIBBESIEENLEBFA—ILTY., BEICEFHTI7MIL
ERVNTSESL,

Click here by 2019-06-24 03:35 CDT to read your message.
After that, open the attachment.

More Info

https://securemail2.aig.com/securercader/read.jsf 9/9/2019
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Disclaimer: This email and its content are confidential and intended solely for the use of the
addressee. Please notify the sender if you have received this email in error or simply delete

it.

Secured by Proofpoint Encryption, Copyright © 2009-2017 Proofpoint, Inc. All rights

reserved.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American
International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

https://securemail2.aig.com/securercader/read.jsf 9/9/2019



