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MIRPERFORMANCE

Pte Ltd Cechia S
CO. REG 2005126062 GST REG 20-0512606-2
INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PTE LTD ™~ F wz ESTIMATE  :TP19010
64, Cecil Street (0 Date : :04/09/20189
#04 / #05 , 10B Building Al < Ref No: 5JD 9193 C
Singapore 049711 ;), - Policy No.:

Bage 01
RE : VEHICLE NO. $JD9193C HONDA FIT g/[ S/E 1, /,l«fg, urt
' ¥
laty Description / Unit Price . Amount
1 REAR BUMPER £6¢. 30 be (T 50 —

2 REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER RH/LH

$38.80 oL/ $77.60 12¢

2 REAR BUMPER BRACKET RH /LH $2480 =" sqg,:g(
1 TAILLAMP R.H. 4 $396.80 y/
SUB TOTAL $1,366.50
LESS 20% $273.30
TOTAL (1) $1,093.20
SPECIAL NETT ITEM
1 REAR BUMPER CLIPS (SET) AL ohs00
1 REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR (SET) 11 530000 X
TOTAL (2) B 534=5.nu
LABOUR
TO CHECKS WIRING & LIGHTING 27 510000
TO REMOVE & REFIX REVERSE SENSOR O 515000
TO PANEL BEATING 2pp $700.00
TO SPRAY PAINTING ? 20 $750.00
LABOUR CHARGES $1,700.00
TOTAL SPARE PARTS & LABOUR C ATGER 1o Cone - henmm“h $3,138.20
e heparer l:li' fne rn‘InFmg B .
» { . 1 g rq rin
. ng
Whcabhpmia 1 iraes
{ T (s, mackd b mﬁpp&’
| i i |
';L.sw.smr FAX  £844 1233

53 UBI AVENUE 1, w01-08 PAYA UBI |N1m1mwﬁﬂgpnim&ian






IVIRFPERFORMANCE
- Pte Ltd
CO. REG 2005126067 GST REG 20-0512606-Z

Nﬂ/ W

INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PTE LTD w ESTIMATE  :TP19010
B4 | Cecll Street _(‘D Date : :04/09/2019
#04 / #05 , |OB Building Al < Ref No : 'SID 9193 C
Singapore 049711 9’ - Policy No.:
Page 101
RE : VEHICLE NO. SJD9193C HONDA EIT / J/ 3/” q m {4
'ﬁq&' P
laty Description / Unit Price _ Amount |
1 REAR BUMPER £66- 30 be (Tra 584250 —
2 REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER RH/LH 538.80 Ofits/ $77.60 (2
2 REAR BUMPER BRACKET RH /LH 52480 7T $495
1 TAILLAMP R.H. “a 9396 &
SUB TOTAL $1,366.50
LESS 20% $273.30
TOTAL (1) $1,093.20
SPECIAL NETT ITEM
1 REAR BUMPER CLIPS (SET) AL 500
1 REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR (SET) 11 $300.00 X
TOTAL (2) $345.00
LABOUR
TO CHECKS WIRING & LIGHTING 20  $100.00
TO REMOVE & REFIX REVERSE SENSOR D 515000
TO PANEL BEATING 20y $700.00
TO SPRAY PAINTING 225 $750.00
LABOUR CHARGES $1,700.00
TOTAL SPARE PARTS & LABOUR cr‘ﬂmﬁ_ 10 Consyltants hancs nar $3,138.20
| o et | |
& jn
| _,..-I"'"-
UK
(n8f0f

!
53 LRI AVENUE 1, 801-08 PATA UBI -uTumm-nmmwma LH EET

TEL-6B44 3733 FAX: 6844 1233
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> Back to OneMotoring

PARFINNF Rehsis Famir

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner |D:
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model;

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

PGP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:
Message

Business
074X

SJD9193C

No

17 Sep 2019
HONDA
FIT13GA
Black

2008
L13A4047548
GE61043595
73.0kW (97 bhp)
$12,631.00
0% Apr 2008
09 Apr 2008

5

$12,631.00

Forfeited

$0.00

08 Apr 2023

A - Car (1600cc & below)
5

$19,328.00

$13,760.00

$13,760.00

Please note that the 5-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be de-
registered upon COE expiry or when the vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if applicable), whichever

is earlier.

The information contained herein is correct as at 17 Sep 2019

IR IR, gy, SO/RNTFBCIIDN angUIne e DaTe by U DI Co S IOraLaragIMpul FF UM | RPN _ I U suayuy i |

1w



~ Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments;

Dear Sir / Mdm,

Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle 5/D9193C and let us have your report urgently.

Motar Claim - lll <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Wednesday, 4 September 2019 4:16 PM

Ng Cheng Choon; 'sur@lkkauto.com’; Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sherini Fillai

RE: T/P SJD9193C

IMG_6236.jpg; ATTO0001.txt; IMG_6237 jpg; ATTO0002.txt; IMG_6238 jpa;
ATTOD003 txt; IMG_6239 jpg; ATTO0004 txt; IMG_6240.jpg; ATT00005.txt; IMG_

6241.jpg; ATTO0006.
e " 1015am@ 511 )14
WvN|
Mk N3

This claim will be handled by Ms Sherini.

*Kindly upload this survey request emalil to merimen.

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee

B4 Cecil Street; #05 - 0B Building
Singapore 049711
Tel: 8347 6100, Ext— 248

----- Original Message-—

From: Ng Cheng Choon [mailto:choon@mb-performance.com]
Sent: 04 September, 2019 2:28 PM
To: Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim @iii.com.sg>

Subject: Re: T/P SJD9193C

Hi,Gabriel

We choose L k k.

Regards,

Ng Cheng Choon

96319168

(WhatsApp WeChat)

> 201959848. T42:02. Motor Claim - Ill <motorclaim@iii.com.sg> B -

>

> Dear Sir / Mdm,

>

> We acknowledge receipt of your email.

>



> We proprose using one of the following motor surveyors:

o

> * LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

> * \ficom Assessment Centre Pte Ltd

>

> Please notify us within 02 days of receipt of this letter for surveyor agreed on or if you have any objections to the
above list.

>

>

> Best Regards,

> Gabriel Wee

=

>

> B4 Cecil Street; #05 - 10B Building
> Singapore 049711

> Tel: 6347 6100, Ext - 248
>

>

> -—0riginal Message——

> From: Ng Cheng Choon [mailto:choon@mb-performance.com)

> Sent: 04 September, 2019 12:15 PM

> To: Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim @iii.com.sg>

> Subject: T/P 5JD9183C

>

> Your Ref: SHB612P

> Attn: Motor claims dept

> Dear Sir/Mdm,

>Pleasesent LBSoR LK K oR Fta

> Thank you

>

> Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using, disclosing
and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located both inside and
outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including the General Insurance
Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling and/or dealing with your claim,
which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable laws. If you do not agree to the same,
kindly let us know immediately.

> DISCLAIMER:

> This emall is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

> It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

> If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if

> this e-mail has reached you by mistake, please delete it immediately

> and infarm us of the error and also be hereby notified that any use,

> distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination of this information in any way or in any manner is
strictly prohibited and may be unlawful,

> Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as

> information could be intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

> Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in

> the content of this message or any delay in delivery which may arise

> as a result of Internet transmission or any modification.

> Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.

> India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

> Registration No. 198703792-K

>

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using, disclosing and
processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers [located both inside and

2



outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including the General Insurance

* Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling and/or dealing with your claim,
which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable laws. If you do not agree to the same,
kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER;

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

it may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached you by mistake, please
delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby notified that any use, distribution, transmission,
printing, copying or dissemination of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be
unfawful.

internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be intercepted, corrupted,
lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this message or any delay In
delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.

India International Insurance Pte Ltd,

Registration No. 198703792-K






Menman g-Claims

111212018
Print Received Message

This mail is associaled with .

*SJD9193C
[SHB612P]
TP
SUNSHINE CAR RENTAL & SERVICES
Aug 31 2019 8:00PM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
Mo Performance Pta Litd

India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (Il_SG), sent on 30/10/2019 10:03 AM.

From
To LKK_HO
Subject  Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (S$$0.00) - 5JD9193C - Claim Handler: Sherini Pillai

Approved:0.00:Please proceed to settle at best

hitps./singapore merimen com/claims/index.cfm Husebox=8VCmaildfuseaction=dsp_PrintACFID=517989558CFTOKEN=43dcdaZafde656ca0-A1. .,

"



Maenmaen e-Claims
Print Received Message

V22020

This mail is associated with

*SJD9193C (MCT19080852)
[SHBE12P]
TP
SUNSHINE CAR RENTAL & SERVICES
Aug 31 2010 8:00PM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD|
Mb Performance Pte Lid

From India International Insurance Pte Litd (HQ) (I1I_SG), sent on 0512/2019 11:08 AM,

To LKK_HQ
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (55831.60) - SJD9193C - Claim Handler: Sherinl Pillal

|Approved:831.60.

hitps/isingapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=5VCmailSfuseaction=dsp_Print8CFID=650480604CFTOKEN=44a2384600a3dads-C..

in



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Birect Settiement

| CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
| Case  |Notified Est Submittad | Ad) Assigned [ adj Apt |Adj Submitted | Ins Auth’ed Siatig
o 20 Mov 2019 gﬁ;’ . '$4850.00 $$850,00 Punding Ter Burvey
i) 4
zait fag | o A ot | |t psamaes | view gt | cancei Case |

Main Claim Details

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS |[Created by adjuster]
Insured: COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD, Co Reg, No : 159303821

Main ;
Claimant: SUNSHINE CAR RENTAL & SERVICES. Co. Reg. Mo.: 53318074X

Vehice Rrg _[31/08/2019 20:00 - ;58
Mo S1D9193C Date of Loss: [136 Manths and 23 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man Yr})
Claim Type: | TP / MCT18080B52 mﬁ"” MCOMOO1S
Vehice Reg Palicy No
b SHEG12P (Claimanty. | 5093374018-02
[Insured):
Excess:

Hepairer: Mb Performance Pre Ltd (HQ) 53 UBL AVE | #01-D8 PAYA UR] INDUSTRIAL PARK, 408934 Ubi - Tel
;‘;"‘”"‘F India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 63476100 ... [Mandled by Sherknl Plllni]
E::‘:':"’ NTUC Incame Insurance Co-operative Ltd (HQ) - Tal:

Adjustr LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel; 6256-3561 ., [Handied by MARCUS CHUA] . [Final Rpt due 17/09/2015]

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view Al |  Compase Case Mail |

NI_5G (05/12/2019): Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (53831.60) - SID9193C - Claim Handler; Sherinl Pill...
I11_SG (30/10/2019); Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$0.00) - S109193C - Claim Handler: Sherinl Plilal
1156 (40,/10/2019): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved ($§0.00) - S109193C - Claim Handler: Sherini Plilal
1I_5G (27/09/2019): Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (5$0.00) - SJD8193C - Claim Handler: Sherini Pillai
111_S5 [26/09/2018); Alert - Ad) Mandate Maintained - 5J09193C - Claim Handler: Sherinl Pillal

111_S6G [26/09/2015)° Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (5$80.00) - SJD9193C - Claim Handler: Sherinl Plllal
MI_SG (13/08/2019): Alert - Ad] Mandate Maintained - SID9193C - Clalm Handler: Sherini Pillai

LI I T I

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS= view Al | Sesrch Tusks | Croate Wew Task | Complete |

Due Date Prigrity Type Task Group Subrject Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?
Mo results.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=ds... 5/2/2020



Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*5SID9193C (MCT19080852)
[SHB612P)
1

SUNSHINE CAR RENTAL & SERVICES

Aug 31 2019 B:00PM

[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION FTE LTD]

Mb Performance Pte Ltd

Uiphoad Documents | upload Photos I c.mnpu-mumrl

Page 1 of 2

View [ew in Browser| v |

Video [1perpage [v] B
Mo | Finalized On India International Insurance Pte Ltd {HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 |26/09/19 1038 | Video - OID 0 | Losd mee
L
Photos/Images 3 per T~ &
tc | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid [HG) Thumbnail | Print
1 |os/19 15:07 General View 0| toadivs | A
2 |08/11/1915:07 | Genersl View © | wars | B
3 |oa/11/19 15:07 | General View B e | A
4 |DAS11/19 1507 Ganaral View 0| waws | A
5 |08/13/19 15:07 | General View O | e |
& |08/11/19 15:07 | General View 0| waws | B
7 |O#/11/19 15107 Ganeral View 0| waaws | B4
g |0B/11/19 1507 | General View 0D wazrvs | B
9 |08/11/19 15:07 | Ganaral View | wews | B
10 [08/11/19 15:07 | Geners) View 0| erwc | B
11 [08/11/19 15:07 | General View 0| toadies | A
12 |0M11/1915:07 | General View 0| wiwc | A
11 |08/11/1915:07 | Ganaral View 0| ews | A
14 |0B/11/19 15107 | General View 0| weawrs | B
15 |08/21/19 15:07 | General View 0| wdwc | A
16 |o8/11/19 15:07 Ganeral View 0| caaiec | A
17 |08/11/1915:07 | General View 0| mewe | B
16 |DB/11/19 15:07 | General View @ | wedws | H
16 |DE/11/18 15:07 | Genaral View | toedirc | B
20 |08/11/18 15:07 | General View 0 | leadwc |
21 |0B/11/1515:07 | Genersl View D | loscwc | A
77 |06/11/1915:07 | Reinspection Photo ! Load G | B4
23 |0B/11/18 15:07 | Reinspection Photo 0 wrs |
24 |08/11/19 15:07 | Rsinspection Phota 0 t=iwc | &
Documentation 1 per page ~]| &
No | Reisbel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 |DB/O09/1% 15:41 | TP GIA REPORT Lead PDF
2 |D&/09/19 15:41 | EMAIL FROM II1 DD 05092019 Load POF
3 17/09/19 17:31 TP ESTIMATE- MARKED Load PDF
4 |26/11/19 12:57 | WORKSHOP INVOICE Load FOF
5 |26/11/19 12:57 | LTA SEARCH Load POF
& |05/02/2009:50 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM Load POF
7 | D5/D2720 09:50 DISCHARGE VOUCHER Load POF
8 |05/02720 09:50 LOD ) | Load FOF
Na | Finalired On India International Insurance Pis Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 |o%/T/19 08:36 Singapore Accident Statsment [« BT
Documents Checklist
| DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST neset | Save | pint ||

|

https://singapore.merimen.comvclaims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_d... 5/2/2020



Merimen e-Claims Page 2 of 2

There arn 88 document checklists configured. |

Our Checkiist Remarks - LKK Aute Consultants Pta Ltd (HQ]

Show Remarks To: o Handling Insurer
Porkn . Raeincen avw Erivate wniwes pOu Ehow i ) SSar perpes

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_d... 5/2/2020



Adjuster Report Page 1 of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coreg no 1essor1ssr)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email; sur@ikkauto.com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our Flle No: CC4/11118015814/UG5302

Date: 05/02/2020
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: India International Insurance Pte Ltd  Policy No MCOMODD15
Claimant ;
Vehicle No : 5JD89193C Insured Vehicle No : SH8812P
Date of Loss 31/08/2019 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: MCT 18080852
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg Mo 5JD9193C
Make & Model, HOMNDA FIT, 1.3 (A) Engine No L13A4047548
Reg. Date: 09/04/2008 (Man. Year: 2008) Chassis No. GEB1D43595
Colour Black Odometer: 180168 km
Engine Capacity. 1339 ¢cc
Market Value/Mew Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (55): Market Valua/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
Genearal Condition Stesring (Serviceable) Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 185/55 R15 Rear Tyre Size: 185/55 R15
Froni Lefi Side: Sumitomo 6 mm Rear Left Side: Sumitomo 6 mm
Front Right Side: Sumitomo 6 mm Rear Right Side: Sumitomo & mm
The above values mpresant e riemanmng e Feads depin
|COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Differance  Diff %,
Parts 1.438.20 529.08 80612 83.21
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1.700.00 570.00 1,130.00 B66.47
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (5§) 3,138.20 1,099.08 2,039.12 64.98
Approved Total (Overridden) (5§) B850.00
(55) 3.138.20 B50.00 228820 729
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (5%) 21967 59.50 160.17 729
Nett Amount (S§) 3,357.87 909.50 2,448.37 7291
+ Loss of Use (2.0 x 5550.00/day) (5$) 100.00
(S5) 1.008.50
Liable Amount (80.00%) (S5) 807.60
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 04/08/2019
Date Inspacted. 16/08/2018 Inspected Al Mb Performance Pie Lid (HQ)
53 UBI AVE 1 #01-08 PAYA UBI
INDUSTRIAL PARK
Singapore 408934
Estimated Period of Repair. 2.0 days
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Adjuster: MARCUS CHUA Manager: Chong Pul Lin

NOTE: This report represents our findinga af the fme and place of inapection stated herein. Such inspection has been camied out fa the best of our
knawiadge and abity but sy othar isbiify under any other circumstances i femby sxpressly sciuded
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Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4
REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: MRM-5G Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 26 Nov 2018)

Parts: 144 HONDA FIT 1.3 (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)

Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominated Standard Lisi)

Print Code: (Unsubmiited, no print-code for SJ08183C)

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code {above) on all estimate pages, running page

numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last astimate page
| Further Info: lems/ivalues not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *.

Recommended Parts

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairar's Amount
1 1 *REAR BUMPER Deformed / Tom B42 50FL "5686.30FL
2 1 *REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER RH/LH OfS Bent T7T60FL  *38.BOFL
3 2 *REAR BUMPER BRACKET RH/LH Not Necessary 468 60FL *FL
4 1 *"TAILLAMP R.H Not Necessary 3596.80FL *FL
5 1 *SET REAR BUMPER CLIPS Necessary 4500FS "45.00FS
8 1 *SET REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR Not Necessary 300.00FS *FS
F=Franchiss part S=SpcNatl. L=ListitemDisc
Sub Total (S§) 1,711.50 650.10
- List Item Discount on L ltems 20.00/20.00% (S%) 273.30 121.02
Total Parts (58) 1,438.20 529.08
Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. J
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Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous ltems
There are no new miscellansous items selected.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltams

1 TO CHECKS WIRING & LIGHTING New 100.00 20.00

2 TO REMOVE & REFIX REVERSE SENSOR New 150.00 50.00

3 TO PANEL BEATING Mew 700.00 200.00

4 TO SPRAY PAINTING New 750.00 300.00
Gross Labour Cost (55) 1,700.00 570.00

[ Report was unsubmitted during this print-out

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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