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Bﬂan Ang (LKKAuto)

From: LA Law <LAlaw@andrewtantionggee.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 11 September 2019 5:04 PM

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)

Ce; LA Law; ATTG Litigation; Andrew Tan

Subject: Fe: Requiring Expert Witness for Legal Suit - Correspondence
Atrtachments: SJE Report_comments.doc

DCizar Bryanm,

Thank you for your emails and the detailed draft SJE report
Kindly find below our commenits to the draft report:-
1. With reference to the higlighted portion at [28], we confirm the contents thereaf.

2. Also, at [13], the affidavits were referred to as "Affidavit-In-Chief" and "AEIC". As a matter of terminology, these
documents are not referred to as AEICs. We suggest that the wards "Affidavit" and “Affid" can be used
respectively, e.g. "Affidavit of the Plaintff", "Plaintiff's AFF-1" "Defendant's AFF-1" for all subsequent
relerences. We enclose herewith our proposed comments in red

We have arranged for a commissioner for you on 12 September 2018 (Thursday) at 3.30pm.

Kindly also let us have your invoice made payable to our firm, and we will proceed 1o obtain half the sum from the
Difendant's solicitors M/S L G Roberts

Trank you,

Best regards,
Li Yu (Louls)
Fer and on behalf of Mr Andrew Tan

ANDREW TAN TIONG GEE & CO.

10 Ansan Road

#30-04 International Plaza

Singapore 079903

Tel: 6220 0074/ 6220 0089,/ 6220 0082

Fax: 6224 1109

Email: andrew®andrewtantionggee.com.sg

La an ntionggee.com

CONFIDENTIALITY © Information in this message and any files transmitted with it are confidential and subject to
Professional Legal Privilege. It is intended for the person addressed to. If you are not the intended recipient or if you
receive this message and/any files transmitted with it in error, you should delete it and any record of it and not
disseminate or disclose it or jts contents in any form. Please also notify us that this message has been received in
grrar,
- Original Mess
From: Brye 115
To: LA Law

Cc: ATTG Litigation ; Andrew Tan
Sent: Wednesday, September 11, 2019 12.12 PM
Subject: RE: Reguiring Experi Witness for Legal Sult - Correspondence

Cear LI Yu



<andrew@andrewtantionggee.com.sg>; LA Law <lAlaw@andrewtantionggee com,sg>
Subject: Re: Requiring Expert Witness for Legal Suit - Correspondence
Dear Bryan,

We will fix the mesting on Friday 23 August 2018 at 2pm. Kindly confirn if you are available,

Thank you.

Best regards,

Li Yu {Louis}

Far and on behalf of Mr Andrew Tan

ANDREW TAN TIONG GEE & COD.

10 Anson Road

H30-04 International Plaza

Singapore 079903

Tel: 6220 0074/ 6220 0089/ 6220 0082
Fax: 6224 1109

Email: anﬂrgw@anﬁrgmant_ia NEEEee.com.sg
LALaw@andrewtantiongeee com.sg

CONFIDENTIALITY : Information in this message and any files transmitted with it are
confidential and subject to Professional Legal Privilege. It is intended for the person
addressed to. If you are not the intended recipient or if you receive this message and/any
files transmitted with it in error, you should delete it and any record of it and not

disseminate or disclose it or its contents In any form. Please also notify us that this message
has been recelved in error.

—— Original Message —
To:

Ce: ATTG LITIGATION ; Andrew Tan

Sent: Thursday, August 15, 2019 2:49 PM

Subject: RE: Requiring Expert Witness for Legal Suit - Correspondence

Dear Li Yu

For next week, only Friday (23 August) anytime is good for me.

Best Regards,

Bryan Ang gEH 2Z}Sﬂ
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

phane; §256-3561 | email pryanang@ikkauto com | fax, 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubf Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: LA Law ém!gﬂ@ggdrewtan;‘!gﬂggee.cam.gb

Sent: Thursday, 15 August 2019 1:02 PM
To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>

Cc: ATTG LITIGATION <LegalE @andrewtantiongeee.com.sg>; LA Law
<LAlaw@andrewtantionggee com sg>; Andrew Tan <andr ndrewtanti LOMm.sg>
Subject: RE: Requiring Expert Witness for Legal Suit - Correspondence

Dear Bryan,

1. We are glad to |nform you that pursuant to the Order made by District Judge Kevin Kwek
("the DJ"} at the Case Management Conference before him on 15 August 201 you have
been appointed as the Single Joint Expert ("SJE”) forfMC/MC 14183/2018. 5

2. Your appointment is on the basls of ypurfees as stated in your emall dafed 3 anuary
2019. Your professional fees / rates (i.e or preparation of tachnical report pliss $600
for & half-day trial or $1,200 for a full day TMatSubject to GST) will be shared between the
parties initially, and Final Order on the payment of your professional fees will be reserved till
further decision by the Civil Trial Judge hearing the matter.

3. Your AEIC as ordered by the DJ is due on 12 Seplember 2019, As such, we will be
arranging a meeting sometime next week at our office with yourself, the Plainiiff and his
wife. Kindly let us know your available dates next week so that we can arrange fora
meeting between the relevant parties.

Thank you.
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