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FOLDER DETAILS
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U TECHNOLOGY, Co. Reg. No.: 532506561
GOLDBELL LEASING PTE LTD,

Claim Details Documents

[Created by insurer]

Co. Reg. No.: 199001196N o -
2B/08/2019 17:00 - :59

| vehicle Reg. No.: GBH47440U Date of Loss: [14 Mgnths #nd 8 Days From LTA
| _Reg Date {Man ¥l B
" ; i DMCVSHI04T 7415000
Claim Type: TP / SNM19D204161C02 Policy/Cover Note No.: (Comprehensive)
| ehicle Reg, No. (Insured}: GBHS268) Policy Mo. (Claimant):
: Excess: _ |550.00
| i Sin Shang Englneering Services (HQ]) 3 Tech park Crescent, Tuas Tech Park, 638129 Tuas - Tel:
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; Handling Tnsurer: E;;g:;l;}rtnn Insurance [Singapore} Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tal: 6389 6111 ... [Handled by Tan Kah Leong -
! Adjuster: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ... [Final Rpt due 16/09/2019]
g ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED - " Viewan | Compose Case Mail__||
| There are no mail for this case.
‘I. -
| — —
i
| ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS view Al |  SearcnTasks |  CreateMewTask | complete ||}
|| Due Date Priority Type  Task Group Subjoct  Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Dana?
| Mo resulbs.
A
|I':"1.—'L L EE—————————————SSEEEEE

«.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=ds... 5/9/2019



Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)

From: Yyvonne Wong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, October 10, 2019 3:32 PM

To: sinsheng engineeringservices

Subject: Accident Involving GBH4744U with GBH5968) on 28/08/2019

Dear Pet Jin
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Confirmed amount $3650.00 @ 5 working days,

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents directly to CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (5)
PTE LTD.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Yvonne Wong (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: yvonnewong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: sinsheng engineeringservices [mailto:sinsheng1981@gmail.com]
Sent: Monday, October 07, 2019 5:07 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Ce: Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto) <yvonnewong@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Accident Involving GBH4744U with GBH5968 on 28/08/2019

Hi Mr. Taufikh,

We are agreed your offer.

wk KINDLY NOTE THAT WE ARE ALLOCATED AT NO 8 TUAS AVE 18 (LEVEL 5), SINGAPORE
638892 WITH IMMEDIATE EFFECT **

Thank You
Regards

Pei Jin

Sin Sheng Engineering Services
No 8 Tuas Ave 18

Singapore 638892



Yvonne Wnng (LKK Auto)

From: sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng g81@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, October 07, 2019 5:07 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Cc: Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: Accident Involving GBH4744U with GBH5968) on 28/08/2019

Hi Mr. Taufikh,

We are agreed your offer.

#% KINDLY NOTE THAT WE ARE ALLOCATED A T NO 8 TUAS AVE 18 (LEVEL 5), SINGAPORE
638892 WITH IMMEDIATE EFFECT **

Thank You
Regards

Pei Jin

Sin Sheng Engineering Services
No 8 Tuas Ave 18

Singapore 638892

(Level 3 Olffice)

(Level 5 _Workshop)

Tel: 6863 9595

Fax: 6863 6477

On Mon. 7 Oct 2019 at 12:00, Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com= wrote:

Hi Peai Jin,

COR /553650 , 5 days.

Regards
Taufikh

Lkk Auto



Yvonne WnnE (LKK Auto)

From: Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, October 08, 2019 9:32 AM

To: Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)

Subject: FW: Accident Involving GBH4744U with GBH5968) on 28/08/2019
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Yvonne Wong (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: yvonnewong@lkkauto.com | fax: G256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

sent: Monday, October 07, 2019 12:01 PM

To: 'sinsheng engineeringservices’ <sinsheng1981@gmail.com>

Cc: Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto) <yvonnewong@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Accident Involving GBH4744U with GBH5968) on 28/08/2019

Hi Pei lin,
COR I/s53650 , 5 days.
Regards

Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: sinsheng engineeringservices [mailtn:ginshengIgﬁi@gmailmm]
Sent: Friday, 4 October 2019 3:16 PM

To: Taufikh (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: Accident Involving GBH4744U with GBH5968] on 28/08/2019

Hi Mr. Tufikh,

Please to remind that we still not vet receive your finalize.

%% KINDLY NOTE THAT WE ARE ALLOCATED AT NO 8 TUAS AVE ] 8 (LEVEL 5), SINGAPORE
638892 WITH IMMEDIATE EFFECT **

Thank You
Regards

Pei Jin



Sin Sheng Engineering Services
No 8 Tuas Ave 18

Singapore 638892

(Level 3_Office)

(Level 5 Workshop)

Tel: 6863 9595

Fax: 6863 6477

On Wed, 25 Sep 2019 at 15:59, sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981@gmail.com> wrote:
Hi Mzr. Taufikh,

Please be informed that we have submitted the after repaired photos to you.
Kindly please have your finalized.

wx KINDLY NOTE THAT WE ARE ALLOCATED AT NO 8 TUAS AVE 18 (LEVEL 5), SINGAPORE
638892 WITH IMMEDIATE EFFECT **

Thank You
Regards

Pei Jin

Sin Sheng Engineering Services
No & Tuas Ave I8

Singapore 638892

(Level 3_Office)

(Level 5 Workshop)

Tel: 6863 9595

Fax: 6863 6477

On Thu, 12 Sep 2019 at 18:50, sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng 1981 @gmail.com> wrote:
Hi Mr. Taufikh,

Please find attached the after repaired photos and have your finalized.

*% KINDLY NOTE THAT WE ARE ALLOCATED AT NO 8 TUAS AVE 18 (LEVEL 5), SINGAPORE
638892 WITH IMMEDIATE EFFECT **

Thank You
Regards

Pei Jin



Sin Sheng Engineering Services
No 8 Tuas Ave 18

Singapore 638892

(Level 3_Office)

(Level 5 Workshop)

Tel: 6863 9595

Fax: 6863 6477

On Wed, 4 Sep 2019 at 14:50, sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng198 1{@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Officer In charge,

We are repairer of motor vehicle GBH4744U. Enclosed Accident Statement and LTA search fee for your attention please.
Kindly assist to arrange for the Pre-Repair Inspection to be conducted within two (2) workings days upon received this email.

Kindly let us have your list of 10 nominated surveyors to conduct the Single-Joint Inspection.

Kindly assist to revert the liability issue or offer if direct settlement is in order

*% KINDLY NOTE THAT WE ARE ALLOCATED ATNO 8 TUAS AVE 18 (LEVEL 3), SINGAPORE
638892 WITH IMMEDIATE EFFECT **

Thank You

Regards

Pei Jin

Sin Sheng Engineering Services
No 8 Tuas Ave 18

Singapore 638592

(Level 3_Office)

(Level 5 Workshop)

Tel: 6863 9395

Fax: 6863 6477

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.avg.com




SIN SHENG ENGINEERING SERVICES

NO 8, TUAS AVE 18,
(Level 3), SINGAPORE 638892

Tel No. : 6863-9595 Fax No. : 6863-6477
E-Malil : sinsheng1981@gamail.com
Buss. Req. No. : 312029/00D

GOLDBELL LEASING PTE LTD
59 SENOKO ROAD
SINGAPORE 758123

Attention : Motor Claim Department
Contact : 6861 0007 Fax No. : 6753 7780

SN Quantity Particular

Estimate

Date :
: GBH4744U

Vehicle Num.

Make/Model :
Chassis/Engy :
Accident Date :
Claim No. :
Reference :

: 29090793

Policy No.

Page1/2

: ES002948

04/09/2019

TOYOTA KDH 201-2018
JTFHTO2PE00243390/1KD2808742
28/08/2019

GEH396E)

Unit Price  Amount 55

LIST ITEMS :

REAR BUMPER

BEUMPER SIDE BRACKET
BUMPER CLIP

REAR DOOR PANEL
TOYOTA EMBLEM
'TOYOTA HI-ACE' STICKER
REAR LAMP, LHS

REAR LAMP GARNISH LH
REAR DOOR LOCK

REAR BODY WEATHERSTRIP
REAR END PANEL

SO NO N B WS

- "
TP PPIT G QU U R W e ) X, R

List Totalss :
25.00% Discount 55 :

METT ITEMS :
70km/h Sticker
B PAX STICKER
SEALANT
REVERSE SENSOR

T P
Z =

Nett Total 55 :
10.00% Discount 55 :

677.50 &

123.50 247,00 N
5.00 25 00 Ak -
2150504
53 20—
45,8041
EGE.QUE“ "
165.20 K
275.10 41~
312,10 MmN
585.907 —

20.00

20.00n ~

40.004 —
250.002¢ 0

nw

CONTINUE /...



SIN SHENG ENGINEERING SERVICES

NO 8, TUAS AVE 18,
(Level 3), SINGAPORE 638892

Tel No. : 6863-9595 Fax No. : 6863-6477

E-Mail : sinsheng1981 @gmail.com
Buss. Reg. No. : 312029/00D

GOLDBELL LEASING PTE LTD
59 SENOKO ROAD
SINGAPORE 758123

Attention : Motor Claim Department

Estimate

Date

Vehicle Num.
Make/Model :
Chassis/Engy :

Page2/2

: ES002948

: 04/09/2019
: GBH4744U

TOYOTA KDH 201-2018
JTFHT02P800243390/1KD2808742

Contact : 6861 0007 Fax No. : 6753 7780 Accident Date ; 28/08/2019
Claim No. :
reference : GBH5968)
Policy No. : 29090793
/M Quantity  Particular Unit Price Amount 5%
LABOUR :
TO DISMANTLE/REPLACE REAR WINDSCREEN 120.00 .~
TO PAMNEL BEAT/REPAIR REAR BODY 750.00 O
TO DISMANTLE/REPLACE ABOVEMENTIONED PARTS
. 10
TO APPLY TUFF KOTE 80.00
TO CHECK WIRING 80.00 7"

LOGO WRITING

TO SPRAY PAINTING

LOSS OF USE : 6 DAYS @ S5120/DAY

Labour Total 55 :

N

e "“jJ”LC? YS9

W

L/f:hﬁ(—'"

YA0

LMT,E,;JW E’g% uCq ¥y

Vi i veg Lo
L u’:}/’ 1 l-u{auu./-f\i ? 5{}

.\"_l. L.

e

SIN SHENG ENGINEERING SERVICES

Total S5 : 5,904.40(,

o

LKK Auto Consultants hence notify
the Repairer of the following:

» To resurvey belora/afier Spray panting

» To display demaged part{s) dunng resuney
« Parts pricas are subject to confirmation

+ Mo ilegal modification(s) is allowed
» Supplementary fem{s) must be resureyed gnd

Acknowiedged by Renaines

Signature:

« Third party survey is on & "Without Prejudice’” bas:s

is subject 1o final approval from |ngurance Compary

... -—



Adjuster Report

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregnoisssoriser)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com:assignments@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Page | of 4

Our Fila No: CS/CTHM90157T93/T1YF3IN2
Date: 14102019

REFERENCE

Handling China Taiping Insurance . X

\aiirar (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Policy No: DMCWSN3047 7418000

Claimant Insured

Vehicle No : GBH4744U Vehicle No : GBH5968

. Nature of Claim

Date of Loss:  28/08/2019 Claim: TP No: SNM19D204161C02

DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE

Reg No: GBH4744U

Make & Model: IH?}YGTA HIACE, 3.0 D DX TURBO MT 2WD 4DR g ine No:  1KD2808742

Reg. Date: 20/06/2018 (Man. Year: 2018) Chassis No: JTFHTO2PB00243390

Colour: White Odometer: 109851 km

Engine Capacity: 2982 cc

Market Value/Mew Car NIA

Price:

Sum Insured (S$):

Market Value/New Car Price

VEHICLE AT F SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 195R15 Rear Tyre Size: 195R15
Front Left Side: Austone 6 mm Rear Left Side: Austone & mm
Front Right Side: Austone G mm Rear Right Side: Austone & mm
The above values reprasent the remaining fyre treads depth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster’'s Difference  Diff %
Parts 3,974.40 3,111.75 B62.65 21.711
Miscellaneous [tems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1,930.00 1,480.00 450.00 23.32
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S%) 5,904.40 4,591.75 1,312.65 22.23
Approved Total (Overridden) (S$) 3,650.00
(5%) 5,904.40 3,650.00 2,254.40 38.18
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S%) 413.31 255.50 157.81 38.18
Nett Amount (5§) 6,317.71 3,905.50 2,412.21 38.18
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 05/09/2019
Date Inspected: 06/02/2019 Inspected At: 8 Tuas Ave 18

Estimated Period of Repair: 5.0 days

Repairer: Sin Sheng Engineering

Services

3 Tech Park Crescent, Tuas Tech Park
Singapore 638129

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=...

14/10/2019



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Adjuster: MOHD TAUFIKH BIN HAMID Manager: YVONNE WONG YIN CHENG

NOTE: This report represents our findings at the fime and place of inspection stated herain. Such inspection has been carried ouf to the best of our
knowiedge and ability bul any other ability under any other circumstances is eredy expressly exciuded

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 14/10/2019



Adjuster Report

REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source:
Parts: WA
Labour:

Validity:

Repairer's

(Last Synchronised: 14 Oct 2019)

Page 3 of 4

TOYOTA HIACE 3.0 D DX TURBO MT 2WD 4DR (M) (Model not available in database)

{Price-denominated Standard List)
Print Code: {Unsubmitied, no print-code for GEH4744U)
These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page

numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page
Further Info: Items/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk .

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *REAR EUMPER Deformed 677.50 FL *B77.50FL
2 2 *BUMPER SIDE BRACKET Mot Necessary 247.00FL *-FL
3 5 *BUMPER CLIP Necessary 25.00FL *25.00FL
4 1 *REAR DOOR PANEL Bent 2.150.50FL  *2,150.50FL
5 1 *TOYOTA EMBLEM Necessary 53.20FL *53.20FL
6 1 *TOYOTA HI-ACE STICKER Necessary 45.80FL *45.80FL
7 1 *REAR LAMP LHS Mot Necessary 365.90FL *-FL
8 1 *REAR LAMP GARNISH LH Repair 165.20FL *-FL
9 1 *REAR DOOR LOCK Dented 275.10FL *275.10FL
10 1 *REAR BODY WEATHERSTRIP Not Necessary 312.10FL *-FL
11 1 *REAR END PANEL Bent 585.90FL *585.90FL
12 1 *TOKM/H STICKER MNecessary 20,00 FN *20.00 FN
13 1 *8PAX STICKER Necessary 20.00FN *20.00FN
14 1 *SEALANT Necessary 40.00FN *40.00 FN
15 1 *REVERSE SENSOR Mot Working 250.00FN *200.00 FN
F=Franchige pan. LeliatiemDiac. N=HNetthemDisc. —_—

Sub Total (S§) 5,233.20 4,093.00

- List Item Discount on L ltems 25.00/25.00% (S$) 1,225.80 953.25

- Nett Item Discount on N ltems 10.00/10.00% (53%) 33.00 28.00

Total Parts (S%) 3,974.40 3,111.75
Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. ]
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 14/10/2019



Adjuster Report Page 4 of 4

Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

There are no new miscellaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems

1 TO DISMANTLE/REPLACE REAR WINDSCREEN Mew 120.00 120.00
2 TO PANEL BEAT/REPAIR REAR BODY.TO New 750.00 600.00

DISMANTLE/REPLACE ABOVEMENTIONED PARTS

3 TO APPLY TUFF KOTE New 80.00 30.00
4 TO CHECK WIRING New 80.00 30.00
5 LOGO WRITING New 300.00 200.00
B TO SPRAY PAINTING Mew 600.00 500.00

Gross Labour Cost (S5) 1,930.00 1,480.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

=< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 14/10/2019



