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Consullants
Asnma= Pia Lid Company Registration No. 199607198R

1 UL AVE I, #12-25 PAYA LT INDUSTRLAL PARK, I AT Q0NN TEL = (631 62563561 FAX : (65 6256ANS

Your Ref: D19004605MFSH Date: 09 September 2019

Our Ref: CS/FCI19015789/T1sd3

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. SHA 81758

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle on
06/09/2019 at the premises of M/s Ding Automotive Pte Ltd and have the following to
report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :8%  3.565.40
Revised Estimate Amount 1 5% 1,660.00
“Check” Ttems Amount 1 5% -
Market Value : §S -
LTA Reimbursement Value : S% -
Mett Value : 5% -

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages

at the n/s body.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.
Repair days: 3 days

Yours faithfully

Mohamad Taufikh
Automotive Assessor



H 1 M5 First Capital Insurance Limdted cheg bo 195000106 G5 Rex ha M2-DUULETS 5
: MS . F lrEtCﬂ pltal & Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapare D48580

Tel (65) 6222 2311 Fax: [(B3) 6222 3547

Claims & Hater Underweiting Dept: 35 Robinson Road #1601 City House Singapore 068877
Tel (65 6507 3848 Fax [65) 507 3649
wierwl misfirsicapital.com.sg

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person
Contact Number.

Please submit to

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

15-07-2018 Our Ref No. D18004605MFSH
12-07-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
SHB4139C Third Party Vehicle. SHA8175B

BLK 10, #01-20 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATESECTORC
GUANG
62657130/ 93299929 Fax No. 0

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: LIABILITY UNCLEAR: SIDE SWIPE

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

NA Fax No. 68416315

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

DING AUTOMOTIVE PTE .
Attention. NIL
LTD
A TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
JASON TEA CHEE KIAT
IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letier, no signature required. J




9232019 Mail - Shirley Hiew (LKK Auta) - Outlook

Re: 501119836 / SHA8175B - Finalize Amount & After Repair Photo .
(DOA:12/07/2019)

Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)
Mon 23/9/2019 3:21 PM

To: claims@dingautomotive.com.sg <claims@dingautomotive.com.sg>
Ce: kellyding@dingauto.sg <kelly.ding@dingauto.sg>; dd hashim@dingauto.sg <dd.hashim@dingauto.sg>; 'taxiscs
<taxiscs@stengg.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Dear Hailey,
Finalize amount confirmed.

Final invoice and all supporting documents sent over to First Capital Ins Ltd.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5408933}

From: claims@dingautomotive.com.sg <claims@dingautomotive.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 23 September 2019 11:25 AM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ilkkauto.com=; Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>

Cc: kelly.ding@dingauto.sg <kelly.ding@dingauto.sg>; dd.hashim@dingauto.sg <dd.hashim@dingauto.sg>;
'taxiscs' <taxiscs@stengg.com=

Subject: FW: 501119836 / SHAB175B - Finalize Amount & After Repair Photo . (DOA:12/07/2019)

Dear Taufikh / Shirley.
Kindly refer attachment that had sent to you on Saturday.
Please help us finalize amount as soon as possible.

We look forward torm you soon.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hailey

Motor Claims Officer
Ding Automotive Pte Lid
DID: 81203490

From: Taxis Customer Service [mailto:taxiscs@stengg.com]
Sent: Monday, 23 September 2019 11:08 AM

https:/foutlook office 365 com/mailinboxid/ AAQKADUXOWNIYmYZLTFhM2QtND [SMy05ZWFILTZIMzADOTlyM2MSNWACAKmZZT vwlEJQizZXVp... 113



a/23/2018 Mail - Shirley Hiew (LKK Auta) - Qutlook

Erom: Taxis Customer Service [mailto:taxiscs@stengg.com]

Sent: Monday, 9 September 2019 6:46 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Cc: dd.hashim@dingauto.sg; Claims@dingautomotive.com.sg; kelly.ding@dingauto.sa; Asher Sng (LKKAuto);
SUR; CS A Team; Admin A

Subject: 501119836 / SHAB1758 - Finalize Amount & After Repair Photo . (DOA:12/07/2019)

Dear Taufikh,

Please see below for the finalize according to our conversion to finalize for SHAB175B
Please refer attachment Estimate & After Paint for SHA81758

Part By Part

Total Repair - 03 Days

Labour = 51080

5/n= 5380

Parts = 50

L+5+P = 51460.00

Total Finalize amount = $1460.00
Thank You

Best Regards ,

Guang
Ding Automotive Pte Ltd
Hp :93299929 / 62657130

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.avg.com

hittps:foutlook. office 365.com/mailfi nbaxid/ AACKADUxOWNIY mYzLTFhM2QINDISNy0SZWFILTZIM2ADO T IyMZMSNwAQAKM2ZZ IvwDE HzZXVD. .. 313



9/9/2019 Mail - Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) - Outlook

Re: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004605MFSH/1

Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)
Mon 9/9/2019 3:11 PM

To: 'Jason Tea' <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; 'CWS Mator Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

EJ 1 attachments (80 KB}
PRELI ADVISE - SHA 81758.pdf;

Dear Jason,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SHA 8175B.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Suri@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

—— e

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S[408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

sent: Friday, 6 September 2018 9:56 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotaorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg=; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: 'Jason Tea' <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004605MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA
LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@ kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailtn:cwsmutorclaims@msﬁrstcapital.mm.sg]
sent: Thursday, 5 September 2019 5:02 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKALUTO.COM

Ce: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg=; Jason Tea

hl‘tpsrh’nullnI:Jk.m"ﬁoe.cmhfmal.h’lnbI:Ix.l'ldIMQKADU:OWNWmTZLTFhMﬂiNUI5N'5-'UEZWF1LTZIM?_‘N}GTIyMZMSNwﬁQMiOwe?tprMiMHGzCh‘uizS. - N2



2/9/2019 Mail - Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) - Dutlook

<JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004605MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax ; 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

i AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
- © www.avg.com

hliﬂfstﬂ"wtluok.uﬂ'lcs.mr'm'mﬂ'll.l'in!:rm:ﬁdFMQkADUxGWNt‘fm‘r’zLTFhI".'lEQINDIENyﬂlﬁZWFiLTEiMzAG'DT1yM2M5NwAQMtie?D(poiMHGz[InizS... 212



TO Fax NO:

ESTIMATE REFORT 15T Cluotation 0R09/2018 15:26
JOB-ND: 50111836

OWNER'S PARTICULARS

NAME: CityCab PTE LTD (Fleet) CONTACT: 65533880 Page 1 of 2

ADDRESS: 383 SIN MING DRIVE 64739522

SINGAPORE 5757170

VEHICLE DETAILS

LICENSE NOx: SHAB1758 TRANS: AUTO CHASSIS: KMHLB41UMGUOTSE00
MAKE / MODEL HYUMDAI | 40 EMGIME: D4FDFUS53314
OWMNER'S INSURER: MS First Capital Insurance Limited

JOB-CODE: TP 54; Ding Auto User 2

CLAIM DETAILS

QUOTED DISCOUNT  DISC PRICE i SR REV
DESCRIPTION ary COsTs PRICE
o 400
1 STRAIGHTEN AMD PANEL BEAT ACCIDENT 1.00 B00.0d 0.00 800.00 Y
AREAS -
2 RUST PROCFING 1.00 80.00 0.00 80.00 ¥y S0
3 SUNCRIES 1.00 50.00 0.00 50.00 v o
. meeroad
4 RESPRAY FRONT DOCR LH 100 250.00 0.00 250.00 ¥y  Foo
5 RESPRAY REAR DOOR LH 100 25000 0.00 250.00 vy e
B RESPRAY SIDE SKIRT LH 100 25000 0.00 250.00 ¥ Z iEE
7 RESPRAY SIDE MMROR LH 1.00  150.00 .00 150.00 vy T
ED oo
TOTAL: 1,830.00 0.00 1,830.00
MATERIALS
1 LHF WMIRROR ASSY 100 B27.80 0.00 627.80 y KX
2 LHF FENDER 1.00 A58 50 131.90 527.60 L v el
3 RERAHR FRONT DOOR LH 1.00 0200 0.00 0.00 s Y
4—RERPAE REAR DOCR LH 1.00 0.00 0.00 0,00 g ¥ 5]
5 FRONT DOOR STICKER-COMFORT DELGRO 1.00 100.00 0.00 100.00 5 }j@ y =
LH fob 4
& FRONT DOOR ADS STICKERLH ¥ 100 150.00 .00 150,00 s Y o o
7 REAR DOOR STICKER-APP COMFORT 100 100,00 0.00 100.00 s Ly o
DELGRO LH Ea
P Py
B REAR DOCR STICKER-APP STORE & 1.00 B0.00 0.00 80.00 g f
GOOGLE PLAY & BOOKNOW LH (0D 2~ oo
8 REAR DOOR ADS STICKERLH # 100 150.00 0.00 150.00 s y
TOTAL: 1,867.30 131.80 1.735.40
TOTAL PARTS & LABOUR : 3,697.30 131.80 3.565.40
EXCESS/ILOADING:SS 0.00 .'} i L& lﬁ:l.
2 L #
Mo, Of Day: _2,7 t~
RE-SURVEY: BEFGRE:AFFESE( AINTING A
5%

PAET-BY:F‘.&RT OR LUMP S

A
DATE OF SURVEY: b 4 41

i gt (lhaeiom

SURVEYED BY:
CONTACT NO: i'llf}’\fli -‘%,H“*‘{ FAX NO:
|

NOTE: LUMP SUM AMOUNT WOULD BE REVISED IF SUPPLEMENT REPAIR IS REQUIRED
G-STAR-WI-ET-001-02-Revi0




M DETAILS

DESCRIPTION

aTy
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

&1 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408333

TEL: B256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 18-8607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CSFCN8015788/T1sd3n2
g?ﬁR—ﬂqIE{[jTTSE:gl?;EDSINGAPGRE 068877 Dale: 25-08-:2019 ” “mu""lmu”mlﬂ
Code : FCIZ2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHB 4138C Veh. Inspected SHA 8175B
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D19004B05MFSH Excess (3) 0.00
Assign From JASON TEA Assign Date 05/09/2019
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HYUNDAI 140 C.C 1685
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2013
Chassis No. KMHLEB41UMGLUIOT2B00 Colour YELLOW
Odometer 468328 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification MIL
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/60 R16 WEST LAKE & mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/60 R16 WEST LAKE & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R16 WEST LAKE 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R16 WEST LAKE B mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. General Information
Accident Date  12/07/2019 Ilnspuctiun Date 06/09/2019
Survey held at 31 CORPORATION ROAD
Repairer DING AUTO PTE LTD
5a. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BITHE INSPECTIOMN WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE"™ BASIS,
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408333
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reyg. Mo. 15-9607198-R Page Mo.:1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHA 8175B
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop {g“ “J]
IREPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|LHF FENDER SERVICEABLE 659.50 -
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -131.80 -
52760 E
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|LHF WIMIRROR ASSY (3N} TO REPAIR SEE 627.80 -
LABOUR
1|FRONT DOOR LH (NPA}SN) TO REPAIR SEE - =
LABOUR
1|REAR DOOR LH (NPA)SHM) TO REPAIR SEE - -
LABOUR
1|FRONT DOOR STICKER-COMFORT DELGRO LH (SN} MNECESSARY 100.00 B0.00
1|FRONT DOOR ADS STICKER LH (SN) curt 150.00 100.00
1|REAR DOOR STICKER-APP COMFORT DELGRO LH (SN) |NECESSARY 100.00 50.00
1|REAR DOOR STICKER-APP STORE & GOOGLE PLAY & MECESSARY B0.00 50.00
BOOKNOW LH (SN)
1|REAR DOOR ADS STICKER LH {SN) cuTt 150.00 100.00
1|SUMDRIES (SN) MECESSARY 50.00 20.00
1,257.80 400.00
LABOUR
ETRAIGHTEN AMD PAMEL BEAT ACCIDENT B00.00 400.00
AREAS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF LHF W/MIRROR
ASSY,FRONT DOOR LH AND REAR DOOR LH.
RUST PROOFING. 80,00 30.00
RESPRAY FRONT DOOR LH. 250,00 200.00
RESPRAY REAR DOOR LH. 250.00 200.00
RESPRAY SIDE SKIRT LH. 250.00 150.00
RESPRAY SIDE MIRROR LH. 150.00 80.00
1,780.00 1,060.00
GRAND TOTAL 3,565.40 1,460.00

Report Ref No. CS/FCIM19015789/T1sd3n2




Page MNo.:2 of 2

[ RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | 1,460.00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18015789/T1sd3n2

| V. % \2‘
ADRIAN LING WAI PING

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH

M.MATAI, AMSAE-A B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-AMMATAI

Automotive Assessor Licensed Appraiser

DESCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Roport is made solely for the use and banafit of the Client namad on the front page of this Repo.

Baport. in wiole or in part, doss: 5o &1 his. g her owin fisk.




