Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: SK Admin <admin@skauto.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 20 November 2020 5:39 PM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); simon koh; JING XIONG KHOOQ; KY Leong; Tyson
Koh

Subject: Re: Your ref: SGG3188C [ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES PC7946U AND

SGG3188C ON 27/08/2019]

Dear Jia Le,

Thanks for your mail

We counter propose Loss of rental @ S$220.00 x 12 days=S$2,640.00 (Toyota Lexus 1S200-20. cc)
Pls reconsider the proposed amount and revert back to us soon.

Thank you

Regards,
Huey Lee
SK Automobile Pte Ltd

On Fri, Nov 20, 2020 at 3:26 PM Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Huey Lee,

We propose settlement as follows:-

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $16,371.00
2. Loss of Rental (12days x $140) $ 1,680.00
3. GIA Search Fee $ 2.00
TOTAL $18,053.00

Please confirm acceptance.
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /

inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via
email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much

regretted.

Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: SK Admin [mailto:admin@skauto.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 18 November 2020 3:59 PM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto); Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: simon koh; JING XIONG KHOO; KY Leong; Tyson Koh

Subject: Re: Your ref: SGG3188C [ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES PC7946U AND SGG3188C ON 27/08/2019]

Dear Jia Le,

Refer to the above matter,we have yet to receive any reply from yours.

Please kindly check & update us the offer the soonest.

Greatly appreciate it if you could expedite the matter.

Thank you

Regards,

Huey Lee
SK Automobile Pte Ltd

On Sat, Jul 25, 2020 at 4:26 PM SK Admin <admin@skauto.com.sg> wrote:

Dear Jia Le,

Refer to your mail dated 21/02/2020, we have yet to receive any reply from your side

Kindly check & revert to us soon



Thank you

Regards,

Huey Lee

SK Automobile Pte Ltd

On Tue, Mar 10, 2020 at 5:28 PM SK Admin <admin@skauto.com.sg> wrote:

Dear Jia Le,

Thanks for your mail

Attached final repair bill & relevant doc as requested.

Kindly check & revert to us soon.

Thank you

Regards,

Huey Lee

SK Automobile Pte Ltd

On Fri, Feb 21, 2020 at 3:32 PM lJia Le (LKK Auto) <JialLe@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice



Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Thank you for your patience.

For COR, recommended amount at L/S $15,300.00(before GST) with 10 repair days.

** Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevant documents(ie: final repair bill, authorisation to act, rental
receipt) to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

Please note that all the finalisation subject to insurer approval.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be
deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Chan Jia Le | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



