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Estimate Repair List

20 September 2019

INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PTE LTD

64 CECIL STREET, #04-00 / #05-00

0B BUILDING

SINGAPORE 049711

Attn: Motor Claims Department

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMHB8610R & SHC8135G ON 02/09/2019 ALONG TANJONG KATONG
ROAD AT ABOUT 1210 HOU

Insured 5 HUA HONG PTE LTD
Vehicle Registration No. 2 SMHB610R
Vehicle Make : HONDA
Vehicle Model - SHUTTLE HYBRID 1.5 AUTO
Vehicle Chassis No. H GP72003303
Pollcy No. : 508727220903
Date of Accident g 02/09/2019 Type of Claim: Third Party
S/N Quantity Description \ / it Price 88  Amount §$
1 1 Side Mirror (LH) Complete  ( i $ 52750
2 1 Front Door Glass (LH) /(] J $  450.00
‘177 9 § 97750
— 19 5y | Less20% §  195.50
(W $ 78200 |
To dlsmawoﬁ'omu-idoormmwchanaamsldemlmrzwa front LH $ 25000 U5y |
door glass !
To perform wire checking | $ 2000/
To spray LH side mirror cover $ 100.00 8 9
$ 1,152.00

7%osTs  soss (0
Total §_T25261
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Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

From: James Tan <james@huahong.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, March 17, 2020 6:00 PM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Ce claims@huahong.com.sg; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Subject: RE: Finalize Case for SMH 8610 R - DOA: 02/09/2019
Dear Steve,

COR (Part by part) $1,032.00 before GST, 2 repair days — Confirm
Thanks

Regards

James Tan

Claims Department

BT s HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
T.6661 9688 | F. 6661 9699 | W. huahong.com.sg

 fMin MO

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 17 March 2020 5:01 pm

To: James Tan <james@huahong.com.sg>

Cc: claims@huahong.com.sg; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Finalize Case for SMH 8610 R - DOA: 02/09/2019

Dear James,
Kindly refer our amended finalize $1,032.00 (P/P, before GST). 2 repair days.

Kindly confirm.

Thanks.

Best Regards,
Steve Chen| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561| Email: SteveChen@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: James Tan [mailto:james@huahong.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, March 17, 2020 9:20 AM



