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o Smier Performance Motors Limited R
A Tine Dmrby Motors Compmmy e’
Oa. key. Bo. 1TVELEENN OET Rey. N MI-0020MELl-m
Toll-Frs= Bunbey L1F00-22E324%
30, Alenandrs Bsed 188, Lempong Armny Eoed 115, Alesandrs Ko
Sine Darty Peciormascws Ceptie Bapt Sodst Deptee Jiee Dardy Bupiteps Centie
Fingapore i%FRa] Eingapore 4§N1AE Fingapore ABFRE4
Fax S4747T70 Fix EHAYTT] Fan E4TRESE] Afteriales
BETREEZA motorTed
GST REG. NO : M2 - 0020081 - X
D4 SEP 201
ESTIMATE
[ Estimate No. i bl 52617 Page No. l of 4 )
Date Estimated . D4/09/2019
_Frepa:'ed By : Gary Poh Chai Hoom y
| - ESTIMATE REPAIR FOR - - ACCOUNT - 40000 )
Ng Hee Chye (Huang XiCai) Cash Bales - Service
12 Haig Avenue Singapore
#03-02
| Singapore 43BBE7 |
REGN. NO. CHASSIS NO. REGN. DATE NCEETL, iy MILEAGE
SLRBGOSH V926038 30/08/2017 216d /CAT . 3 0
DESCRIPTION ¥ __VALUE
Replace rear bumpear and attachment. ,g 1.275.00
Painting rear bumper 9 1,038.00

To replace tyre and wheel rim including balancing. (1x).

To check steering geometry and conduct wheel alignment In
accordance with BMW specifications. {1x)

RO 94.00
45| s

To check electrical wiring systems and lightings al the 160 177.00

rear saclion for proper function
Sundries. |t~ ? 40.00
Total Labour 1: 3,155.00
DESCRIPTION QTY PRIC VALUE
ALLOY RIM 7JX18 DOUBLE SPK 473 1 757.00 g | ; 757.00.
REAR BUMPER FANEL PRIMED (PDC) 1 1.045.45 £ 1,045.45
RR BUMFER LH F?ID-E GUIDE 1 61.35 7 61.35
I Tatal Parts 1,B683. 80

. glmenss
[ o A\ ‘ﬁ}vf Labour 1 3,155.00 |
A TNHY Parcs 1,863.80
\M r Labour 2 0.00
Excesp 0.00
l"'ﬁ" [ {t Total GST & 7% 351.32
m‘“

d Yelng - H l?(-};'"ﬂ“d Total 5,370.12

** THIS ESTIMATE IS VALID FOR A PERIOD OF 30 DAYS ONLY™ ‘.)

** PRICE FOR PARTS ARE SUBJECTED TO CHANGE WITHOUT PRIOR NOTICE **

sO\ § AV



Hsiao TnnE (LKKAuto)

—_— 10 v\ ikirrerorr—————

From: Sharon Heng L K <sharon heng.leekun@simedarby com.sg>
Sent: Saturday, 2 November 2019 11:.08 AM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Cc Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Subject: DIRECT SETTLEMENT FINAL REPORT - SLRBEOSR
Attachments: SKM_C45819110209011.pdf

Dear Taufikh

For your perusal ;

Labor $2545,00
Parts 5 757.00
Total 5330200

LOSS OF USE = S60 X 3 DAYS.
LTA SEARCH FEE - $7.45.

Owner is claiming

Note ; 3 working days.

Please reply me directly.

Best Regards

Sharon Heng
Performance Motors Ltd
Body & Paint

DID : 63190123

Fax : 64743229

“This electronic mail content and any accompanying attachments ("the Message”) Is intended only for the named
addressee ("the Recipient”) and may contain information that is confidential, privileged and/or proprietary to the
Sime Darby group of companies ("Sime Darby") and/or protected under applicable laws. If you are not the intended
Recipient, you are strictly prohibited from using, disseminating, forwarding and/or printing the Message. Please
notify the sender immediately by return e-mail and permanently delete all copies of the Message. Sime Darby
disclaims all liability for any error, loss or damage arising from the Message being infected by computer virus or
other malicious software. Any views and/or opinions expressed in the Message are solely those of the author's and
do not necessarily represent those of Sime Darby's.”

—-0Original Message—-—

From; service.pml@simedarby.com,sg [mailto:service.pmi@simedarby.com sg]
Sent: Saturday, 2 November, 2019 9:02 AM

To: Sharon Heng LK

Subject: Message from KM_C458



‘Ps-.rformance Motors Limited

& i o e B Day Sraud
Co Sag ho 1374015386 GRT Rog fa ME-O0R00N 1 -

Final Report
Estimate No b1 52617
Date Estimated 04/09/2019
Prepared By Gary Poh Chai Hoon
- ESTIMATE REPAIR FOR - - ACCOUNT - 219
Ng Hee Chye (Huang XiCai) India Int'L Insurance Pte Ltd
12 Haig Avenue 64 Cecil Street
#03-02 #04-0510B Building
Singapore 049711
Singapore 438867
REGMN. NO., CHASSIS NO REGN DATE MODEL MILEAGE
SLRBE0O5R WBA2B32050V92603 30/08/2017  216d CAT 0
ACCOUNT: 219
DESCRIFTION ORIGINAL PRICE DISC. % NETT
To maka good rear bumper including to remove and install body 850.00 0 850.00
pans n order to canry out painting job
To respray fear bumper, §34.00 0 8934.00
To replace rear leht wheel rim including balancing. BO.OO 0 B0.00
To check steering geomeatry and conduct whes! alignment 451.00 o 451.00
according to BMW specification
To check electrical wiring systems and lightings al the rear section 150,00 0 150.00
for proper function.
Sundries. 80.00 0 B0.00
DESCRIPTION LINIT PRICE aQTy DISC. % NETT
ALLOY RIM 7JX16 DOUBLE SPK 473 757.00 1.00 0 757.00
Total Labout 2.545.00
Total Parts ; 757.00
T o Total Labour & Parts : 3,302.00
K ““*"\ *'"‘“'t“kﬂ ) GST @7%: 231,14
—— Grand Total 3.533.14

" = ...F _i__ -
| LOSS OF USE = $60 X 3 DAYS

ad ———e LTA SEARCH FEE = §7.45

52617 - SLREG0OSR xisx, Page 1 Finalised by: Korg Hui Xian, DID: 63190123 Fax: 64743229



> Back to OneMotoring

Land Transport Authneity

Land Transpor Authonty

10 Sin Ming Drive

Singapore 575701

GST Registration Na. - M4-0006529-2
Print Date/Time : 02 Sep 2019 / 14:41:00
Receipt Date/Time : 02 Sep 2019/ 14:41:00

Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipt No. - ITNET-00000-180802-002135

Previous Rscsipt No_ ©
S/N Wtom Description/ Amount GST Amount
Business Transaction Reference Before Amount After GET
No. GST (S$) (S85) (S%)

Result of Insuranca Enguiry - SLNST 16U
As at 01 Sep 2018M16:04:00

Insurance Co: INDIA INT'L INS PTE LTD
1 Insurance Enguiry - SLNST16U

Enguiry Fea 7.00 048 740
20190002143930015130
Sub-Total T.00 048 748
Total Befare Rounding 7.00 048 T48
Rounding Difference 0.04
Total Amount Payabls 745
Paid By
oooioi 2358 745
Visa/MasterCard
Total T45
Cash Change D.00
Tendered Amouni TA45
Excess Relundable Amounl 0.00

THANK ¥OU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly seitled by the payment service
provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered veid and Iate fee
may apply.



Hsiao Tung (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAUtD)

Sent: Monday, 4 November 2019 4:03 PM

To: Sharon Heng LK

Cc: Taufikh (LKKAuUto)

Subject: RE: DIRECT SETTLEMENT FINAL REPORT - SLR8605R //DOA: 01/09/2019// LKK REF

CC3/11119015680/T1pb3

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

For COR, recommended amount at P/P $3,302,00(before G5T) with 03 repair days.

**Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevant documents(le: final repair bill, authorisation to act, rental receipt) to
us [LKK) for our necessary action.

Please note that all the finalisation subject to insurer approval.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settiement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | emall: chewht@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1,
#02-25 | 5(4DB933)

——-Original Message—-—

From: Sharon Heng L K <sharon.heng.leekun@simedarby.com.sg>
Sent: Saturday, 2 November 2019 11:08 AM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com:

Ce: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>

Subject: DIRECT SETTLEMENT FINAL REPORT - SLRBGOSR

Dear Taufikh

For your perusal :



Labor $2545.00
Parts $ 757.00
Total $330200

Owner is claiming LOSS OF USE = S60 X 3 DAYS.
LTA SEARCH FEE - $7.45.

Note : 3 working days.

Please reply me directly.

Best Regards

Sharon Heng
Performance Motors Ltd
Body & Paint

DID : 63190123

Fax : 64743229

"This electronic mail content and any accompanying attachments (“the Message") is intended only for the named
addressee ("the Recipient”) and may contain information that is confidential, privileged and/or proprietary to the
sime Darby group of companies ("Sime Darby") and/or protected under applicable laws. If you are not the intended
Recipient, you are strictly prohibited from using, disseminating, forwarding and/or printing the Message. Please
notify the sender immediately by return e-mail and permanently delete all copies of the Message. Sime Darby
disclaims all liability for any error, loss or damage arising from the Message being infected by computer virus or
ather malicious software. Any views and/or opinions expressed in the Message are solely those of the author's and
do not necessarlly represent those of Sime Darby's.”

----- Original Message—

From: service.pm|@simedarby.com.sg [mailto:service.pml@simedarby.com.sg|
Sent: Saturday, 2 November, 2019 5:02 AM

To: Sharon Heng LK

Subject: Message from KM _C458



1i2me Marimen e-Claims
Claim Audit
— AUDIT TRAIL
Bt (1T Auielin Reriipree Hy
i One 015 cym DY Modified Claimant’s Name: -> NG HEE CHYE. Claimant's ID: -> S72430358. !_;L’ﬂ
2 453019 cym yeh Model Changed (204297) BMW 216D 1.5 D Active Tourer (F45) (). bl
04 Sep 2019 feeg No: SLRBSOSR. Acct Date: 2019/09/01. Clsim Type: TP Insurer: India Internationa (A] Loy
P Cim Created | Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ). TP Insurer: AXA Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ), Workshop: Performa
16:57 . Shu Pei
nce Motors Limited (Alexandra)
04 Sep 2019 , [A] Loy |
a 16:57 Adj Co Assigned LKK Auto Cangultants Pra Ld (HQ)! Shu P
04 Sep 2014 i . [A] Law
§ S Adj Next Rpt Changed  Next Rpt:Final Apt.Due Date:2019/08/13 b
04 Sep 2019 : : [A] Lau
& 16:57 Adj Mandate Set Approved |0.00, Reinsp:Ad) decides. Shu Pel
04 Sep 2019 ; [A] Lo
T taite Labe! Added {30653):Direct Settlement. Lol o
04 Sep 2018 y [A] Lau
8 16:58 Adj Adjuster Assigned  [Nona] -> MOHD RASUL Shy Pei
[A]
9 :gi:ﬂ 2019 o 4) Mandate Request  CurReq:0.00:PODS Liability; 100% Remarks: Q1D reversing hit TP m‘;';‘] i
FENG
: [
12 Sep 2018 Mext Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2019/09/13. Mandate Remarks: please revert on quantu
10 pg.39 Adj Next Rpt Changed . bindly note that according to ID impact seems to be minor n"'""" |
1))
12 Sep 2015 Approved .00 please revert on guantum and kindly note that according to ID impact s
" 0B:39 Adj Mandate Set eems to be minor "L':,IH:’:H
1
12 195ep 2015 4y pduster Assigned  MOHD RASUL -> MOWD TAUFIKH BIN HAMID (A] Lau
14:28 Shu Pei
JOAMNE
13 ggns "1 Ady Rpt Initiated LEE
: KHANG
MIN
mmuf:
pa DB ROV ADIZ oy bt Modified Insured Name: -5 -. Insured 1D: -> -. LEE |
09:02
KHANG
MIN
OAMNE
i
15 DB Nov 2013 oy et Modified 191 Reg, Date: -> 2017/08/30 LEE
09:02
KHANG
MIN
JOANNE
16 56 MY 2017 cim Detalls Notified LEE
' KHANG
MIN
CurReq: 3720.59:P005 Liability; 100% *Quantum: [almhﬁ $3,533.04 « (B)LOU  [A)
11 Nov 2019 (3days x $50,00). $180.00 « (c)LTA/GIA search fee: $7.45 = Total: $3,720.59 *Vehicl CHEW
17 16:59 Ad] Mandate Request " o BMW 216D (1496¢c) *38 recommendation repair days *For your approval plea  HSIAQ
se. TONG
Date From 4|75 »| pateTo 4|75 »| Audit Type None v 6o
ACTIVITY
No record

Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History

2269962

2336815

05 Sep 2019 TP Case
09:03:09 [Insurer)

D& Nov 2019 | OD/TP Case
09:02:21 (Adjuster)

India
LKK Auto
Mator Commuttants | IMemational © - gipeg0sr | sLns7iEU 11.77
Pie Lid Insurance Pre
[ M3 (Hg)
LEK Auto Le® Aulo
Motor Consukants  Consultants  SLRBSOSR  SLNSTI6U 11,77

pis 110 Pie Ltd (HQ)

hitpa:/isingapore. menmen.comiclaimslindes. cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=nsp_viewhisioryScaseid=B63091Sextid=3158564CFID=622. .,

12



1Mnaszomg Merimen e-Claims

Print Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SLRE6O5R (MCA190220)
[SLN5716U]
P
NG HEE CHYE
Sap 1 2019 4:00PM

I
Performance Motors Limited

From India International Insurance Pte Lid (HQ) (II_SG), sent on 12/11/2018 08:28 AM.
To LKK_HGQ

Subject Alort - Ad] Mandate Approved ($$3720.59) - SLREG05R - Claim Handler: Lalitha Krishnan

Approved:3720.59.

hitps.//singapore. mefmen_cam/claimafindex ofmHusebox=8VCmalAfuseaction=dsp_PrintACFID=82651T008CFTOKEN=4b2{B0e33404130c-D4. .

m




AU Imsurmnce Pie Lid

S 1800 580 4588 [Within )
(65) 6880 4888 |

redefining /insurance % (65) 6880 4740 -

=g

New butiness
NG HEE CHYE (HUANG XICAL)
12 Haig Avenue date
#0302 07,/08/2017
SINGAPORE 438867
your servicing destribulor
$D CONTEGO SERVICES / 14235
r gervicing distribulor cortact
Policy Schedule xdasiagbi
Your SmartDrive PML
Your policy snapshot
Policyhokder name NG HEE CHYE (HUANG XICAI} Pollcy number VA1 / GAZ65336
Cover Comprahensive FIl / HRIC 72430358
Perlod of Insurance fram 30,/08,/2017 1o 29,/08,/2018 (both dates inclusive)

Gross Premium after 20% NCD SGD 2,652.12

% GS5T SGD 185.65
Final Premlum §G0 2, 837.T7
Your benefits highlights {refer to Pulicy Wording for il terms and conditions)
SmartDivePMLBaneits SRR
s  Medical Expenses - Up to 541,000 per injured persons
s  Pomonal Accident Benefits to insured - Limit of Linblity. 55100000
e  Personal Accxdent Benefits to Drivers a1 $20,000 sach and Passengers 81 5410,000 sach
s  MewtorOld Replacement - 100% compensation for car jess than 12 months old = in event of total loss due 1 sccidernt
s UptolDd DmLmﬂM-ESIMDIMTmmmMm
e  Loss of parsonal ems in 1he car - up o 5$500
Vehicle detalls
Make & Model of Vehlcle BMW 216D Year of manutacture 207
Vehicle reglstration number SLRBE0OSR Type of Use Privale Use
Body type MPY Engine capacity (c.c.) 1496
Seating capacity (excl driver) 4 Engine numbar 37545020B3TC15A
Off-Peak car No Chassie number WBAZE32050V926038
insured's Estimatad Marke! Value Market Value 8t the time of Loss (including accessonies and spare parns)
Limitation to use As per Cartificate of Insurance
Finance Loan Company UNITED OVERSEAS BANK LIMITED

Excess applicable jeter 1o Policy Wording for other applicable Excesses)

Basic Dwn Damage Excess SGD 400.00
Wingscreen Excess Hot Applicable

An Additional Excess 5 applicable B follows:

$£2600 tor undecisred Young mnd inexpanence [irees]

£2000 fo Mamed Driveris) with driving experience of lees than 1 year on the relevan cinas ol drnang Beence

$1500 fol Named Driveris) who are age 21 years o0 8nd beiow with driving swpenence ol 1 year o more on the relevan class of driving licence.
$1000 for hamed Drtveis) who are age 22 yeare old 10 26 yeais old with diiving sxperience of 1 year or more on the relevant class of driving licence

XA Insurence Pre Lid | 188903512M) 1ot
B Shemton Wy, §24-00, ALL Tower,

Eingapore DGBR11

Customar Centre, #81-01



Hsiao Tnng (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 18 November 2019 11:53 AM

To: PRSP

Cc Admin A

Subject: RE: DIRECT SETTLEMENT FINAL REPORT - SLRBEOSR //DOA: D1/09/2019// LKK REF

CC3/11M9015680/T1pb3

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We confirm settlement at $3,720.59(all-in).

We will proceed to close file.

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | emall: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1,
#02-25 | 5(408933)

----- Original Message-—

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 4 November 2019 4:03 PM

To: Sharon Heng L K <sharon.heng.leekun@simedarby.com.sg>

Cc: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: DIRECT SETTLEMENT FINAL REPORT - SLRB60OSR //DOA: 01/09/2019// LKK REF: CC3/11119015680/T1phb3

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

For COR, recommended amount at P/P 53,302.00(before G5T) with 03 repair days.
1



**Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevant documents(ie: final repair bill, authorisation to act, rental receipt] to
us (LKK) for our necessary action,

Please note that all the finalisation subject to insurer approval.

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation

terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 5741-4108 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1,

#02-25 | S(408933)

—Qriginal Message-—

From: Sharon Heng L K <sharon heng leekun@simedarby.com.sg>
Sent: Saturday, 2 November 2019 11:08 AM

Tao: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com=>

Cc: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: DIRECT SETTLEMENT FINAL REPORT - SLR8605R

Dear Taufikh

For your perusal :

Labor $2545.00
Parts S 757.00
Total 5330200
Owner is claiming LOSS OF USE = 560 X 3 DAYS.

LTA SEARCH FEE - 57.45.
Note : 3 working days.

Please reply me directly,

Best Regards

Sharon Heng
Performance Motors Ltd
Body & Paint

DID : 63150123



- Fax: 64743229

“This electronic mall content and any accompanying attachments ("the Message") Is intended only for the named
addressee ("the Recipient") and may contain information that Is confidential, privileged and/or proprietary to the
sime Darby group of companies ("Sime Darby") and/or protected under applicable laws. If you are not the intended
Recipient, you are strictly prohibited from using, disseminating, forwarding and/or printing the Message. Please
notify the sender immediately by return e-mail and permanently delete all copies of the Message. Sime Darby
disclaims all liability for any error, loss or damage arising from the Message being infected by computer virus or
other malicious software. Any views and/or opinions expressed in the Message are solely those of the author's and
do not necessarily represent those of Sime Darby's.”

~-0riginal Message-—

From: service.pmi@simedarby.com.sg [mailto:service. pm|@simedarby.com.sg)
Sent: Saturday, 2 November, 2019 9:02 AM

To: Sharon Heng LK

Subject: Message from KM_C458
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.+.CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Direct Settlement

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING =
Case Notified Est Submitted Adj Assigned Adj Rpt Ad| Sutsrmithad Ins Auth'ed Status
| 1059 2019 3% g S $§3,302.00  |5$3,302.00 w for Survey
Edit Rug e Adi Rt | Edlit Estimares view e | <=y

Main

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS | [Created by adjuster]
Insured: | COMFORTDELGRO RENT-A-CAR PTE. LTD, Co Reg No. -
Maim | )
Cisimant: MG HEE CHYE, ID: 572430358
Vehicle Reg . |o1/09/2019 16:00 - :59
Na.; SLRASOER Dite of Loss! EIH Months and 2 Days From LTA Beg Dats (Man ¥r))
| . Palicy/Cover
Claim Type: (TP / MCA190220 Note No.: M495126/03
Vehicle Reg.
Na. SLNS716U mt:__ VAL/GAZEST36
[Irmured): z
Excess:
Re Performance Motors Limited (Alexandra) 303 Alexsndra Road. Sime Darby Performance Centre, 1585941 Alexandra - Tel:
PaIrer | gvy00172/63190174

m’“"“‘“’? India Internationsl Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 63476100 ... [Handied by Lalitha Krishnan - 6347 &139]

Claimant’s
Ingurer:

AXA Tnaurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6338 7288
Ptm Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-1561 .. [Handied by MOWD TAUFIKH BIN HAMID] .. [Final Rpt due

. LEK Auto
Adjstert  113/09/2019]

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view All |  Compose Case Mai |

« IT_5G (12/11/2015) Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (583720.59) - SLABSOSR - Clalm Handler; Lalitha Kri...
« TI_SG (12/09/2019): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved {550.00) - SLREGOSR - Claim Handler: Lalitha Krishn...

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS= View AR | Soarc Tesks || Greste Maw Task | Comptete |

Due Date Priority Type Task Group Subject Handler Aszigned By Complated On Creatad On Done?
Mo results.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 19/11/2019
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Claim Documents

*SLRBG0OSR (MCA190220)
[SLNS716U]
‘"l
NG HEE CHYE
Sep 1 2019 4:00PM
[COMFORTDELGRO RENT-A-CAR PTE. LTD]
Performance Motors Limited

Page 1 of 2

upioad Documens | Upinag Photss |  Composs tew Lenier | View [View in Browse v |
Photos/Images Qperpage [v] B
Ne |Relabel/Heorder | LKK Aute Consultants Pre Lid (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 |11/11/18 16:35 | Odemeter Reading Q| wars | A
2 |1U11/19 16:35 Chassis Number 0| waawrs | &
I [1011/18 16:35 | General View 0| e | A
4 [11/11/19 16:3% | General View 0| taerc | A
5 (1171119 18:35 | Genersl View 0| tmewc | A
B 11119 16:35 | Genersl View 0| wews | H |
7 |11/11/19 16:35 | General View 0| wiaws | A
B |10/11/19 1635 | General View @ | teadc | A
% |11/11/19 1635 | General View 0| toasiec | BA
110 |11/11/1916:35 | General View 0| wearws | M
11 |11/11/1916:35 | General View O | wawe | A
(12 [11/11/19 1635 | Ganeral View 0| toecwec | B
13 11011191635 | General View D | tmdwc | M
14 |11/11/19 1635 | General View 0| Losais | A
15 |11111/19 1635 General View 0| adws | A
16 |11/13/19 1635 | General View 0 wdws | H
17 |11/11/19 16:35 | Genaral View 0| wmaws | A
18 |1/11/19 16:35 | General View D | toadirc | A
1% [11/11/19 1835 | Genaral View 0| lesws | A
20 |11/11/19 16:35 Ganaral View 0| cadie | M
Documentation 1perpage V]|
o | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 |04/09/13 16:58 | TP ESTIMATE @ | Loac FoF
7 |04/09/19 16:58 | TP GIA REPORT g Lond POF
3 |19/09/19 17:23 | TP ESTIMATE- MARKED Load POF
4  |11/11719 16:40  |LOD _g Load POF
5 |11/11/19 16:40 | Authorisation to Act Load POF
& |11/11/19 16:40 | Workshop Involea @) | Loacror
7 |11/11/19 16:40 | LTA Search Fee € | Lows PO
8 |19/11/1908:17 | DISCHARGE VOUCHER 0 | Load FOf
Na | Finalized On India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 10/09/19 1146 1V Singapore Accident Statemant Load POF
Documents Checklist
DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST meset | Save | pnne |

There ame no docament checklists configored.

~
W
Show Remarks To: Dh-ﬂlnﬂlm Insurer
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp... 19/11/2019
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregno 1sss071sam)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3581 Fax; 6844-B805 Email; sur@lkkauto com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC3/1118015680iT1PB3Q2

Date: 18/11/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: India Interational Insurance Ple Lid  Policy No: M485128/02
Claimant .
Vehicle No : SLRBBOSR insured Vehicle No : SLN5716U
Date of Loss: 01/08/2019 Mature of Claim: TP Claim No: MCA1980220
| ATI |
Reg No: SLRBGOSR
Make & Model: BMW 2160, 1.5 D Active Tourer (F45) (A) Engine No: 37545028B37C15A
Reg. Date: 30/08/2017 (Man, Year: 2017) Chassis No: WBAZ2B32050ve26038
Colour: White Odomater: 45115 km
Engine Capacity. 1496 cc
Market Value/New Car NIA
Price
Sum Insured (SS); Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable). Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable). Yes Engine Modificalion: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 205/60 R16 Rear Tyre Size: 205/60 R16
Fromi Lefi Side: Goodyear 6 mm Rear Left Side: Goodyear 6 mm
Front Right Side: Goodyear 6 mm Rear Right Side: Goodyear 6 mm
The sbove values epresant ihe remaming fyre ieads depth
\COST OF CLAIMS "~ Repairer's Adjuster’s Difference  Diff %/
Parts 1,843.8D 837.00 1.108.80 56.04
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 D.00
Labour 311500 2,465.00 650.00 20.87
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 D.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total [S5) 5,058.80 3,302.00 1,756.80 34.73
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S%5) 35412 23114 122.98 3473
Mett Amount (S$) 5412.92 3,533.14 1,879.78 34.73
+ Loss of Use (3.0 x S560.00/day) (S5) 180.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (55) 7.45
Nett Liability (S§) 3,720.59
INSPECTION
Date of Assignmenl: 18/08/2019
Date Inspected: 18/08/2019 Inspected Al Performance Motors Limited
(Alexandra)
303 Alexandra Road, Sime Darby
Performance Cenltre
Singapore 158941
Estimated Period of Repair. 3.0 days

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 19/11/2019



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Adjuster: MOHD TAUFIKH BIN HAMID Manager: CHEW HSIAD TONG

NOTE: This report represents our findings at the lime snd place of inapection stated herein. Such inspection has bean carmd out o the best of our
knowisdge and ability but any offer iabiity under any othar circumstances i3 heraby sxpressly extluded.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 19/11/2019



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4

REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: MRM-5G Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 06 Nov 2019)

Parts: M1-MPV BMW 2180 1.5 D Active Tourer (F45) (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0) |

Labour: Repairer's {Price-denominated Standard List)
Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SLREBOSR)

Validity: These eslimates are valid only If thay contain the print code {above) on all estimata pages, running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

Further Info: tlems/values not In reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *.

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *SUNDRIES Necessary 80.00FS *80.00FS
2 1 *ALLOY RIM 7X16 DOUBLE SPK 473 Cut T57T.00FS *757.00FS
3 1 ‘REAR BUMPER PANEL PRIMED {PDC) Repair 1,045 45F5 “F5
4 1 *RR BUMPER LH SIDE GUIDE Not Necessary 61.35F5 *F5
F=Franchiss parl S=Spchett

Total Parts (55) 1,943.80 837.00
[ Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. 1]

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 19/11/2019



Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

There are no new miscellanecus items selecled

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour Items
1 REPLACE REAR BUMPER AND ATTACHMENT New 1,275.00 850.00
2  PAINTING REAR BUMPER New 1,038.00 834.00
a TO REPLACE TYRE AND WHEEL RIM INCLUDING New 94,00 80.00
BALANCING
4 TO CHECK STEERING GEOMETRY AND CONDUCT MNew 531.00 451.00
WHEEL ALIGNMENT IN ACCORDANCE WITH BMW
SPECIFICATIONS
5 TO CHECK ELECTRICAL WIRING SYSTEM AND MNew 177.00 150.00
LIGHTINGS AT THE REAR SECTION FOR PROPER
FUNCTION
Gross Labour Cost (5§) 3,115.00 2,465.00
Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. J
< END OF ESTIMATES >
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 19/11/2019



