Vic (LKKAuto)

#

From: Claims Dept of CTI «<claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Monday, 7 October, 2019 11:56 AM

To: Admin A; Vie (LKKAuto)

Cc: Tan Kah Leong; Alfred Toh; Chee So Chow; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto);
winnieins@yahoo.com.sg; azminafrina@gmail.com

Subject: SEEK MANDATE> RE: CTP REF NO. SNM19D204066C02/3(tkl) LKK REF NO.

CC6/CTI19015394,/T1ha3 Accident involving SDN8203H, SHD2252K & SJR4877Y on
29 August 2019

Attachments: LETTER TO Ol pdf; Footage from SIRA877Y.MP4; Collision (online-video-
cutter.com).mp4d

LKK REF-CC6/CTI19015394/T1ha3
CTPIS REF — SNM19D204066C02/3(tkl)

Dear Vic

We refer to your email of even date pertaining to the above matter.

Please proceed to resolve the property damage claim by SHD2252K at 57,536.30.
We await your payment advice to enable Kah Leong to act accordingly.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: A ik Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain con fidential information.
Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or pariial, is prohibited, If you are not the intended
recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Vie (LKK Auto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 7 October, 2019 10:36 AM

To: Tan Kah Leong <KahLeong. Tan(@sg.cntaiping.com=>

Ce: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com=; Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept(@sg.cntaiping.com=;
Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@]lkkauto.com=>: Alfred Toh
<alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com=

Subject: <SEEK MANDATE=> RE: CTP REF NO. SNM19D204066C02 LKK REF NO.
CC6/CTI19015394/T1ha3 -

CTl| REF - SNM19D204066C02
LKK REF — CC6/CTI19015394/T1ha3

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SDN 8203H (01} / SHD 2252K (TP) / OTHERS ON 29/08/2019

We refer to the above matter.



It was reported that Insured vehicle had collided to 3 stationary vehicles. A copy of the video footages were attached

for your reference.

We had spoken to the Insured Driver and she was informed of the TP claim and NCD issues. A letter was sent out to
the Insured to notify TP claim as well. No feedback received till date.

As such, liability may not be to our Insured’s favour and we have to settle the claim from the TP vehicle and the

damages sustained to TP vehicle were consistent to the nature of the accident.

summary to offer to repairer PRIME AUTO CLAIMS SERVICE PTE LTD is as follows:

TP CLAIMED REVISED - TO OFFER
Cost of Repair (w/gst) S 10,262 .88 S 6,527.00
Loss of Rental ($93.90 x 7 days) 5 657.30 5 657.30
Loss of Income (5100 x 7 days) 5 700.00 $  350.00 (550 x 7 days)
GIA Search Fee 5 2.00 % 2.00
TOTAL | $11,622.18 S 7,536.30

Breakdown of days is as follows:

Recommended Days 6 days
Weekends / Downtime 1 day
TOTAL | 7 days

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

For your approval and/or further instructions please.

Thank you.

Best Begards,
Vic Alpeh | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Elk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Parl, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)

24 2alr

¥

SRER N Save the Earthe Print only when necessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use ar distribulion by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mall in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all altachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the

sander that vou have deleled the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.
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PRIME GROUP

Date: 11.09.2019

Our ref: SHD2252K
Your Ref: SIDNR203LI

China Taiping Insurance (S) Pre Lid

3 Anson Road # [ 6-0( Without prejudice
Springleal Tower Fax: 6224 7175
Singapore 079909

Attn: Motor Claims Dept

Dear Madam,

ACCIDENT ON 29.08.2019 INVOLVING VEHICLES S1ID2252K & SDN8203H

We are on behalf of M/S Prime Car Rental & Taxi Services Pte Lid the owner of vehicle
SHD2252K in their third party claim against your insured / driver of SDNS203H

Appended below our client’s claim:-

|. Cost of repair $ 6,527.00
2. Loss of rental @0$93.90 x 7 days (Incl. | Sun) $ 65730
3. Loss of income @3 100.00 x 7 days £ 700.00
4. GIA search Fee b 2.00

Total % 7.886.30

We enclosed herewith our invoice 4213, GIA search receipt, letter of authority & Letter of
Certification for vour retention. Please acknowledge receipt.

For amicable settlement. please let us have your ofler
Regards

Yours [aithfully,

Alice Ledpg
F-mail; aliceleong@iprimeautoclaims.com

Enel.
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51 UBLAVE 1, £01-25 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (0651 62563361 FAX @ (65) 62564315

Our Ref: CC6/CTI19015394/T1ha3

(03 SEPTEMBER 2019

THASNEEM PARVEEN D/O SIRAZUDEEN
BY EMAIL BLOCK 274D PUNGGOL PLACE
#13-838

SINGAPORE 824274

Dear SirfMadam,

BY POST &

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SDN 8203H / SHD 2252K / OTHERS ON 29/08/2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under

the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

We have received a claim from Body Repairer/Workshop acting on behalf of the owner

of SHD 2252K against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report, accident scenario and evidence at hand, liability is down
against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the

Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfally,

Vig Alpeh

: 6841 2096

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com

B China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Lid
{Motor Claims Dept)

azminarfina@ gmail.com
i Email)



Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 3 September, 2019 5:03 PM

To: azminarfina@gmail.com

Cc Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: Your Ref: SDN 8203H - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SDN 8203H / SHD 2252K / OTHERS

ON 29/08/2019

!’ V"}' Autg

- Consultants
dl A R Fte i

51 UBIAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, 5IN PAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62364315

Our Ref: CC6/CTI19015394/T1ha3

03 SEPTEMBER 2019

THASNEEM PARVEEN D/O SIRAZUDEEN BY POST & BY EMAIL
BLOCK 274D PUNGGOL PLACE

#13-838

SINGAPORE 824274

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SDN 8203H [/ SHD 2252K / OTHERS ON 29/08/2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the
claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

We have received a claim from Body Repairer/Waorkshop acting on behalf of the owner of SHD 2252K against your
motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report, accident scenario and evidence at hand, liability is down against us. We will therefore
proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended reclpient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law, If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.



LETTER OF AUTHORITY

To: PRIME AUTO CLAIMS SERVICE PTE. LTD.

Re: ACCIDENT ON 30.08.2019 INVOLVING SHD2252K & SDN8203H
ALONG SENGKANG EAST DRIVE

I/ We, M/S Prime Car Rental & Taxi Services Pte Ltd hereby authorized you to carry out repairs

of the damage caused to my / our vehicle no. SHD2252K in the above accident.

I/ We further also confirm and agree that all sums of money to be recovered by you on my/ our
behalf shall be paid to you. I/ We hereby also authorise the third party insurer to release to you

such sums of money recovered on my / our behalf.

------------- CEEEERY

Signature (Company's stamp if applicable)
Name:
NRIC:



MOTOR CLAIMS DISCHARGE MOUCHER

Policy Mo @ DHMBECENIOOZ1E1L0D Claim e = SHMI9DIEGA06BC02L3 (tkl)
Clalmahe. ¢ PRIME CAR BENTAL & TAX! SERVICES PTE LTD
Amount (R 5 L = £ 11

5INGAPDRE DROLLARS SEVEN THOUSAND ©IVE HUNDORER THIRTY SIX
AND: CENTS THIRTY OWNLY

I/¥e agree Lo gccept the above mentlioned amount to be pald te mefus in full &

Fipal zettlement of 311 claims,
SUsE

Clai

L. disbursements for injuries [/ damages

zined by mefus through an sccoident lovolweling

mant Vehicle Mo, & SHD O ZZSZE

Insured Vehicle Moo : ERNCRZ0EH

Date

of Lass = 29 _0B.207%9

Place of Acdigent : BENGHKAENG EAST DRIVE

IM: CONSTDERATION of 'the payment made td ma2/us of the aforementioconed- sum by
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SI[NGAFCORE) PTE. LTD., I/We agrees absclutely to
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGARORE) BTE. LTD: andfor

Ingured Name f THASHEEM PARVEEN D/Q SLRAZUDEEN
Driver Hame 1 THASNEEM ZARVEEM D/0 STRAZHOERM

from all ‘claims, present or futurée In eespect of 4ll l&ss): indury or damage
gustalned by mefus arising our of the zaid accident

1 acknowledge that this payment 8§ made without admission of liabilicy on the
part of CHINA TAIPING INSUHRAMCE (SINGAPCRE] PIE. LTID.

{1} General Rarages 55
{#) Cost o Repalr/Excecs 53 &, 5200
{3} Loas of Use/Bental /Rarning 5 1,067,340
4% ZFLa/Police Reports/
Ipvesthgacion ResulisdSearch Fees 35 20
(53 Medical Repokts/Expenses 55
18y Survey Fecs/P_1. Feegs 85
[Ty Tost inciuding Disbursamsnt 55
TOTAL: Zradiens o % % & W W 8 B ¥ o sl T, 536, 340
Qﬂﬂﬂwaﬂ
=
Z &
Claimant Hame He

Signature

_L;\“t\mu.. Nli

e Ol



PRIME GROUF

MESSRS

ITEM

Make

Repar [Date

TAX INVOICE

Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd
& Benoi Place Singapore B20927

Tel: 6861 0908 Fax: 6515 20848

GST Reg. No: 201606560M

Reg No. 201606560M

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (8) PTE LTD

3 Anson Road
£16-00 Springleaf Tower
SINGAPORE 079509

DESCRIPTION

Model HONDA SHUTTLE
29/08/201%

lenms: of Payment CoD

* Compound mterests at the rate of 1% per month

THIRD PARTY CLAIMS
BEING LUMP SUM REPAIR T THE ABOVE
VEHICLE

will be charged on late pavment

PREPARED BY

NO.: 4215

DATE (09209
WORKS ORDER NO : 4260

VEHICLE NO SHD2252K
LINIT PRICE AMOUNT
b 6] OO0
SUB TOTAL 5 6,100.00
GST ™% < 127.00
ROUNDING ADJD 5 000
TOTAL 5 6,527.00

PRIME AUTO CLAIMS SERVICE
Munager



Prime Taxi Office

PRIME CAR RENTAL i 8
& TAXI SERVICES PTE LTD [l

Email . primetaxi@singnet com,sg
Website : www primetaxi.com.sg

Co. Cert, No: 199606293Z
Gst Reg. No: 19-9606293-2

Your Ref : Please advise Our Ref: SHD2252K
Date :03.09.2019

To : Whom It May Concern

From : Prime Car Rental & Taxi Services Pte Ltd

RE: LETTER OF CERTIFICATION FOR MR. TAN HOCK Al

This letter serves to confirm that Mr. Tan Hock Ai, Nric Number S0144889G is a Taxi
Master for Prime Car Rental & Taxi Services Pte Ltd hiring the Vehicle Number
SHD2252K at a daily rate of Singapore Dollar Ninety Three and Cents Ninety ($93.90)
Only.

Should clarification require I can be contacted at 94524182,

Thank you with Best Regards

Yours Sincerely

Mr. Lim Huan Hiang
Workshop Manager



8/30/2019 T

\ GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
Al GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

g I & Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

. NSURANCE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 5224 0030

EANE ASSOCIATION Opcrating_l Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to Sprm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE ST Registration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref Na: GR-19-141769

Date of Request; 30/08/2018 Your Ref No: Online Purchase
Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Lid

& Benai Place

Singapore 629927

Dear SirlMadam,

Enguiry Date 30/08/20149
Enguiry By Chrissy Teo Ye En
*Vehicle No. SDNB203H
Accident Date 29/08/2019
Enguiry Result
TP Vehicle Na. Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
SDONB20aH China Taiping Insurance (Singapare) Pte. Lid. 03/01/2019-02/01/2020 6389 6111
Thank You,

The images provided to you are taken from the original repons forwarded 1o the cenire by the members of the General Insurance Asaoc;iatin_n af
Singapare and we lake no respan sibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liebility whatsoever for any loss ar damage arising oul of
or in connection with the repors or their images.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.



83072019 Invoice

e i,y GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
n- GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
s & 6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
- 'NSURANCE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +85 6224 0030
" ASS0CIATION Operating Hours: Monday ta Friday 8am to 5pm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GSET Registration Mo: M400017735

TAX INVOICE

Our Ref No: GR-19-141789

Date of Request: 30/08/2019 Your Ref MNo: Online Purchase
Prime Auto Claims Service Ple Ltd

6 Benoi Place

Singapore 629927

Dear SirfMadam,

Enquiry Date 30/08/2019
Enquiry By Chrissy Teo Ye En
7 Vehicle Nao. SDNB203H
Accident Date 29/08/2019
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (58)
TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You.

This is 2 computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[X] GIRO [ ] Cash [ ] Chegque




