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31 UBTAVE 1, 802-25 PAYA UB] INDUSTRIAL PARK. 5IMG CPORE $08933 TEL £ (D63) 02563561 FAX : (1651 625315

Yourref:  DI19005568MESH

Our ref: CS/FCI19015330/AvE3 Date : 26/3/2019

The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. GBH 5449R

We thank you for your instruction on 30/8/2019

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on

30/8/2019  at the premises of M/s MG SOLUTION PTELTD
and have the following Lo report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5514,436.48

Revised Estimate Amount : 5%9,000.00 (LUMP SUM)
"Check” Items Amount : 8§

Market Value 1 8%

LTA Reimbursement Value : 5%

Mett Value : 5%

Deseription of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
rear portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

ADRIAN LING WAI PING
8.Eng AMSOE AMIATE AMSAE-A M.MATAI
Licensed Appraiser



MS @ FirstCapital

M5 First Capltal Insurance Limited ©o#eq be 1950001060 G5 Reg Mo M2 -QOOLETE-D
6 Raffies Quay 421-00 Singapare 048580
Tel (6506222 2311 Fax (B5) G222 3547

Clitens & Mot Usderwrlting Bept: 36 Robinsan Rgad R1E-01 City House Singapore 068377
Tel: (B5) 6507 3848 Fax (65 E507 3848
wiweni msTirstcapiial TDIM.EE

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person

Contact Number,

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
28-08-2019 Our Ref No. D13800556BMFSH
26-08-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
SHCB187G Third Party Vehicle. GBEHS449R

23 KAKI BUKIT AVE 4 AAS KAKI BUKIT CENTRE#02-03
SHAROMN CHIA

65073848/ 0 Fax No. 65073849

WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MA Fax Mo. 68416315
A

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop
Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD Attention. MIL
MNA TP Solicitor Fax No. MNA

JOANNEY

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 26 September 2019 9:43 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims’; SUR

Cc: ‘Joanne Yong'

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19005568MFSH/1 -GBH 5449R
Attachments: GBH 5449R PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle GBH 5449R
Date of survey: 30/8/2019
Number of days (estimated) : 12 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 30 August 2019 4:45 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=
Cc: 'Joanne Yong' <Joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19005568MFSH/1-GBH 5449R

Dear Sir/Madam,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle GBH 5449R on 30/8/201 9.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 30 August 2019 5:39 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com=>

Cc: 'loanne Yong' <loanneyong@msfirsteapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19005568MFSH/1




Dear Sir/Madam,

Thank you for your assignment.

Best Regards,
Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408033)

From: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 30 August, 2019 9:30 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@ LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Joanne Yong
<Joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19005568MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 30 August 2019 4:45 PM

To: ‘CWS Motor Claims’; SUR

Cc 'Joanne Yong'

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D1900556BMFSH/ -GBEH 5449R
Dear Sir/Madam,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle GBH 5449R on 30/8/2019 .

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>

Sent;: Friday, 30 August 2019 9:39 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com:=

Cc: 'Joanne Yong' <Joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg=>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19005568MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Madam,

Thank you for your assignment.

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: gssignments@]kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: CWS Mator Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirsteapital.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 30 August, 2019 9:30 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Joanne Yong
<Joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19005568MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,



We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

Ps: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



MG SOLUTION PTE LTD
73 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 (South Wing) #02-03 Singapore 415933
Tel: (+65) 6243 1373 | Fax: (+65) 6243 1376
Reg, No: 201427944N

THIRD PARTY REQUESTOR / CONTACT

DATE : 30-Aug-12

JOB TYPE : T/P CLAIM

Voo

- i . e
j*rm:-gﬁzu:; IPLRS

TO : FIRST CAPITAL
ATTENTION : MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT
ESTIMATE REPORT
VEHICLE DETAILS
VEHICLE NO : GBH5448R
MODEL : TOYOTA HIACE COMMUTER
CHASSIS NO
ACCIDENT DETAILS DATE : 26-Aug-19
TIME : 00:30HRS

JACK LI

CLAIM DETAIL : PARTS

SN DESCRIPTION QaTty Uﬁ:;léléﬂ' TD:::E:EIST
1|FRONT BUMPER &_‘u 1 -] 54000 | 3 540.00 -
5|FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER LH p-¢ A 1 |s 10000]|$ 190.00|X.
a|HEADLAMP LH (i 1 |s esoo0ls 65000 |7
4|FRONT DOOR LH Zenddtd 1 |$ 155000|8% 1550007
slTacate i stected 1 |s 18e600|s 188690 |
8| TAILGATE LOGO  MNév 1 |8 60.00|§  60.00 |~
TITAILGATE TOYOTA HIACE STICKER A~ i ] 80.00 | % 80.00 e
s|TalLGATE Lock  De—md 1 | s  az000|s 32000
a|TAILGATE WEATHERSTRIP & 1 |8  42210]s aj.zr'r’é'ﬂ"""z i<
10| TAILGATE WINDSCREEN MOULDING N 1 |$ 180.00 | $ 18000 |~
11lrearR BuMPER  * Visfo4—2 1 |s s53000|% 53000 -
12|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER /M4 2 |s 55408 11080] 7
alTaLame (WA 1 |s a2040|s 32240
14| TAILLAMP LOWER APPRON ?uu--\té' 1 |s  1sssols  1ssso |
15| TAILLAMP LOWER APPRON SIDE RETAINER {‘;_, 1 |s 62.00|5 62,00
1efTaiLLAMP PANEL T AC 1 |s ss560|8 55580
17|REAR FENDER. LH %MJM 1 5 1.080.00 | & 1,980.00 -
18|REAR FENDER AIR VENT LH C'“*L-é 1 |s 80.00|§  80.00 il
19{REAR END PANEL(OUTER) D E-prfu 1 |3 680.00 | §  680.00 -
o eeetLiwpe ) PisfoAted o



20| REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH _ phEiée 1 |s 2s000|s 28000 W &
468000 TOTAL PRICE $ 10,615.30
. ’ LESS 25% $ 2,653.83
126045 SUB TOTAL PRICE § 7,061.48
TOTAL
SIN DESCRIPTION QTY | UNITSINETT | o0
1|FRONT BUMPER CLIPS(SET) /¥*+ 1 |s 2500|8  2500|7
2|COMPANY LTA ADDRESS M 1 |s 5000 s  spaf|3°
3|HEADLAMP CLIP(SET) A~ 1|8 2000|s 2000 /e
4|REAR NUMBER PLATE Dested 1 |s 50005  soe0f 30
5| TAILGATE 70KMH  Maar 1 |s so00|s  3pen] /¢
8| TAILGATE WINDSCREEN SEALANT 7 pleer 1 |s 120005 12000740
| TAILGATE WINDSCREEN INNER SEAL " 1 |s  10000|s 10000 | ¥°
8|REAR BUMPER CLIPS(SET)  Xlear 1 |3 2008  2000| ="
a|TAILLAMP LOWER APPRON RIVERT e 1 |3 3000|s 30007 2°
10lREAR END PANEL INSULATION SEALANT /4%~ | 1 |5  12000|s 12000 6©
11|REAR REVERSE SENSOR < Je—¢ 1 |s 200005 ze000]|297
HRE TOTAL $  785.00
CLAIM DETAILS: LABOUR AND SPRAY PAINTING
PANEL BEATING, REMOVAL AND [
1|REPLACING PARTS s soopa| He?
F i
[
2|TO SPRAY PAINT AFFECTED AREA s  eoged| A0
i
3|TUFF coar s 1s000| X
4|WIRING CHECK § 8000 30
i
TO REMOVE RAND REFIX FRONT DOOR .
5| MECHANISM $ TB{J,B( §u
TOTAL $1,610.00 210
CLAIM DETAILS: LABOUR AND SPRAY PAINTING
PANEL BEATING, REMOVAL AND
1|REPLACING PARTS s 200040 | /%00
2|TO SPRAY PAINT AFFECTED AREA s 140000 109"
3| TUFF COAT s 15000 | X
4|WIRING CHECK 5 soed | 39
TO REMOVE AND REFIX TAILGATE
5| MECHANISM $ 15&,5{ 8
TO REMOVE AND REFIX REAR TAILGATE
6{WINDSCREEN s 18000 ‘29




TO REMOVE AND REFIX REVERSE 5“
TISENSOR s 120 .
7
A 4,080.00
TOTAL $ ;1 7 ;?ﬂ
ESTIMATE REPORT
TOTAL PARTS COST 5 B8, 746.48
TOTAL LABOURCOST : S 5,690.00
TOTAL REPAIRCOST : § 14,436.48

PROVED DETAILS

SURVEYOR
CONTACT NO

PART BY PART / LUMP SUM
NO OF DAYS

FAX
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607T198R GST Reg. No 18-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref :  CS/FCI19015330/Avi3n2

|NUAIO

36 ROBINSON ROAD

Date: 02-10-201
#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 e -

Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC B1BTG Veh. Inspected GBH 5448R
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D19005568MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From JOANNEY Assign Date annazn1g
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA HIACE c.c 2082
Engine No. HIDDEMN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. JTFHTO2PA00243685 Colour SILVER
Odometer 34612 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195 R15C BRIDGESTONE & mm
L/H Front Tyre |185R15C BRIDGESTONE & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |1%5R15C BRIDGESTONE 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |195R15C BRIDGESTOMNE 6 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5, General Information
Accident Date  26/08/2018 Inspection Date 30082018
Survey held at MG SOLUTION PTELTD
23 KAKI BUKIT AVE 4
(SOUTH WING) #02-03B
VICOM INSPECTION CENTRE,
SINGAPORE 415933
5a. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C}IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 12 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Req. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607188-R
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GBH 5449R

Page No.:1 of 2

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop [::I} t-'al}
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER DEFORMED 540.00 540.00
1|FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER LH NOT NECESSARY 180.00 -
1|HEADLAMP LH cuTt 650.00 650,00
1|FRONT DOOR LH DENTED 1,550.00 1,550.00
1| TAILGATE DISTORTED 1,866.90 1,866.90
1|TAILGATE LOGO NECESSARY 60.00 60.00
1|TAILGATE TOYOTA HIACE STICKER NECESSARY 80.00 80.00
1| TAILGATE LOCK DAMAGED 320.00 320.00
1| TAILGATE WEATHERSTRIP CuT 42210 245,00
1| TAILGATE WINDSCREEN MOULDING MECESSARY 180.00 180.00
1|REAR BUMPER DISTORTED 530.00 530.00
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAIMNER @$55.40 NECESSARY 110.80 110.80
1| TAILLAMP cuT 322.40 32240
1|TAILLAMP LOWER APFROMN DAMAGED 158550 165.50
1| TAILLAMP LOWER APPROMN SIDE RETAINER NOT NECESSARY 62.00 -
1| TAILLAMP PAMEL TO REPAIR SEE 555.60 -
LABOUR
1|REAR FENDER LH BUCKLED 1,980.00 1,980.00
1|REAR FEMDER AIR VENT LH CRACKED a0.00 80.00
1|REAR END PANEL (QUTER) DISTORTED GR0.00 680.00
1|REAR END PAMEL TOP GARNISH BENT 280.00 280.00
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -2,653.83 -2,420.15
7.961.47 7,260.45
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET FRONT BUMPER CLIPS (SN) MECESSARY 25.00 2500
1|COMPANY LTA ADDRESS (SN) MECESSARY 50.00 30.00
1|SET HEADLAMP CLIP (SM) NECESSARY 20.00 10.00
1|REAR MUMBER PLATE (SN) DENTED 50,00 30.00
1| TAILGATE TOKM/H (SN) NECESSARY 30.00 10.00
1| TAILGATE WINDSCREEMN SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 120.00 40.00
1|TAILGATE WINDSCREEN INMER SEAL (SN} MECESSARY 100.00 40,00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19015330/Avfan2




' Vd 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

"_J"" - 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 198607198R GST Reg. No, 19-9607198-R Page No.2 of 2
s Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition |\ Chop tg}] {51‘;
1|SET REAR BUMPER CLIP (SN) NECESSARY 20.00 20.00
1{TAILLAMP LOWER APPRON RIVERT (SN) MECESSARY 30.00 20.00
1|REAR END PANEL INSULATION SEALANT (SN) MECESSARY 120.00 60.00
1|REAR REVERSE SENSOR (SN) DAMAGED 220.00 200.00
785.00 485.00
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING,REMOVAL AND REPLACING PARTS. 600.00 300.00
TO SPRAY PAINT AFFECTED AREA. &600.00 400.00
TUFF COAT. MOT NECESSARY 150.00
WIRING CHECK. 80.00 30.00
TO REMOVE AND REFIX FRONT DOOR MECHANISM. 180.00 80.00
PAMEL BEATING REMOVEL AND REPLACING 2,000.00 1,400.00
PARTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF TAILLAMP PANEL.
TO SPRAY PAINT AFFECTED AREA. 1,400.00 1,100.00
TUFF COAT. NOT NECESSARY 150.00 -
WIRING CHECEK. 80.00 30.00
TO REMOVE AND REFIX TAILGATE MECHANISM. 150.00 80.00
TO REMOVE AND REFIX REVERSE SENSOR. 120.00 50.00
TO REMOVE AND REFIX REAR TAILGATE WINDSCREEN. 180.00 120.00
5,680.00 3,590.00
GRAND TOTAL 14,436.47 11,335.45
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 9,000.00
{TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCIM19015330/Avi3n2

J ZI: 3‘2-
ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng. AMSOE AMIRTE, AMSAE-A,M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES: This Report is made solely for the use and banafit of the Client namad an the front page af this Raport.




