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PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

- > Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type: Company
Owner ID: 569N

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: GBH2574G
Vehicle to be Exported: No

Intended Deregistration Date: 29 Aug 2019
Vehicle Make: TOYOTA
Vehicle Model: DYNA 150 5MT
Primary Colour: Silver
Manufacturing Year: 2018

Engine No.: 1KD2793028
Chassis No.: JTFAT35YX0K210130
Maximum Power Output: -

Open Market Value: $27,084.00
Original Registration Date: 03 Apr 2018
First Registration Date: 03 Apr 2018
Transfer Count: 0

Actual ARF Paid: $1.355.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: No

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -

PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00
Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 02 Apr 2028
COE Category: C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
COE Period(Years): 10

PQP Paid: $18,403.00
COE Rebate Amount: $15.816.00
Total Rebate Amount: $15,816.00

Page 1 of 1

The information contained herein is correct as at 29 Aug 2019

OK
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ESTIMATE

Our Ref: AC2019032/TP/GBH2574G - 28.08.2019

Vehicle number: GBH2574G

Items Qty  List Items

1 1 Tallgate

2 1 Tallgate sticker "TOYOTA"

3 1 Tailgate sticker "DYNA"

4 1 Tailgate lower member

5 4 Tailgate hinges @ 65.50

B 2 Tailgate stoppers @ 28.60

7 2 Taillamps - L/R @ 291.33

g 2 Taillamp panels - L/R @ 185.90
9 1 Rear licence plate bracket
10 1 Rear sidegate-LH

1 1 Rear sidegate lock hinge - LH
12 1 Rear sidegate lower member

Special Nett items

1 1 Rear sticker "70 KM/H"

2 1 Rear licence plate

3 l1set Rear reverse sensor

Labour charges

1 Tocheck rear electrical wiring

2  Toremove, refix rear reverse sensor

3 To respray undercoating

4 Torespray painting and etc

5

Panel beating, cut, weld remove & replacing above parts

ESTIMATE PARTS AND LA

[V#

1?/‘5’%‘2

/% g

UR GRAND TOTAL §

ddr

Automaobile Integrated Managamant Pre Lig
Co & GST Regno. 2016052576

Officz: 28 Sim Ming Lane 807147 Midview Oty Singapore 573972
Workahop: 29 Lok Bukie Ave 5 808-01 [South Wing) Singapore 815533

Page 1of 1

Emaill: sutomim cisim@gmall.com Tei: 3115 8371

Vehicle Made & Model: TOYOTA DYNA

unt
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Sub-total 6,208.10
Less 25% 1,552.28
Total List 4,656.83
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Total Special Nett 330.00
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120.00 §&°
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Total Labour 2,530.00
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Hsiao Tnna (LKKAuto)

From: AIM PTE LTD <automim.claim@gmail com>

Sent: Tuesday, 24 September 2019 5:24 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LEKAuto)

Cc: CS A Team; Admin A; assignmenis

Subject: Re: [EXTERNAL] NOA- GBH2574G // Claim TP 28.08.2019 *** LKK REF:
CC4/ASM19015320/wa3

Attachments: Letter of demand GBH2574G (1).pdf, INVOICE GBH2574G.pdf; 24092019172308 pdf

Hi Mei Kwan,

Enclosed the relevant documents for your action. Please proceed.
Thank you.

Regards,
lacyne

Automobile Integrated Management Pte Ltd
tel; 91198371

On Thu, Aug 29, 2019 at 7:16 PM Mei Kwan [LKKAuto) <Meikwani@lkkauto.com> wrote:

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE

SAVEAS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.,

Please be informed Ol has reported. Please refer to the below OI's sketch plan and statement.



Dl

Please arrange for TP survey.

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | emall: MeiKwand lkksito.com | fax: 67413108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{4o8933)

From: AIM PTE LTD <auto mail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 28 August, 2019 2:50 PM

To: SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey <maotor.su axa.com.sg>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] NDA- GBH2574G // Claim TP 28.08.2019

Hi,



Please refer to attached to advise further,

Thank you.

Regards,

Jacyne

AlM

tek F11063 7Y



1WS/2019 Claim Portal

« <TP-Mandate IA> - S9MO1YP2 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING
SMA 2463A(0I) & GBH 2574G(TP) ON 28/08/2019

Type
© Question

Message
Liability: 100%. Insured rear-ended third party, Inform Ol about third party claim. Agreed to settle at best

and aware NCD Issue. We seek your mandate at $3,663.50(all-in), TP-Mandate |A had been uploaded in
Smartclaims. Kindly let us have vour approval/instruction. Hsiao Tang - 5-Oct-19 .

hitps//vo.smanclaims. axa.com.sg/claim-poralhimiindex-vendor-service-requests himi#service-requests/view-message/TservicoRequestNumbe I
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Immediate Advice
To : AXA Insurance Pte Ltd Date: 5/10/2019
Survey Details:
Date of loss 28-Aup-19
Date of appointment 29-Aug-19
Date of survey 29-Aug-19
Location of survey AUTOMOBILE INTEGRATED MANAGEMENT PL
Vehicle Details:
Claim Type: THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Vehicle number GBH25746G
Make and Model TOYOTA DYNA 150 5MT
Date of registration 3-Apr-18
Parf Rebate
Market Value s 55,000.00
Parf Rebate 5 14,722.00
Mett Loss 5 40,278.00
Repair details:
|Initial Estimate |'s 7,516.83 |

Proposed/Revised repair cost:

Parts 5 1,806.76 | [Parts less 50%)
Check items (estimate) < -

Labour s 1,260.00

Total S 3,066.76

Lump Sum(if applicable) 5 3,050.00

|Number of days for repair | a|
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Remarks:

Ol REAR-ENDED THIRD PARTY.

Mandate:

Liability(TP) 100%

Proposed repair cost S 3,263.50

Loss of use 5 400.00 |(4days x 5100)
Loss of rental NIL |no. of days
Loss of income NIL |no. of days
LTA search fees MNIL

Others MNIL

Proposed Total 5 3,663.50




Hsiao Tnﬂ (LKKAuto)

From: Mel Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 10 October 2013 11:15 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: New message for service request 134508, vehicle number GBH2574G
10/10/19 10:50 AM *** MessageHi Hsiao Tong, proceed. Thanks - KHONG Lynn

----- Original Message-—

From: lynn.khong@axa.com.sg <lynn.khong@axa.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 10 October, 2019 10:51 AM

To: admin-d@lkkauto.com

Subject: New message for service request 134508, vehicle number GBH2574G

AXA Insurance has sent you a message for claim number S9MO1YP2.

Please click here https://vp.smartclaims.axa.com.sg/claim-portal/ to view the message in Vendor Portal.

This message Is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by AXA except where provided for in a
written agreement between you and AXA. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or
partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.



Hsiao TD“E (LKKAuto) I i I

From: AlM PTE LTD <automim.claim@gmaill.com:>

Sent: Monday, 14 October 2019 1:45 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto]

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: [EXTERNAL] NOA- GBH2574G // Claim TP 28.0B.2019 *** LKK REF
CCA/ASM18015320/Upa3

Hi Hsiao Tong,

We accepted the amount. Please proceed. Any document needed?
Thank you.
Regards,

lacyne

Automobile Integrated Management Pte Ltd (aim)
tel: 91198371

On Mon, Oct 14, 2019 at 12:41 PM Hsiao Tong [LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) 53,263.50
2. Loss of Use (4days x $B0.00) % 320.00
Total | $ 3,583.50

Please confirm acceptance.

“please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the autharised driver. The terms of our without prejudice



engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other related
claims.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pie Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | emall: chewht@lkkauto.com | fox: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S[408033)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 24 September 2019 5:27 PM

To: AIM PTE LTD <automim.claim@gmail.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com:>

Cc: €S A Team <cs-a@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; assignments <assignments(@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] NOA- GBH2574G // Claim TP 28.08.2019 *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM19015320/Upa3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE

SAVEAS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.

Hi Hsiao Tong,

Kindly assist.

Ta check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.



Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6366 o055 | email; MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51. Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408031)

From: AIM PTE LTD <automim.claim@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 24 September, 2019 5:24 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan(@|kkauto.com>
Ce: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>; assignments <assipnments@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: [EXTERNAL] NOA- GBH2574G Jf Claim TP 28.08.2015 *** LKK REF: €C4/A5SM18015320/wa3

Hi Mei Kwan,

Enclosed the relevant documents for your action. Please proceed.

Thank you.

Regards,

Jacyne

Automobile Integrated Management Pte Ltd

tel: 91198371

On Thu, Aug 29, 2019 at 7:16 PM Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@|kkauto.com> wrote:
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE”
SAVEASTO COSTS



Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed DI has reported. Please refer to the below O1's sketch plan and statement.

Please arrange for TP survey.

Thank voul.

Hest Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeilKwand [kkawto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(q089:33)

From: AIM PTE LTD <automim.claim@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 28 August, 2019 2:50 PM

To: SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey <motor.survey(@axa.com.sg>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] NOA- GBH2574G // Claim TP 28.08.2019

Hi,

Please refer to attached to advise further,

Thank you.



Regards,

lacyne

AlM

el #119EIN
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<« Service Request Details

Clanky
SeMO1YP2

melergnon

None #*

August 28, 2019

Report Date

Aug 28, 201% 3:46:00 PM

Hisouest Liite

August 29, 2019

D Date
September 5, 201%

Viindor Name

LKK AUTO COMNSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP}

Type of Loss

Third Party Vehicle Damage

- _

Pending verification - Direct Sertlement
Actions

Next Step
Agree {o perfarm service

Claim Portal

p. AT
T35

Vily
E Vv

Vehicle Infarmation

Incudiinl Vel it Resgistralicin =
GBH2574G

hrmur-w.mmmwwmmmwmwmmummmmmummmmﬁu

2



arz2er2018 Claim Porial

WM

LORRY

Service Address

Primary Contact/Insured

TAN CHC SIANG DORIS

32C MANGIS RDAD. 424967, Singapore
DaHT94912
DORISTCS@YAHOO.COM.SG

Claim Handler

KHONG Lynn
48804892
lynn khong@axa.com.sg

Adelitional Instructions

Invoices Histary Documents Asspssmint Metrics MNotes

hitps:/ivp smartclaims axa.com.sgiclaim-portalhtml/index-vendor-service-requests himigservice-requests/?senvicaRequesiNumbar=1 34508



Catherine Chnng (LKK Auto)

From:

Sent:

To:

Subject:
Attachments:

Categories:

Hi,

AIM PTE LTD <automim.claim@gmail.coms
Wednesday, 28 August, 2019 2:50 PM

SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey
[EXTERNAL] NOA- GBH2574G // Claim TP 28.08.2019
Motice of acct GBH2574G (28 AUG).pdf

Raghav

Please refer to attached to advise further.

Thank you,

Regards,
Jacyne

Al
tel 91188371



Automobile Imtegrated Management Pte Ltd

GST Reqistration No. : 201605297G
Company Registration No. 201605287G

st remgrated Munugene e Lot

Tax Invoice

INVOICE TO

AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD
B SHENTON WAY

#24-01 AXA TOWER
0GB811

INVOICE NO. AC2018032/TP
DATE 24/09/201%9
DUE DATE 24/08/2019
TERMS Due an receipt

VEHICLE NO.
GBH2574G

DESCRIPTION

INSURANCE CLAIMS
LUMP SUM REPAIR COST

GST SUMMARY
RATE
GST @ 7%

Payment mode:

* Bank transfar to OCBC current 712821057001

* Paynow, UEN. 201605297G

SUBTOTAL
GS5T TOTAL
TOTAL
BALANCE DUE

GST
213.50

* Cheque to be issued to Automobile Integrated Management Pte Lid

ary RATE AMOUNT
1 3.050.00 3.,050.00

3.050.00
213.50
3,263.50

S$$3,263.50

NET

3,050.00

Workshop Address: 23 Kaki Bukit Ave 5 #04-01 (South Wing) Singapore 415933

Mailing Address: 28 Sin Ming Lane #07-147 Midview City Singapore 573972
Emall: automim.acct@gmall.com

Tel: 91188371 /91198372



Automobile integrated Managemant Ple Ltd

Co. & GS.T. Reg no. 201605297G

DOffice; X8 Sin Ming Lame #07- 187 Midview City Smgapore 573572
Workshop: 23 Kaki Bukit Aye S 804-01 (South Wing) Singapare 415533

Avtnmobile integrated Manapsment P Lid Ernail; agtarmim.claimi@gmall com Tel: 31198371

By Email

Our ref: AC2019032/TP/GBH2574G-28.08.2019/LOD

24" September 2019

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd

8 Shenton Way

#24-01 AXA Tower

Singapore 068811

Attention: Claim Officer in charge

Dear Sir / Madam,

CLAIMANT — JET-VACS SERVICE PTELTD
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH2574G AND SMAZ2463A ALONG THE SLIP ROAD OF PAYA LEBAR

AND BARTLEY ROAD ON 28 AUGUST 2019

We are appointed by JET-VACS Service Pte Ltd to repair their vehicle GBH2574G. The
claimant has requested and authorized us to assist them in presenting their claims in
connection with the above-said accident. We are submitting these claim for your
consideration:

1. Cost of Repair 55 3263.50
2. Loss of use (4 days x $120 per day) SS  480.00

Total Claims: $S _3743.50

We enclosed herewith the following document:

[a) Original Final Repair Bill
(b) Letter of Authorization

We look forward to the settlement of the said claim. Please note that it is a condition of any
settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to and shall not affect any other claims
arising from this accident.

Thank you.

Yours faithfully,
Automobile Integrated Management Pte Ltd



Hsiao Tnnﬂ (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Wednesday, 25 September 2019 2:46 PM

Ta: PDORISTCS@YAHOO,COMSG

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMA 2463A(AXA) AND GBH 2574G ALONG/AT PAYA LEBAR

ROAD/ BARTLEY ROAD (SLIP ROAD) ON 28/08/2019

25 Sept 2019
Ms Tan Cho Siang Doris
Dear Sir/ Mdm

OUR REF  :CC4/ASM19015320/Upa3 // S9MOD1YP2

YOUR REF  : SMA2463A

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMA 2463A(AXA) AND GBH 2574G ALONG/AT PAYA LEBAR ROAD/ BARTLEY ROAD (SLIP
ROAD) ON 28/08/2019

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor
insurer, AXA Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a third party claim(s) from AUTOMOBILE INTEGRATED MANAGEMENT PL acting on behalf of the
owner of GBH2574G against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is not in your favour as it is a head-to-rear collision. As
such, we shall procead to negotiate for an amicable settlement of the third party claim at best to avoid further
litigation, which would escalate to even more cost.

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD) may be affected as a result of the claim against your policy.

As Insurers, they shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according to the rights
afforded under the policy, Should you not be seeking the protection of your policy and seek to take conduct of third
party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your own cost and defence, please reply to us within 7 days from the
date of this letter, You intent must be formally expressed to AXA and acknowledged by AXA.

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the following to
chewht@|kkauto.com within 7 days from the date of this letter if not provided at our reporting centre. The list
below is not all inclusive and further document may be required:

. Police report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence and status (if any)

. Driver's driving license or foreign driving license (if any)

. Driver's work permit/ work pass

. Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any)

. Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (If any)

. Copy of the letter of authorization

. Video footage of accident (If any)

. Statement and/or police report from independent witness(es) [if any)

. If you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third Party(s), you are to keep us

informed of your legal representative(s) and the status of the claim.

To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with any of the Third Party(s)
and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or settlement without our prior knowledge and
consent. If you receive any correspondence or legal document such as a Writ of Summons in connection with this



accident, please forward it to us immediately. You may emall it to cst@axa.com.sg or deliver it by hand 1o AXA
Customer Care Centre.

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AXA of their rights to repudiate any claim because of any breach of
policy terms and conditions you and/for your authorised driver may have committed.

in the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), we shall keep you informed of the final
indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).

if you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact as at 6742 3197 or chewht@lkkauto.com. Please
quote our claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more effectively.

Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phome: 6rg2-g197 | email: chewht@lkkaute.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrinl Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S[q08433)



AUTHORIZATION TO ACT

], _JET-VACS SERVICE PTE LTD

(the third party claimant) of _BLK 3005 UBIAVEUES

#03-52 SINGAPORE 408861 (address), owner of _GBH2574G . (vehicle no.)

henby authorize AUTOMOBILE INTEGRATED MANAGEMENT PTE LTD (*the workshop™) to act for me

with respect to my claim for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use (“claim”) for my vehicle

po. _GBH2574G__ that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on _28/08/2019

(dltﬁ} ahn; PAYA LEBAR ROADBARTLEY ROAD (SLLIPF ROAD)

(location) involving vehicle nofs

SMA2463A __ (“the accident™).

I farther authorize the workshop to settle my sbove meationed claim in a manner that they desm fit
and the worlkshop is further authorized to receive payment further to settlement of my claim with

payment cheque/s being made in favour of the workshop.

1 further acknowledge that any seftlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a without

prejudice and without admission of lisbility basis msafar as the driverfowner/insurers of the other

vehicle/s is concemed.

Dated this __ 2 (day) of F‘"_ (month) zu_j (year)

, ROCno.: 2016052976
|\ Registored Address: 28 Sin Ming Lane

;g" 5 Y Email: sutomim scct@gmail.com
.i( } l Tl B G RT 5!‘?_!]1'2

Signed by “the third party claimant” Signed by “the workshop”
(with chop if applicable) (with chop)

Automobile integrated Management Pte Lid

BOT- 147 Midview City Singapore $73972



AXA THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Vehide No: SMAZ4B3A  |insd weh)
GBHZSTAG (TP veeh) Model: TOYOTA DYNA 150 SMT

Date of Accident/ Time: 28082018
Repait Extlmata 5] .01
Firial Repalr Cosl pGST) 5 1 3,263.50
Loss of Use $§ | az000 4 deys ot 532000 per clay |
Rental (il any) 15 - dapsat s per day
LTA / GIA Search Fee %
Otheri: 33

15 1
Final Settlement Sum I:l l 3,583.50

Payes Name ;AUTOMOBILE INTEGHATED MANAGEMENT FTELTD
1s Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? | | YES ] NO  (Kindly indicate below|

Al ot Non GlA Registered Workshop: Agreed Uability 100 (%)
] For GIA Registered Workshop: BOLA Applicable: Yeu/ Mo BOLAScenatio No:
BOLA Liability: %) Asvessed Llabilty (*y__________{%)
* Ausogied Linbility to be filled anly for chain coliians and far cases where BDLA does not opoly.
Remarks:
MOTE:

1. PLEASE EXPRESSLY RESERVE YOUR CLIENT'S RIGHTS IF 50 REQUIRED IN THIS SETTLEMENT DOCUMENT.,

2. THIS SETTLEMENT 15 ON A WITHOUT PRE/UDICE BASIS AND SHOULD NOT CONSTRUED AS AN ADMISSION OF
LIABILITY ON AXA AND THEIR CLIENT/TORTFEASOR IN ANY MANNER WHATSOEVER.

3. AXMA RESERVES THEIR RIGHTS UNDER THE POLICY TERMS & CONDITIONS AS WELL AS THEIR RIGHTS IN LAW,

Only spplicable to rental clalm - All document are 1o be submitted with this ssttlement confirmation. In the evenL rental

agresment | invaiees are not recelved within 7 doys of this signed confirmation. we will automatically revert 1o loss of use claim
per the NINA releL

We/l conficmed that this is a full and final settiement that we and or cur client have/had/Mhas against you (AXA and their
policyholderfautharised driver tonfeasor] far any and all losses (pest/present/future) arising from this accident

We confirmed that we have the sutharity of oor chient to act for and an ther behall in this accident.

Automobile Integrated Management Pte Lid
AOC nao.: 2016052970
Fegistered Address: 28 Sin Ming Lane s
Signature of workshop repTELEhA IV .1“, J gnature of Witnkss [ Worlahop stamp (i spplicable]

Hame of fep talive:

oate 1|\ "u_ql_ ol apond, CNS ﬁ'f

one 13iof19

\\LKK ) ) cies
Mame nliﬁm;:w

Date:

AXA insurance Pre Lid (Company Reg, Hoo 199903512M]
£ Shenton Way #£24-0) AYA Tower Singapore DGBR11
AXA Customer Centre 80121131

Telaphane: «55 G830 4RE8 - ash.comag



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6255 3581 FAX: 6256 4015
Reg Mo 188607198R GST Reg. No. 19-89607188-R

AMiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD Ref CC4/ASM18015320/Upa3q2
A oue: wwzos [N
ATTNLYNN Code: ASM
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SMA 2463A Veh. Inspected GBH 2574G
Policy No. VPA/P2129983 Coverage (%) 0.00
Claim No. SEMOD1YP2 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 29/08/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA DYNA (M) c.c 2982
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. JTFAT3SYX0K210130 Colour SILVER
Odometer 54379 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Maodification NIL
General GOoOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185/75 R15 YOKOHAMA B mm
L/H Front Tyre |185/75R15 YOKOHAMA & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |155R12 (D) YOKOHAMA, 6/6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |155 R12(D) YOKOHAMA 6/6 mm
Py Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  28/08/2018 Inspection Date 29/08/2019
Survey held at AUTOMOBILE INTEGRATED MANAGEMENT PL
28 SIN MING LANE #07-147 MIDVIEW CITY SINGAPORE 573872
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE™ BASIS
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS,
5h. i ‘Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ui Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 8256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg Mo 190607198R GST Reg. Mo 18.8607198-R Paga No 1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GBH 2574G
aty ~ Description of Parts Condition: | [ Efmate | UIREIEee
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|TAILGATE (CONSISTENT) DENTED / BENT 1,485 .60 1,485 60
1|TAILGATE STICKER TOYOTA' (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 1689.60 189.60
1|TAILGATE STICKER 'DYNA' (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 58.60 58.60
1|TAILGATE LOWER MEMBER (CONSISTENT) DENTED / BENT 541.680 54190
4| TAILGATE HINGES @565.50 (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 262.00 -
2| TAILGATE STOPPERS @$28.60 (CONSISTENT) NIS CUT 57.20 28.60
2| TAILLAMPS -UR @$291.33 (CONSISTENT) NIS CRACKED 562 60 201.33
2| TAILLAMP PANELS -L/R @5185.90 (CONSISTENT) WIS BENT 371.80 185.80
1|REAR LICENCE PLATE BRACKET (CONSISTENT) BENT 186.50 186.50
1|REAR SIDEGATE -LH (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 1,685.90 -
1|REAR SIDEGATE LOCK HINGE -LH (CONSISTENT) BENT 185.50 195.50
1|REAR SIDEGATE LOWER MEMBER (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 591.80
LABOUR
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -1,552 28
LESS 50% DISCOUNT - -1,581.77
4 656.82 1.581.76
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR STICKER "TOKM/H' (SN) (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 10.00 10.00
1|REAR LICENCE PLATE (SN) (CONSISTENT) BENT 40,00 15.00
1|SET REAR REVERSE SENSOR (SN) (CONSISTENT) SHORTED 2B0.00 200.00
330.00 225.00
LABOUR
TO CHECK REAR ELECTRICAL WIRING., 50.00 10.00
TO REMOVE ,REPLACE REVERSE SENSOR . 80.00 50.00
TO RESPRAY UMDERCOATING. 120.00 50.00
TO RESPRAY PAINTING AND ETC, 1,080.00 550.00
FPANEL BEATING ,CUT WELD REMOVE & REPLACING 1,200.00 800.00
ABOVE PARTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR
SIDEGATE LOWER MEMBER
2,530.00 1,260.00

Report Ref No. CC4/ASM18015320/Upa3q2
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Page No 2of 2
GRAND TOTAL 7.516.82 3.066.76
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS y Wun
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION) :

Report Ref No. CC4/ASM19015320/Upa3q2

CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAMER OF LLABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES - This Reporn is mado solely Tor the use snd benefit of the Clieni nemed on the frant page of this Repan
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