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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Taxis) <LeeGek@smrt.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 12 June 2020 3:43 PM
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Subject: YOUR REF: SHC 4510H (OUR REF: CC4/III19015310/Ega3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING PA 

7245U & SHC 4510H ON 24/08/2019 ***    SMRT Ref: TAX/08/19/2099
Attachments: 1039_001.pdf

Dear Cecilia, 
 
We have returned the original signed DV to III on 11/6/20 (copy attached). Thanks.  
 
Regards 
Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6556 3548) 
Claims Department 
SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd   

 
 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Friday, 12 June 2020 3:35 PM 
To: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Taxis) 
Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SHC 4510H (OUR REF: CC4/III19015310/Ega3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING PA 7245U & SHC 4510H 
ON 24/08/2019 *** SMRT Ref: TAX/08/19/2099 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Lee Gek, 
 
We have check with our principal and we are pleased to settle at G/S $3500.00 (all-in). 
 
Kindly sign on DV as attached and email back to us (LKK). 
 
Thanks  
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the 
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this 
negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be 
made via email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any 
inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
 


