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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 24 January 2022 5:12 PM
To: TEO Kitty
Cc: Accounts (LKKAuto); Admin A
Subject: AXA Claim Ref: S9M01YUN // New message for service request 134530, vehicle 

number SHD208C

Hi Kitty, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Kindly refer to calculation table as  below, we confirm that the total GST is $24.84. 
 

      

  Fee Charged 7% GST Total  
1 Third Party Express Settlement 350.00 24.50 374.50  
2 Registered Mail Fee  27.09.2019 2.37 0.17 2.54  
3 Registered Mail Fee  06.04.2020 2.37 0.17 2.54  

  354.74 24.84 379.58  
 
 
"Wishing You Happiness & Prosperity Chinese New Year 2022" 
 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
 
 
-----Original Message----- 
From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, 24 January 2022 4:32 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: FW: New message for service request 134530, vehicle number SHD208C 
 
24/1/22 4:20 PM              ***  
Hi Hsiao Tong, The gst amt is wrong, we are unable to process pyt, pls let us have the amended invoice. - TEO Kitty 
 
 
-----Original Message----- 
From: kitty.teo@axa.com.sg <kitty.teo@axa.com.sg> 
Sent: Monday, 24 January, 2022 4:21 PM 
To: admin-d@lkkauto.com 
Subject: New message for service request 134530, vehicle number SHD208C 
 
AXA Insurance has sent you a message for claim number S9M01YUN. 
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Please click here https://vendor.smartclaims.axa.com.sg/ClaimApplication/dist/html/index-vendor.html to view the 
message in Vendor Portal. 
 
This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by AXA except where provided for in a 
written agreement between you and AXA. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or 
partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately. 
 


