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SG 98 MOTORPTELTD

4001, Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1 #01-21 SINGAPORE 569622

Dale: 29 August 2019

To :

Aftn
Tel.

LKK

By

VEHICLE NO . FBJ 4521K
ACCIDENT DATE: 26 August 2019

oo~ h bW -

Description

Exhaust Pipe KM

Exhaust Guard ( wh

Rear Tail Panei - RH ¢+~
Handle Bar RH Ny

Mirror RH ¢ Wit

Bar End Balancer Wl
Front B Fairing - L |f C v
Front RH Signal Py
Brake Lever _cvq.

Tel: 54524898 Fax: 8452 4868

Emall: sg_motor_soterprise@yahoo.comsg

By Fax: 6256-4315

Yamaha R15

—_
.-.L_'L_.tg e e A
—_

Sub-Tolal
Less 10%
Sub-Total

§45 0V
144D

Quotation §

580.00 X

190.00 L~

150,00 ¥

185.00 75

95.00

190.00 A
00420 A —
9500

8500 —

1,780.00
178.00
1,602.00




VEHICLE NO : FBJ 4521K Yamaha R15

Nett ltems
1 Towing fee ™t 40.00 ¥
2 Remove & replace necessary paris, 25070 IEle-
align & stc 3= DR D
3 Putty & touch up paint work 28060 120 l.—
Sub-Total 570.00
Nett Total 2,172.00
MB: This oalimate was made from o visust (0£6-5D
spactan only, any oiher dimaEgo parns of
willl gcving you and submil supplermeniary
lbem o you acoordingly,

Kindly revert upon completion. Thank you

SG 98 MOTOR PTE LTD c;ﬂ lo% ‘. Bt~
N A A

aJ—lSwM
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» To desplay Sarmages] parin] Dunng ey

+ Parm prcas an sudmct & confirmason

» Third panty survey & on & “Without Preguics” bess
u by gl mociicanordy) & aioees

* Supplenentary ibemiy) Ferped
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plRa2018 Claim Portal

« Service Request Details

Clalm
SIMO1YNS

Referance
None #

Loss Date
August 26, 2019

Keport Lhals

Aug 28, 2019 9:04:38 AM

Request Date
August 28. 2019

Diie Diate
September 4, 2019

Vendor Name
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP)

Tvpe of Loss

Third Party Vehicle Damage

Eanmnilea
S0 W ILED

Pending verification - Direct Settlement

Actions

Mext Step
Agree to perfarm service

Vehicle Information

Incident Vehicle Registration #
FBla521K

hitps:iivp. smarciaims ‘axa com.sglclaim-portaltmifindex-vendaor-senvice-requests himi#sarvice-requests/PserviceRequestNumber=134287 112



B28/2018 Claim Portal

TBC

Service Address

Primary Contact/Insured

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No.2 ANG MO KIO STREET 63, 569111, Singapore

Claim Handler

LOH Cynthia
6568804843
cynthialoh@axa.comsg

Additional Instructions

NOT REPORTED

Inwoicas History Documents Assessment Metrics Notes

hitps:/ivp. smartclaims axa.com sg/claim-portalmtmlindex-vendor-service-requests. himi# service-reguesis/TserviceReguesiNumber=134287

a2



Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Sg Motor <sgmotor2000@yahoo.com.sg»

Sent: Tuesday, 27 August, 2019 4:27 PM

To: SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey
Cc 5g Motor

Subject: |EXTERNAL] Please arrange PRI on bike FBJ 4521K
Attachments: FBJ 4521K- AXA -PRI.pdf

Categories: Raghav

Attn : Mator Claim
Dear Sir / Madam
Please arrange PRI on bike FBJ 4521K as per attached.

Please provide a list of surveyors and their respective company name.

Thank You

ARegards
Linda

SG 98 Motor Pte Ltd

Bik 4001 #01-21

Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1
Singapore 568622

Tel: 64524898 Fax: 64526898



2142020 Claim Poral

<« Re:RE: PLEASE UPDATE STATUS

Type
© Question

Message
PIR AGAINST TP - PLEASE REJECT TP

hitps:/ivp smartclalms, axa.com.sg/claim-portalihimlindex-vendor-service-requests himig/sarvice-requesis/view-message/TserviceRequestMumbe.,. 11
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Sngapore S05885
T &4 8547 0000
Fas «08 0347 4883
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Reaport No : TP/IP/55487/2019

Date : 31 OCTOBER 2019 e

TAN HUI MING ZAC

BLK 416 YISHUN AVENUE 11
#08-353

SINGAPORE 760416

RECIPIENT'S COPY

STERN WARNING

1. In-.reshgatiuna against you, Tan Hui Ming Zac, NRIC: S9€ )6 " 987F

—" !
AR o 573 ALLEGED OFFENCE(S!

|"S/No ' Legislation 1 Date &

CcCoOmiIT

s disclosed by investigations,
i pﬁi,uqnumt any offence in

31/10/2019

Date



- Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 7 November 2019 5:49 PM

To: 'claims’

Cc ‘Mg Wai Yin'; jasminetan@transcab.com.sg; ‘alicelim@ava-ins.com’; 'diskyac@ava-
ins.cam'

Subject: YOUR REF: SHC 5170Z (OUR REF: CC4/ASM19015293/Dgb3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING

SHC 5170Z & FBJ 4521K ON 26/08/2019 ***

Dear Sir/Madam,

OUR REF : CC4/ASM19015293/Dgb3
YOUR REF :SHC5170Z

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC 5170Z & FB] 4521K ALONG/AT YISHUN AVE 1 ON 26/08/2019

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor
insurer, AXA Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a third party claim(s) from M/S SG 98 MOTOR PTE LTD acting on behalf of the owner of FB] 4521K
against your motor insurance policy.

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had amongst other information
given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to
negotiate for an amicable settlement with third party claimant.

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD) may be affected as a result of the claim against your policy.
We also wish to inform you that Section Il of the Motor Insurance Policy is attached, and capped, with an excess of
$5.000.00 for third party claim settlements.

As Insurers, they shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according to the rights
afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your policy and seek to take conduct of third
party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your own cost and defence, please reply to us within 7 days from the
date of this letter. You intent must be formally expressed to AXA and acknowledged by AXA.

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the following to

ceciliachong@lkkauto.com within 7 days from the date of this letter if not provided at our reporting centre. The

list below is not all inclusive and further document may be required:

Police report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence and status (if any)
Driver’s driving license or foreign driving license (if any)

Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any)

Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (If any)

Copy of the letter of authorization

Video footage of accident (if any)

Statement and/or police report from independent witness(es) (if any)

If you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third Party(s), you are to keep us
informed of your legal representative(s) and the status of the claim.

“«a @ @ & 8 & 8 »



To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with any of the Third Party(s)
. and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or settlement without our prior knowledge and
consent. If you receive any correspondence or legal document such as a Writ of Summons in connection with this
accident, please forward it to us immediately. You may email it to ceciliachong@lkkauto.com or deliver it by hand
to AXA Customer Care Centre.

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AXA of their rights to repudiate any claim because of any breach
of policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised driver may have committed.

In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), we shall keep you informed of the final
indemnity upon conclusion of the matter{s).

If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact as at Ms. Cecilia Chong (LKK Handler) 6749 4274 or

ceciliachong@lkkauto.com. Please quote our claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more
effectively.

"Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you Is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liability en our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver, The terms of our without prejudice engagement
should not be disciosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other related claims.”

Best Regards,

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(308933)

T
SESSSR w= Save the Earth Print ooly when necessary



Cecilia Chnnﬂ (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chang (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday. 4 February 2020 3:14 PM

To: ‘Sg Motor’

Cc 5g Motor

Subject: RE: Your ref: CC4/ASM19015293/gb3 Our Ref: FBJ 45217K, Accident along Yishun Ave 1
on 26/8/2019 1930hrs

Attachments: Ol GIA REPORT.pdf; Ol PIR.pdf

Your Ref: FBJ 4521K without Prejudice

Our Ref: CC4/ASM17015293/Dgb3

Dear Sirs/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC 51707 (AXA) & FBJ 4521K ON 24/08/201%

We refer to the above matier.

Attached is o copy of our insured police investigation result and accident statement for your easy reference.
We have reviewed the matter and we are of the view that our driver is not liable for the accideni. Your client

was charged with careless driving.

In view of the above, we have our principal instruction to deny liability and unable to look into your client's
matter.

Thank you.

Note: This video foofage is solely for investigation and shall not be reproduced. You underfake to preserve ifs
confidentiolity and will not disclose. provide or make available the video footage in whole or in part, to any
third party.

"Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyhalder and/or the autharised driver. The terms of our without prejudice engagement
should not be disclosed in any other related matter({s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other related claims.”

+ Wishing you @ Happy ana rrosperous Lunar New Yegy »

Best Regards,

Cecilin Chong | Case Handler

LKEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phome: G740-4274 | emall: CecllinChonganlkkauto.com ! fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51. Pays Ui Industrial Park, Ubi Avenuoe 1. #o2-25 | S$(408a013)

¥y RSES o
= Save the Earth Printé only when mecessary




SG 98 VOTORPTELTD

4001, Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1 #01-21 SINGAPORE §65622
Tel: G452 4898 Fax: B452 4868

Emall: sg_motor_enterprise@yahoo.com.sg

DATE: 23 October 2019 Invoice No: SGB8-PD-19-108

AXA Insurance S'pore Ple Ltd PD - Direct Settlement
8 Shenton Way

#27-01 AXA Towers

SINGAPORE DG8811

Your Insured; SHC 51702
Date of Accident:  26-Aug-19

Location: Along Yishun Avenue 1

FINAL REPAIR COSTS
VEHICLE NO. _ FBJ 4521K (Yamaha RZ15)

Cost of Repair for Vehicle No.: FBJ 4521K (lump sum) $850.00
Total. $850.00
SINGAPORE DOLLARS: EIGHT HUNDRED FIFTY ONLY
Notes:

1, All cheque payment should be "Crossed™ and mada payubls lo G 98 MOTOR PTE LTD
z Nrduqulhuuldhmwrﬂmrw'mmnntMrnmmthemuqu
3. For further enquiries an this involes, plaase feel fres 1o contoct us

SG 98 Motor Pte Ltd
LG




SG 98 VOTORPTELTD

4001, Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1 #01-21 SINGAPORE 568622

Tal: 6452 4808 Fax: G452 4858

Emall: sg_motor_snlerprise@yahoo.com.sg

DATE: 23 October 2019 Invoice No: SGB8-PD-18-108

AXA Insurance S'pore Pte Ltd LETTER OF DEMAND

8 Shenton Way
#27-01 AXA Towers
SINGAPORE 068811

Your Insured: SHC 51702
Date of Accident:  26-Aug-19

Location: Along Yishun Avenue 1

FINAL REPAIR COSTS
VEHICLE NO.  FBJ 4521K (Yamaha RZ15)

Cost of Repair for Vehicle No.: FBJ 4521K (lump sum)
Loss of Use: 3 days x $25
Towing Fee:
LTA Search:
Total.
SINGAPORE DOLLARS: NINE HUNDRED FIFTY-SEVEN AND CENTS

FORTY-NINE ONLY

$850.00
$75.00
$25.00
$7.49

$957.49

Moles:

1. All cheque payment shoold be “Crossad” and made payable to 5G 98 MOTOR PTE LTD

2. Al chague should have our “Invoice Mo® wiillan on the ioverse side of The chegue
A For further anguiries on this invaica, ploase feel free fo confact us

v

SG 98 Motor Pte Lid
LG




CASH SALES / WORK ORDER

GJ HAH RECOVERY SERVICES

Business Reg No. 53346881K
Handphone No : 9855 8851 No- 4 3 4 []

nm:D:J\T% "-0\ @.\J\ VPN P f\ 3

Vehicle Mn:.:E 87 48 1K moer:_f2AS

From : ‘\W\.b‘f_‘ Fh l3—. To : CC(-H\

Remurks : i LS?MSL ) " s

Amount : $ E\‘* &CLCQ CJ(/M -

NOTE: Vihilcle s transported at owmer's risk. The mmrnﬂﬂﬁlmrﬂpﬂnﬁhﬂiw
fior damages or olher luj'uur‘p'ehi-uinwhihlhﬂultmw?m‘hi

Authorised by: . Received ? '




Tl
azr0ie Hecaipl

qt;' > Back to OneMotaring

i i :
i
£ Laml'l'ranswrtRﬁ.uthurﬁy
r_ ; Land Trenapaon Autharity
4 10 Sin Ming Driva
i ‘t; Skhgapors 5T5701
' GST Raplsirafion Mo, : M4-0008529-2
Primt Date/TMime : 27 Aug 2019/ 15:37:24
Recalpl Date/Mime : 27 Aug 20198 /153724
Tax Invoice/Receipt
Reoelpt No. : ITNET-00000-180827-002192
: Previous Recalpt No. ; b"" “\ ‘\
-';'1 SIN Mem Nescription/ Amoumnt GST  Amount
iy Business Transactlon Refarence Bafore Amount After GST
e F W) * osTsm  (s8) (s8)
L
iy -
Elh:
L,
T,
[l#i 048 T48
i 0.40 748
0.40 740
049 749
e Total Bafore Rounding 14.00 098 1488
* Rounding Differance 0.03
U‘-—""’/ Total Amount Payable 1495
Q-
Crodil Card:
b (B\ ¥I00C000000ATEE | - 14.85
' Total 1495
Cash Change 0.00
Tendered Amount 14,96
Excass Rofimdable Amount 0.00
THANK YOU AKRD HAVE A NICE DAY

Pleasa anzura that all paymants to the Authority are good and promptly settlad by the paymant sarvice
provider [ financial institution, Otherwise, the transaction and recelpt Is considered volid and late foe

may apply.

ML . V. S0 VY I CUREY L P BBy T (1 LS| LI _ I 1 300U 1 )

L




' ” V LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Sl BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrisl Park, Singapore 408833
- TEL 6256 3561 FAX: 8256 4315

Reg Mo 199607188R GST Reg. No. 19-8607188-R

AXA INSURANCE PTE L CCA/ASM19015283/Dgadg2
8 SHENTON WAY #24-01 Date . 05.03.2020 IM]IM.II"
AXA TOWERSINGAPORE 068811 "

ATTN:CYNTHIA LOH Code: ASM
Jal 1}

T T e IR
Lk il rardL.uials = | Fine HAars g
h R LT Ny e e

Insured Veh. SHC 51702 . Veh. Inspected FBJ 4521K
Policy No. VFX/P1880520 Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. SAMO1YNS Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 29/08/2019

Make & Model YAMAHA YZF-R15 c.c 150

Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2014

Chassis No. ME11CK051E2015578 Colour BLUE

Odometer 46451 Steering IN ORDER

Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM

General GOOoD

SRR
Balance
R/H Front Tyre |[90/80 R17 MICHELIN 2 mm
L/H Front Tyre : mm
R/H Rear Tyre |130/70 R17 MICHELIN 2 mm
L/H Rear Tyre : ' mm

Accident Date i
Survey held at SG 88 MOTOR PTE LTD

BLK 4001 ANG MO KIO INDUSTRIAL PARK 1

#01-21 SINGAPORE 560622

e  Rearks.

OUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
HAVE NOT AUTHORISED FIEPAI.

ysofRepair R

A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITH
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE




y 7L LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

m’#_. 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Indusiral Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 2561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg No: 188607188R GST Reg. No. 19-0607188-R Page Mo.:1 af 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. FBJ 4521K

1|EXHAUST PIPE (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY _ 580.00 -
1|EXHAUST GUARD (CONSISTENT) cuT 19000 180.00
1|REAR TAIL PANEL -RH (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE . 150.00 -
LABOUR
1|HANDLE BAR RH (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY ~ 185.00 :
1|MIRROR RH (CONSISTENT) cuT 85.00 85.00
1|SET BAR END BALANCER (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 190,00 -
1|FRONT FAIRING -LH(CONSISTENT) cuT /42000 420,00
1|FRONT RH SIGNAL (CONSISTENT) DAMAGED 5.00| 85,00
1|BRAKE LEVER (CONSISTENT) cuT 85.00 85.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -199.00 -88.50
1,791.00 796.50
LABOUR

TOWING FEE. NOT NECESSARY 40,00 -
REMOVE & REPLACE NECESSARY PARTS ALIGN & 250,00 150.00|

ELC.INCLUEWE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR TAIL PANEL -
PUTTY & TOUCH UP PAINT WORK. 280,00 120,00
570,00} 270.00
GRAND TOTAL 2,361.00 1,066.50

Report Ref No. CC4/ASM18015283/Dga3q2 ’

ANG BRYAN TANI
Automotive Assessor | Investigator

HSCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES . This Aepart is mads ssialy for the ues and benafil of the Cllent namad on the front page of this Report
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