Cecilia Ch':"“ﬂ (LKK Auto)

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>
Sent: Monday, 4 November 2019 12:29 PM

To: Cecllia Chong (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: SGC3529Z & SLH5016M doa 27/8/19
Attachments: rental jpg; Ita fee.pdf, INVOICE.pdf; LOA RENTAL pdf
Dear Cecilia,

Enclosed is the invoice , LOA , rental & Ita fee.
As request following :

1. RC S 4000 ( AS agreed )
2. loss of rental $1080 ( $120 x 9 days - 12 days recommend )
3. lta 57.45

@ 100%

TOTAL $5087.45

Please let us have your offer soon . Thanks

Ragards,
Chris Chan Pick Yuen

Hp:92712214

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong®@lkkauto.comz>

Sent: Friday, October 18, 2019 4:33 PM

To: 'chris_chanbebe@hotmall.com' <chris_chanbebe @hotmail.com>

Subject: RE: SGC3529Z & SLH5016M doa 27/8/19

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Chris,

For cost of repair, the recommended repair cost as calculated is L/S $4000.00 (before GST) with 12 repair days.
Kindly forward your LOD and other documents to us [LKK).

*Please note that the repair cost and number of repair days are subjected to our principal’s approval®

Thanks
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In the matter of an accident involving g"::(- Qﬁhq Z {(my/our vehicle)
and SLH qﬂl'n’l"u"l {other vehicles)

02207/ 1% uons PIE (changi )0kt Bxper} Bouieyud €47

I'We, le C@ﬂ Huat M (NRIC ! Passport No / Co
Registraion No) S/ ¢ OO\LF o

Singapore

ITel Noj hereby, authorize and appaint you,
Advocate & Solicitors 1o act for me/us and to receive all proceeds of the seftlement monies.

(Applicable for minors)
And/or on behall of my {Relationship) (Name)

{Date of Birth)

AUTHORITY

I/We hereby authorize you to commence legal proceedings in my/our nsmets) and 1o take instructions from
my/our repairers whom |/'we have appointed as my/our agents in respect of my/our claim(s),

I'We hereby authorize you 10 pay 10 yourselves all Party and Party costs you may at any time receive in
connection with the above matter and confirm that there will be no need 1o pay the same into the Chient’s
Accouni with your Bankers.

U/We hereby further authorize you to release all proceeds of settlemeni monies received by you (afler deducting
your legal costs) to my repairer, GARAGE 833 LLP in settlemnent of my outstandmg bill‘account with them,

I/'We only wished 10 be informed of my/our case when there are major developments. You may keep my/our
agents informed as and when nocessary,

IJ'WEhmbyluthnri::;uumrdmdulmsnfmduimmmwwurmmilhnﬁﬂuyhlmhtlh:

cost of o my repairer, if the claim for cost of repair is not sertled in full,
Signature or Right Thumb Primt of
MName:

Company chop (if applicable)
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GARAGE 833 LLP

Block 25 Kaki Bukit Road 4 #06-51 Synergy@ KB Singapore 417800
HP: 92712214

INVOICE

LIM CHOON HUAN Date: 04" NOV 18
25 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 4

#06-51 SYNERGY @KB

Singapore 417800

Accident date:27" AUGUST 2019
Final Bill For Vehicle No: SGC3529Z TOYOTA COROLLA

Descriptions AMOUNT
|Lump Sum repair cost as recommended by $4,000.00

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

|surveyor : Mr Marcus

Tota ,000.00

S/IDLRS: FOUR THOUSAND ONLY

Fage 423



DREAM CARZ LEASING PTE LTD s

B Wkl Buklt Ave &, 004-20, Premier, Singapore 415075  Tel [63) (3845206 Fan: |65] niBA5I05

Emall weamearzieasing@gmall.com

INVOICE
Lim Choon Huan Invoice No: 10763
Bk 660 Hougang Avenue 8 Invoice Date: 06-08-19
#10-482 Due Date 06-08-18
Singapore 530660 VHA Na: 2369
Description
Rental for g8 Days @ $ 12000 per Day $ 1.080.00
Vehicle No SGBos4A
Vehicle Description Toyota Altis
Rental Period 28-08-19 to 06-09-18

Total Amount Payable $ 1,080.00






Land Transport ¢’ Authority

Land Transpon Authority
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapote 575701
GST Registration No. : M4-0008528-2
Print Data/Time : 28 Aug 2018/ 13:05:.09
Recelpt Date/Time : 28 Aug 2019/ 13:05:00
Tax Involce/Recelpt

Recept No. ; [TNET-00000-180828-001620

Result of Insurance Engulry - SLHS016M

As ot 27 Aug 2018/07:00:00

Insurance Co: FWD SINGAPORE PTE. LTD.
1 Insurance Enquiry - SLH5016M

Enquiry Fea 7.00 0.49 T7.49
20180828130352164398
Sub-Total 7.00 0.49 7.49
Total Before Rounding 7.00 0.49 7.49
Total Amount Payable 7.45
Paid By :
aaoood 105 St Sant Viea 745
Total 7.45
Tenoared AMounT T45
‘Exoess Refundabls Amount 0.00

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!




