Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Goh, Jeremy <Jeremy.Goh@aig.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 26 January 2021 2:34 PM

To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: <File review> AlG Ref: #8782622887SG003#027# || Accident between SLZ 1668

M and SLP 6531 T on 19 Aug 2019 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIG19015286/Abb3

Dear Jasper,
Please close off the file above in Merimen.
Do submit report or invoice for any services rendered.

Regards

Jeremy Goh

Complex Claims Examiner — Auto Property Damage Claims
AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

AIG Building

78 Shenton Way, Level 10
Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1767

Jeremy.goh@aig.com | www.AlG.com.sg

If you have received this message outside of your usual work hours, I do not expect that you will read, respond to or action it until appropriate for you.

From: Goh, Jeremy

Sent: Monday, September 14, 2020 2:23 PM

To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: <File review> AIG Ref: #8782622887SG003#0274# | | Accident between SLZ 1668 M and SLP 6531 T on
19 Aug 2019 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIG19015286/Abb3

Hi Jasper,

| noted there was no survey conducted.

Can u keep the file open for another 2-3 more months, pending any correspondence from the workshop.
After that, | will decide whether to close off the file or not.

Thanks and Regards

Jeremy Goh

AlIG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1767

Jeremy.Goh@aig.com | www.aig.sg

Advanced Leave Notification:



