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Yvonne Wong !LKK Auto)

From: Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, October 30, 2019 5:53 PM

To: Vision Autowork

Subject: RE: VEHICLE NO SJV5967T DOA: 26/08/2019

Dear Michelle

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents directly to NTUC Insurance.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Yvonne Wong (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6256-3561 | email: ywonnewong@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrinl Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
From: Vision Autowork [mailto:visionautowork@gmail.com]
Sent: Wednesday, October 30, 2019 5:14 PM

To: Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto) <yvonnewong@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: VEHICLE NO 5JV5967T DOA: 26/08/2019

Dear Yvonne,

Mr Adrian already confirmed the COR with us at $2,250.00 (4 days)

Thank You
Yours faithfully,

Michelle
Hp: 9856 4815

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4,
#08-09 Premier (@ Kaki Bukit,
Singapore 415875

Tel: 6341 6789

Fax: 6341 6778

On Wed, Oct 30, 2019 at 5:02 PM Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto) <vvonnewong(@|lkkauto.com> wrote:



" Dear Michelle

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Confirm Lump Sum $2250.00 @ 4 working days.

Please check and confirm

Please reply by email

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Yvonne Wong (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: ywonnewong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Bk 51, Payn Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408943)
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" Toyous Corolla ARis 1AA [Now
S-yv COEL)

One Owninr Ondy! WesS Maintained, Unit 19 Excelient Conditsn! Dor't Miss This Usiet Bank O 1n House Losn Avsiabile. Call Bor Mo
Enquirssl

[ Toyota Carolla Altis 1.6A (New 549,800 4,580 fyr 09-Febr-2010 1,558 ex 130,000 ken Sedan Availahie
10y COE |

Weil Mainsaned By Previous Owner! High Loan With iigh Trade In Avillsbie, Price Negotiabie. Call New O Vist Our Showroom Todey.

[] Toyota Corolla Altis 1.6A (New  $39,800 6,150 jyr 18-Feb2010 1550 o 108,000 om Setan Aunilabie
S-yr COE)

Lowest Degreciation [n The Market! Low Milaage With A3 Weer And Tesr Replaced! View To Believe This Prisine Congition Uni! Proven

Raliatile Cor Wit Mo Majar lecues! Small Paimt Corraction Meaded To Look Good As Naw! Al Financing Ogptions Avail &s Well, And Dgtia | rsmei

[ Toyows Corclls Altis 164 s18.038 NA 28-Fab-2000 1,590 cc 155,484 km Setan Availntie

Just Arrved! Encefiont Concition Assured And Peace OF Mind. Very Well Mantained, Trade Tn Weicome, At Fest Before 118 Gone! 100%
In Heuse Losn Available. View To Beliove! Don't Miss, Cal Today!
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Crmner 1D Type Business
Owerier 1O #35C
B ANIA Y| AR s s i e — = =]
Vehicle Na SINSRETT
Vehicle to be Exported: Yes
Intended Deregistration Date: 18 Sep 2019
Viehicle Make TOYOTA
Vehicle Model COROLLA ALTIS 1.6 AUTD
Primary Colour Black
Manufaciuring Year 2009
Engine No 774962413
Chassls Mo MROSIZEE 106164704
Manimium Povwer Output 80.0 kW (107 bhp)
Open Market Value: $17.85300
Original Registration Date: 01 Feb 2010
First Registration Date: 01 Feb 2010
Transfer Count 3
Actual ARF Pald: $17.653.00
o T P/ T R (RS | T e S S SRR — =~ =]
PARF Eligibility Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date 31 Jan 2020
PARF Rebate Amount $8.924.00
Ctided COFRERSWDEGINTT T e e e e e S e
COE Expiry Date 31 Jan 2020
COE Category A - Car (1600ce & below)
COE Period(Years) 10
QF Paict $20.501.00
COE Rebate Amount §755.00
Total Rebate Amount $9.681.00

The Information contained hergin is correct as at 18 Sep 2019



AT T IEID ¢ VAL - Kaas Buke
ENTRY DATE & TIME: SROAZ016 1334 Your NCD will be affected due to late reporting

SUSMITTED Y. Nortain Be Abcul Maga Actual e-Filling Submission Date & Time: 28/08/2019 12:30

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT
IMPORTANT NOTICE

1 Pisass rapor cormacily the detalls of the scodent to speed Up B olairms proCess

Z. This Form musl be complated by the Polcyholdes andiar the Authorsed Divar

3 information provided most be &s truthiul and accurale as possbie Any wiful merepresentaton of withoiding of matenal facls may alow NESTENCE COMODENeE 10
repudiate policy |lability .

A, Tne :=sue and scceptanon of s Form oy insurance comparnies s nod an sdmeson of poicy i@ty on the par of the msurance companies

& Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

£. This repori wil be forwarded by the insumers of the GlA Records Managemsni Cenire esfablished by the General Insurance Associafion of Singapore (GIA] for
srchiving and (el coples of s g will, for 2 fes, b made avadable upon anplestion by interesisd paries

T. By the iodgomant af this mepor 1o ihe Insurers, you heroby consaenl o ihe archiving of this repor af the centre and io copies of ha repor baing made availabio
sloresad

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date OFf Repor ZBMBER015 12:24

Date Of Accident 26/0872018 16:50

Exact Location Of Accident BLK 288 BOON LAY DRIVE (MSCP)
Country/Stata of Loss SINGAPORE

Vahicla Registration Numbear SJIVBaAsTT
Insured/Policyholder

Mame Of Registerad Owner 533 MOTORING

Co Reg No 53295935C

Emall Address NOEMAIL

Maobile Phene No

Altarnative Phone Mo OFFICE-88501860

Vehicle Particulars

Manufacturer TOYOTA

Maodsl COROLLA ALTIS 1.6 AUTO

Exact Purposa far which vahicle was being used at

time of accident WORK PURPOSE

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy

for repair to your vehicla? NO
* If No, Please slats action 1o be taken THIRD PARTY
Vhicla Calegory FRIVATE HIRE
Insurance Company
MName of Insurance Company NTUC INCOME INSURANCE CO-OPERATIVE LTD
Type Of Coverage COMPREHENSIVE
Fleat Palicy YES
Policy Numbear 5108469002-000008 CLASSIC
Covar Note Numbear
Driver
Name of DOrivar KOH WEE CHUAN
NRIC Mo 51632840
Date Of Birth 29/011964
Cocoupation OUTDOOR
Date Of Driving Pass 06/058/1982
Driving Experience 36 YEARS AND 11 MONTHS
Gender MALE
Moblie Numbar [LOCAL) +65-88501860
Fax Number
Contact Number
EMail Address WEECHUAN4BSS@GMAIL.COM

Fage 1 of 13



Addrass BLK 2688 BOON LAY DRIVE #14-564
Pasicode 642268

Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company NO

If No, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured OTHER - HIRER

Vahicle Registration Number of Driver's Own -
Vehicle -

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle -

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident HIT AND RUN / VANDALISM | DAMAGED WHILST PARKED
Weather Conditions CLEAR
Road Surface DRY

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accidemt? NO
Mumber of vehicles (including own vehicle)

involved in the accident 2

Was any body injured in the Accident? NO

Was any Injured conveyed to hospital by NO
ambulance?

Was any ather material or property damaged? YES

| have bean approached by unknown parson(s) NO
soliciting/offering accident claims assistanca

Number of Passengers (Including Driver) 0

Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported to the police? NOD

If Yes, Please stale which Paolice Statlon

Was notice of intended Prosacution given? NO

If ¥es, against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

REFER TO ATTACHED

Attachmeni(s)

Ara accidant photos available for attachmant? YES

Was thare any video captured by Car Camera? MO

Was thara any audlo racorded? NO

Vahicle Registration Number GBGAIBAL
Vahicla Maka/Modal/Colour TOYOTA | HIACE VAN TURBO SOR MT
Datails Of Propertias

Vehicla Catagary COMMERCIAL VEHICLE

Name of Driver

NRIC/Passport Number

Contact Number

Address

Fosicode

Insurance Company Name

Mature Of Damaga

Mo, Of Passenger (Including Driver)

Page 2 of 13
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Sketch Plan #2
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On 26.08.19 at about 11:00hrs, I parked my car (SJV5967T) at
Block 268 Boon Lay Drive muiti-storey carpark and left for home.
On 26.08.19 at about 16:50hrs, 1 came back to my vehicle and
saw a piece of paper on my windscreen, stated Sorry Boss Pls call
me I hit your car and wanted to settle and phone number. I then
saw my front left hand side was damaged. 1 made a call to the
mobile number written on the paper and the other party admitted
he have banged onto my car accidentally and ask me proceed
claim his insurance.

.r'rl .i'
My Car : SIV5967T ;’ / ‘Z L,A
3" party Van : GBGB968U 7= L
/

f -
. (M ¥ . Dine !’*
.l"‘f-'h' K’Pfch / .,rz__p 'f[_ ,?}J ; /
Whoted e PJ Vb2 Set(e aoek
; f.?\-k ? [1}1. ( r;;;. r Coyl [e yf’;rr ! .:JJ.P

@ I”"""*'*-’ cliivia T ASarorc

-

4“*. i

]

T
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Vision Autowork Pte.Ltd.

( ROC / GST Reg. No. 201500371E)

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, #08-09 Premier@Kaki Bukit
Singapore 415875

Tel : 6341 6789 Fax: 6341 6778
E-mail:visionautowork@gmall.com

TO - NTUC MOTOR CLAIMS DEPTS
VEHICLE NO : SJV5967T

MODEL : TOYOTA COROLLA ALTIS
DATE OF ACCIDENT  : 26.08.19

TIME OF ACCIDENT - 168:50HRS

DATE : 18.09.19

Nonn

WE APPEND HEREUMNDER THE ESTIMATED COST OF REPAIRS TO BE CARRIED OUT TO THE ABOVE VEHICLE

CLAIM DETAIL : PARTS

SIN DESCRIPTION ary "';';I;ET m;‘;:;:'ém
i|FronT BUMPER e E—2 , 1 |s sesools  sesoef
2|FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMP LH ©™ ;‘% 1 Is  1eso0ls  Fesoo |+
3|FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMP COVER LH Ml 1 ls amsaols  arsa0 b
4|FRONT BUMPER LOGO /" 1 |s  i7s10ls  awsdo 65
5|FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE 1 |s  14000]s 140.00 [+
8|FRONT BUMPER TOP RUBBER rel ~~ 1 s 75.00 | § 75.00 | ©
7|FRONT BUMPER LOWER COVER 1 |s  10000]|s 100.00 | *
8|FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER  L11 A~ 2 |S 75.00 | § 15000 | ¥ 5
8|FRONT RADIATOR GRILLE CW CHROME /™ “ 1 | § 360.00 | § 360.00 | .+

10|HEADLAMP LH 5" },.,._[,-‘{l . 1 1S 708.10 | $ 788.10 |~
11|HEAD LAMP LOWER BRACKETLH  NE= | 5 4500 | § 4500 | ¥
12|FRONT SUPPORT PANEL |4 ~1" 1 |s  7s000|8  7s000]
13|FRONT FENDER LH DeAdd 1 |5  63000]$ §30.00 | -~
15|FRONT FENDER EMBLEM 'WTI' /e 1 |5 67.20 | § 67.20 | 7
14|FRONT FENDER INNER COWLING LH /S #~é~ 1 5 17000 | § 170.00 |

A 2G50 TOTAL PRICE § 441550

173517 LESS 25% ] 1,103.88

SUB TOTAL PRICE 1 3.311.63

SIN DESCRIPTION QTY | UNIT S/INETT |TOTAL S/INETT
1|FRONT BUMPER CLIPS (SET)  jple~ 1 |s 50.00 | § 50007 o
2|FRONT RADIATOR GRILLE CLIP (SET) A/ o~ 1 18 5000 | § 5000 | *
3|FRONT FENDER INNER COWLING CLIP (SET) = | 1 |5 80.00 | § 80.00 |+
4|FRONT SUPPORT PANEL SEALANT Al s 1 |5 80.00 | § go.00 | *
5|FRONT FENDER INNER COWLING CLIP (SET) - | 1 |'s 5000 | § 50.00 |
6| RADIATOR COOLANT s Tk 1|5 40008 40.00 [*

TOTAL $ 350.00



TO : NTUC MOTOR CLAIMS DEPTS
VEHICLE NO - SJV5967T

MODEL : TOYOTA COROLLA ALTIS
DATE OF ACCIDENT  : 26.08.19

TIME OF ACCIDENT : 16:50HRS

CLAIM DETAILS: LABOUR AND SPRAY PAINTING (FRONT)

SIN JOB DESCRIPTION PRICE ADJUSTED COST
PANEL BEATING, REMOVING AND A 460
1|REPLACING PARTS $ 1,400:60 o
2|SPRAY PAINTING TO AFFECTED AREA| $ 140000 | TO
Fa
3|WIRING CHECK $ sopo| >~
REMOVE AND REFIX AIRCON
CONDENSOR AND REFILL AIRCON g
4|cas 5 12000 -~
REMOVE AND REFIX RADIATOR AND i
5|CONDUCT PRESSURE TEST : 80.00
1
B|REFOCUS HEADLAMP BEAM 5 60.00
TO CHECK DIAGNOSTICS OF VEHICLE
MANAGEMENT/CONTROL
UNITS,RESET MEMORIES TO &
7|SPECIFICATION ETC, § 180.00
TOTAL 3 3,320.00 "
] =
TOTAL PARTS COST  : § 3,661.63
TOTAL LABOUR COST : § 3,320.00
TOTAL REPAIR COST - § 6,981.63

NB: THIS 15 ONLY AN ESTIMATE AND SHOULD ADDITIONAL WORK BE FOUND NECESSARY TO BE
CARRIED OUT IN THE COURSE OF REPAIRS, EXTRA MATERIALS AND LABOUR COST WILL BE CHARGED
ACCORDINGLY WHICH HOWEVER.YOU WILL BE INFORMED PRIOR TO ACTION TAKEN

PARTS PRICES ARE SUBJECT TO CHANGES.

YOURS FAITHFULLY,

ABBY

SERVICE ADVISOR
ABBY
HP : 0856 4815

Adnen
¢ r’&'}

LK |

oY%

olify

(__'7

uﬁ)wj.

.7)»-7 )



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Uibl Industrial Park, Singapare 408333

TEL: 6256 3581 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No 188607188R GST Reg, No. 19-0807188-R

DAMAGE ASSESSMENT REPORT

NTUC INCOME INSURANCE CO-OPERATIVELTD Ref:
Date.  04-11-2019

73 BRAS BASAH ROAD
#05-01 NTUC TRADE UNION HOUSESINGAPORE

CSINCT90152T1/AyTan2

NI

189556
ATTN: JEFF LIN Code: INC
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GBG B9BBU Veh. Inspected SJv 5967T
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. MT/105974-002 Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From DANIEL KOH Assign Date 29/08/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTAALTIS c.c 1598
Engine No, HIDDEN Year of Reqg. 2010
Chassis No, MROS3ZEE106164704 Colour BLACK
Odometer 236160 KM Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Medification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/ Front Tyre |195/85 R15 HABILEAD 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |185/65 R15 HABILEAD 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |1895/E65R15 HABILEAD 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |195/65 R15 HABILEAD 6 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT N/S PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. General Information
Accident Date 261082019 [Inspect Date / Time  18/09/2019 ( 02:05 PM )
Survey held at  VISION AUTOWORK PTE LTD
8 KAK| BUKIT AVE 4,
#08-0% PREMIER @ KAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE 415875
Sa, Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A™WITHOUT PREJUDICE™ BASIS.
BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

|ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR 4 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 201-25 Paya Ubl Industial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6258 3581 FAX: 6256 4115

Reg Mo 199607158R GST Reg No. 18-9607188-R Paga No1ol 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJV 5967T
Qaty Description of Parts Condition mﬂr{m Wrﬁ;{!ﬂhﬂ
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
| [FRONT BUMPER DEFORMED 585.00 485,00
1|FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMP LH CRACKED 195,00 185,00
1|FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMP COVER LH NOT NECESSARY 175.10 -
1|FRONT BUMPER LOGD MECESSARY 175.10 65.00
1|FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE NOT NECESSARY 140.00 -
1|FRONT BUMPER TOP RUBBER NOT MECESSARY 75.00 -
1|[FRONT BUMPER LOWER COVER NOT MECESSARY 100.00 -
2|FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER @575.00 N/5 NECESSARY 150.00 45.00
1|FRONT RADIATOR GRILLE CAW CHROME NOT MECESSARY 360.00 -
1 |HEADLAMP LH CRACKED 798,10 T88.10
1|HEAD LAMP LOWER BRACKET LH CRACKED 45,00 45,00
1|FRONT SUPPORT PAMEL TO REPAIR SEE 750,00 -
LABOUR
1|FRONT FENDER LH DENTED 630.00 630.00
1|FRONT FENDER EMBLEM "WWTI* NECESSARY 67.20 67.20
1|FRONT FENDER INNER COWLING LH NOT NECESSARY 170.00 -
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -1,103.87 -585.07
331163 1,755.23
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET FRONT BUMPER CLIPS (SN) NECESSARY 50.00 30.00
1|SET FRONT RADIATOR GRILLE CLIP (SN) NOT NECESSARY 50.00 T
1|SET FRONT FENDER INNER COWLING CLIP (SN) NOT NECESSARY 80.00 -
1|FRONT SUPFPORT PAMNEL SEALANT (SN) NOT NECESSARY B80.00 -
1|SET FRONT FENDER INNER COWLING CLIP (SN) NOT NECESSARY 50.00 -
1|RADIATOR COOLANT (SN) MOT NECESSARY 40.00 -
350.00 30.00
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING, REMOVING AND REPLACING 1,400.00 500.00
PARTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF FRONT SUPFORT
PANEL
SPRAY PAINTING TO AFFECTED AREA. 1,400.00 500.00

Report Rel No. CS/INC19015271/Ayfan2




V V LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Payn Ubi Indusinal Park, Singapore 408333
TEL: 6258 3581 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg Mo: 190607128R GST Reg. Mo, 19-9607158-R Page Mo 2ol 2
Qty Description of Parts Condition mat:n wwm. :
WIRING CHECK 80.00 30.00
REMOVE AND REFIX AIRCON COMDENSOR AND REFILL |NOT MECESSARY 120,00
AIRCON GAS.
REMOVE AND REFIX RADIATOR AND CONDUCT NOT MECESSARY 80.00
PRESSURE TEST
REFOCUS HEADLAMP BEAM NOT NECESSARY B0.00
TO CHECK DIAGNOSTICS OF VEHICLE NOT NECESSARY 180.00 -
MANAGEMENT/CONTROL UNITS RESET MEMORIES TO
SPECIFICATION ETC.
3,320.00 1.030.00
GRAND TOTAL 6,981.63 2.815.23
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 2,250.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
(CONFIRMED)
Report Ref No. CS/INC 1801527 1/Ayfan2
ADRIAN LING WAI PING K.K_LAU CPT(RET)
n.&uus(ommr&m-a,u.mul BEng(Hons),B.Bus MBA,PEng,PE,
MinstAEA MASME MIRTE

Licensed Appraiser

DESCLABER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES - This Ropar is mats saisly bor the uss and berelil of e Cliant nemesd on te ront pags of this Repon.

REGD Autc Consultant-5AE, Licensed Appraiser




