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Brind A e DADEME Danate Eamibng

> Back to OneMotoring
Enqmre PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars
Crwner ID Type: Company
Owmner ID: 292D
Vehicle Detalls
Vehicle No.: 5G16%958
Vehicle to be Exported: No
Intended Deregistration Date: 28 Aug 2019
Vehicle Make: MERCEDES BENZ
Vehicle Model: CITARD 0530 6.4L AT TURBO ABS
Primary Colour: Multicoler
Manufacturing Year: 2015
Engine No.: 902926C1098004
Chassis No.: WEB&2B08323129412
Maximum Power Qutput: -
Open Market Value: $293.828.00
Original Registration Date: 11 Feb 2016
First Registration Date: 11Feb 2016
Transfer Count: 1]
Actual ARF Paid: f0.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility: No
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -
PARF Rebate Amount: £0.00
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Rebate Amount; $0.00
Total Rebate Amount: $0,00

The information contained herein is correct as at 28 Aug 2019
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127312018

Menmen e-Claims

Claim Audit

1 F 9019 cim ot Modified Claimant's Name: -> SMRT BUSES LTD. Claimant's ID- -> 1982022920, i
2 ﬁ_‘;‘;’“ 2019 im veh Model Changed (202451) MERCEDES-BENZ CITARC 0530 6.4 D (A). Dbl aha
Reg No: SG1A9SB. Acct Date: 2019/08/25. Claim Type: TP, Insurer: AIG Asis Pacifl
3 12857301 cim created < Insuranca Pte. Ltd, (5G). TP Insurer: MS First Capital Insurance Ld (HQ). Worksn () ot ST
: op: SMAT Automotive Services Pte Ltd (Woodlands)
4 f:;"? 2019 adj Co Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ): (Al o S
5 ﬁ;‘;’ 2019 adf Next Rpt Changed  Next Rpt:Final Rpt Due Date:2019/09/09 (Al ﬁ e
6 125377 adj mandate Set Approved:0.00, Reinsp:Ag) decides. (A] ﬁ Shu
29 Aug 2019 ged [200005] AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre. Ltd, (SG) -> [203630) AIG Asip Pacific Ins  [1] Merimen
4 14;52 Chm Ins Co Cha urance Pte. Lid, (Express) Administrator
29 Aug 2019 . [A] Lau Shu
;] 14:53 Label Added {23):Express, Pei
9 224492019 agj Adjuster Assigned  [None] - CHEN TSUE YEE (S Ll St
29 Nov 2019 [A] HUEY
10 11:50 Ady Ryt Intsisted YON
29 Nov 2019 5 | [A] HUEY
A Cim Dt Modified 171 Reg. Date: -> 2016/02/11. pou
29 Nov 2019 [A] HUEY
1z 3 Cim Detalls Notified o
Cur.Req: L1357,00: Insured kit side of TP bus that was stationary at bus stop. Liabili
13 llJ_Dpc 2 Adj Mandate Request Ty down against Insured. **5S days recommendation far repair + 1 Sundays + 2 PR [A] ke
14:49 i Puthura)
Date From 475 »| pateTo 4|75 > Audit Type None v o
ST
Mo record
Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction Hi:turv
' LKK Ato LKK Auto
261306 | N Tadiete | Motor | Consultants  Consultants  SGI6958 | SGV2095 1177

Pre Ltd Pte Ltd (HQ)

https:/isingapore.manmen.com/claims/ndex. ctm Husebox=MTRadjusiar&fuseaction=dsp_viewhistory&caseid=860863&mmid=31519TACFID=634

vz



Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Tan Wei Teck (Auto Sves/Claims & I1A/Claims & |A/Buses) <TanWeiTeck@smr.com =g~

Sent: Tuesday, 14 January 2020 5:16 PM

To: Khanchna [LKK Auto)

Cc Karen Chan Siau Chin (Auto Sves/Claims 8 |A/Claims & |A/Buses); Admin A

Subject: RE: OUR REF:BUS/08/19/1053 - ACCIDENT ON 25/08/19 INVOLVING SG16%58 ANC
SGV209S ALONG Sembawang Way

Attachments: Iimg-114171253-0001.pdf

WITHOLUT PREILIDICE

[ 3enr Khanchina

Attached herewith the duly signed DV as well as Authorization Letter for vour perusal and necessary action
Uriginal copies will be forwarded to vour office shortly, Thanks

Regards,

Patrick Tas

Clalms and Insurance Agency

& Ang Mo Kio Street 62
Singapore 569140

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) [mailto:khanchna@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, January 14, 2020 4:00 PM

To: Tan Wei Teck (Auto Sves/Claims & 14/Claims & 1A/Buses)

Cc: Karen Chan Siau Chin (Auto Sves/Claims & 1A/Claims & [A/Buses); Admin A

Subject: RE: OUR REF:BUS/08/19/1053 - ACCIDENT ON 25/08/19 INVOLVING SG1695B AND SGV2095 ALONG
Sembawang Way

Without Prejudice
(save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm.

wWe rafer to the above matter,

Thank you for the occeptance.

We attach herewith a copy of the DV and Authaorisation Letter for your further action.

Thank you.



"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter Is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of llability, whatsoever, should be deemed /[ inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the lssues of
liabllity/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

« wishing you @ Happy ana rrosperous Lunar New Yeg, »

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

DID: 6841 2360 email: Khanchnaf@lkkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Ubi Avenue |, #02-25 | §(408933)

From: Tan Wei Teck (Auto Sves/Claims & IA/Claims & [A/Buses) <TanWeilecki@smrt.com.sp-

Sent: Tuesday, 14 January 2020 2:56 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchnaia lkkauo.com>

Ce: Karen Chan Siau Chin (Auto Sves/Claims & 1A/Claims & 1A/Buses) <ChanSiauChinsmrt.com <u -
Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: OUR REF:BUS/08/19/1053 - ACCIDENT ON 25/08/19 INVOLVING SG1695B AND
SGV209S ALONG Sembawang Way

WITHOUT PREIUDICE
Dear Khanchna

Your below offer is accepted, kindly let us have your DV if any. Thanks

Regards,

Patrick Tan

Claims and Insurance Agency

Direct line +65 6556 3522 | tanweiteck@smri.com sg
& Ang Mo Kio Street b2

sSingapare 569140

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) [mailto:khanchna@lkkauto.com)

Sent: Tuesday, January 14, 2020 1:54 PM

To: Tan Wel Teck (Auto Sves/Claims & 1A/Claims & [A/Buses); MTPRI

Cc: Chong Fei Yuan (Auto Sves/Claims & [A/Claims & [A); Balgish Binte Abdul Halil (Auto Sves/Claims & 1A/Claims &
[1A/Buses); Karen Chan Siau Chin (Auto Sves/Claims & JA/Claims & IA/Buses); Admin A

Subject: RE: OUR REF:BUS/08/19/1053 - ACCIDENT ON 25/08/19 INVOLVING SG1695B AND S5GV2095 ALONG
Sembawang Way



Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm.
We refer fo the above matter.

We propose setfliement as follows;

|. Cosi of Repair % 9.150.00
2. Loss of Use |& days x $250) $ 1.500.00
3. LTA Search Fee % 7.00

Total $ 10.657.00

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resalving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of llability, whatsoever, should be deemed / Inferred fram this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issuss of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement,

« Wishing you @ Happy ana rrosperous Lunar New Yeg, -

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LLKK Auto Consultanis Pre Lid

DID: 6841 2360] email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue |, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Tan Wei Teck (Auto Sves/Claims & IA/Claims & [A/Buses) <TanWeiTeck@smrt.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 26 November 2019 1:38 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchnaa lkkauto.com=; MTPRI <M TPRL @ smri.com.sg>

Ce: Chong Fei Yuan (Auto Sves/Claims & IA/Claims & [A) <FeiYuan@smrt.com.sg>: Balgish Binte Abdu!
Halil (Auto Sves/Claims & IA/Claims & 1A/Buses) <BalqishBAH (@smir.com.sg>; Karen Chan Siau Chin
(Auto Sves/Claims & [A/Claims & TA/Buses) <ChanSiauChin/@'smri.com.se>; Admin A <admin-

aa lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: OUR REF:BUS/08/19/1053 - ACCIDENT ON 25/08/19 INVOLVING SG1695B AND
SGV2098 ALONG Sembawang Way

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Pear Khanchna

Video footage attuched as requested and it shows that our bus was stationary at the bus stop bay for passengcr oot
when it was collided by vour client’s vehicle

s vour elient is the main cause of this accident, kindly settle our claim soonest possible. Thanks

Regards,



Patrick Tan

Claims and Insurance Agency

Direct line +65 6556 3522 | tanweiteck@smrt.com.ag
6 Ang Mo Kio Street 62

Singapore 569140

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) [mailto:khanchna@lkkauto.com)]

Sent: 26/11/2019 11:20

To: MTPRI

Cc: Chong Fel Yuan (Auto Sves/Claims & 1A/Claims & [A); Baigish Binte Abdul Halll {Auto Sves/Claims & IA/Claims &
14/Buses); Tan Wei Teck (Auto Svecs/Claims & IA/Claims & [A/Buses); Karen Chan Siau Chin (Auto Sves/Claims B
1A/Claims & [A/Buses); Admin A

Subject: RE: OUR REF:BUS/08/19/1053 - ACCIDENT ON 25/08/19 INVOLVING SG1695B AND SGV2095 ALONG
Sembawang Way

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Diear Sir / Madam.

we refer to the above matter.

We would like 1o request a copy of video foolage/scene photos(if any) in order for us 1o look into the matta
Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between partles on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resclving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the lssues of
liability /damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LLKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51. Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Ubi Avenue 1. #02-25 | S(408933)

From: MTPRI <MTPRIa smrt.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 26 September 2019 9:02 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a/@lkkauo.com=; CS A Team <cs-aa lkkauo.com=

Ce: Chong Fei Yuan (Auto Sves/Claims & 1A/Claims & [A) <FeiYuan@ smrt.com.sg>; Balgish Binte Abdul
Halil (Auto Sves/Claims & TA/Claims & 1A/Buses) <BalgishBAH @ smrt.com.sg>: Tan Wei Teck (Aulo
Sves/Claims & IA/Claims & 1A/Buses) <TanWei Teck @ smrt.com.sg>; Karen Chan Siau Chin (Auto
Sves/Claims & 1A/Claims & [A/Buses) <ChanSiauChini@ smrt.com.sg>

Subject: OUR REF:BUS/08/19/1053 - ACCIDENT ON 25/08/19 INVOLVING SG1695B AND SGV20uS
ALONG Sembawang Way

Dear Sirs,



ke |
)

Wé clainr on behalf of SMRT Buses Ltd, owner of the vehicle registration number SG1695B. Your client’s
negligent driving has caused the above accident. A< a result, my client has suffered the following losses.

Cost of Repair $9,150.00
Loss of Use 52,200.00 | B daysx 527500 )
LTA search fee $7.00
Total $11,357.00

We enclose the following
documents,

1) Repair Invoice

2) GIA report

3) LTA search

We look forward to vour confirmation to settle our claims within 15 days from the date of this emal. Pavment
by cheque shall be crossed and made payable to SMRT Buses Lid.

Thanks & Regards
Hua Yen



11472020 Marimean e-Claims

Print Received Message

This mall is associated with

*SG1695B8 (11268137375G)
[SG‘:%EEE]

SMRT BUSES LTD
Aug 25 2019 B:00PM
[MURALI S/0 SUBRAMANIAM]
SMRT Automotive Services Pta Ltd

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Lid. (Express) (AIG_SG_EXPRESS), senl on 30/12/2019 13:21 PM
To LKK_HQ
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$10657.00) - SG16958 - Claim Handler: Syed-Yusoff, Saliha

#ppmved:mﬁi}'.ﬂﬂ:LDU to be offered up to sﬁﬁﬂ_iSISH x6 d-éys].mandate approval is subject to final rﬂpa.l-r bili &
|ATA

hitps. ifsingapone. merman.com/caims/index.cfm Musabox=SVCmailAfuseaction=dsp_PrimtACFID=65588381 ACFTOKEN =db3chaccied bBfdT-502
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...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Express

| CLATM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
[ Caze Wotifizd Est Submatted Adj Assigned Ad) Apt Ad) Submitted Ins Auth'ed Status

|76 Au8 2019 BPsI01T  l549,150.00  |5$9,150.00 a1
|_ 210 Bag I Edit Adj Rpt I Eidet Fatirmsnes Wiw Spt CIFI:II:“-I

Main

CLATM SUBFOLDER DETAILS | [Created by ndjuster]

Insured: HURALI 5/0 SUBRAMANIAM, [0: 57728409

Muin i

Claimant: SMAT BUSES LTD, Co, Reg. No.: 1982022920

Vehicle Reg. . [25/08/2019 20:00 - 159

N |sG16958 Date of LSS: | 142 Months and 14 Days From LTA fleg Date (Man Yr)]

" Palicy/Cover | 2100509727 (Comprehensive)

Cain Type: . [TP/ 112631373756 Note o | Coverage: 27/04/2019 - 26/04/2020

Vehicle Reg.

Mo $GV109S ey ey, |p-19083203MPEP
| (Tnsured) )
Exr=gs:

Repairer: SMRAT Automotive Services Pte Ltd (Woodlands) 60 Woodiands Industnal Park E4, 757705 Woodlands - Tel: 68662628
Handling AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) - Tel: 65-5419-3000 . [Handled by Syed-Yusoff, Ssliha] Salita Syed-
Insurer Yusoffifaig.com

m“ MS First Capital Insurancs Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 52222311

Adjustar: LKX Auta Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel 6256-3561 _ [Handied by CHEN TSUE YEE| __ | Final Rpt due 09/09/2019]
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view Al | compose Case Mau |
« AJG_SG_EXPRESS [10/12/201%): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$10857.00) - SG16358 - Clalm Handler; Syed-Yusoff...

Mo results

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKSS
Due Date  Priority Type

view All | Sesrch Tasks | Create wew Task | compiete |
Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Dana?

Task Group

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=d... 31/1/2020



Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*SG16958 (11268137375G)

[sGv2095]
™

SHMRT BUSES LTD
Aug 25 2019 B:00PM
[MURALI S/0 SUBRAMANIAM]
SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

Page | of 2

View [view in Srowser] -

Letters /Correspondences 1 per ¥}
No | Finalized On LKK Auto Consultants Pie Ltd (HG) Thumbnall | Print
1 |iomn Third Party Express Settlement - Payment Breakdown 0 =
Photas/Images 3 pes ~] &
No | Relabel/Recrder | LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 | 10/0%/19 17:34 Ganersl View Q| caewvc | A
2 |10/08/19 17:34 Goneral View 0| s | M
3 |10/09/19 17:34 | General View @O | s | A
4 |10/08/19 17:34 Ganeral View 0| wcaaws | A
5 |10U09/18 17:34 | Genersl View 0| icadivc | &
B [1/05/19 1734 | General View Q| adws | B
7 |10/09/19 17:34 | General View 0| ews | B
8 |10/09/1917:34 | Genaral View ©| weerws | B
9 |10/09/19 17:34 | Ganeral View 0 wews | B
'10 | 10/09/19 17:34 General View 0| edws | A
11| 108/19 1734 General View 0| loeawec | A
12 |10919 17:34 | General View @ | tewc | A
10 |10/09/18 17:34 | Genarsl View Q| wars | B
14 [10/09/1917:34 | General View 0| wmews |
15 |10/09/19 17:34 General View 0| adirc | A
16 (100919 17:34 | General View 0| eciwc | A
17 |10/09/1917.34 | General View @ | teec | A
18 |10/09/19 17:34 | General View B | e | B |
19 | 10/09/19 17:34 | General View @ | wwawe | B
20 10919 17:34 | General View 0| wedwc | 4
I | 10/09/19 17:34 Genaral View 0| eairc | A
77 |10/19/19 17134 | General View 0! i=dwc | B
71 |10j09/18 1734 | Genaral View | oars | A
24 | 10/08/19 17:34 Ganeral View i toea G | B
25 |10/09/19 17134 | General View 0| edwe | 4
6 | 10/09/19 17:34 | General View 0| loedipc | A
IT | 10/09/19 17:34 General View i Load 3G | B
28 | 10/09/19 17:34 Ganeral View 0| weaws | 4
29 |10/09/19 17:34 | General View 0| aws | B
30 |10/0918 17:34 | General View O v | A
31 |1yvowie 173 | General View Q| lssawc | &
37 [10/09/15 17:34 | General View @ | tadws | A
33 |1yo918 17:32 | General View 0| weamws |
4 |10/09/18 17:34 | Ganersl View | Losows | B
A5 | 10/09/19 17:34 Ganeral View 0| tcadec | A
36 | 10VDaS18 17:34 | Genaral View 0| loediec | M
37 |10/08/18 17:34 | General View 0| esarc | B
I8 |10/09/19 17:34 | Genersl View 0| wors | H
39 |10/09/19 17:34 | General View | woaws | A
40 |10/09/19 17:34 | Genars| View 0 | oo

hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_... 31/1/2020



Merimen e-Claims

Page 2 of 2

Letters/ Correspondences 1 per ~] &
No | Finaled On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HG) [ Thumbnail | Print
il
&1 |1/09/19 1734 | Genersl View 0 | wedwrs | A
42 |10/09719 17:34 General View 0| adws | A
41 |10/08y1% 17:34 | General View i wad G | B
44 |10/09/1917:34 | General View @ | s | A
45 | 10/09/19 17:34 General View 0| et | A
46 |10/09/19 17:34 | Odemeter Reading 0| wadwc | A
47 |10/09/19 17:34 Chassls Humber B | Load s ﬂ;
48 |10/09/19 17:34 General View 0 | weows | B
49 |10/09/18 17:34 | General View 0| catwvc | &
Is0 |10/00/19 17:34 General View @ | adies | B
§1 |10/09/19 17:34 | Ganeral View @O | aaws | B
52 |10/09/19 17:34 General View _g waates | BB
53 | 10/09/19 17:34 Ganeral View 0| s | A
54 |10/09/19 17:34 | After Repalr Photo Q| teadwc | B
S5 |10/09/19 17:34 | After Repair Photo 0| oews | A
S6 |10/09/19 17:34 | After Repair Photo O | weervs | A
57 |10/09/12 17:34 | After Repair Photo Q| wews | A
56 |10/0919 17:34 | After Repair Photo 0| wews | A
56 [10/09/1% 1734 | After Repair Photo 0| adws | M
Documentation 1 ~]| &
lio |Relabel/Recrder | LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid [HG) Thumbnail | Print
1 |39/0B/1% 17:34 | TP ESTIMATE- MARKED g Load PDF
7 |29/08/1917:34  |TP GIA REPORT Load POF
3 |14/11/19 15:12 | TP ESTIMATE-MARKED-FINAL Load POF
4 |14/11/19 15:96 | EMAIL TO O g Load POF
S |a9711/19 17111 LoD s Lowd POF
6 | 29/11/19 17111 LTA SEARCH Load POF
7 |31/01,/20 09:24 WORKSHOP INVOICE _8 Load POF
B |31/01/20 05:24 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM Load POF
9 |31/01/20 09:24 | Release Voucher ) | tosd por
i | Finafized On AIG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid, (5G) Thumbnall | Print
1 |30/08/19 10:57 | O GIA REPORT @ | Load woF
Documents Checklist
DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST meset | save | e |

Thete are no document checklists conligured.

Our Checkilst Remarks - LKK Auvte Conaultants Pte Lid (HG)

"
W
Show Remarks To! ﬁ Handling Insuber
hiate . Ramasui 478 privdis uniess yos ahow € 10 GENGT gRIMES
https://singapore.menmen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_... 31/1/2020
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NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
|‘h‘lhlr:.ln No: SGV209S (Insd veh) Model: ERCEDES-BENZ CITARO
SG16958 (TP vah) 530 6.4 L AT TURBO ABS

| Date of Accident: | 25/08/2019 A)

Global Sum Settiement| - | [ ] Yes | [X] No

Repair Estimate M- 12,053.70

Final Repair Cost 5 9,150.00

Loss of Use - 5 1.500.00 6.00 days at $250.00 per day

Rental (if any) 5 0.00 days

LTA / GlA Search Fee - 7.00

Others 5 0.00

5
Final Settlement Sum - 10,657.00

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Reglstered? [ 1 YES [X ] NO (Kindlyindicate
balow)

A) For Non GIA Registerad Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)
BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No

B} For GIA Reqisterad Workshop:

BOLA Liability: {%) Assessed Liabiiity (*): (%)
* Assessed Liability fo be filled only for chaln collisions and for cases where BOLA does nal apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) | SMRT Buses Lid 5 10,657.00
2) 5
3) - &
31 Jan
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 2020
LKK Aulo Consultants Pte Lid Data

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report;
Medical Report/ Bill (if any)

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc& fuseaction=dsp_d... 31/1/2020



Adjuster Report Page 1 of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (cs reg e 1ssearsesr)

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com:assignments@|kkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our Flle No: CC3/AIG19015267/EKS302

Date: 31/01/2020
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.  Policy No: 2100509727
Claimant i
Vehicle No : SG16958 Insured Vehicle No : SGVZ085
Date of Loss 25/08/2019 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: 112681373756
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SG16958
j MERCEDES-BENZ CITARO 0530, 6.4 L AT :
Make & Model: TURBO ABS (A) Engine No: 802926 C 1098004
Reg. Date: 11/02/2016 (Man. Year: 2015) Chassis No: WEBS2B808323120412
Colour: Multi-colour Odometer: 279546 km
Engine Capacity: 6374 cc
Market Value™ew Car NIA
Prica:
Sum Insured (S5): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Servicaable): Yes Engine Modification: Mo  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 275/7T0R225 Rear Tyre Size: 275/T0R225
Front Left Side: Firenza 5 mm Rear Left Side; Firenza 5 mm
Front Right Side: Firenza & mm Rear Right Side: Firenza 5 mm
The nbove vaives mpresani e remmmng fyre reads gaarh
'COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %
Parts B,185.70 7,387.13 798.57 9.76
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 D.00 0.00
Labour 3,868.00 3,248 .00 622.00 16.08
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S§) 12,053.70 10,633.13 1,420.57 11.79
Approved Total (Overridden) (S$) 9,150.00
Nett Amount (5§) 12,053.70 9,150.00 2,903.70 24.09
+ Loss of Use (6.0 x $5250.00/day) (S%) 1,500.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (S§) 7.00
Natt Liability (S5$) 10,657.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 2B/08/2019
Date Inspected: 28/08/2019 Inspected AL SMRT Automotive Services Pie Lid
(Woodlands)
&0 Woodlands Industnal Park E4
Singapore 757705
Estimated Period of Repair: 5.0 days

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 31/1/2020
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Adjuster: CHEN TSUE YEE Manager: Khanchna Pothuraj

NOTE: This report represenia our fndinga ad the time and place of mspection stafed hersin. Such inspection has been carmisd ouf ke the bast af our
knowiedpe and ability buf any other fabifity under any other circumsiances iy hereby expresaly excluded

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 31/1/2020
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REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

1 1 *LAMP TAIL:REAR RH FOG MB CITARO 0530 Broken 1.261.71F *1.,261.T1FL
2 1 ‘FLAP RADIATOR:FOR MB CITARD 0530 Denled 544500F *544500FL
3 4 “LAMP ,SIDE MARKER:FOR MB CITARO 0530 BUS Broken 378.00F *37B.00FL
4 1 *BUMPER :REAR ,RH,FOR MB CITARO 0530 Broken 837.84F  *B37.B4FL
5 1 “LAMP ,EXTERIOR :REAR FOGLAMP ,FOR MB CITARO Broken 63.15F  *B3.15FL
6 1 *STICKER SMRT Necessary  200.00FS *200.00FS

F=Franchise part S=SpcMett. L=ListhemDisc
Sub Total (S§) 818570  B8,185.70
- List Item Discount on L Items 0.00/10.00% (S%§) 0.00 798.57

Total Parts (S§) 8,185.70 7,387.13

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. ]

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 31/1/2020



Adjuster Report Page 4 of 4
Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscellansous ilems selected.
Recommended Labour
Ne Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltams
1 TO REMOVE & INSTALL ALL ABOVE ITEMS AND REPAIR New 2,650.00 2,120.00
OTHERS DAMAGED AFFECTED AREAS
2 PROVIDE LABOUR AND MATERIAL TO PUTTY AND New 1.218.00 1,126.00
RESPRAY ABOVE REPAIR ITEMS
Gross Labour Cost (S$) 3,868.00 3,246.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 31/1/2020



