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> Back to OneMotoring

DADEF s peels [ S

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Crenar [T

Vehicle Details

Vichiile Mo

Vehicle to e Esported
intended Deregistration Date:
Vehilcle Make

Virhicle Model

Primary Colour
Manubacturing Year

Engping Na.

CHassiy Mo !

Mairmurn Power Outpul:
Open Marke! Value:

Qriglnal Reglstration Date
First Registration Date:
Tranafer Count:

Actual ARF Pakd:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibiliny:

SARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
imended COE Rebate Details
COE Expity Date

COE Category:

COE Penoo(Years)

QP Pald:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebale Amount:

The informatkan conlained berein i correct as al 29 Aug 2019

BN A gt g e 0] S e S 0 W [t et 1

Company
925K

PCo56C

No

29 Auy 2019

GOLDEN DRAGON
MMLATSTIN4
Multicalor

2011
ISBEA2252197241
LLIBECDHTBAD11IDY

$85,095.00
21 i 2011
21 ul 2011
1]
$4.25500

o
$0.00

20 Jul 2021

C - Goods Vehicie & Bus
10

$31.08%.00

3587500

$5.675.00

R P i

in



Chang i

CONNECT3
566 Woodlands Road | Manda: Estate | Singapore 728697
Tel (65) 9850-9666 Email: Connect3winmisiigmall com

ROC:5336006 1L W hance nodly
GST:53360061L .:Iu' - H:_"
o T Swsiey dnagad paryi| ey ey
OTIWPCESsCTIMC-349 * Farts oroe o fuliect © comiention
* Third party Surviy & o0 8 "Without Prudcs” e
» g e e icHin 1| 8 Biwd
Lampac Insurance Bhd * Suppst My AR Tt B reurveres gl
100 Beach Road S
B 19-(X) Shﬂ“' Tt A Y R
Singapore 189702 %
(HJOTATION
Dear Sir,
Cust of Repar 1o Vetucs PCE2SC
With reference to the above-mentioned, we are pleased to quote as follows -
No.  DESCRIPTION | un-] U/PRICE :ss;l AMOUNT (55)
"1 montwndsereen - AT TV smew | ssee (197
1 Eront windscreen inner moulding e .r'H: 4+ EBpo0 | ea0mo S/
[ P - — ™ —————— . e ———— .-..---I
3 Front LH rear view mirior assy » Ef 1| 1.35000 1.35000 1 Ifﬁ"/
' , _ o o 5794
4 Sealan nec ] 4000 20007 ),
. i : = i . d
% Labour to remove L refil front windicresn 1 1.000 00 100000 /L) I:Mf
b | Check witing 1 i : 2000 ‘ w000,
"7 Tiabourcharges 7 600 0O T TB0000 g0

. N S| ———
|
|

K Spray panting | 2800 oo 1 800 00 J:H'?.

s . S58.570.00

S [LEL) M ﬂf;-"{‘f }‘W/ﬂ i

Thank vou j o, ik‘.j' J 147

‘f'sml‘plhﬂhlully._ s ';n'l’l II' 1'_ - .‘m- --.E:lq::! nolify

, o ALY i netoneg

Wit - 41 | oo

HP: 9850-9666 = |9 D o Prapden” bese
L ﬂ?y . . .L:\":I_“..a?lp:;!ﬂ

(155 314 B ko el

{ 3¢
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SUB-TOTAL ‘

o Price before T 2w
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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

———————EEEEEEEE

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpaccom>

Sent: Thursday, 29 August, 2019 855 AM

Te: Mei Kwan [LEKAUtD)

Cc: MT Claim_SG

Subject: RE: Request for pre repair inspection for accident involving PCB56C & YNBBITS ( yr
insured ) on 25/08/19 [External Confidential]

Attachments: 29082019085307 pdf

Categories: HMK

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Mei Kwan,

Attached copy of insured’s report for your attention.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555

Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ex1.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706
I

The all | % | Jonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com|

Sent: Wednesday, 28 August, 2019 5:59 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Ce: MT_Claim_SG; Khanchna (LKK Auto); CS A Team; Admin A

Subject: RE: Request for pre repair inspection for accident involving PC656C & YNB697S ( yr insured ) on
25/08/19 [External Confidential]

Your ref: 19/19/19/VC05/022271
LKK ref: CC4/CTI19015226/ka3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE'
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action.



‘Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com»

Sent: Tuesday, 27 August 2019 4:18 PM

To: assignments@lkkauto.com; Admin A

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: FW: Request for pre repair inspection for accident involving PCES6C & YNBEITS ( yr
insured ) on 25/08/19 |External Confidential)

Attachments: Estimate.pdf, GIA Report.PDF A Al @ '37[ Lﬂiﬁ'

WNL

Lonpac External - Confidential Ymurmmim\t,

Our Ref : 19/19/19/VvC05/022271

Dear Nivitha

Please proceed to survey accordingly.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tgh_{_ﬁS] 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

.
| ) The all ©%%) lonpac.com.sg
—

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Winnie Chai [mailto:connect3winnie@gmail.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 27 August, 2019 3:36 PM

To: MT_Claim_5SG

Subject: Request for pre repair inspection for accident involving PC656C & YNB697S ( yr insured ) on 25/08/19
Afternoon

Attached is the GIA & estimate for yr ref.

Pls kindly assign yr surveyor down for the survey.

Thanks

Winmie Chai
Connect3
HP:9850-9666



cJconnects

566 Woodlands Rd ( Manda Fstate ) Singapore 728697
LEN no 533600611
HP: {+65) 9850-9666 Email: Connect3wmnmiegmail com

Your Rel - Pls advica
06 Seprember 2019

_I Lunpaﬁsumm:c Bhd

100 Beach Road

Lu_l 9-00 Shaw Tower
Singapore 189702

Dear Sir,

TO PROPOSE A CLAIM OF AN ACCIDENT INVOLVING PU6S60 & YNBGITS
ON 25/08/19.

We refer 10 the above, we are authorized by owner Fuchi Ple Lid of vehicle no PC656C 1o
negotiate and settle the claim on his behalf

We hereby quanuty our ¢luim as follows -

I} Repair Cost inc 7% pst S8 §.724 50
5, Lossof Use @S150 X 03
7 days S$ 450.00

Total 58 6.174.50
We enclosed a copy of each of the ihlinmﬁg for your consideration

11 Repar Bill inv. 726

2} Motor Accident report of vehicle no PC6SHC

3} Letter Authonzation (ongimal available upon request)
41 Insurance Certificate

51 Vehicle registration card

6)  Pre repair inspection (done by Steve LKK on 29/08 19)

Kindlv acknowledge receipt of the above said documents and hope 1o receive your
favourable reply ASAP
Thank vou

Yours sincerely =0\
Qs |

Winme Chas
HP: 9850-96h4



cJconnects
566 Woodiands Road
Singapore T2BEET
Tel (+65) 9850-9686 Email connect3winniediigmail com
UEN No: 533800610

BILL TO
TAX INVOICE NO.: 726
lL.onpac Insurance Bhd DATE 6-Sep-19
100 Beach Road D/O NO -
#1900 Shaw Tower PIO NO .
Singapore 189702 VEHICLE NO - PCB56C
TERMS : coD
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
Accident damaged repair cost 1o vehicle PCE56C ¥ 599000
Accident date 25/08/19
SUBTOTAL | § 5.350.00
7% GST $ 37450
TOTAL: § 572450
EAGE
* It no discrepancy is reporied within 7 days from Connect3
tha dale af this stalamant the account will be
CONRINATAT BE COMmec]

* A 1% Late Payment Charge will be imposed on
any outstanding balance in the next statement |
no paymant is received fn

* All chequeis) should be crossed and made s N

payabla 1o ~ Connectd " Authansed Signature



LETTER OF AUTHORITY & INDEMNITY

Lornaty
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Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 5 November 2019 2:38 PM

To: MT Claim_SG

Cc Admin A

Subject: Mandate Reguest - ACCIDENT BETWEEN PC 656C & YN B6975 (LONPAC) ON
25/08/2019

Attachments: DS Supporting documents pdf; LKK SURVEY PHOTOS. pdf; LKK REINSPECTION
PHOTOS. pdf; LKK Adjustment Report.pdf; LKK Inspection Report pdf

Tracking: Recipient Delivery
MT_Claim_5G
Admin A
olivialauElkkauto com Delvered: 5/11/2019 2:38 PM
Mekwani@ikkauto com Delvered: 5/11/2019 238 PM
shupeiikkauto com Delivered: 5/11/2018 238 PM

LPC ref- 19/19/19/VC05/022271
LKK REF; CC4/LPC19015226/Eka3

Dear Sir/Modam,
We refer to the above matter.

we have highlighted fo your good office on 03/09/2019 of Third-Party's request to do Direct Settlement with our
Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

Our Insured driver collided into parked Third party vehicle. We opine that BOLA 23 is applicable and liability is
down against Insured.

summary 1o offer o third party repairer "CONNECT 3" as follows: -

Claimed Amount Revised Amount
|. Cost of Repalr [w/GST) $9.169.90 % 5.724.50
2. Loss of Use (3 days x $ 150) $ 450.00 $ 450.00 (3 days x $150)
Total | $7.619.50 S 6,174.50

**03days recommendation for repair
The abov r val.

Thank you.



Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Ehanchna@|kkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 7 November 2019 4:38 PM

To: Winnie Chai

Cc Admin A

Subject: RE: 2nd REMINDER - Accident involving PC&56C & YNB697S | Lonpac Insured ) on
25/08/19

Attachments: LONPAC DV PCBS6C pdl

Without Prejudice

(save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

we reler 1o the above matier,

We confirm setflement as per your LOD dated 6/9/2019 for $ 6,174.50 (all in)
We attach herewith o copy of the DV for your further action.

Kindly send us |LKK) all the documents below for our necessary action: -

& Criginal LOD
. Original Final Repair Tox Invoice
. Original Lefter of Authorisation & hardcopy of the DV

Thank you.

Kindly note that this negotiation berween parties on this marner is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resalving the
maticr amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of Hability, whatsoever, should be deemed [ inferved fram this
negotiation of terma/settlement.

In the eveni of new evidence belng discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
lishility/dumages, elther party is not bound. thereafier, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”™

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LLKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchnaflkkauto.com(Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Winnie Chai <connect3winnie(@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 5 November 2019 2:18 PM
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com™>; GERALD BIN POH WEE <geraldpohia/lonpac.com>

Ce: Admin A <admin-a@ lkkauto.com>
Subject: 2nd REMINDER : Accident involving PC656C & YN8697S ( Lonpac Insured ) on 25/08/19

Hi Khanchna



TEL 6256 3581 FAX: 6256 4115

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 801-25 Pays Ubl Industirtal Park, Singapore 408833

Reg. No: 198607198R ST Reg, No. 18-9507T198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD Rel CC4/LPC18015226/Ekad3n2
o e ot courseswanrore wssss 2 220 | [T
Code: LPC2
1. Policy Particulars ;- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. YN BES7S Veh. Inspected PC B56C
Policy No. Z16VC05002087 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. 19/19/19/VC05/022271 Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From GERALD Assign Date 27082018
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model GOLDEN DRAGON e.c BE93
XMLBGS7J14
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2011
Chassis No. LLIBECDHTBAD11207 Colour MULTI COLOUR
Odometer BOO063 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |[275/70 R22.5 BRIDGESTONE 5 mm
L/H Front Tyre |275/70 R22.5 BRIDGESTONE S mm
R/H Rear Tyre |275/70 R22.5 BRIDGESTONE 5 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |275/70R22.5 BRIDGESTONE 5 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT PORTION
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. General Information
Accident Date 250872018 |inspection Date 26/08/2019
Survey held at CONNECT3
7 0OLD TOH TUCK ROAD
SINGAPORE 597648
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON AWITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS
5h. Estimale Days of Repair

IESTiMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl industnal Park, Singapore 408833
TEL B258 3581 FAX G256 4115

Reg. Mo 199607198R GST Reg. Mo, 18-8607 168-R Page No.'1 ol 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. PC 656C
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT WINDSCREEN CRACKED 3,800.00 3,500.00
1|FRONT WINDSCREEN INNER MOULDING NECESSARY BB0.00 500.00
1|FRONT LH REAR VIEW MIRROR ASSY BROKEN 1,350.00 1.200.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT - -520.00
5,830.00 4,680.00
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
B|SEALANT @1540.00 (SM) MECESSARY 320.00 320.00
320.00 320,00
LABOUR
LABOUR TO REMOVE & REFIT FRONT WINDSCREEN, 1,000.00 800.00
CHECK WIRING 20.00 20,00
LABOUR CHARGES 800.00 450,00
SPRAY PAINTING. B00.00 400.00
242000 1,670.00
GRAND TOTAL B,570.00 6,670.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CC4/LPC19015226/Eka3n2
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HOD LEONG CHUAM

Automotive Assessor

[HBCLAIMER OF LLARILITY TD THIRD PARTIES - Thia Fmpart b made sobsly lor e uee snd beaelil of e Clism named oo the el pags of this Raport.




