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RE: YOUR REF: GBJ 5941A (OUR REF: CC4/ASM19015191/Ugb3) *** ACCIDENT 
INVOLVING GZ 6251H & GBJ 5941A ON 16/08/2019 *** --

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) (ceciliachong@lkkauto.com) 

To: liusbro@ymail .com 

Date: Friday, 3 July 2020, 12:04 pm SGT 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

Dear Susan, 

- • At the same time, please email me a copy of surveyor marking estimate list . 

I of 10 

Thanks 

"Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be 
construed as an admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of 
our without prejudice engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should 

it be binding in any other related claims." 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence 
should be made via email. Submission of claim related documents will 
be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

Best Regards. 

Cecilia Chong I Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749-4274 I email: Cct,;il iuChonµ(a,J kbuto.com; fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51. Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Ubi Avenue I. #02-25 I S(408933) 

14-Jul-20. 11 :31 AM 
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Fw: YOUR REF: GBJ 5941A (OUR REF: CC4/ASM19015191/Ugb3) *** ACCIDENT 
INVOLVING GZ 6251H & GBJ 5941A ON 16/08/2019 *** 

From: Susan Low (liusbro@ymail.com) 

To: ceciliachong@lkkauto.com 

Date: Friday, 3 April 2020, 12:46 pm SGT 

We refer to our email dated 27/03/2020. 

Kindly let us have your discharge for our client's execution and your cheque made in our favour as soon as 
possible. 

Thank. 

Best Regards, 

Susan Low 
M/s Liu's Brother Auto Engineering Workshop 
No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-01 
AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit 
Singapore 4178~3 
Tel: 67411730 Fax: 67445746 

--- Forwarded message ---
From: Susan Low <liusbro@ymail.com> 
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <ceciliachong@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Friday, 27 March 2020, 3:29:20 pm SGT 
Subject: Re: YOUR REF: GBJ 5941A (OUR REF: CC4/ASM19015191/Ugb3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING 
GZ 6251H & GBJ 5941A ON 16/08/2019 *** 

We hereby confirm acceptance of your offer. 
,I 

Kindly let us have your discharge for our client's execution and your cheque made in our favour as soon 
as possible. 

Thank. 

Best Regards, 

Susan Low 
M/s Liu's Brother Auto Engineering Workshop 
No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-01 
AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit 
Singapore 417883 
Tel: 67411730 Fax: 67445746 

On Thursday, 26 March 2020, 1 :53:58 pm SGil", Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <ceciliachong@lkkauto.com> 
wrote: 

14-Jul-20. 12:03 PM 
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No. , K,,ki lluk it Avenu e 6 11 01-01 Auto Jl,1y @ K,1i<i Uuld t Sing,1pore ,11 7883 

ROB No: 5i,91793J . Tel: 6·;~1 -1730 / '/J ' . Fax: 67,1,1-5·; 46. Em.iii : liusbro@)'m,1il.co111 J~stimutc 
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rc:::;;~~-=-r~----------~---------i.:_ ___ s 
Name: -~XJ\ Insurance Singapore Pt eLtd __ ________________ _ ___ Date: -_,. __ 27-08-19 
Addrcss:.Motor C"1ims Department , _____ ______,, __________ __ Vehicle No: Gl3J59~-.--

8 Shenton \
11
/ay 11 27 .. 01 Model/Make: Mirsubishi 

Item 
No. 

AXA Tower .. __________ ___ _ Singt pore 068811 - -- - -.. ------ --- . Canter FEA011JR2SDEK 

Descriptions Of Pans 

Rear Lh Freezer Side Door 
Freezer Side Door Outer Rubber Lower 
Freezer Side Door Outer Panel Frame Lower 
Freezer Side Door Horizontal Rubber 
Freezer Side Door Horizontal Panel Frame 

Original 
Quotation/ 
Estimation 

$ 3,300.00 SN 

Revised 
Quotation/ 

Cost Of Repair 

$ 300.00 SN .:2_,!l? 
s 380.00 sN Jo v 
$ 350.00 SN ~1) 
s 680.00 s~ lfo J 

Labor for Panel Beating, Cur, Weld, Straighten & Replacing Parts Ercs $ 1,000.00 

To putl'y & spray painting & including touch up paint on accident affectecd are, $ 600.00 

--~-- - ___ ___ ___ _____ __ j ___ -· 

Total Parts & Labour of estimate for damaged vehicle 

Total amount in Lump Sum Basis for repaired vehicle 

SOLS: 

rLK_v ct,ut . \;pfilyltants he~ce. notify 
--; qt . e· of the following .. th

:. · ,.,'.,,. 1 oefr ,·e,after spray painting 
' r- '' part(s) during resurvey I t· 1u .... . 'J• ( .,i•.,,iJe · 

·• c· are ! " ~!eel lo conlirmat1on . .. . 
. 1s I . . . "Without Prejudice bas,s J , i \ :,urve , 1c, on a 

"· .. ,1,f;r,at,on(s) is allowed 
.· ,so ' be resurveyed and 

S· .. , ,,.,.11en1a,, ,12m(s1 Insurance Company 
5 Sc, bjPr! 10 final approva r . 

J..c::· :-.vls"gc::, IJy r.epairer 
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