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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: claims@96motorsports.com

Sent: Tuesday, 27 August, 2019 6:32 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: PRI FOR  SJN3481H  ; YOUR INSURED GBE2041T (China Taiping)

Attachments: WhatsApp Image 2019-08-22 at 6.40.08 PM.jpeg; WhatsApp Image 2019-08-22 at 

6.40.08 PM (2).jpeg; WhatsApp Image 2019-08-22 at 6.40.08 PM (1).jpeg; WhatsApp 

Image 2019-08-22 at 6.40.06 PM (1).jpeg; WhatsApp Image 2019-08-22 at 6.40.06 

PM (3).jpeg; WhatsAppVideo2019-08-27at52856PM.mp4

Dear Vic, 

 

Kindly refer to the attached scene photo and video. 
 

Thank you. 
 

Royce Phua  
 

62/64 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 

Ark @ KB Singapore 417893  
Tel         : 6702 6996 

Fax        : 6384 6996 

Email    : Operation@96motorsports.com  
Website: www.96motorsports.com  
 

 

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, 27 August, 2019 5:24 PM 

To: claims@96motorsports.com 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: PRI FOR SJN3481H ; YOUR INSURED GBE2041T (China Taiping) 

 

Dear Royce, 
 

We refer to the above matter. 
 

Please be informed that we are currently pending for OI GIA report. 
 

Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Vic at 6841 2096. 
 

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course. 
 

Thank you 

 

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 
 

Best Regards, 

Shu Pei| Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
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Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: claims@96motorsports.com <claims@96motorsports.com>  

Sent: Monday, 26 August 2019 11:26 AM 

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng 

(LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: PRI FOR SJN3481H ; YOUR INSURED GBE2041T (China Taiping) 

 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE  
 

Dear Lkk, 

  

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJN3481H and GBE2041T on 22/08/2019 

AT / ALONG WOODLANDS AVENUE 3 

  

We act for LYN AUTO PTE LTD, whose vehicle registration number SJN3481H was damaged in the above 

accident.  

 
Please arrange for Adrian to conduct the survey. 

  

If we do not receive any reply from you within the stipulated timeline, our client shall proceed to repair the 

vehicle without further reference to you. 

 

Royce Phua  
 

62/64 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 

Ark @ KB Singapore 417893  
Tel         : 6702 6996 

Fax        : 6384 6996 

Email    : Operation@96motorsports.com  
Website: www.96motorsports.com  
 


