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Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

From: Florence KOH <florencekohef@yahoo.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 25 March 2021 2:29 PM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin-D (LKKAuto); Ming-Yao Lee

Subject: K K Cheng ref: ACC/10566/20 ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKJ 7124Y & GBB 9179A 

ON 20/07/2019 ***LKK REF: CC6/AIG19015089/Urb3

without prejudice 

 

Dear Jaslin 

 

We refer to your email dated 24th March 2021. 

 

We settled the claim on a global sum basis.   

 

We estimate liability at 55% in  favour of our mutual client (SKJ 7124Y). 

 

Regards 

Florence 

K K CHENG & CO 

Tel: 6227 1272 

Fax: 6227 5563 

 

 

 

 
On Wednesday, 24 March 2021, 11:35:26 am SGT, Bee Ling Koh <kohbeeling@yahoo.com.sg> wrote:  
 
 

 
 
----- Forwarded message ----- 
From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> 
To: kohbeeling@yahoo.com.sg <kohbeeling@yahoo.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Lee, Ming-Yao <mingyao.lee@aig.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, 24 March 2021, 08:48:58 am SGT 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKJ 7124Y & GBB 9179A ON 20/07/2019 ***LKK REF: CC6/AIG19015089/Urb3 
 

Dear Sirs/Madam, 

  

We refer to our email dated 08/02/2021. 

  

Kindly let us know the agreed liability of the claim settlement. 
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We look forward to hear from you soon. 

  

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)  
Sent: Monday, 8 February 2021 2:32 PM 
To: kohbeeling@yahoo.com.sg 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Lee, Ming-Yao <MingYao.Lee@aig.com> 
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKJ 7124Y & GBB 9179A ON 20/07/2019 ***LKK REF: CC6/AIG19015089/Urb3 

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

   

Dear Sirs/Madam, 

  

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKJ 7124Y & GBB 9179A ON 20/07/2019 

  

We understand that you act for our insured, Loh Kok Lin, for claim against the third-party insurer MS First Capital 

Insurance Ltd.  

  

We would appreciate it, if you could kindly let us know the agreed liability so that we are aware of his/her percentage of 

claim settlement. 

  

We look forward to hear from you soon. 
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Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  


