Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Lee Peng Geok <cecilialee@sparkcarcare.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 13 May 2020 9:14 AM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto); Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: REMINDER TO EQ/LKK FOR OFFER - SLL9482C & YM8903C DOA 22/08/2019 ***

LKK REF: CC4/EQI19015081/Kga3

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/Madam

Strictly without admission of any liability and solely for quick amicable settlement, we confirm settlement at $16,300.00
for property damage only. Please note that this acceptance is purely for quick settlement and it shall not be cited or
relied on as precedent in any proceeding. Please note that the contents of this document apply to vehicle damages only.
It is condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any personal injury claim (if any) of the
owner/driver/claimant.

Please arrange to let us have your payment made in favor of ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd within the next seven
(7) days.

Please let us have your reply by email as we are currently deployed to work from home in view of the current COVID-19
situation in Singapore.

Thank you.

Best Regards
Cecilia Lee
Claims Department | ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd

‘[{:} Think Before Printing j_

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 12 May 2020 4:18 PM

To: Cecilia Lee Peng Geok <cecilialee@sparkcarcare.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: REMINDER TO EQ/LKK FOR OFFER - SLL9482C & YM8903C DOA 22/08/2019 *** LKK REF:
CC4/EQI19015081/Kga3

WARNING : This email originated from an external party outside ComfortDelGro. Do not click on links or open attachment
unless you know the sender.

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Cecilia,

We are pleased to offer G/S $16,300.00 (all-in).



