| e CE[E_],ILIE'OE'H&Q/ K«J;[”..u o

‘ _~ |I x. Kﬂ]‘mﬂtﬂ B ASSIGNMENL (Office)
o (T erEn \{ﬂ_ﬂ_. QU L\ ) o EC']I S pef Tune J&‘O}lﬂﬂlg@c‘46q

un@“wil Hlmmllr‘xn'&uwxr-\n; |
E-Z_ 443&(:,  Insured: g\igéalg?%
Tel: _

To tnspect b W eliele Ho

Fatinais s LB

R VT (_Mmg
of %xm 160 i Mll\t} #a{ro\
e bsMc«.«tsom:\ [stif

Pl ]'H
e Eucess

Sy bnswaed

o ogled |08

hAake of Yeh

(Client's Record) -
Al REV [ REP. | REY 24 l”\
[ ate/Time lB‘E‘[ng ﬁﬂﬂm |, rgon Contacls d ?Ajhj Wehiele

DmelTame_ \-'tl m/Instroe tiir {_L/(ﬁ} Edmlﬂi{

l_'_-‘"--ﬂ'm==“ L

[ARIAL 1| Uk nm e

lEZ_,J;.:y e S -

|-‘|“m,*n 6 J‘«
“‘-“’“{d'“’"j

16|31t BIbi3gEm - “l'NLLL sl "“f"‘ V‘J‘

sl |fa.nr{“ R el
”\“\\‘ '@ Uolprn &MS will i) us R«m\m\

;



ASS.REC. BY:
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Mo nnerh ASSIGNMENT

From: Date: Veh No ‘{' g g-..;pzf < Regn: j 4 q‘f
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' V4 V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
AdE BmE = 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

N TEL 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-86071588-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

ERGO INSURANCE PTELTD Ref : CS/EGITED12742/Kvd3
5 TEMASEK BOULEVARD |
e warze [N
SINGAPORE 038985
Code: EGI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GBG 8186 Veh. Inspected EZ 4428C
Policy No. Coverage (5) 0.00
Claim No. DSMCV1801347/SL/pl Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From  YEEPEILI Assign Date 13/07/2018
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer = Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  09/07/2018 Inspection Date 23/07/2018
Survey held at LAl HUAT (MENG KEE} MOTOR PTE LTD
160 SIN MING DRIVE #04-01/02
SIN MING AUTOCITY
SINGAPORE 575722

5a. Remarks

AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




T WL Couens

BdA BA B Ple Lid

51 UBLAVE 1, £01-25 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (5] 62563561 FAX : (D63) 62564315

Your Ref: DSMCV1801 347/SL/pl
Our Ref: CS/EG118012742/Kvd3

The Motor Claims Department Without Prejudice
ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd

Dear Sir™Madam.
PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO_EZ 4428C .

e ——————

We thank you for the instruction on _13/07/2018.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle
on 23/07/2018 at the premises of M/s LAl HUAT(MENG KEE) PTE LTD and have the

following to report.-

Workshop Estimate Amount 8% 12.991.00

Revised Estimate Amount . S$  11.365.30

“Check™ ltems Amount :8%  1.536.30

Market Value : S§

LTA Reimbursement Value : S8

Nett Value 8%

Description of Damage: o

The vehicle sustained damages I —

at the rear portion. = bk
offside

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.

Yours faithfully

KENNETH KONG
Automotive Assessor



' Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd)) <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 13 July 2018 9:46 AM

To: ‘admin-d@lkkauto.com’

Cc: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Subject: Ol : GBGB186) / TP 1 EZ4428C/LKK / DOA : 09/07/2018 (DSMCV1801347)

Attachments: GBGB186) - SAS.pdf; EZ4428C - SAS.pdf; E74428C - ESTIMATE.pdf; EZ4428C - PRS
FORM.pdf

Dear Catherine,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016" in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be
the “single Joint Expert”.

Please assist to conduct this survey from LAl HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD,

ADDRESS - BLK 160 SIN MING DRIVE
#04-01 SIN MING AUTOCITY
SINGAPORE 575722

PERSON TO CONTACT . JENNY @ 6453 8110

ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE  : STEVE LIM
Note: To survey on without prejudice basis. Please advise the consistency of damages to third party vehicle and
inform the repairer in writing, that you are require to conduct a re-survey before vehicle is returned to

claimant. They are to contact your office directly. Please do keep us in the loop.

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form from workshop and return to us together on your update of the survey
status via Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg.

Attached are estimate, insured and third party SAS (note: reports not to be released to any Third Party).

Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

Regards
Yee Pei L
Claims Assistant (Motor)

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd




ERGO

Eh 131.07.2018 Sent via Fax
Qur Reference: DsMCV1801 347 l"rs L,I’p|
or
Your Reference: EZ 44280
Email
jenny.lim@laihuat.com.sg
To: LAl HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTELTD
Pre-Repair Survey (PRS) Acknowledgement
Vehicle For Inspection: EZ 4428C
Insured's Vehicle: GBG 8186)
Date Of Accident: 09.07.2018
We acknowledge receipt of your request for PRS on: 12.07.2018
In compliance with "State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016", do select an assessor from )
the list below and indicate your selection in the box marked *. * | KK Auto Consultants J
AlS Automobile Inspection Services Ple Ltd LBS L.B.S Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
FTA EarmTeam Consultancy Pte Lid LEK LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
1AS Infiniti Appraisal Service PS5 Priority Services
JPK JP Knights Pre Ltd VaC Wicom Ltd

Your request for inspection does not have your client's cost of repair estimate, kindly forward 3 copy.

Your request far inspection does not have your client's GIA report, kindly forward a copy.

We acknowledge your interest for direct cottlement, we will 255255 & revert soon upon receipt of estimate.

Our Insured's driver has not reported the accident to us todate.

V |athers:  OFFICER-IN-CHARGE - STEVE LIM

Prepared by: Q—éé/k Pei Li 6829 9154 claims@ergo.com.s
i
Signature: FAX : 6829 9247
Assessor wse only: Waorkshop use only:
Assessor attended workshop on;
Assignment Date: Date:
Assignment Time: Time
Inspector:
Remarks: [ vehicle not available at the appointed date and time.

Kindly acknowledge our Assessor presence for the above job .

Workshop Acknowledgement & Stamp.
Nate: Our Inspection is on o without admission to liability basis.




Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

From: Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, July 25, 2018 10:33 AM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)'

Ca SUR; "Yee Pei LI’

Subject: RE: GBGB186) /TP : EZ4428C/LKK / DOA: 09/07,/2018 (DSMCV1 801347)
Attachments: EZ 4428C pdf

Dear Sir,

Enclosed preliminary revised for EZ 4428C.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jannice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@|kkauto.com | fax: 6250-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, July 13, 2018 9:54 AM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)' <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>; assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; "Yee Pei Li' <peili.yee @ergo.com.sg=>

Subject: RE: GBGE186] /TP EZ4428C/LKK / DOA . 0s/07/2018 {DSMWlBDlE‘-d?}

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From; Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) [mai1to:Suwev.Hepan@ergo,mm.sg]
Sent: Friday, 13 July 2018 9:46 AM

To: ‘admin-d@Ikkauto.com’ <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Ce: ASSIGNME NTS@LKKAUTO.COM

subject: Ol . GBG8186) /TP : EZ4428C/LKK [ DOA : 09/07/2018 [DSMCUIEDiEd?}

Dear Catherineg,



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Jenny Lim <jenny lim@laihuat.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 29 August 2018 3:01 PM

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: Finalisation - EZ 4428C / Volvo V70

Attachments: £7 4428C.pdf; IMG_1002.jpg; IMG_1 003.jpg; IMG_1004 jpg; IMG_T 005.jpg; IMG_

1006.jpg; IMG_1457 jpg; IMG_1458.jpg; IMG_1459.jpg

Dear Sir
For your confirmation, please:

- Pars: $9,418.00
- L&P:  $1,050.00

Sub-total: $10,468.00
LS -20%: ($2093.60) = $8374.40
Lump sum: §BS§U.QDI 8 days

Supporting document and photographs are enclosed for your reference.
Thank you.
Kind regards.

Jenny Lim

for LAl HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTELTD
160 Sin Ming Drive

#04-01, #04-02 & #07-03

Sin Ming Autocity

Singapore 575722

Tel: 64538110

Fax; 64586267
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LAI HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD_

Sector A, Block 21, Sin Ming Industrial Estate #01-56/58/60 Singapore 575679, Tel: 6453 8110 Fax: 6459 6267
RCB MNog 199407592C
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Boh, EHA#ES SAICO Deluxe = #e,
"Our services include the latest and reliable CAROLINER MARK IV repair bench, draw-aligner and the support

dolly system to provide accurate re-alignment and speedy repairs. We also provide the new and advanced SAICO
Deluxe oven heater for re-spraying all motor vehicles."
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~ .~~ LAl HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD

t Sector A, Block 21, 5in Ming Industrial Estate ﬂ'[lI-th-'SSIHJ'Sing:L;mm 375679, Tel: 64533 K110 Fax: 6459 6267
RCB No: 1994075920

ESTIMATE

FomfaRicEs CAROLINER MARKIV 9, TRUESFIHEANEREBTREASEANNRTINCESE .
B, EHEEN SAICO Deluxe |E# P . e
"Our services include the latest and reliable CAROLINER MARK IV repair bench, draw-aligner-and the support

dolly system to provide accurate re-alignment and speedy repairs. We also provide the new and advanced SAICO
Deluxe oven heater for re-spraying all motor vehicles.”



F A ¥ (HE ) OMBARAA
‘ LAl HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD

Sector A, Block 21, Sin Ming Industrial Estate #01-56/58/60 Singapare 75679, Tel: 6453 8110 Fux: 6439 6267
RCH Moz 19940753520

ESTIMATE

EST.No .... . ESTOD19758
Tharmn “few Chum Page ....o.ooen con ool of 2
Your ref N : TE-GBG 81864 ERGO
Job Mo ~ - 59550
Ourref ...... s 180714
Payment ... ......000s i
Date ...ovvver oo veeee o 230712018
At ... ey Av7horn s
@ i / e
Vehicle No ... EZ 4428C . :

Vehicle Model . Volvo V70
Accident on ... 9/7/2018 A7 /o a7
Gots,,
Guantity Unit  Description Unit price  Disc. pct Amouint
Supply of Parts - Nett item:
100 P Rear bumper | 175480  Pet/err 175480 —
1.00 Pc Rear bumper lower 534 30 C#] 53430 —
1.00 Pc Rear bumper top gamish 347 .80 7y 347 B0 —
100 Po  Rear bumper reinforcement  {Shebo 1,536.30 . 1,536.30
100 Pc  Rear parking sensor, centre LH 208.00 Jher 20800 —
100 Po  Rear parking sensor, centre RH 208.00 Shem 20800
100 Pr Rear tailnate 3 R3O 0N c/A 3R/NDND e—
1.00 Pe Rear tailgate reflector LH 811.00 e g11.00 «—
a P Ceordmdevconwithrculd 2-7 TS, 243360 Ll Ao pizaoo <t
100 Fe Reat Vil emblen g4 00 Az, G400 —
100 Pe Rear 15 emblem g 00 A, HROD T
1.00 Pe Rear Yol emblem 102.00 A 10200 —
1.00 Fc  Rear 2.5 emblem 94.00 s, 9400 ~—
Labour & Misc.
Py /’

1.00 To dismantle and refix rear windscreen 160.00 160.00

WL famee

s

oA ATREME CAROLINER MARK IV i, ﬁ]&ﬂ’c‘!&'#H’ﬁIé‘?ﬂi;ﬁﬁﬂﬂ:ﬁﬂ-ﬁ'?ﬁﬂﬂﬂlxﬂﬂkﬁﬁﬂ.
B, EXEESAICO DeluxeE#SP .

"Our services include the latest and reliable CAROLINER MARK IV repair bench, draw-aligner and the support
dolly system to provide accurate re-alignment and speedy repairs. We also provide the new and advanced SAICO
Deluxe oven heater for re-spraying all motor vehicles.”



Sector A, Block 21, Sin Ming

| k% (W EDMBER A
‘ LAl HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD

RCB No: 1994073920

[ndustrial Estate #01-56/58/60 Singapore $75679, Tel: 6453 8110 Fax: 6459 6267

ESTIMATE
EST. Mo ...... ESTO019758
Tham Yew Chum = OO of 2
Your ref. - TP-GBG 81864 ERGO
Job No. . . " B9630
oo 1T - (PRUPRMIRR. . | 1.0 F b
Payment ... ....oc «oooee
Date 2307208
Attrr .. e
“ehicle MNo EZ 4423C
Vehicle Mods! . Volve W70
Accident o . 9712018
h{}uaﬁtmﬁ 'Ltna'r tiéscnphr_‘nr? T Unit pnice  Disc pet ﬂm:‘_*:';nt_
1.00 To supply sealant 40.00 Ar, 4000 —
1,00 To transfer rear reversing camera + cables 60.00 80.00 “
1.00 To remove and renew above pars 280.00 280.00 «
1.00 Ta spray paint 600.00 600.00 J 3,
Sub-Total 12,991.60
GST 7.00% 808 41
Total S8 13,901 01

kA A@FHE#Y CAROLINER MARKIV ##, TRELZHEINESRATRESEANNR NI AGER.
B, EA%EN SAICO Deluxe B EHA P .

"Qur services include the latest and
dolly system to provide accurate re-

Deluxe oven heater for re-spraying all motor vehicles.”

reliable CAROLINER MARK IV repair bench, draw-aligner and the support
alignment and speedy repairs. We also provide the new and advanced SAICO



' V4l V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

) ; - 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607108R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automoblie

ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD Ref © CS/EGIHMB012742/Kvd3n2
Sord) SONTES TonER: | HIRARIID
#04-01 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE Date: 03-09-2018
SINGAPORE 038985
Code : EGI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GBG B186J Veh. Inspected EZ 4428C
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. DSMCV1801347/SL/pl Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From YEE PEI LI Assign Date 13/07/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model VOLVOVTOTS (A) c.c 2521
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2008
Chassis No. ¥y BWEBE0S10109858 Colour METALLIC GREY
Odometer 195749 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |245/40 ZR18 MICHELIN & mm
L/H Front Tyre |245/40 ZR18 MICHELIN & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |245/40 ZR18 MICHELIN 4 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |245/40 ZR18 MICHELIN 4 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  0%/07/2018 Inspection Date 23/07/2018
Survey held at LAl HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTELTD
160 SIN MING DRIVE #04-01/02
SIN MING AUTOCITY
SINGAPORE 575722
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS,

5b., Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR 5 Working Days




' ’d 74

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

‘-;J/.;._-: 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No. 1 af 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. EZ 4428C
Estimate Our Adjusted
aty Description of Parts Condition |8 mnup?;n [2,‘1“
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER (SN) BUCKLED / 1,754.80 1,754.80
CRACKED
1|REAR BUMPER LOWER (SN) CRACKED 53430 534.30
1|REAR BUMPER TOP GARNISH (SN) MISSING 34760 347 60
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT (SN) BENT 1,536.30 1,536.30
1|REAR PARKING SENSOR,CENTRE LH (SN} SHORTED 208.00 208.00
1|REAR PARKING SENSOR,CENTRE RH (SN} SHORTED 208.00 208.00
1|REAR TAILGATE (SN) CRACKED 3,630.00 3,630.00
1|REAR TAILGATE REFLECTOR LH (SN) CRACKED 811.00 811.00
1|REAR WINDSCREEN WITH MOULDING (SN) NOT NECESSARY 2,433 60
1|REAR W70 EMBLEM (SN) NECESSARY G400 94.00
1|REAR TS EMELEM (SN} MECESSARY 98.00 98.00
1|REAR VOLVD EMBLEM (SN) NECESSARY 102.00 102.00
1|REAR 2.5 EMELEM (SN) NECESSARY 8400 94,00
1|SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 40,00 40.00
11,891 60 9,458 00
LABOUR
TO DISMANTLE AND REFIX REAR WINDSCREEN. 160.00 120.00
TO TRANSFER REAR REVERSING CAMERA + CABIES 60.00 &0.00
TO REMOVE AND RENEW ABOVE PARTS 280.00 280.00
TO SPRAY PAINT. 600.00 550.00
1,100.00 1,010.00
GRAND TOTAL 12,991.60 10,468.00
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 8,350.00
(TOITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/EGI18012742/Kvd3n2

Y 454

KONG SENG CHEONG

Licensed Appraiser

MSCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Repor s made sobely for the use and
Mo Habilily of responsibility whatscsver, o contact or bod, b accepted 19 any third 2

rhy Wi T

repdy o tho Benort Wikl of

banefit of the Cliant named on the front page of this Report.

party acting o




