Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Lily Loi <lily.loi@ow.sg>

Sent: May 6, 2020 6:46 PM

To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Cc: Sharon Ten; Ling Ting An; Adeline Lim; Vic (LKKAuto); Adeline Lim

Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLR1419H & SLG457L ON 21/08/2019 (AIG)

Dear Jasper,

We accept your offer $480.
Kindly forward DV to us.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Lily Loi (Ms.)
Senior Claims Executive, Motor Claims Department
D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011

OPT/MAIERHZ s

Head office: & Kung Chong Road Singapore 158143 Tal: (+65) 8472 1313 Fax: («+65) 8472 212
Branch: B Serangoon North Ave § Singapore S54800 Telk («85) G484 9910 Fax: (+65) G481 1011
EBranch: 462 Tagore Industrial Ave Singapore 787823 Tel: [+B5) BABZ2 6BE8 Fax: [«BE) B4BZ 9223

www.ow.sg | www.facebook.com/OptimaWerkz

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not copy, distribute or use it for any purpose, nor
disclose its contents to any other person.
Please notify the sender if you receive this email in error, and delete the email and its content immediately after which.

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 27 April 2020 9:55 AM

To: Lily Loi <lily.loi@ow.sg>

Cc: Sharon Ten <sharon@ow.sg>; Ling Ting An <tingan.ling@ow.sg>; Adeline Lim <adeline@ow.sg>; Vic
(LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLR1419H & SLG457L ON 21/08/2019 (AIG)

Without Prejudice

Dear Lily,

Thank you for your email.

We propose a settlement at a global sum of $480.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from
this negotiation of terms/settlement.



In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via
email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted.

Best Regards,

Jasper Chua| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Lily Loi [mailto:lily.loi@ow.sg]

Sent: Saturday, 25 April, 2020 6:21 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; Sharon Ten; Ling Ting An; Adeline Lim

Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLR1419H & SLG457L ON 21/08/2019 (AIG)

Dear Vic,

Please let us have your proposed offer without further delay.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Lily Loi (Ms.)
Senior Claims Executive, Motor Claims Department
D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011

ORPT/MALERHZ prero.

Head office: 8 Kung Chong Road Singapore 158943 Tal («B5) 8472 1313 Fax: (=686} 8472 212
Branch: 84 Serangoon North ave § Singapore 5854500 Tek («05) G484 9979 Fax: (+65) G481 101
Branch: 452 Tagore Industrial Ave Singapore 787823 Tel: (+B6) 6452 6868 Fax: [+BE) G452 8223

www.ow.sg | www.facebook.com/OptimaWerkz

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not copy, distribute or use it for any purpose, nor
disclose its contents to any other person.
Please notify the sender if you receive this email in error, and delete the email and its content immediately after which.

From: Lily Loi

Sent: Tuesday, 10 March 2020 12:23 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Sharon Ten <sharon@ow.sg>; Ling Ting An <tingan.ling@ow.sg>;
Adeline Lim <adeline(@ow.sg>

Subject: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLR1419H & SLG457L ON 21/08/2019 (AIG)

Our Ref : SLR1419H / TP#1019
Your Ref : SLG457L



