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ASSIGNMENT
From pale: A6 , & , |€\ Veh No: __QC)( 4595 O \rRegn MAY | 29\€
Estimalted Cost: Typé aef M.Cycle / Bus | Van | Lorry / Taxi / Prime Mover /
0D /(P)WS / TP RES 0D RES 1 EVA 1INV | MV Truck / Traller or
To Inspect Vehicle No: SCX 4 6‘!6 D Make: Honda HR-V ~cc 1496
at Workshop mis “hian Choon Colour Red AIC:  Insured  Std NI/ NA
o Bl (4 Sta ¥y "f) DAV |SpReading 21137 T/Radio: Insured [ Std | NI [ NA
Insured: ‘# 0 5_ Q?——- B | EngiNo: - -
Policy No. CINo: :_yu H Mru %) 0T 004" 9%'1
Claims No, B Gen. Cond Fair | Poor | Burnt o -

Sum Insured: Excess: SteeringyInorder JJammed | Leaked / Burnt or

. =
-Jammad | Leaked | Burnt or

(Client's Record) Brake:

Make of Veh: de(D q7 S5 2614 Modi:  Nil .\‘ STD ARim or o -

Tyre Size: o 2\S |60 gun__ —

(Policy Candition) y R 215 6o R\E B

Remark: The veh had commenced its NS | O Bs@xuow. IGY | FS I LIZA | MIC | OHTSU | PIR / SUMI /
repair at the time of inspection. TOYO / YOKO or

Bal. or Market Value: Front Rear
IDAC Accident Rport © CGonsistent?: Yes orNo ~ |rEal S mm R/Bal. s mm
GIA | PR Seen: _ Consistent? : Yes or No L/Bal. . g - mm L/Bal. R }— mm
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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

— —
From: eileen.bay@fwd.com
Sent: Friday, 23 August 2019 11:32 AM
To: assignments@lkkauto.com; sur@Ikkauto.com; admin-a@Ilkkauto.com; admin-
d@lkkauto.com
Cc: motorclaims.sg@fwd.com
Subject: RE:PRIG 479 - 19 TC ===========5cx 9595d | FWD insured: SLG8372U
Attachments: PRI g 479tcjpg; SLG8372U.zip

Hi LKK,

Please refer to the email below and liaise with TP repairer for survey arrangement,
Liability is clear, please explore direct settlement.
Kindly create the case in Merimen.

Kind regards,

clecn Gay

Executive, Claims

FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd.

b Temasek Boulevard, #18-01 Suntec Tower Four, Singapore 038986
T (65)69217411

E eileen.bay@fwd.com

W www.fwd.com.sg

FWD

insurance

¢ P> Google Play

From: Motor Claims SG - SG Common

Sent: Friday, 23 August 2019 10:14 AM

To: Eileen Bay - SGUser

Subject: FW: PRI G 479 - 19 TC ===========5cx 9595 d

PNPV2018-00012176

From: tonygn tonygn [mailto:tonygn18@hotmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, 22 August, 2019 10:39 PM

To: Motor Claims SG - SG Common; james540@gmail.com
Subject: PRI G 479 - 19 TC ===========5¢x 9595 d

Sent from Outlook

ATTENTION:
The email and any attachments transmitted with it are private and confidential and intended solely for the

1



use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this email in error, please
notify the sender immediately and delete this email and any attachments from your system. You should not
. use, disclose, copy or store this email and any attachments.

Messages and attachments are scanned for all viruses known. However, you are advised that you open any
attachments at your own risk. If this message contains password-protected attachments, the files have NOT
been scanned for viruses by our mail domain. Please always scan for viruses before opening any
attachments.



Thian Choon Auto

Blk. 176, Sin Ming Drive, #05 - 02, Sin Ming Autocare, Singapore 575721
Fax: 6458 - 8913 | Email: jamestay540@gmail.com

pate:- 22 , & , 2019 [BY HAND
Motor Claims Department /
Fryd Siaqepet /ﬂ_ﬁEZ M

BY FAX :-

Dear Sir, ot ML’V COP Y

NOTICE TO INSURER TO CONDUCT PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION
WITHIN 2 WORKING DAYS PURSUANT TO PARAGRAPH 6.2 OF
PRE-ACTION PROTOCOL FOR NIMA CASES

We have been appointed by the Owner to re[}qir his/her motor vehicle
NO-&.?_{?_&_’P_OH_ 5, ’_CP,:‘ / / __with another venicle
NO.SLG_&?S?Q qaﬁﬁé ,4(/?!{(? ‘_fﬁ»f’;f'f.CQ CCH’

Please be informed that the said vehicle can be inspected at:-

Contact » Workshop : Thian Choon Auto

Blk. 176, #05 - 02, Sin Ming Autocare

Sin Ming Drive, Singapore 575721

Contact Fax - 6458 - 8913

Person : Mr. James / 9755 - 3077

Email : jamestay540@gmail.com

If you fail to conduct the pre-repair inspection within the next 2 working
days excluding any intervening Saturday, Sunday or Holiday. We will
commence repairs thereafter without further reference to you.

Yours faithfully,
Wu LLC - Law Firm - Tony Gn

Our Ref : 19 - H’?,(/)
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> Back to OneMotoring

PARFICOF Rehata Frmiire

* Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner |1D Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 27 Aug 2019

Singapore NRIC
063C

SCX9595D

No

27 Aug 2019
HONDA

HRV 1.5 DXCVT
Red

2018
L15B4534096
JHMRU1810GX204097
96.0 kW (128 bhp)
$19,096.00

10 May 2018

10 May 2018

0

$19,096.00

Yes
09 May 2028
$14,322.00

09 May 2028

A - Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
10

$38,000.00

$33,056.00

$47,378.00

NUps:/vriEa.gov.sgra/vryacuon/enquirercepalepy - upliCoeroreUereginpul FEUNG | IUN_IUSFUSU4UUS | |

i



8/27/2019 Used Honda HR-V Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMart

scCARMART.COM Login  Sign up
New Cars Sell My Car Directory Products Insurance Articles Forum Re
Post an Advertisement i SSRESA S — Autsinn
Sell it yourselfl Advertise it at just As agpiration Foe Car Bupers
$58 until it's SOLD! click here to view
our PRISTINE USED CARS
Direct Owner at GREAT PRICES
Post an Ad Advertiser Login Ways of Selling
Browse by Category ¥ | Sort by Date Posted ¥ || 20 results/
6 vehicles |Honda HR-V )
Model Price Depreciation Eng Cap Mileage Veh Type
Search Selection Honda HR-V Any Any 2018 Any Any Any Av
Honda HR-V 1.5A DX $84,800 $B,670 fyr 30-Apr-2018 1,496 cc 27,160 km Suv Av

KAH Motor Unit! 1 Owner Only! Most Reliable And Well Known SUV! Very Low Fuel Consumption And Low On Maintenarice! Trade In
Welcome! Flexible Bank/In House Financing Avallable With Fast And Easy Loan Approvall 100% Loan Can Be Arranged As Well! Guarant... &

Benefit Auto Enterprise Pte Ltd
Posted: 24-Aug-2019 Tags: 2018 Honda HR-V, 2018 honda HRV, Honda HR-V, honda HRV, Honda, HR-V, HRV, Used Honda

Honda HR-V 1.5A LX (OPC) $71,800 $7,050 fyr 23-Apr-2018 1,496 cc 10,765 km sSuv Av

Special Promotion 1.5% Interest Ratel Limited Time Only! Agent Warranty Till April 2023. Low Mileage And Low Depreciation! High Specs
L Model! 1 Owner Unit. Fully Agent Serviced And Maintained. Pristine Condition! A Peace Of Mind And Hassle Free Experience! Call/SM...

Republic Auto
Posted: 21-Aug-2019 Tags: 2018 Honda HR-V, 2018 honda HRV, Honda HR-V, honda HRV, Honda, HR-Y, HRV, Used Handa

Honda HR-V 1.5A LX $105,800 $10,810 fyr 06-Jun-2018 1,496 cc 28,000 km Suv Av
Loan Available! Sporty Suv White Unit. Highest Specs! 5 Years Agent Warranty, Best Selling Suv. Maintained At Kah Motors. Lowest
Mileage In The Market. Please Call/Sms/Whatsapp Now For Enquiries And Viewing Appointment. (Consignment Unit). &

Autotrust Traders Pte Ltd
Posted: 20-Aug-2019 Tags: 2018 Honda HR-V, 2018 honda HRY, Honda HR-V, handa HRV, Honda, HR-V, HRY, Used Honda

Honda HR-V 1.5A DX $84,500 $8,630 fyr 03-May-2018 1,496 cc 23,000 km Suv Av
Superb Condition With 3 Years Agent Warranty (Until 2021), Best Selling SUV. Maintained At Kah Motors Since Day 1. High Loans Up To
90% Of The Car Price With Interest Rates Starting From 2.28%. Call Now To Book An Appointment To View This Beauty. Strictly By App... G

Posted: 19-Aug-2019 Tags: 2018 Honda HR-V, 2018 honda HRV, Honda HR-V, honda HRV, Honda, HR-V, HRV, Used Honda

Car Buying Car Selling Car Ownership

Car Aftermarket On The Move Lifestyle STA Car Eval

Honda HR-V 1.5A LX $86,800 §8,680 fyr 28-May-2018 1,496 cc 13,386 km Suv Av

Special Promotion At 1.5% Interest Rate! Limited Time Only! Low Mileage And Low Depreciation' High Specs LX Model! 1 Owner Only!
Full Agent Servicing And Warranty Till May 2023! Pristine Condition! A Peace Of Mind And Hassle Free Experience! Call/Sms/Whatsapp F...

Republic Auto

Posted: 16-Aug-2019 Tags: 2018 Honda HR-V, 2018 honda HRV, Honda HR-V, handa HRV, Honda, HR-V, HRV, Used Honda

Honda HR-V 1,5A DX (OPC) $68,800 $6,520 /yr 10-Sep-2018 1,496 cc 11,940 km SuV Av

Facelift Model! Low Interest, In House Loan Available, Choice Of Leather Colour Selection, Well Maintained SUV That Is As Good As Brand
New And Smell Like Brand New! Fully Agent (Kah Motor) Maintained With On-going Warranty! 1 Owner! STA Evaluation Provided! Buy 1t...

Dickson Automobile
Posted: 23-Jul-2019  Tags: 2018 Honda HR-V, 2018 honda HRV, Honda HR-V, honda HRV, Honda, HR-V, HRV, Used Honda

https://www.sgcarmart.com/used_cars/listing.php?RGD=2018&MOD=Honda HR-V&RPG=208VEH=0&AVL=2 1/2



SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

Hlease report carreclly the detalls of the accident to speed up the claims process
This Form must be completed by the Policyholder and/or the Authorised Driver

Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible Any wilful misrepresentation or witholding of material facts may allow Insurance companies to
aepudiate policy liability

< The issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies Is not an admission of policy liability on the part of the insurance companies
o Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

This report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance Association of Singapare (GIA) for
wchiving and that copies of this repart will, for a fee. be made avalable upon applicalion by interesled parties

By the lodgement of this report to the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and to copies of the report being made avallable
dloresaid

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report 22/08/2019 17:48

Date Of Accident 22/08/2019 10:10

Exact Location Of Accident 255 ALEXANDRA ROAD
Country/State of Loss SINGAPORE

Jehicle Registration Number SCX9595D
Insured/Policyholder

nWame Of Registered Owner GN WENYI CHARLENE
NRIC No S88110863C

Email Address NOEMAIL

Mobile Phone No (LOCAL) +65-92217272
Alternative Phone No OFFICE-92217272
Vehicle Particulars

Manufacturer HONDA

Model HR-V-1.5 (A)

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy

for repair to your vehicle? NO

It No, Please state action to be taken THIRD PARTY
Jehicle Category PRIVATE CAR
Insurance Company

Name of Insurance Company AVIVALTD

Type Of Coverage COMPREHENSIVE
Fleet Policy NO

olicy Number 10835801

_over Note Number
Driver

Name of Driver
NRIC No

Date Of Birth
Jccupation

Date Of Driving Pass
Driving Experience
sender

Mobile Number

Fax Number
Contact Number

EMail Address

GN CHIANG HERN TONY

$1296823Z

03/02/1958

INDOOR %
07/07/2003
16 YEARS AND 1 MONTH

MALE

(LOCAL) +65-92217272

TONGGN18@HOTMAIL.COM



Address S
Postcode

Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company NO

If No. Relationship of the Driver with the Insured PARENT

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own
Vehicle

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle -

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident HIT AND RUN / VANDALISM / DAMAGED WHILST PARKED
/Veather Conditions CLEAR
Road Surface DRY

Other Information
Nas any foreign vehicle involved in this accident? NO

Number of vehicles (including own vehicle)

involved in the accident *
Nas any body injured in the Accident? NO
Was any injured conveyed to hospital by NO
ambulance?

/Vas any other material or property damaged? YES

| have been approached by unknown person(s) NO
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

Number of Passengers (Including Driver) 0
Details of Police Action

WNas the accident reported to the police? NO
It Yes. Please state which Police Station

/Vas notice of intended Prosecution given? NO
If Yes.against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

REFER TO SKETCH PLAN

Attachment(s)

Are accident photos available for attachment? YES

Was there any video captured by Car Camera? NO

Was there any audio recorded? NO
DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1
/ehicle Registration Number SLG8372U

Vehicle Make/Model/Colour

Details Of Properties

Vehicle Category PRIVATE CAR
Name of Driver

NRIC/Passport Number

Contact Number

Address

Postcode

Insurance Company Name

Nature Of Damage

No. Of Passenger (Including Driver)



SKETCH PLAN
IMPORTANT NOTICE
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SKETCH PLAN
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THIAN CHOON AUTO- -

176 Sin Ming Drive #05-02 Sin Ming AutoCare
Singapore 575721

Tel: 6458 8913
Co. Reg. No. 53091973K

ijﬁLA QC‘T‘I’}&’\M"\" E':S‘f'ilr'}"wd‘&ol CoaSt O.F P'e(Oa.‘;P

Velicle. No SEx 9595pD

| Fonrt Bumper  # 650 Jec ~

> Eront ) H [rw )_o.n\fD Q’/lzé xnn

5 .L'J.n'v:: cover @ 75 76 855
2 Front L gwrv“of’_ﬁ" S&A@-T LS Ve 3 4165
20"‘/0 = $564

q,'F‘Q'ecf‘ecl are o # H 504250

2}_ 9]01’-07 fgmn‘{":ﬂ on

5 ancm.:j P&csl}u..’i'f' 7 on otteded area 44 K0

25T
quou v \SSC‘ =
pr“
\-\L) Eeipmf
hence notify ‘ ,:,7 }
the Repairer of the following:
© To ey camgudprks) g ooy Tera\ 410 o4
. part(s :
= Pars pices e stjct o confrmation | o= $’r 2905
» Third party survey is on a "Without Prejudice” basis _

« No iliegal modification(s) is allowed

Supplementary item(s) must be resurveyed and
..muﬂmdkmlmw

Acknowledged by Repairer
Signature:
Date:

a8y 20, | |s: $¥S0.




Merimen e-Claims

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Page 1 of 1

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
Case Notified Est Submitted Adj Assigned Adj Rpt Adj Submitted Ins Auth'ed Status
22 Aug 2019 33 Mg 2013 $$850.00 $$850.00 Pending e Survey
Main Edit Reg_| 0n:00 Edit Estimates View Rpt | e
Edit Adj Rpt | Cancel Case |

Claim Details Show All

Main Reference

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS I [Created by adjuster]

Insured: Tan Hock Hwa,

ID: 517098778

Main GN WENYI CHARLENE,
Claimant:

Vehicle Reg.
No.:

ID: 58811063C

22/08/2019 00:00 - :59
[15 Months and 12 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man Yr)]

PNPV2018-00012176 (Comprehensive)

SCX9595D Date of Loss:

Policy/Cover

Claim Type: |TP /1201900025130

Note No.: Coverage: 17/10/2018 - 16/10/2019
Vehicle Reg.
No. SLGB372U :'g:;m’:zn
(Insured): ’
Excess:
Repairer: Thian Choon Auto () Blk176 Sin Ming Drive, #05-02 Sin Ming Autocare, 575721 Sin Ming - Tel:
Handing | rwp singapore Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: 6727 5700 ... [Handled by Eileen Bay]
Adjuster: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ... [Handled by PARASURAM SHANMUGAM] ... [Final Rpt due

03/09/2019]

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED
+« FWD_SG (30/08/2019): SURVEY REPORT

view All |  Compose Case Mail |

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS=
Priority  Type

View All | Search Tasks | Create New Task | complete |
Assigned By Completed On Created On

Due Date Handler Done?

No results.

Task Group Subject

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_c... 2/9/2019



Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*SCX9595D (1201900025130)
[SLG8372U]
™

GN WENYI CHARLENE
Aug 22 2019 12:00AM
[Tan Hock Hwa]
Thian Choon Auto

Upload Documents ] Upload Photos I Compose New Letter I

Page 1 of 2

View [View i v 7]

Photos/Images 3 per page E [
No |Relabel/Reorder |LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
‘1 |29/08/19 17:54 General View © | loadirc | 4
2 |29/08/19 17:54 General View © | LoadirG
3 |29/08/19 17:54 | General View ©  wadrc | 4
4 |29/08/19 17:54 General View | Ladirc | A
5 |29/08/19 17:54 General View ©) | Loadire
6 |29/08/19 17:54 General View 0 | ladirc || &
7 |29/08/19 17:54 General View B | Loadirs
8 |29/08/19 17:54 General View € | wadirc |
9 |29/08/19 17:54 General View ©  loadirc | &
10 |29/08/19 17:54 General View © | wadrc | &
11 |29/08/19 17:54 General View € | Loadirc
12 |29/08/19 17:54 General View ) | adirc
13 |29/08/19 17:54 General View © | Loadirc | M
14 |29/08/19 17:54 General View O | adirc | ¥
15 |29/08/19 17:54  |General View © | Ladirc | &
16 |29/08/19 17:54 General View 0 | wadirc | &
17 |29/08/19 17:54 General View 0 | wadirc | &
18 |29/08/19 17:54 General View 0 | adirc | &
19 |29/08/19 17:54 General View © | Loadirc
20 |29/08/19 17:54 General View O | adirc | &
21 |29/08/19 17:54 General View € | Loadirc | ¥
22 |29/08/19 17:54 General View © | wadirc | &
23 |29/08/19 17:54 General View | adrc | &
24 |29/08/19 17:54 General View € | Load PG
25 |29/08/19 17:54 General View © | adirc | &
26 |29/08/19 17:54 General View © | Loadrc |
27 |02/09/19 09:08 Dismantled Parts © | LadirG
28 |02/09/19 09:08 Dismantled Parts © | Loadirc
29 |02/09/19 09:08 Dismantled Parts O | wadrc | &
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregno1sssor1ser)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com
VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT
Our File No: CS/FWD19014888/FSD3E2
Date: 02/09/2019
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd. Policy No: PNPV2018-00012176
Claimant Vehicle scxesesD Insured Vehicle No:  SLG8372U
Date of Loss: 22/08/2019 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: 1201900025130
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SCX9595D
Make & Model: HONDA HR-V, 1.5 DX CVT (A) Engine No: L15B4534096
Reg. Date: 10/05/2018 (Man. Year: 2018) Chassis No: JHMRU1810GX204097
Colour: Red Odometer: 21137 km
Engine Capacity: 1496 cc
Market Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (S$): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 215/60 R16 Rear Tyre Size: 215/60 R16
Front Left Side: Dunlop 5 mm Rear Left Side: Dunlop 5 mm
Front Right Side: Dunlop 5 mm Rear Right Side: Dunlop 5 mm
The above values represent the remaining tyre treads depth
|COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference Diff %
Parts 1,975.00 564.00 1,411.00 71.44
Miscellaneous Items 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 930.00 500.00 430.00 46.24
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S$) 2,905.00 1,064.00 1,841.00 63.37
Approved Total (Overridden) (S$) 850.00
Nett Amount (S$) 2,905.00 850.00 2,055.00 70.74
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 23/08/2019
Date Inspected: 26/08/2019 Inspected At: Thian Choon Auto
Blk176 Sin Ming Drive, #05-02 Sin Ming
Autocare
Singapore 575721
Estimated Period of Repair: 3.0 days

Adjuster: PARASURAM SHANMUGAM

Manager: Hiew May Fung
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NOTE: This report represents our findings at the time and place of inspection stated herein. Such inspection has been carried out to the best of our
knowledge and ability but any other liability under any other circumstances is hereby expressly excluded.
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REPAIR DETAILS

'Reference

Part Source:
Parts:
|Labour:
Print Code:
Validity:

|Further Info:

(Last Synchronised: 02 Sep 2019)
N/A HONDA HR-V 1.5 DX CVT (A) (Model not available in database)
Repairer's (Price-denominated Standard List)
(Unsubmitted, no print-code for SCX9595D)

These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

ltems/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *.

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

1 1 *FRONT BUMPER Buckled 650.00F *650.00FL
2 1 *FRONT LH HEAD LAMP Not Necessary 1,250.00F *FL
3 1 *FRONT LH BUMPER SPORT LAMP COVER Broken 75.00F *55.00 FL

F=Franchise part.

L=ListltemDisc.
Sub Total (S$) 1,975.00 705.00
- List Item Discount on L Items 0.00/20.00% (S$) 0.00 141.00

Total Parts (S$) 1,975.00 564.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |
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Recommended Miscellaneous Iltems

There are no new miscellaneous items selected,

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 SPRAY PAINTING ON AFFECTED AREA New 450.00 250.00

2 KNOCKING ADJUST FRT ON AFFECTED AREA New 480.00 250.00
Gross Labour Cost (S§) 930.00 500.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

l

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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