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0.S.K.Auto Spare Parts Trading (1994)

Blk 10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A AMK Autopeoint #04-09

Singapore 568047 HP 91004390/HP 91254449 Fax 64841482
Email: oskautomotiveamkigmail.com

M/s FWD Singapore Pte Ltd DATE 27.08.2019
6 Temasek Boulevard, #18-01 CAR NO SMK 8976 U
Suntec Tower Four, Singapore 038986 MAKE Volvo V60 T4

ESTIMATE COST OF REPAIR FOR THE ABOVE MENTIONED VEHICLE.
YOUR INSURED : SGR 282 A

| Pc | Pes | Y VIFWASHBDI 104483 | UNITPRICE]  AMOUNT
|
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40
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s
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O.S.K.Auto Spare Parts Trading (1994)

Blk 10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A AMK Autopoint #04-09

Singapore 568047 HP 91004390/HP 91254449 Fax 64841482
Email: oskautomotiveamkigmail.com

M/s FWD Singapore Pte Ltd DATE 28.08.2019
6 Temasek Boulevard, #18-01 CAR NO SMK 8976 U
Suntec Tower Four, Singapore 038986 MAKE Volvo V60 T4

SUPPLEMENTARY CLAIMS FOR THE ABOVE MENTIONED VEHICLE.
YOUR INSURED : SGR 282 A

PelPoa ] YVIFW48HBD1104483 [ UNITPRICEl _ AMOUNT
| |
1 | pc” |Front bumper right side fog lamp garnish / (uf £182.00|
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0.S5.K.Auto sﬁnm Parts Trading (1994)
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_» Back to OneMotoring

Enquire Vehicle Transfer Fee

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.
SMK8976U

Make / Model
VOLVO / V60 T4

Vehicle Type:
P11 - Passenger Station Wagon/Jeep/Land Rover

Vehicle Attachment 1:
Mo Attachment

Vehicle Scheme :
Normal

Chassis No.
YV1FW48HED1104483

Propellant
Petrol

Engine No. :
B4164T4124137

Motor No. !

Engine Capacity :
1596 cc

Power Rating :

Maximum Power Output ;
132.0 kW (177 bhp)



. Maximum Laden Weight :
2110 kg

Unladen Weight :
1582 kg

Year Of Manufacture :
2012

Original Registration Date:
12 Jun 2013

Lifespan Expiry Date:

COE Category :
E - Open Category

Quota Premium:

$73,301.00

COE Expiry Date ;
11 Jun 2023

Road Tax Expiry Date ;
11 Dec 2019

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date :
11 Jun 2023

Inspection Due Date
11 Jun 2020

Intended Transfer Date :
09 Nov 2019

CO2 Emission :
167.00 (g/km)

CEV/VES Rebate Utilised Amount :

CO Emission :

HC Emission ;

MNOx Emission ;

PM Emission:



Fees To Be Paid For Transfer

Transfer Fees $25.00
Road Tax Renewal - 6 months (12 Dec 2019 to 11 Jun 2020) $371.00
Road Tax Renewal - 12 months (12 Dec 2019 to 11 Dec 2020) $£742.00
Message

The fees above do not include any late road tax fees, which apply if road tax or lay-up has expired.

You can use the digital service Enquire Road Tax Payable to check if there are any late road tax
fees.

Any road tax that has been paid for the vehicle will be transferred to the next owner.

Print OK 2

Save as PDF

Copy as Text



" - Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: venessa.chan@fwd.com

Sent: Thursday, 22 August 2019 4:52 PM

To: admin-d@lkkauto.com; admin-a@Ikkauto.com

Cc: matorclaims.sg@fwd.com; clarali@fwd.com

Subject: Request for Survey: Accident between SMKB976U & SGR282A on 17.08.2019 OUR
CLAIM REF: 1201900024759

Attachments: SGR282A Ol GIA pdf

Dear Nivitha,

Please refer to the email below and liaise with TP repairer for PRS.
Please create the case in Merimen
Thank vou.

Best Regards,

Administrative Assistant, Claims

FWD

insurance

FWD Singapore Pre, Lud,

O [emasek Boulevard, #1801 Suntee Tower Four, Singapore 038086
E o venessachan@ Pwdeom

W owwe fwd.com.se

From: Venessa Chan - SGUser

Sent: Thursday, August 22, 2019 10:22 AM

To: 'Susan Flon'

Cc: Motor Claims SG - SG Commaon; Clara Li Zirong - SGUser

Subject: Request for Survey: Accident between SMKE976U & SGR282A on 17.08.2019 OUR CLAIM REF:
1201900024759

Hi Susan,

Please confirm your insured's reported accident date as our insured reported accident date is on 18.08.2019.
Thank you.

Best Regards,



Adnfinistrative Assistant, Claims

S

insurance

FWD Singapore Pre. Lud

6 Temansek Boulevard. #18-01 Suntee Tower Four, Smgapore 0389860
| venessachand iwd com

W owww Pwd comsy

| :_uﬂ_tut_c:l_wrlh D Flyer robile o)

From: Susan Fion [malito:oskautomativeamk@gmail.com]

Sent: Thursday, August 22, 2019 10:13 AM

To: Motor Claims 5G - $G Common

Subject: Request for Survey: Accident between SMK8976U & SGR282A on 17.08.2019

Dear Officer,
Kindly arrange your surveyor to do an inspection for the following accident claim :
Request Survey Date: 27,08.2019 (Tuesday) After 1230 Noon

Our Vehlele: SMK 8976 L
Your Insured: SGR 282 A (FWD Insured)
Subject: Accident Involving SMK 8976 LI & SOR 282 A on 17.08.2019

WorkShop: 0.S.K. Auto Spare Parts Trading (1994)
Address: Blk 10 Ang Mo Kio Autopoint #04-09

Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A Singapore 568047

A copy of the estimate will be given to the surveyor upon his arrival. We enclosed our client's GIA Report
for your reference.

Kindly confirm with us via email, phone or fax(6484 1482) upon receiving this email,

Thank vou.

Best Regards,

Susan



91004390
0.5.K. AUTO SPARE PARTS TRADING (1994)

ATTENTION:

The email and any attachments transmitted with it are private and confidential and intended solely for the
use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this email in error, please
notify the sender immediately and delete this email and any attachments from your system. You should not
use, disclose, copy or store this email and any attachments.

Messages and attachments are scanned for all viruses known. However, you are advised that you open any
attachments at your own risk. If this message contains password-protected attachments, the files have NOT
been scanned for viruses by our mail domain. Please always scan for viruses before opening any
attachments.



Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, October 02, 2019 5:26 PM
To: oskautomotiveamk@gmail.com
Subject: SMK8976U Finalize

Dear Susan,

Well noted. Close it

Thanks

Best Regards,
Steve Chen| Assistant Automotive Assessor
LKK Autao Consultants

Phone: 5256 3561 | Emall: SteveChen@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: oskautomotiveamk@gmail.com [mailto:oskautomotiveamk@gmail.com]
Sent: Wednesday, October 02, 2019 1:26 PM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: SMK8976U Finalize

Dear Steve

Good day,

Regarding our whatsapp message this moming, we confirm the L/S COR at $3000 (@ 4 working days.

Thank You
Best Regards
Susan

0.58.K. Auto Spare Parts Trading (1994)

On 27/9/2019 11:37 am, Susan Fion wrote:
Dear Steve

As we were unable to locate the documents for this diamond coating, \
per spoken with Susan via tele-conversation, please proceed to award $200 for this and confirm
with us the finalised offer would be $3050 / 4 davs

Thank you
Kane
0.5.K. AUTO SPARE PARTS TRADING (1994)

1






Hsiao Tnnﬂ (LKKAuto) —

From: oskautomativeamk@gmall.com

Sent: Thursday, 3 October 2019 12:24 PM

To: Hsiac Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Request for settlement offer. SMKBST&U
Attachments: SMKBS76U LOD Report.pdf

Dear Hsiao Tong

Good day,

Attachment is the LOD report of SMKBS7U. The ariginal copy will be mail out to your office on today
Kindly assist on providing the settlement offer at your earliest convenience.

Your reference; 120190024759***CC4/FWD19014884/Epa3

Thank You

Best Regards

Susan
0.5.K. AUTO SPARE PARTS TRADING (1994)
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111452019, Menmen e-Claims

Print Received Message

This mail is associated with ;

*SMKB8976U (1201900024759)
[SGR2B2A]
TP

HAFEEZ BIM AMRAN BAGARIB
Aug 17 2018 12.00AM
[LEONG THENG WEI]

Osk Auto Spare Parts Trading (1994)

From FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd. (HQ) (FWD_SG), senl on 11/11/2019 10:59 AM.
To LKK_HQ
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$3247.45) - SMK8976U - Claim Handler: Clara Li Zi Rong

prpmueu :3247.45.

hitps./fsingapore merimen. com/claimaindox cfmHussbon=3VCmail&fuseaction=dsp_Prnl&CFID=624714548CFTOKEN={d2dbbcdBac3d21b-06... 1N




Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: oskautomotiveamk@gmail.com

Sent: Thursday, 14 November 2019 11:43 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Ce Admin A; Olivia Lau (LEKAuto)

Subject: Re: Request for settlement offer: SMKB976U

Dear Hsiao Tong
Thank you for the offer.
Kindly assist to issue DV.

Thank You
Best Regards

Susan
0D.5.K. AUTO SPARE PARTS TRADING (1994)

On 14/11/2019 11:39 am, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) wrote:
Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.
We propose settlement at a global sum of 53,240.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affectfinfluence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: oskautomotiveamk@gmail.cam <oskautomotiveamk@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 13 November 2019 3:04 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>




Ce: Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau®@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: Request for settlement offer: SMK8976U

Diear Hsiao Tong
Good day,

We would like to check on the status of the settlement offer since your last month's
acknowledgement reply.

Kindly assist to provide the settlement offer as soon as possible so that we can proceed further in
closing the case.

Thank You

Best Regards

Susan

0.5.K. AUTO SPARE PARTS TRADING (1994)

On 4/10/2019 9:51 am, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) wrote:
Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
Thank you for your emall.

Cantents noted.

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice
basis with the sole intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal
proceedings. No admission of llability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will
materially atfect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter,
by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKE Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@{kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{4080:43)

From: gskautomotiveamk@gmall.com <oskautomotiveamk@gmail.com
Sent: Thursday, 3 October 2019 12:24 PM

To: Hsiao Tong [LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com=>

Subject: Reguest for settlement offer: SMK8976U




Dear Hsiao Tong
Good day,

Attachment is the LOD report of SMKB97U. The original copy will be mail out to your
office on today.

Kindly assist on providing the settlement offer at your earliest convenience.
Your reference; 120190024759***CC4/FWD19014884/Epa3

Thank You

Best Regards

Susan
0.5.K. AUTO SPARE PARTS TRADING (1994)



0.S.K. Auto Spare Parts Trading (1994)

Blk 10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A AMK Autopoint #04-09
Singapore 568047 HP 91004390/HP 91254449 Fax 64841482
Email: oskautomotiveamkfgmail.com

_SATISFACTION & DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I, Hafeez Bin Amran Bagarib, owner of vehicle number SMK 8976 U declare

that my vehicle have been completed to my satisfaction and was discharged

from 0.S.K. Auto Spare Parts Trading (1994) at Block 10 AMK Autopoint
#04-09 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A Singapore 568047 on the M
day of Ruc, 20169.
Signature of Assured,

[

":;-"
L S
Hafegz Bin Amran Bagarib.

Accident Date : 17.08.2019
Nams : Hafeez Bin Amran Bagarib

Address : 37 Punggol Field £01-35 Prive S828809



Merimen e-Claims Page | of 1

.++CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Divect Settlament

| CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING _

| Coae Motified Est Sutwmitied Adj Asmagrned At Bt Adj Subsmitted Ina Auth'ed Status

' |13 Av9 3019 e $$3,00000 | $$3,000.00 Punding fer Sursey
L] H w

| _"."‘.L_"_J £alit Ady et | st tiomatm | | _view n3t | cancel Case |

I LEONG THENG WEL, ID: 572042076
Main N
[,:Imm MAFEEZ BIN AMRAN BAGARID, 1D STEI4867G
Vehicle Reg. . |18/0B/2019 000D - :59
No.: SMKE976U Diate of LOsS: | 154 \yonths and 6 Days From LTA Beg Date (Man ¥r]]
Claim Type: TP / 1201900024759 pACY[COVET | pNPY2019-00000199 (Compronensive)
Vehicle feg.
Na. SGR2BZA Fgml' 5108951 CLASSIC
{Inpuired) )
Excess:
Conairer. | O-5-K. Auto Spare Parts Trading (1994) (HQ) BLK 10 ANG MO KIO INDUSTRIAL PARK 2A #04-09 AMK ALITO POINT SINGAPORE
PaiIrer: | cenoay, SGED47 Ang Mo Kio - Tel:
pandind | FwD singapore Pte. Ltd, (HQ) - Tel: 6727 5700 . [Handlud by Clara Li 21 Rang]
Caimants | NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd (HQ) - Tol
Adjuster: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 .. [Handled by CHEN TSUE YEE] . [Final Rpt dus 03/09/2019]
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view Al | Compase Case mui |
+ PWD_5G (11/11/2019): Alurt - Adj Mandate Approved ($$1247.45) - SMKB976U - Claim Handier: Clara Ll Zi...
ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS— view il | Search Tashs | Create New Task | compiets |
Due Date  Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handiar Assigned By Completed On Created On ~ Dona?
N resultd
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Claim Documents

*SMKBS76U (1201900024759)

[SGR2B2A]
TP

HAFEEZ BIN AMRAN BAGARIE

Aug 18 2019 12:00AM

[LEONG THENG WEI]

0.5.K. Auto Spare Parts Trading (1994)

Upioad Documents |  Upiasa Photos | compose new Lener |

Page | of 2

No | Finalized On LKK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 |(Datt) Third Party Express Settiement - Payment Breakdown a EdiT
Assessment Reports [1perpage V]| &4
|Ma | Firaliczd On LXK Autn C Itants Pie Lid (HG) Thumtsnasil | Print
1 [20/08/15 18:49 | Adjuster Immediate Advice O | Loearm
1 ==
| Photos/Images 3 +1 &
to |Relsbai/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pt Ltd (HG) [ Thumbmail | Print
1 |19/091914:23 | General View O edirs | B
'z |19/09/19 14:23 | General View 8 | waaws | &
3 |19/09/1914:23 | Geners] View @ | woaws | B
4 |16/00/19 14:33 | General View 0| s 7
5 |19/09/19 1423 | General View 0O edies | B
& |19/09/1914.23 | General View O | lceaws | B
7 |19/09/19 14:23 Ganeral View @ | oaaws | &
8 |19/06/19 14:33 | General View 0O | woaws |
9 |19/09/19 14:33 | General View 0| s |
10 |19/09/19 14:23 | General View 0| v |
11 |19/09/19 14:23 | General View 0 | ades | A
12 | 1970919 14:23 Ganeral View 0| waaws | A
13 |19/09/19 14:23 | General View 0| wadwe | A
14 |19/09/19 14:21 General View _II_I_ load oG | B
15 |19/09/19 14:23 | General View 0| wedivc | A
16 | 19/09/190 14:23 General View D | tesawc | A
17 |19/09/19 14:23 | General View 0| wadivc | A
18 |19/09/19 14:23 | Genersl View 0| waws | B
19 |16/09/19 14:23 | General View B | wadws | A
20 |19/09/19 14:21 | General View O | adirc | A
21 |19/09/19 14:31 | General View 0! waawc | A
22 |19/09/19 14:23 | Genernl View 0 | wedc | A
23 |19/09/19 14:23 | General View 0| waws | B
24 [19/09/19 14:21 | General View 0 | wedirc | @
25 |19/00/19 14:24 Reinspection Photo g Load G | BA
26 [15/09/15 1434 | Relnspection Photo 0| tsawc | A
27 |19/09/19 14:34 | Reinspection Photo 0| wadirc | A
|28 | 19/09/19 14:24 Reinspection Photo g_ ioad G | M
25 |15/09/19 14:24 | Relnspection Photo 0| adirc | A
|30 |19/09/19 14:24 Reinspection Photo D | load 1rc
131 19/00/19 14:24 | Reinspaction Photo 0 eadwc | B
32 |19/09/19 14:24 | Reinspection Phato B e |
33 |19/09/19 14:24 | Reinspection Phato 0| wodrs |
34 |19/09/19 14:24 | Relnspection Photo 0| tceas | A
35 |02/10/19 13:48 After Repalr Photo _n Load PG | A
36 |03/10/1% 13:48 | After Repair Photo || leadiec | BA
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Page 2 of 2

Letters/ Correspondences 1 pex page _E_ )
{mo_[Finsfizes On LKK Auto Consultants Pis Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Primt
37 |0)/10/19 13148 After Repalr Photo Loagd PG | BA
'Ipocum-nhﬂm I: perpage | v] ﬂ?ﬁ
[Nz | nelabel /Rearder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) | Thumbnail | Print
| | 29/08/19 18:41 | EMAIL - FWD TO O DD 22.08.19 '@ | LoasFoF
2 | 29/08/19 18:41 | EMAIL FROM FWD DD 22.08.2019 | Load PDF
3 |2%/08/1921112 | TP ESTIMATE - MARKED Load POF
4 |oo/posis 135 | TP GIA REPORT Laad POF
5 |06/11/19 12:55 | WORKSHOP INVOICE ) | ioasroF
B | DB/11/19 12:58 | LTA SEARCH 0 | o ror
7 |06711/1912:59  [LOD Load POF
8 |25711/1% 10:30 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM Load POF
9 [25/11/16 10:30 | Relesss Voucher 0 | vooa roF
{No_| Finalized On FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd. (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
{1 |33/oe/19 18:12 E-filed GIA repart Load POF
|7 |6/08/1% 08:55 | DAMAGED PHOTO 1 0| eaws | A
|3 |26/08/1908:55 | DAMAGED PHOTO 2 0| eaws | B
4 |26/00/19 08:55 | DAMAGED PHOTO 3 0| weaws | &
Documents Checklist
DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST Reset | Save | pom |
There are no document checkdists configured,
Our Chechlist Remarks - LK Auto Consultants Pte Lid (M)
el
W
Show Remarks Ta: E[ Handling Insurer
Hapie Barmsies are peredle aniess wou ahes i B TR et
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Preview Pﬂ.gf 1ofl

MOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM
THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT
(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
Vehicle No: SGR282A (Insd veh) Model: VOLVO V60 1.6 T4 (A)
SMKBI76U (TP veh)
| Date of Accident: | 18/08/2019
Global Sum Settiement | | [X] Yes || ] No
Repair Estimate - 4,867.00
Final Repair Cost - 3.240.00
Loss of Use L 4,00 days at $60.00 per day
Rental {if any) 3 days
LTA ! GIA Search Fee g
Others: it
L
Final Settlement Sum (Global Sum) g 3,240.00

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ 1 ¥YES5 [X ] NO (Kindlyindicate
below)
A) For Nen GIA Registered Workshop: Agread Liability 100 (%)

BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No:

B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability (%) Assessed Liability (*): (%)
* Assessed Liability to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1} | 0.5 K. Autlo Spare Parts Trading (1994) - 3,240.00
2} ' §
3 £
25 Nov
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 019
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Rolease Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report;
Medical Repaort/ Bill {if any)

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=8SVCdoc&fuseaction=dsp_... 25/11/2019



Adjuster Report Page | of 4
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coreg o 1sseorser)
51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-B805 Email: sur@Ikkauto.com;assignments@|kkauto.com
VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT
Qur File No: CC4/PWD18014BB4/EPA3Q2
Date: 25/11/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer. FWD Singapore Pte. Lid. Policy No: PNPYV2019-00000199
Claimant ;
Vehicle No : SMKBETEU Insured Vehicle No : SGR2B2A
Date of Loss: 18/E/2019 Mature of Claim. TP Claim No: 1201800024759
ESC F I
Reg No SMKBITEL
Make & Model: VOLVO VB0, 1.6 T4 (4) Engine No: B41B4T4124137
Reg. Date: 12/068/2013 (Man. Year: 2012) Chassis No YV1FW48HBD1 104483
Colour Silver Odomater 107869 km
Engine Capacity 1596 cc
Market Value/New Car NIA
Price:
Sum Insured (S3%): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition Steering (Serviceable). Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yas
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 235/40 R18 Rear Tyre Size: 235/4D R18
Front Left Side: Firenza 5 mm Rear Left Side: Firenza 5 mm
Front Right Side: Firenza 5 mm Rear Right Side: Firenza 5 mm
The above walues repraseni the remanring e reeds depth
\COST OF CLAIMS Repairers  Adjuster's Difference  Diff %|
Parts 3317.00 3,089.40 227.80 6.86
Miscellaneous ltems 0,00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1,550.00 660.00 890.00 57.42
Paintwork Labour 0,00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Caleulated Gross Total (55) 4.867.00 3,749.40 1.117.60 22.96
Approved Total (Overridden) (5§) 3,000.00
Nett Amount (5§5) 4,867.00 3,000.00 1,867.00 38.36
+ Loss of Use (4.0 x 5560.00/day) (S5) 240.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (S5) 745
Nett Liability (5§) 3,247 A5
Global Sum Settlement (S$) 3,240.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 221082018
Date Inspected: 271082019 Inspected Al 0.5 K. Auto Spare Parts Trading
(1964) (HQ)
BLK 10 ANG MO KIO INDUSTRIAL
PARK 2A #04-08 AMK AUTO POINT
Singapore 568047
Estimated Period of Repair: 4.0 days
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Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Adjuster: CHEN TSUE YEE Manager: CHEW HSIAQ TONG

NOTE: This reporf represants our findings af the fime and place of inspection stated herein, Such inspection has bewn carmed aul io the bos! of our
knowiledge ard ability but any othir habiity under any other dreomstances i hersby aspressly eniuded
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REPAIR DETAILS

Reference ‘
Part Source: (Last Synchronised: 06 Nov 2019)

Parts: MWIA VOLVO VED 1.6 T4 (A) (Model nol available in database)

Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominated Standard List)

|Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SMKBS7BU)

| Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages. running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimale page

Further Info: llemsivalues nol in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *.

Recommended Parts

No. Qty ::" Particulars Condition Repairers  Amount

K *FRONT BUMPER Cut 1,398.00F *1,388.00 FL
*FRONT BUMPER TOW COVER Not Necessary 45.00F “FL

3 10 *FRONT BUMPER CLIPS MNecassary (1 PCS 50.00F *30.00 FL

ONLY)

I *FRONT RIGHT SIDE HEAD LAMP Cut 1,642 00F *1,642 00 FL

5 1 “FRONT BUMPER RIGHT SIDE FOG LAMP  Cut 182.00F *182.00FL
GARNISH

F=Franchizse part. L=LigillemDisc
Sub Total (S§) 3,317.00 3,252.00
- List Item Discount on L ltems 0.00/5.00% (S§) 0.00 162.60

Total Parts (S§) 3,317.00 3,089.40

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no new miscellansous ilems selectad,

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 TO DISMANTLE AND REPLACE THE ABOVE MENTIONED MNew B00.00 200.00
PARTS

2 LABOUR FOR RESPRAY FRONT BUMPER ASSY New 400.00 200.00

3 TO CHECK HEAD LAMP WIRING New 100.00 30.00

4 RUST-PROOFING ON THE REAR ACCIDENT AFFECTED New 150.00 30.00
PORTIONS

5 LABOUR FOR REPAIR AND MODIFY FRONT TOP PANEL MNew 300.00 200.00

Gross Labour Cost {5%) 1,550.00 660.00

Reporl was unsubmitied during this prinl-out

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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