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—— KENNETH por: 23/08/2019 Puwe/Time:  23/08/2018
Registerad in Merimen: ZMZDJ_Q_
Pre-assign / CCU / FTE
| invured Vehicle No. - GBC 2645L Clatm No MFL2019D0000842
e e BRANK'S SINGAPORE PTE. LTD. wolicy e D19MFLO000151
besuired Tel N HP- Make/Madel ©  TOYOTA HIACE REGIUS-2.5D
Excess See I1 1S DOA: 27/07/2018 03:35 JUNGTRNOFMPODLANDS AVE 3AWOODLANDS CENTRE ROAD
% drreer the owner? { YES § NO § MNuture of Accident :
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> Ba‘k to OneMotoring
Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner |D Type: Singapore NRIC
Cwner 1D 428E

Vehicle Details

Wehicle Noz FBK%9521
Vehicle to be Exported: et

Intended Deregritration Date: 22 Aug 2017
Vehicle Make YAMAHA
Vehicle Model: YZF-R3 ABS
Primary Calour Blue
Manufacturing Year: 2015

Engine No. HA02EM23453
Chassis No.: MHIRHO7 1000004594
Maximum Power Output: -

Open Marker Value: $4.98200
Original Reglstration Date: 27 Apr 2014
First Reglstration Date: 27 Apr 2014
Transter Count: 1

Actual ARF Paid: $748.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibilitv: Mo

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -

PARF Rebate Amaunt £0.00
Intended COE Rebate Deatails

COE Expiry Date 26 Apr 2024
COE Category; D - Motorcycke
COE Perind(Years): 10

OP Paid: $4,501.00

COE Rebate Amounl: $4.341.00
Total Rebate Amount: $4.341.00

The Information contained hersin ls correct as at 22 Aug 2019

OK



Bixe mads!

Yamaha ¥YZF-A3

Tipe

ANy

Price From

Anwy

PricaTa

.l._n,.'n

Clazs

ANy

NMORE SERACS DFTIONT w

O SEARCH w

Yamaha YZF-R3 (/listing/usedbike/yamaha-yamaha-yri-r3/13905/7)

('Esnrgrusedbikeryamaha-yamana-yrl-r3/ 35054

SG0$8800

Reg - 26/06/2015
Type: Sport Bikes
IMce

S0000%m

Y15 Used MotorCyolesBikes For Sale i Smgapars by Owners & Daglars - SGHbkaman

S SEARCH i IEW ALL | FLESTINGIUSEDR IR SILISTINGA

4015 Yamana R3 For Sale, Dniginai Conminon. Wedl Taken Care Sy Owner Viewing @ Speedway Motor No. 36 Toh Guan Roaa East #01-32 Singapore

6OESED
Posted on . 11082019
i PAIT) A0 & CHdi e AT

B COMPARE

Yamaha YZF-R3 (/listing/usedbike/yvamaha-yamaha-yel-r3/13851/)

[flrsting fusedblkafyamaba-yamaha-yaf-r 271 38517

560gq1099
Reg DR/A2017
Type: Sport Blkes

12ex
Trade vl oan sviilable Vi Bike Dynamic Centre
Pomsied o - 170D

PAID D o Dl an

B COMPARE

DETALS I (/LESTING/ USEDRIEE Y ALCAHA- T ANAHA-FIF-R1A T904Y

DETALS I [/LISTING/USEDEIRE/VAMAHA. YAMAHA YTF-EL 138517



T & T Auto Services Pte Ltd

160 Sin Ming Drive
#08-14 Sin Ming AutoCity
Singapore 575722
Tel: 6266 6876 Fax: 6266 6861
GST Registration No: 200910712E

26" August 2019

India International Insurance Pte Ltd
64 Cecil Street

#04/#05 10B Building

Singapore 04971 |

Dear Sir,
RE: THIRD PARTY CLAIM
OUR INSURED: FBK9952L
YOUR INSURED: GBC2645L
DATE OF ACCIDENT: 27/0712019
We refer to the above matter,
Kindly be informed that Estimate Repair cost of FBK9952L is $512,000.00.

Kindly revert as soon as possible.

Thank you.

Regards. Q‘f/f P

Yours faithfully ¢ Comigr Y w sH

{¢f4 -

yrai-,

Lt Ny ccenamieo! 7

T& T Auto Services Pte Lid



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: . Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 23 August 2019 11:32 AM
To: T & T Auto Services Pte Lid; sur@lkkauto.com; Admin-D [LKKAuio)
Cc: € Meenachi - Ill
Subject: RE: Accident Involving GBC2645L / FBK9952L on 27/07/2019
Attachments: IV GBC2645L.PDF
12-3Fper (@ 23 fl"f 2ol
Reqa 0N ® VIn M-
uhice In
Dear Sir/ Mdm, e lunrudin

Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle FEX559520 and let us have your report urgently.
This claim will be handled by Meena.

Please let us have your client's accident report and repair estimate for our appointed surveyor to conclude his report.
*Kindly upload this survey request emall to merimen

Thank You.

Daniel Pooi
Motor Claims Department

India International Insurance Pte Ltd
64 Cecil Street #04-02 10B Building

Singapare (49711

Tel: 6347 6100 Ext 202 Fax: 6224 4174

S&P A" rated Eumpﬂny

il

Ih TEMM AT IO AL
I.N'I-I.JMNI. ]

From: T & T Auto Services Pte Ltd [mailto:tntautoservices@gmail.com)

Sent: Friday, 23 August, 2019 11:22 AM

To: Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim @iii.com.sg>

Subject: Re: Accident Involving GBC2645L / FBK9952L on 27/07/2019

Dear Daniel,

Kindly arrange LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to conduct the survey.
Thank vou.

Regards

Vincent Tan

T & T Auto Services Pre Ltd

Tel: 6266 6876 Fax: 6266 6861
Hp: 9145 9776



On Fri, 23 Aug 2019 at 11:09, Motor Claim - 11T <motorclaim@iii.com.sg> wrote:

Dear Sir / Mdm,

We acknowledge receipt of your email.

We propose using one of the following motor surveyors:

Automobile Inspection Services Pte Ltd
VP Appraisal

Form Team Adjusters Pte Ltd

Infiniti Appraisal Service

IP Knights Adjusters

LBS Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Priority Services

RT Appraisal

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Vicom Assessment Centre Pte Ltd

L ]

& & & ® & &

Please notify us within 02 days of receipt of this letter for surveyor agreed on or if you have any objections to the
above list

Daniel Pooi

Motor Claims Department

India International Insurance Pte Ltd
B4 Cecll Street #04-02 108 Bullding

Singapore 048711



Tel: 8347 6100 Ext 202 Fax: G224 4174

S&P'A-' rated Company

. ;NI.‘HA

lNTI’. RMATIONAL
1:\::1.1 AMICT

LW AP0 R
T e rmg— | S8

{

From: T & T Auto Services Pte Ltd [mailto:tntautoservices @gmail.com]
Sent: Friday, 23 August, 2019 10:53 AM

To: Motor Claim - Il smotorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Subject: Accident Involving GBC2645L / FBK9952L on 27/07/2019

Dear Sir,

We refer to the above matter.

Kindly arrange pre-repair inspection of motorcycle no: FBK9952L at our premises:

T & T Auto Services Pte Lid

160 Sin Ming Drive

#08-14 Sin Ming AutoCity

S(575722)

Thank you.

Regards.

Vincent Tan



T & T Auto Services Pre Lid
Tel: 6266 6876 FFax: 6266 6861

Hp: 9145 9776

Kindly note that by submitting this claim 10 us, you are deemed 1o have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers
(located both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry,
including the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing,
handling and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with
applicable laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful,
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
ntercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification,

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Lid.

Registration No. 198703792-K

Kindly note that by submitting this claim 1o us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore, This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. [ you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

&4



DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification,

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Lid.

Registration No. 198703792-K



aiMaroia Mariman e-Claims

Print Received Message

This mall is associated with :

*FBK9952L (MFL2019D0000842)
[GBC2645L]
3

WONG BAOYANG ALISTAIR
Jul 27 2019 3:00AM

-]
T&T AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD

From India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (I1I_SG), =ent on 17/09/2019 14:31 PM.
To LKK_HQ

Subject Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (S56337.45) - FBK9952L - Claim Handler: C. Meanachi

Approved:6337.45:0UR RECOMMENDATION IS AS FOLLOWS : COR $6000.00 LOSS OF USE 2B0.00 LTA 7.45
TOWING FEES

hitps./isingapore menmen.com/claims/index.cfm Musebox=5VCmail&fuseaction=dsp_Print&CFID=50205896ACF TOKEN=1a7712a6b446cd3-98... 1N




T & T Auto Services Pte Ltd

160 Sin Ming Drive
#i8- 14 Sin Ming AuloCily
Singopore ST5722
Tel: 6266 6876 Fax: 6266 686
G5 1 Registration MNo: 2009107 12E

Date: 09" September 2019

Our Ref: 0919-1420

Your Ref:

Atin: The Motor Claims Department

India International Insurance Pte Ltd

6d Cecil Street

#04/805 108 Building

Singapore 049711

Dear Sir,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBC2645L 7 FBKYISZL ON 270772019

Please refer 1o the above-mentioned accident.

We are writing on behall of Wong Baoyang Alistair,the registered owner of motor vehicle no:
FBKY952ZL which was involved in the above accident.

We are Instructed that the above aceident was caused solely and completely by the negligence
of your insured's vehicle no: GBC2645L. As a result of which, our client have suffered loss
and expenses.

We are instructed by our client 1o claim for:-

|. Cash-In-Lieu 556,000,000
2. Loss of Use{ 14 days (@ $20.00/day) S5 280,00
3. LTA Search 55 7.45
4. Towing Fee S8 50000
5. Stworage Fee (14 days @ $50.00/day ) S5 T00L00

TOTAL 1S87.037.45

We enclosed hereby the following documents for your consideration:

(a) GIA Report lodged by our driver

(b) Owner & Driver 'C/Driving Licence
{¢) Certificate of Insurance

[d) LTA Search

(e) Towing Receipt

Kindly acknowledge receipt of the above said documents and your favourable reply is greatly

appreciated.

Yours faithfully.

T & T Auto Services Pre Lid

LL“M o . -1.

Vincent Tan




TO [MDIN U TERRATONAL  INMgANCE e g
GY CECIL STLEET
;ﬁ'@? flos 10 BRuiwDing

S (045 nﬁ
Dear Sirs,

CLAIMANT:
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GLc J(¥SL  AND bfic 195LL ON NKNI | 9

AT Tusctiers OF waon peax PuE § /uwr_w_nwx cebps Fulherd

UWe, _Wons GACYARPS AuSTMA , am/are the registered owner of motor

]

Car no. Flic 99CL

Plesse note that 1 have assigned all compensation monies due to me/us in the above said accident
to M/ST & TAUTO SERVICES PTE LTD.

[/We, hereby authorize you to release all compensation monies pertaining to the above-
mentioned accident to M/S T & T AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD and forward your settlement
cheque to M/S T & T AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD whom [ had authorized to collect the seid

compensation monies.

Thank you.
\ |
( l"l,t..u\f %;w )]
e e e A e e A .9 [ & cedresenas
Signature of Claimant gm By -
Date: 19 SEP 2019 " 19 SEP 2019



Ah Di Mohile: 8588 8877

' Email 1 efficiennowing sgagmail.com
2d Mawura rﬂjﬂ# Services P u‘ N FLiA44K

CASH SALE /JOB ORDER

e C

‘w:hu.lcho f[k-m ﬁ{fhl No: VMA“

MiE (8/&) REES 5
Time {day mghn Cnnmi:l No:
)

*‘i“_ﬂém > g»/a

{18 ]
Cush § ﬂthcﬁ

B2EA @z Tow Truck
Authorised By: _22 Diriver Namctwej

A R H A S bl R AR IR,
—mREEANDA

Note: Vehide is towed at awner s rsk The company sccepls no respamiibility
for damages o olher misdemeanoer to your vehicle whilst being lowed.

-i'//mwf'__ Efficient Towing Services

407 Sin Ming Avemie 213-307, Sin Ming Garden, Singapore 570402

NO. 36730
Date ﬂdfﬁ_

D Jump Stary Changing of battery

[] Tyre Replacement
Dﬁﬁuﬁdm

] Multi/Basement

[ with Losd'Cargo Box
] King Dotly

(] Transport Charge

[] Low Body Kit

] poot Opening Service
[] Crane UpWineh Ow
[] coliect Doc/Key

[ Repe

] woodiands and Tuas Checkpoint

4O E



222019 Recaipt

- Ba::.k to OneMotoring

Land Transpon Authanly

10 Sin Ming Drive

Singapore ST57T01

G5T Registration No. : M4-D006528-2

Print Date/Time 22 Aug 2018/ 15:13:18
Receipt Date/Time © 22 Aug 2018/ 151318

Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipt No. : ITNET-00000-1806822-001972
Previous Receipt No.
SIN Item Description/ Amount GS5T Amount
Business Transaction Reference Before Amount After GST
No. GST (S$) (5%) (s%)
Result of Insurance Enquiry - GRC2845L
As at 27 Jul 2019/00:00:00
Insurance Co INDIA INT'L INS PTE LTD
1 Insurance Enquiry - GRC2645L
Enquiry Fes T.00 049 740
20190822151205892373
Sub-Total T.00 048 )
Total Before Rounding T.00 [ag T45
Rounding Difference 0.04
Total Amount Payable T.45
Paid By
Direct Debit: eNETS Debdl
20190822151220870 (Internet Banking) T45
Total T.45
Cash Change 0.00
Tendered Amount T.45
Excsss Relundable Amaount 0.00
THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!
Please ensure that all payments (o the Authority are good and promplly settlad by the paymant servica

provider ! financial institution, Otherwise, the transaction and receipt 18 considared vold and late tose

may apply

PGS /W . QoY S0 AT OO COTMIeE T @ yTTENT i Ui | TN =T iaa )
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InTeRNATIONAL
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IR R FRE-R Y
vy che s e {807

EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(_;,c'.\ VA

INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE I'TE LTD

o, Mg, Wi 19UT0NTIZN | GET. Acg, P, M- T EDE-X
64 | Contl Strvet | 814 | #05 | #00-02 | 117 Bailibing | Singapore 04F7 11

Office [05] 63476100

Tanadl  insurediiicamUg

Fax  [65)62244174  Websine wwwlll com g

RISCHARGE VOUCHER
|li- Direct Settlement (PODS)

India Rel; MFLINE000084
Claimant Ref | Féx ssszl

Wall, T8 AUTOSERVICES FTE LT

with tha appoinied Survyor ol India Intemational insurance Pta L

iijuticy
igribes, the settlement terms heecin thauld pot be med &1 23
evizace 0 prejadice 1o the claimasts peraanl fsjies CiE31
andiar oiher uminsured losses claim arising of (e
subject mattet i Whis sction.

{"the workshop®) hareby gonfirm (hal we/l have reacned an agroamant

of Surveyor] with respect 1o Ihe amaun claimed for 83

pt/pekad], 53 5745
on TN

jg L AUTOD CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

[narmi

§,000.00

yahicla), This s pursuant 1 ihe ingpection conductad on IR0

Weall confirm (hat well arafem mithorized by the owner WONG BAOE
il of wehiche no FEK S 1n make the claim as sst oul mihe
s matter on histher batml! @ mannér thal wa'l deam fit. Wall

party claiman

Well furtner confirm fhal woll will indsmnity india intemational
ihey will or have alraady incumed |0 Iha ayent mm third

furthesr clalin against the formes for any loss and expanse:
-

of use pursuant ta tha damage o FEKESSIL

Wall confirm that the agreamanl '

basis

dispule ansing oul of the same.

VWa/l authorize you 1o pay the lotal amount of

Dratotd U ES oeeeass

CLAIMANT:
Signature

Mamea
MRIC

Address

Nalionalily:

D pealion

pursuant 1o the secdant and that furhier this salilim

This ngresment & sunject to the appllcation ol Singapom iw and the Sngapora Courts have esclusive junsdichion ovar By

st [ Ee b

(———), 5§
:m 'Et vohicls no Faxsesn  thal was damaged pursuani 10 the acciden! which ootumad
{dals) ot JUNCTION OF WOOOLANDS AVE 3 & WODDLANDS CTA D flocalion) Ewolving vehicle no GBC 3845 (insured

{onta) ol “ine workshap®

280,00 (loss of

{"the third party

an and wall taee Nl sutherity o sslile
fpiatter of authonty green ty “the thind

damages. koss andior expansa thal

Il above sald agmement lodges &

repairs andior rentsl andlor loss

of ol claims of *ine third party claimant”

thout prajudice and winoutl admssion of latility

g TATAUTOSERVICES PTE LTD

WITNESS:

Signniure:

LKK AUTO COMSULTANT PTE LTD

51 UBI AVE 1 #02-25

PATA LB INDUSTRIAL PARK §[£0893T)

losses claim in o Later date.

oaly
”lﬂﬂﬁd&ﬁﬁpﬂlﬂ
mmw

Further, the

seitlemenl term

hierein should mot be watd 1 @8

prepudice tﬁ_‘lﬁdh‘;‘hdﬁ
:ﬂﬂn::iu uhl‘:ad losses claim arising of the
ﬁhﬂﬂwhﬁm



Menmen e-Claims Page 1 of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Direct Settiement

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING

Case Nakifled Eui Subirmitiss Ad) Assigiied | Ay Rpt Ad) Submitted | 1ns Auth'ed Statun

|71 3012008 D MeINT 15$6,00000 | 5$6,000.00 R o e
| L1 Hnu]lﬂ i Eoe mates | | _view tie | Cancet Case |

Main Reoference Clalm Detalls
CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS [Created by adjuster]
Insyred: BRANK'S SINGAPORE PTE. LTD., Co. Fey. ho.: 1989007550
Main .
Claimant: WOMNG BAOYANG ALISTAIR, [0 59170428E
Wahiche Reg. _|27/07/2019 03:00 - :59
Ne.. PKSSSL Oate of Loss: | |39 Manths From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r)]
Clsim Type:  |TP / MFLZ01900000842 N"u' ':’m_‘ ':'"_"' DIGHFLOD001 51 (Comprehansme)
Vehicle Reg.
Palicy No
o, GBCIB45L . | SDF9ET7LIEI-03
[Insured) (Clairmant) |
‘Excess
Rapairer: TAT AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD (HQ) BLK 19 SIN MING IND EST SECTOR A #01-19, 575677 Sm Ming - Tel: £455331%
'I""‘"“"'"f' India Intemnational Tnsurancs Pte Lid (HQ) - Tel! 3476100 . [Handied by €. Mesnachl - 6347 £071)
mrf"‘ NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd (HQ) - Tel
Adjuster; LKK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 5256-3561  [Handled by KENNETH KONG] .. [Final Rpt due 03/09/2015]
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view &l |  Compose Case Mail ﬂ

115G (17/09/2019): Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (S$56337.45) - FEK9952L - Claim Handler: C. Maenachi

111_SG (0506 2019): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$0.00) - FEK995IL - Clalm Handler: C. Mesnachi

111_SG (04/09/2019) Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved ($30.00) - FBK9951L - Clalm Handler: C. Meennchi |
115G (30/08/2019): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved [530.00) - FBK9951L - Clalm Handler;: C. Mesnachl

-
-
Ll
Ll

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS= view &l | Search Tusks | Creste tew Task | Compiste |

Due Date Priority Type Task Group Subject Handier Apsigned By Completed On Cruated On Dane?
No results.
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Claim Documents

*FBK9952L (MFL2019D0000842)
[GBC2645L]

TP
WONG BADYANG ALISTAIR
Jul 27 2019 3:00AM
[BRANK'S SINGAPORE PTE. LTD.]
T&T AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD

Upioad Documents |  Upiosd Photos | Compuse New Lener | View [viaw in Browsar| v |
Photos/Images 3perpage [v] M
No | Relsbel/Reorder | LXK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) | Thumbnail Print
i |DR/09/19 12:090 | General View 0| awc | B
2 |06/09/19 12:098 | Genersl View 0| wairc | A
3 |06/09/1912:09 | General View 0! adwc | &
4 |069/19 1209 | General View 0| eaxws | A
5 |DR0919 12108 | Genaeral View 0| weowrs | WA
6 |D6/09/19 12:09 | General View O s | B
7 |06/09/1912:08 | General View O ladws | B
B | 08/09/1912:09 | General View 0 leadirc | B
9 |08/09/19 12:08 | Genaral View 0D lesars | A
10 |06/09/1912:09 | General View 0| caaws | A
11 |08/09/19 12:09 Ganeral View 0| woaws | B4
12 | 06/09/15 12:09 Ganeral View 0| loadiec |
11 |pA/09/19 12:08 | Genersl View 0| adies | A
14 |06/08/1912:08 | General View 0| adws | A
15 |06/09/19 12:00 Ganeral View 0| oedrs | M
16 |06/09/1912:09 | General View 0| tooaws | &
17 | 06/0%/19 12:09 General View 0| adirc | A
18 [D&MA/10 12:08 | General View 0O | lesaws | B |
15 |06/09/19 12:0% | General View 0| dws | B
0 |06/09/1912:09 | Ganeral View @ | iedws | B
21 |0B/09/1912:08 | General View 0| woews | B
22 |0B/09/19 12108 | General View 0| wawe | BA
21 |06/09/19 12:09 | General View O aervs | B
24 |06/09/1912:08 | Ganaral View O acrwc | B
5 |0E/D9/1912:09 | General View Q| wiws | B
26 |0B/09/1912:09 | General View 0| toaws | A
27 |06/09/19 12:08 | General View 0| adwrc | A
2B |0B/09/19 12:08 | General View 0| diec | A
Documentation 1 ~] B
Mo | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 [23/00/1915:49 | O1 GIA REPORT @ | iosaror
2 [23/08/1% 1549 | ACKNOWLEDGEMENT EMAIL TO 111 DD 23.08.2019 0 | l=aror
1 |27/0M1908:56 | TP ESTIMATE - TOTAL LOSS [

4 |27/08/15 08:56 | TP POLICE REPORT Load POF
5 | 06/09/19 12:07 PARF COE REBATE 3 Load POF
|6 |09/09/1915:13 | TP LOD, LTA SEARCH AND TOWING TNV Load PGF
|7 |OB/10D/1% 08:46 | DISCHARGE VOUCHER [+ T
& [DR/10/1906.46 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM g Load PGF
9 |DB/10/19 D846 | LTA SEARCH Load POF
10 |0B/10/19 08146 | TOWING FEE a Load FOF
11 |0B/10/1508:46 | LOD Load POF
Mo | Finalized On India International Insurance Pte Litd (HG) Thumbnall | Print
1 [26/08/1511:11 | IV ACCIDENT STATEMENT [ B
1z |oano/is15:48 | FEme9szL 0 | iecror
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Documents Checklist

DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST neset | save | et |
There are no document chacklists configured.

Show Remarks To: [] Handling Insurer
i s ied RIS Oew e S wou Ao DD efher pdfies
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (co reg Mo tosso718sr)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park

Singapore 408833

Tel B256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignmenis@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our Flle No: CC4/I118014878/KGA302
Date: 0BMO/2018

REFERENCE

Handiing Insurer- |14/@ Intemational Insurance P policy No D18MFLO000151

Claimant Insured Vehicle

Vehicle No * FBK3952L s GBC2645L

Dale of Loss:  27/0772018 Nature of Claim: TP Hm - MFL201800000842

DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE

Reg No: FBK9952L

Make & Model: YAMAHA YZF-R3, 321cc ABS Enging No; H402E0023453

Reg. Date: 27/04/2016 (Man. Year: 2015) Chassis No: MH3RHO7 1000004564

Colour: Gray Odometer: 0km

Engine Capacity: M

Market Value™ew Car N/A

Price:

Sum Insured (S§): Markel Valua/New Car Price

CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY

General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accdent Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 110770 R17 Rear Tyre Size: 150/60Z R17
Front Ledt Side: Bridgastone 3 mm Rear Left Side: Bridgestone 4 mm
Front Right Side Bridgestone O mm Rear Right Side: Bridgestone 0 mm
The above valuea repvesent (he remaining e treads depth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's  Adjuster's  Differance  Diff %)
Parts 0.00 000 0.00
Miscellaneous llems D00 0.00 0.00
Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Paintwark Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S§) 0.00 0.00 0.00
Approved Total (Overridden) (S§) €,000.00
Nett Amount (55) 0.00 6,000.00 -6,000.00
+ Loss of Use (14.0 x 5520.00/day) (S%) 280.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (S5) 7.45
+ Legal Costs/Disbursements (55) 50.00
Nett Liability (S§) 6,337.45
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 23/08/2019
Date Inspectad: 23/08/2018 Inspected At: T&T AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD (HQ)
BLK 18 SIN MING IND EST SECTOR
A #01-10
Singapore 575877
Estimated Period of Repair: 0.0 days
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Adjuster: KENNETH KONG Manager: Chong Pui Lin

NOTE This raport represents our findings at the fme and place of inapection stiled heren, Such inspaction hag bean carmed ouT i the baat of our
inowiedge and abilfy but any other Kabiity under any ather circumstances is hermaby saprassly sxciuded
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PLEASE BE INFORMED OWNER THAT THE VEHICLE NOT ECONOMICAL FOR REPAIR.

MARKET VALUE : $10,500,00
LTA REIMBURSEMENT VALUE (RV) : §4,300.00
NETT VALUE : $6,200.00

IN VIEW OF THE ABOVE. THE VEHICLE IS UNECONOMICAL TO BE REPAIRED
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REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source:

Parts: MiA, YAMAHA YZF-R3 321cc ABS (Model not avallable in database)

|Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominated Standard List) |

iPrint Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for FEK99521)

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

Further Info: ltems/values not In reference catalogue are p_raﬂm:l with an asterisk ‘:

Recommended Parts

There are no new parts selected.
| Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.
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Recommended Miscellaneous ltems
There are no new miscallansous items selected.

Recommended Labour

There are no labour items selocted.
[ Report was unsubmitied during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=g... 8/10/2019



