Asher SH (LKKAuto)

From: Tan Kah Leong <KahLeong.Tan@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 7 January 2020 1:58 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: OQUR REF: SNM19D203972-GBH1386P-TKL - FW: Direct

Settlement - Accident Invalving GBH1386P (Ol : CT1 - TBA) AND 5LQ7424H (TP : LKK
REF - CCa/CTI19014871/Kea3) on 16/08/2019

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged
Without Prejudice

Dear Asher,

We refer to your emall below
Please proceed to settle at 53,146.45(all-in).
Thank you.

Regards

Tan Kah Leong
Assistant Executive
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 075908
DID. (65) 63896183 | F: (65) 6222 1033

W: www sg cntaipingcom | FB: www facebook com/chinataipingsal

Discimimor This e-mail and any fites trangmitted with i is infanded anly for the named recipnts and may conlain confidential iformation. Any
pnautionzed disclosurm, vse or dirseminagbon of this message, either in whole or partial, = profvbited. If you @ mof the intended recipment. please nolify
the sender immedialely. Piease delale (he e-mall and any copies of |f theregfiar

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com)

Sent: Monday, December 16, 2019 12:55 PM

To: Tan Kah Leong <KahLeong Tan@sg.cntaiping.com>; Claims Dept of CT1 <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chee 50 Chow <sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: OUR REF: SNM19D203972-GBH1386P-TKL - FW: Direct Settlement - Accident
involving GBH1386P (01 : CT1 - TBA) AND S5LQ7424H (TP : LKK REF - CCE/CTI19014871/Kea3) on 16/08/2019

Your ref : SNM19D203972-GBH1386P-TKL
Dear Sirs,

We refer to the above matter.



« The accident occurred when our insured rear ended third party vehicle. We are of the opinion that BOLA scenario 27 is
applicable for this matter. Liability is not in our insured's favour.

We did clarify with insured the nature of the accident and he's aware that NCD (if any) would be affected.

We seek your approval to offer repairer " WEI LEE MOTOR WORKS" at 53,146.45 (all-in).

The summary Is as follows: -

Amount Claimed Amount Revised

1. Cost of Repairs (with GST) 54,923.71 % 2,889.00
2. Loss of Use (5days x S80) S 400.00 5 250,00 (Sdays x 550)
3. LTA Search Fee 5 7.45 5 7.45

Total $3,146.45

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal,

For your approval please.

Thank You.

Bes! Regords

Asher Sng | Coe Hondle

LEK Aulo Consuftants Pe Lid

phone: &84 [-4051 | emol: gihersng@ikoulo.com | fox &741-4108

Bl 51 Paya Ubl Incusidcd Park. Ubl Avanue 1, #02-25 | 5[408933)

From: Tan Kah Leong <KahLeong. Tan@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 2 October 2019 2:23 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupe| @ |kkauto.com>

Cc: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com=>
Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D203972-GBH1386P-TKL - FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBH1386P (Ol : CT1 -
TBA) AND SLO7424H (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CT119014871/Kea3) on 16/08/2019

Dear Shu Pei,
We refer to your email below
Attached is our insured's GIA report for your necessary actions

Please keep us posted on the status of the claim



* Thank you.

Regards

Tan Kah Leong
Assistant Executive
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance [Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 078808
DID: (BB) B3B8 6193 | F [BS) 6222 1033

W: www sg ontaiping.com | FB: www. facebook comichinataipingsa/

Discharmar. This a~miail and any fles transmifted with @ & imiended ondy for the amed ecpmnts and may confsin configemtal information  Any
uirauthanzed disclosine, uss or dissemination of this message, aithar m whoks or partial s prohibied I you ame nal ihe ifended meiplent please nilify
the sender imvmediately. Please aslebo the e-mai and any copsas of it thareafioer

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, September 26, 2019 12:22 PM

To: Tan Kah Leong <Kah T Lntalping.com>

Ce: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@|kkauto.com=;
Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D203972-GBH1386P-TKL - FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBH1386P (O : CTI -
TBA) AND SLQ7424H (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI19014871/Kea3) on 16/08/2019

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.
Kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA repart for our necessary action.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email shupel@ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Bk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, 802-25 | 5(408933)

From: Mel Kwan (LEKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 10 September 2019 8:32 AM

To: Tan Kah Leong <Kahleong.Ta ntalping.com>

Cc: C5 ATeam <cs-a@lkkauto.com=; Admin A <admin-a@ lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.coms;
Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.coms

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D203972-GBH1386P-TKL - FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBH1386P (Ol : CTI -
TBA) AND SLQ7424H (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CT119014871/Kea3) on 16/08/2019

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.



Kindly let us have a copy of your insured'’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pie Lid

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MelEwani@lkkaitocom | fax: 67414108
Bik 51, Pava Ui Industrial Parle Uhi Avenue 1. #02-25 | S{408694)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 6 September, 2019 5:30 PM

To: Tan Kah Leong <Kahleong.Ta .cntaiping.com>

Cc: CS A Team <cs-a@Ilkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D203972-GBH1386P-TKL - FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBH1386P (Ol : CT] -
TBA) AND SLQ7424H (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI19014871/Kea3) on 16/08/2019

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Thank you.

Hest Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 ooss | email: MeiEwan@ |kkaute.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Uhi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1. #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping. com:

Sent: Monday, 26 August, 2019 10:58 AM

To: Chong Boon 5en <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.coms>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chee So Chow
<sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan @Ikkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
<AsherSng@|kkauto.com>; Tan Kah Leong <Kahleong Tan(@sg cntaiping com>

Subject: OUR REF: SNM19D203972-GBH1386P-TKL - FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBH1386P (Ol : CT| -
TBA) AND SLO7424H (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CT119014871/Kea3) on 16/08/2019

Dear Boan Sen,
Please assist LKK.

Note : officer in charge — Kah Leong 63896193.

Regards,
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079908



» T:(B5) 63896116 | F (65} 82247175

W: www sg cntaiping.com | FB: www facebook com/chinataipingsg’ | WeChat: A F %1% Taiping SG

Disclarmer This e—rmail and any les fransmilted wilh i & ntasded cnly for the namad mcpents and may coifam confidential informalion. Any
unauthonzed disclosure. use or digsemination of this message, aiffes in whoie or patial, @ probibited (1 you am nol the mended recpmnd, pisase molfy
fhe sendes immediately, Please deiele the e-mal and any copves of i thermsafter

From: Mel Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan @lkkauto.com|
Sent: Friday, 23 August, 2019 5:52 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsd -2 ing.com>
Cc: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.coms>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBH1386P (Ol : CT1 - TBA) AND 5LQ7424H (TP : LKK REF -
CCB/CTI19014871/Kea3) on 16/08/2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE”
SAVEAS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle SLQ 7424H at M/s Wei Lee Motor Works - Sin Ming on a WP basis and TP repairer
proposed for a direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
« TP GIA report
» estimated cost of repair
« preliminary advice

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank vou.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultunts Pte Lud

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@|kkauto.com | fux: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Indostrial Parck, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S(408a:33)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit hitp://'www.svmanieccloud.com
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& % A
WEI LEE MOTOR WORKS

HLOCK 9 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE #01-32,
SINGAPORE 5756844,
TEL: 8456 9830 « FAX: A458 0126 « EMAIL: welleamotarworks@gmail.com
Businass Fagn No: 288436/00J

11,0CT 2019

China Taiping Insurance (5] PL

Attn: Motor claim dept-3" party claim
Claiming against your insurad vehicle no: GBH1386P
Accident involving vehicle no:SLO7424H/GBH1386P
ON 16/08/2019 AT Sinaran Dr

Dear officer incharge
We are the warkshap for the owner of vehicle no: SLO7424H

Regarding the claim for the case above, this is a liatility clear case considering that your client’s
vehicle collided into the rear portion of our client’s vehicle.

The claim for vahicle No: SLO7424H as fallow:-

Cost of repair to SLQ7424h 5 2,700.00 finalised with your surveyor
G5T ™% 5 1B5.00
Loss of use S 400.00 SBOx5d
LTA search fes S 7.45
5 3,296.45

Enclosed with all the necessary document for your referénce.

Kindly let us have your reply soonest possible.

Thank you.



LML AVE LoAOL2E PAYA L I INDLSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPUORE JUS933 TEL £ 065 62563300 FAN 2 (00367414106

Our Rel: CC&/CTII9014871/Kead

11 OCT 2019

WONG.S ENGINEERING

10 ANSON ROAD

#05-16 INTERNATIONAL PLAZA
SINGAPORE 079903

Dear SirfMadam.
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH 1386F AND SLQ 7424H ON 16/08/2019

We refer 1o the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under
the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, hiability 1s down aganst us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement. please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further gueries.

Yours faithfully,

e

Asher

Case Handler
DID: 6841 6051
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: ashersng @ lkkauto.com

c.c.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre Ltd
{Muotor Claims Dept)



AUTHORIZATION TO ACT

. 0 | |
] L4 {f?flamft P (“the third party claimant’)
o 6rA app Themson Road (address),
owner of XA }Q}ll—’f—] (vehicle  no.) hereby  authorize

wpl lee dotor wioks

(“the workshop") to act for me with respect to. my claim fr.':ir'repair costs and/or
o MHEH ot was

rental and/or loss of use (“claim”) for my vehicle no.
n f{’{’%{-}m? (date) along

damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred 0
3 . -
Sinaran Dy (location)

@bt 1256 F (“the accident")

involving vehicle no/s

| further authorize the workshop to settle the above mentioned claim in a
manner that they deem fit and the workshop Is further authorized to receive

payment furtherto settiement of my claim with payment cheque/s being made in

favour of the workshop.

| further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my
behalf Is on a without prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar
as the driver/owner/insurers of the other v.?hfcia!s is concerned.

‘

Date this 1§ dayof ™7 (month) 20 (vear)

— e

" ; ~— ;f;;."
Signed by “the third party claimant”

Signed by “the workshop®



Policy No @ DMCVSNI0DEZZI1900 Claim Mo : SKM19D203572
Claimant : XM LEASING FTE. LTD.
Amount t 5%3,146.45

DOLLARS THREE THOUSAND OME HUNDRED FORIY SIX AND CENTS
FORTY FIVE ONLY.

I/We agres to accept the above mentioned amount to be pald to mefus in full &
final settlement of all claims, costs & disbursements for injuries / damages
sustained By me/ua through an accident inveolwving

Claimant Vehicle No. : SLO 7424H

ifnsured Vehiecle M. : GBH 13BEP
Date of Loss : 16/08/2019
Flace of Accident : SINARAN DR

IN CONSIDERATION of the payment made zo ma/us of the aforementionsd sum by
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE |[SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD., I/We agres absalutely to
discharge CHIMA TAIPING INSURAMCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD. and/for

Insured Namsa 1 WWB ENGINEERING
Driver Hams : POW BDON SANG

from all claims, pressant or future in respect of all loss, injury or damage
sustained by me/us arising out of the sald accident.

1 acknowledge that cthis payment im made without admission of Lliability aon the
part of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LID.

i1} General Damages 5%
i2) Cost af Hspair/Esxsess 5% 2,889.00
{3) Loas of Use/Rental/Escning 55 250.00
(4) GIA/Police Reports/

Investigation Results/Search Fees 5% 7.45
(%) Medical Reports/Expsnsas 55
(&) Burvey Fees/Towlng Fee/Disbursamant 53
{7} Coat including Disbursement 55

AL s e Vel e e TR T B B L s e e 3,146.45

Claimant Mame : MH LEASING PTE. LTD. MRIC No : 201611813C

WA\ Y

Signature | Date :




] i
& 4‘] E ? BLOCK 8 SIN MING INSDUSTRIAL ESTATE #01-28,
SINGAPORE 575644,

TEL: 6450 9830 FAX: 6458 0128

WE|] LEE MOTOR WORKS TR . 30004

TAX |
NO WL03853
M/S China Taiping Insurance (S) PL Vehicle No - SLQ7424H
Date : 11-0CT-2018
Quantity Particulars Unit Price  Amount Incl.
GST
SLQT424H
1.00 Accident involving vehicle no:
SLQ7424H/GBH1386P
DOA: 16/08/2019
1.00 Cost of repair for vehicle no: SLQ7424H $2,700.00 $2,700.00
Lump sum repaired as recommended by your
appointed surveyor,LKK Auto Consultants
1.00 GST 7% $189.00 $189.00
Total Amount Incl. GST $2,889.00
Standard Rate GST Amount [7.00%) $189.00
Total Amount Before GST £2,700.00

" Uaer Ot 11, 3018 188 10of1



M Gmall karen Seah <weileemolorworks@gmail.com>

Notification of Successful Vehicle Insurance Search for Receipt No.: ITNET-
00000-190819-002660

1 message

LTA <LTA-VTL@)Ita gov.sg> Mon, Aug 19, 2019 at 4:53 PM
To: weileemotorworks@gmail.com

Land Transport Authority

Notification of Successful Vehicle Insurance Search for Receipt
No.: ITNET-00000-190819-002660

Dear SirfMadam

We wish to inform you that your transaction on "Enquire Vehicle Insurance Particulars”
performed on 18 Aug 2018 was successful and the Receipt No. Is ITNET-00000-190818-
002660.

2. The detalls of the search resulls ara as follow:
Vehicle No. Search Date Search Time Search Result

GBH1386P 16 Aug 2019 17:10:00 E‘I['I_lENGLNHNG INSURANCE (SINGAPORE)

3. Please contact our customer sarvice officers at tel . 1800-CALL LTA (1800-2255 582) should you
reguire further assistance.

4. Visit www. onemotoring.com.sg for more information, or go 1o www Ita.gov sg/feedback if you
have any feedback. This email is auto-generated, please do not reply to this email,

5. Thank you.

If you are not the intended recipient of this communication, please delate it

As it may contain confidential or official information, do not retain it or disclose the contents to any
person as it may be an offence under the Official Secrets Act,



