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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid conegne 1sssomiser)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto,com;assignments@lkkauto.com

To; AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid. From: LKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid
AlG Bullding §1 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25
78 Shenton Way #08-18 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 079120 Singapore 408933

Attn: Date: 23 Aug 2019

Preliminary Advice

Vahicle No 1 SLTE43Y Accident Datle . 18/08/2019
Make L AUDI A4 Palicy No. - 1700064 761-01
Assignment Date  : 23/08/2018 Excess : 5%0.00
Date of inspection  : 23/08/2019 Est. Duration of Repair  : 3 days
Inspaction Al : Premium Automobiles Pte Lid (UBI)

55 Ubi Road 1

Singapore 408699

Point of Impact / General Description of Damages
The vehicle sustained impact / damages front partion and parts claimed are consistent to the accident.

Repairer's Estimate (Gross) 58 8,166.00
Revised Amount S5 2,895.00
Check ltems (Estimated) 155 200.00
Total =1 2,895.00
Lump Sum Repair 55

Total Loss Consideration

New for Old Value 'S5

Pre-Accident Value S5 113,000.00
COE | PARF Rebale 88 60,034.00
Salvage Value ‘8§

Margin for Repair S5 52,966.00

Ramarks

{ X ) The vehicle is repairable at our adjusted amounl. We have also confirmed excess and policy coverage.
Kindly let us have your authorisation.

{ j  The vehicle is uneconomical to be repaired, you are advised to invite tender for the wreck,

{ ) Other comments :



Shirlﬂ Hiew !LKI( hutﬂ!

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 23 October 2019 11:33 am

To: jiayee yap@premiumauto.com.sg; Adrian Ling (LKKAuto); CS A Team; Admin A; SUR
Cc: ‘Boo seng yak'; ‘Carrine Leong'; '‘Chang Chee Sing'

Subject: RE; FINAL REVISION - SLTE43Y - OD AIG - SURVEYED 23 AUG 19

Dear lia Yee,

Confirmed final fig $2484.40 @ 3 days of repairs before excess 5 600/- & GST.

Kindly expedite the discharge voucher and tax invoice to us for close case.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handlars
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall: Sur@ Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, 802-25 | 5(408533)

From: jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg <jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 17 October 2019 5:42 pm

To: Adrian Ling (LKKAuto) <adrianling@Ikkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Boo seng yak' <boojohnny@gmail.com>; 'Carrine Leong' <carrine.leong@premiumauto.com.sg>; 'Chang Chee Sing’
<claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: FINAL REVISION - SLT643Y - OD AIG - SURVEYED 23 AUG 19

Hi Adrian and all,
Revised estimate is attached.
Please confirm repair cost of 52484.40 @ 3 days of repairs.

Your early closure is well appreciated.

Thanks & Best Regard
lla¥ee Yap
Clairms Administratos



Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd meg s msianw
LS Ubi Road 1 Boad Singapore 4086599
p. +65 6388 2323 d, +B65 6768 9925 f.+&5 6841 1183

e jlayee yapEpramiumautocomsg w. www audl.com.sg
Audl Showroom, Audl Centre 2B1 Alexandra Road Singapore 15'_?"]33 p. +65 6836 2223

Email Disclaimer

This ermall, ingluding ary sttachment, & confidential @and may also be privileged

1 you have received i in arror, please notily us immedibtely by reply e and then detete this message from your ik
Plpase do mol copy B of usa it for eny purpase, or disclose s contents or gy sitachment Lo Ay ol person Thank yiu



8/28/2019 Mail - Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) - Outlook

Re: OD CLAIM FOR SLT 643 Y ON 18/8/2019

Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)
Wed 28/8/2019 10:47 AM

To; Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>
Ce SUR <sur@®lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ilkkauto.com>

B 1 attachments (695 KB)
ESTIMATE pdf;

Dear Syafig,
As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SLT 643Y (Excess $ 600/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at
Tel: 6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from nsurance
company before completion of the repair.

“Our client reserve their right_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Thank you.,

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@|kkauto com | fax: 6156-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 22 August 2019 2:01 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D [LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR 5LT 643 Y ON 18/8/2019

Dear all,
Attached is the estimate for your kind reference.

Best Regards,

Syafiq
Claims Admin Assistant

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 188802271W)

55 Ubl Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p. +B5 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9911 f. +65 6841 1183

e. claims@premiumauto.com.sg W. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223

hitps:fioutiaok office comimail/deeplink Pversion=2018081802.10&papoutva=1



B/2ar2019 Merimen e-Claims

View Received Message

This mall is associated with :
*SLT643Y (21676855025G)
oo
Aug 18 2019 3;30PM

[FAMN YUAN WET]
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

[Reply || Reply Al || Mark as Unreaa | Print Message | | Delete Message | | Farward |

Erem AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (AIG_SG), sent an 28/08/2019 10:33 AM,
Ta LKK_HQ
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$2695,00) - SLT643Y - Claim Handler: Mithoo Singh, Aashweenjeat Kaur

Approved: 2695,00:Re-inspection to be dane for damage check and supplemantary items / labour,

'DOCUMENTS SUMMARY
There are No docuUMEnts,

hitpe-/isingapore. merimen comiclaims/index cfmHusebox=5VCmaildfuseaction=dsp_viewBmode=1 Bilinboxid=1530857&iDomainid=11&i0bjld=7... 12



> Back to OneMaotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owiner 1D Type:

Owiner 10

Vehicle Detalls

Vehicle Na-

Vehiche to be Exportad:
Intended Dereglstration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colaur:
Manutacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis Na..
Mazimum Power Qutput:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Dare:
Transter Count;

Actual ARF Paia:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility;

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount!
Intended COE Rebate Detalls
COE Expiry Date;

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paidi

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The infermation contained herein s correct as at 23 Aug 2019

PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

Singapore NRIC
5478

SLT&43Y

No

23 Aug 2019

AUDI

AL 1ATFSISTRONIC
White

2017

CVNO42140
WALIZZZFa4IAD15845
1100 kW (147 txhp)
$32.721.00

16 Oct 2017

160ct 2017

1]

42781300

Yes
150ct 2027
$20,859.00

15 Oct 2027

B - Car sbove 1600cz or $7kW (130bhp)

10

$48.109.00
$39,17500
$460.034.00
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T

Name of Policyholder  : FAN YUAN WEI Vehicle No. SLTB43Y

Period of Insurance 16 Oct 2018 To 15 Oct 2019 Policy No 1700064761-01

Engine No. : CVNDL4180 Endorsemaent No

Chassis No. : WALIZZZF44JAD18865 Issued Date 06 Oct 2018
ABOUT THE COVER

| Make/Modet ALDI A4 1.4 TFS1 S tronic
Engine Capacity/Tonnage : 1.385.00 CC Sum Insured = Market Value First Year of Registravon 2017
Diriver Restnction P8, Off Peak Car - No Insunng with COE/PARF - Yes

FPerson or Classes of Persons Entitted to Drve®

A} The Bijia yiaka
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Vi Pl W) Dty B0 SO0 ke 0F 50 D00 @8 nespenances Dvesr Epcss” M0 |0 TR @ O 7 o0 BalTOria Drves | NEm OF WITTHED FEL S TN o yREE T ERDETETIE

Age Condition 35 years old and above
Limitation as lo usa"

juw Erry b Al SOMAERE Bl pledsar® [uEESEE @ B e FrdyMoer s b mesl
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sed e [T Rasdngs

EXCESS
Section 1
Fim - $0 Cwn Damage - 600 Thed - 50 Fioog Cower - 30

Section 2
Fropeety Damage - 50

Windecrean 1100

Mamed Driver and EXCESS ishers sppicanis)

FAM TLIAN WE| - 8500 10w Cemage |

APPROVED REPORTING CENTRES/AUTHORISED REPAIRERS (FOR CLAIMS RELATED REF

T Al Cuminress Sefviin Covmia SOl 58 Libe Ploed | Segeocos S04 ENSEI127

For ot Approved Beporting CemiresRic Authoised Aepsimess. pisase Contact ouf Jd-Rour acoses! emergency Roning &l «8% 0538 f000 dhematvey. pou mily meier i 460 wabai wes 84 0O 8
o AEG ST Mol Ape Simply samnch 5o oo A0 S5 from (Tunes o Doaogs My

Hire Purchase Company/Employers Loan; Standard Chartered Bank (Singapore) Limited

¥l Pty oyt T poioy 59 wiech s Camhicam of insrancs mulaing & ] 0 SCEOiiEnos wi e ronons of P oo YehmeTred Farry Rl el Companaanon A [Cap THE), Fan oo
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PREMIUM LEASING -CHB

20 ALEXANDEA ROAD AUDN CUSTOMER SERVICE CENTRE

SINGAPORE 150638 AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.
Underwritten by AIG Asia Pacific imsurance Pie. Lid AUTHDRISED REPRESENTATRE

i 1 Ak



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408628
Tet | 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183
Emad: Nora khaif@premiumauto.com.sg / caims@ipremiumauto. com.sg

Telefax

Estimate :  Accident Repairs
Workshop : UbiRoad 1

Contact No : 63662323

Fax No : 68411183

Reference :  PA/OD/1004/2019/TNS
Date +  22-Aug-19

Vehicle NOT in workshop. Kindly arrange for survey.

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
78 Shenton Way

#07-16 AIG Building

Singapore 079120

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept
Tel: 56841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315

Owner's Name
Address

Telephone
Type of Claim

Policy No.

Vehicle No
Model Code
Model / Year
Engine No
Chassis No
Mileage

Date In
Liability
Excess Cost
Estimated By
Accident Date
Place of Accident

& @8 s8 @4 B E® S8 A8 a8 @8 @& T

MR, FAN YUAN WEL

BLE 1304 LORONG 1 TOA PAYOH
#08-510

Singapore 311130

B1BO7326

Own damage Claim

1700064761-01

SLT643Y

Audi A4 Sedan 1. 4 TF5I 5
16710/2017

CVN D44160
WALZZZF44)A019865

lahnny Boo / Allan Wu
18-Aug-19
TOA PAYOH STADIUM



\utomobiles
, Singapore 408695
3 Fax!684]1 11832

slefax

r Accident Vehi

s/n Nature of Jobs

Estimated Surveyor's
Charges Recommendation

To remove , check and reinstall front wire harness
1 for headlights, horns, outside temperature sensor
and headlight washer assy.

To dismantle and renew front bumper. Re-organise
2 crash management components, Reinstall all parts
removed.

3 Torespray front bumper

4 To carry out diagnostic check,
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES

S/IN S 36000 .~

$ 1,05000 57

S 900,00 55

S/N & 152.00
$ 2,502.00




- -
Premium Automobiles
55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408694
Tel 63662323 Fax:6841 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SLT 643 Y

S/N  Parts Description S/Nett Remarks
1 FRONT BUMEPR '&T‘-"‘ 3 1,946.00+
2 FRONT BUMPER FIXING PARTS $ 258.00-
3 FRONT BUMPER GRILLE - CENTER | A% ~ s 178.00"
4  FRONT BUMPER CLOSING ELEMENT I s 191.00
5  RADIATORGRILLE ¢ pwleod s 1,053.00 — 1
6  FRONT BUMPER AIR GUIDE GRILLE -RH ) s 123.00 »
7 FRONT BUMPER FOAM FILLER PIECE $ 113.00 +
8  FRONT BUMPER CARRIER A s 733.00 A
9 FRONT BUMPER COVER ~ $ 116.00 A
10 CAUTION SIGN NEC $ 13.00 ¥
11 STICKER FOR AIR CONDITIONER %}H - NEC $ 7.00 4
12 FRONT BUMPER BRACKET ), $ 125.00 4
13 FRONT BUMPER SUPPORT - LH / RH 2 s 52.00 *
14 HORN - RH LOW TONE S 262.00 /
15 HORN SPRING SHACKLE - RH g 5 26.00 4
16 HEADLIGHT WASHER LIFT CYLINDER - RH| : 192,00 -
17 RADIATOR AIR GUIDE GUIDE - RH S 25.00
18 RADIATOR INNER DUCT S 11004
19 rRONTNO.PLATE Mo SIN S 40.00 /
20  SUNDRIES st N S 20000 /
TOTAL SPARE PARTS CHARGES : $5,664.00
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES $ 2,502.00
GRAND TOTAL $8,166.00
All charges are not inclusive of GST
Legend Remarks (0K) = Approved, Remarks (X) = Not approved

Spare parts are Specal Nett



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubl Road 1, Singapore 408699

Tel : 6366 2323 Fax : 6841 1183
LK Auto Congultanty hence no!
the Repairer of the following:
«Ta w m“
* T0 Sispley damaged :
Telefax * Parts prces ey -.-:E‘..';".;.".:
* Thied party survey s on & "Wilhout Pre,
: ;:hw TOdieanons) i aowes
- T ——
Name : f..fn_!;w [_j
Acknowsesgen by
Surveyed Date : o 3{ Bﬂ’f‘i Sqgnanse -
Authorised Date : Dme:
Excess Cost -
Liability -
Remarks A futlasid ; 03 ?7&.
Please Note : This estimate is based on wisual inspection of the affected vehicle.

Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly.
For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Norah Khai at

Tel:6768 9828 for appaintment.

Yours faithfully,
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Johnny Boo Allan Wu
Body Repair Manager Claims Consultant




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408669

Tel 6388 2323 Fax: 6841 1123

Emall. Nora khalf@premiumauto com sg / claimz@premiumauto.com. sg

Telefax

Estimate ; Accdent Repairs
Workshop ! UbiRoad 1

Conlact No . 6366 2323

Fax No : 68411183
Reference H PA/ODM 0042018 TNS
Date  22-Aug-18

Vehicle NOT in workshop. Kindly arrange for survey,

AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
78 Shenton Way

#07-16 AlG Building

Singapore 079120

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept
Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315

Owner's Name : MR FAN YUAN WEI
Address :  BLK 130A LORONG 1 TOA PAYOH
#08-310

:  Singapore 311130
Telephone 1 B1807325
Type of Claim :  Own damage Claim
Policy No. 1700064761-01
Vehicle No : SLTe43Y
Model Code :  Audi A4 Sedan 14 TFSI S
Model | Year T enorMmT
Engine No :  CWVN D44180
Chassis No 1 WAUZZZF44JA015865
Mileage :
Date In :
Liability P
Excess Cost HEE
Estimated By ¢ Johnny Boo / Allan Wu
Accident Date :  18-Aug-18
Place of Accident :  TOAPAYOH STADIUM



Automobiles

, Singapore 408659
13 Fax: 68411183

zlefax

for Accident Vehicle SLT643 Y

Estimated Surveyor's
Sin Nature of Jobs Charges Recommendation

To remove , check and reinstall front wire harmess for

1 headlights, horns, outside temperature sensor and SN & 360.00 360.00
headlight washer assy.
To dismantle and renew front bumper. Re-organise

2 crash management components. Reinstall all parts $ 1,050.00 500.00
removed.

3 To respray front bumper s 800.00 550,00

4 To carry out diagnostic check. S/IN § 182.00 192.00
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES $ 2,502.00 1,602.00

)




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubl Road 1, Singapore 408659
Tel - 6386 2323 Fax . 6841 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SLT 643 Y

ma Prices
SIN Parts Description SiNett Remarks

1 FRONT BUMEPR $ 1.646.00

2  FRONT BUMPER FIXING PARTS $ 258.00

1 FRONT BUMPER GRILLE - CENTER $ 178.00

4  FRONT BUMPER CLOSING ELEMENT $ 191.00

5  RADIATOR GRILLE $ 105300 § 842.40

&  FRONT BUMPER AIR GUIDE GRILLE - RH $ 123.00

7 FRONT BUMPER FOAM FILLER PIECE $ 113.00

8  FRONT BUMPER CARRIER $ 733.00

8  FRONT BUMPER COVER $ 116.00

10 cAUTION SIGN NEC § 13.00

1 STICKER FOR AIR CONDITIONER NEC § 7.00

12 FRONT BUMPER BRACKET $ 125.00

13 FRONT BUMPER SUPPORT - LH / RH 2§ 52.00

4 LORN - RH LOW TONE $ 262.00

15 HORN SPRING SHACKLE - RH $ 26.00

18 HEADLIGHT WASHER LIFT CYLINDER - RH s 182.00

17 RADIATOR AIR GUIDE GUIDE - RH $ 25.00

18 RADIATOR INNER DUCT $ 11.00

19 ERONT NO. PLATE SIN § s000 ° 40.00

20 SUNDRIES 5 200.00
TOTAL SPARE PARTS CHARGES $5,664.00 3 882.40
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES s 250200 §  1,602.00
GRAND TOTAL $8.166.00 §  2484.40
All charges are nol inclusive of GST
Legend : Remarks (OK) = Approved, Remarks (X} = Not approved

Spare parts am Special Nat



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408630
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax : 6841 1183

Telefax

Name

Surveyed Date
Authorised Date
Excess Cost
Liability
Remarks

Please Note

Yours faithfully,

This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle
Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall inform you accardingly.

For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Norah Khai al
Tel:6768 9828 for appointment

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Johnny Boo

Body Repair Manager

Allan Wu
Claims Consultant



Premium Automobiles

AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd Norah Kha
78 Shenton Way 6768 9911
#07-16 AIG Building H841 1183
Singapore (79120 Nora khai@ premiumauto.com sg
Attn: Motor Claims Dept Body & Paint Dept
YrRef: SLT 643 Y PA/OD/1004/2019/NH

20 Nov 2019
Dear Sir,

RE: INSURANCE CLAIM FOR SLT 643 Y, Audi A4 SEDAN 14 TFSI S-
TRONIC.

With reference to the above-mentioned vehicle. no. SLT 643 Y, claimant,
Mr. Fan Yuan Wei, please find the related document per attached.

1. A copy of the Original invoice no. 8501449] — SS 2.016.31.
2. A copy of the Discharge Voucher duly signed by client.

Based on the above document, we would appreciate vou could expedite the
pavment soonest possible.

If you require any further clarification, please do not hesitate to contact me at
6768 991 1.

Regards

This is a computer-generated document. No signature is required.

Nomh Khai
Claims Dept

Enel
AlG-SLTH43 Y

from
Telaphone +55-
Telefax  +85-
EMail

Dur department
Our Rel

Your Ref

Date

total pages

Pramium Automobiles Pte Lk
Shaowroom

8 Leng Kee Road

Singapore 158000
Telephone (65) 6566 1111
Teietax  (65) 6471 3733

Service & Pans Cenlres
55 Ubi Rd 1

Singapore 408689
Talephone (65) 6336 2323
Telefax  (65) 684 11183



Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Audi Centre Singapore Alexandra Service Centre Boervice Centre ustomer Servica
I8 Amsaruira Road I8\ Alpsarves Foad :gumum1 Eﬂhﬂwﬁl ENSE 0N
w*%m W'%m wm #4-hour Breakdown Sevos SETW 1733
m-r“‘ T MT“H—-Mim h'wmf‘% Email SumTDe CArRlTYETTILAS SO N
INS TAX INVOICE
Page 1 14:42 Company Reg. No. 199802271W
GET HReg. No. 195990227IW
ALG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PIE LTD Invoice No: 85014451 Account: RooDE IT 01

AIG BUILDIKG

MOTUR CLAIM DEPT

18 SHENTON WAY Date 18/11/2019 AIG ASIA PACIFIC IMBUBANCE PTE LTD
#0T=16 MOTOR CLAIM DEPT
STHGAFORE 075120 07912( R AIC BUILDING
s Gl Order : SLTOE43Y 76 SHEWTON WAY
#07-1%
Term 30 SINGAPORE 079120
Regn No: sctoessy v 347810 Regn Date: 1e/10/2017 Mileage: 30813 WIF No.: &4544
Model: A4 SEDAN 1.4 TFSI § tronic Chassis: WADZZZF44IAD1SEES Engine: cvn 044160 Dept: o
You have been assisted by - UB=Tony Foong i 33 |
Details Qty Unit Price Amount
8§ SUBLET M: 40,00 1.00 40,00
TO SUPPLY VENICLE NUMBER PLATE
g e M: A8EE -600.00 1.00 -&00,00
Insurance Excess/liability
5 BODYNORE M3 160.00 1.00 3&0, 00
TO REMOVE,CHECE AND MEIHSTALL FRACMT WISE
HARNESS FOR HEADLIGHTS, HORMS, OUTSIDE
TEMPEHATUSE SENSOR AND HEADLIGHT WASHER
ASSY
s BODYWORE M: 500. 00 1.00 500,00
TO DISMANTLE AND RENEW FRONT BUMPER.
REORGANISE CRASH MAMAGEMENT COMPONENTS.
BEINMSTALL ALL PARTS REMOVED
5 BODYWORE M: 550.00 1.00 550.00
TO RESPFAY FRONT BUMPER
5 BODYWORE M: 152,00 1.00 182,00
TO CARMY OUT DIACHOSTIC CHECE
% ARWOESIEST 3FT GRILLE Less 020% 1,00 10583.00 B4Z.40
Parts B42.40 Sub-Total 1, 8084.40
Labour G.oa ATaM0g
Sublat 1,842.00 AP P 1 et
Menus 0.00 o ) 7% GST e
Lubricant 0.00 k‘_"i:s g
\:,J Grand Total Fi016:31

a2

1efu

Received by

For & on behalf of

Premium Automobiles Pre Lid




Premium Automobiles

Telefax

AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid Norah Kha from

78 Shenton Way H768 9828 Telephone +85-
#07-16 AIG Building fR41 1183 Telefax  +85
Singapore 079120 Mobile  +65.
Motor Claims Depit Body Repair Our departmant
YrRef: SLTH43 Y Your Claim Ref

PA/OD/ 1004/ 201%EH ~ Our Ref
19 September 2019 Date

1 total pages
RE: CLAIM - OWNER'S SATISFACTION/DISCHARGE VOUCHER

Premium Automaobilles Pl Lid

Showroom
Make & Maodel H Audi A4 Sedan | 4 TFSI S 9 Leng Kee Road
Vehicle Chassis No, WAUZZZFHIAGI 9865 fm :55, BSBE 1111

Tealei 65) 8471 3733
Vehicle Regn No. 1 SLT 643 Y s

Service & Paris Canir
Vehicle Mileage £ 30915 KM &% Ul Road 1 =

Singapote 408600
Vehicle Owner : Mr. Fan Yuan Wei T;mhunu {B5) B36E 2323

Telaf 5 1
Certificate No : 170006476101 nx  (65) 6841 1183

Own Damage Excess : 642,00

Accident Date ] 18/R/2019

Place : Toa Payoh Stadium

Repair Cost : ss 063

WIP No. 2 64544

Repairer's Name - Premium Automobiles Pre Lid

I/'We certify that the vehicle has been fully repaired 10 my entire sabsfaction and that
payment of the repairer’s charges that are claimable under the policy will be deemed in
full and final settlement of my claim.

-—-—'—':"__'_,__-'_":..-.‘
Owner / Insured Signature e
Time s 1l &Sz, -
Date H 20 [ 1 \ A

MSCHARGE VOUCHER- AW - SLT 43 Y



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 1

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING

Case | MNotified | EstSubmitted | AdjAssigned = Ad)Rpt | Ad)Sumitted | [s Authed  Status
I8 Aug 2019 | | 23 Aug 2009 532,484,440 S51.4B4.40 Pending for Survey
Makn 15:12 Bait Pstimates || view fipt | | Report
£dit asj Bt | Cancei Case |

== [Created by insurer]
(FAM YUAN WEL, [D: 581215478, Tel +6581807326, Email: JOHN. TANGOUTLOOK.COM

| $8/08/2019 15:00 - ;59
SLTG43Y Date of Loss: [22 Manths and X Davs From LTA
Reg Date [Man ¥r)]

(0D / 216768550256 Policy/Cover Note No.: 170006476101 (Comprenensive)
| |Eapess: ) | 54600.00

| Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (UBT) 55 Uni fload 1, 4086549 Ubi - Tel: G676A9EI8/9AZT/F311

| AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (5G) - Tel: 65-6419-3000 ... [Handled by Mithoao Singh,

| Asshweanjest Kaur] Asshweenjestkaur.Mithoosingh@laig.com ==l
Ltd (HQ) - Tel 6256-3561 ... [Handied by ADRIAN LING] .. [Final Rpt

LEK Auto Consultants Pte
dueO3fo8/2me) . ——
|FAM YUAN WEI (38 { Male) , WRIC: SB1215478, Tel: +6581807325 Email: JOHN. TANGDUTLDOK.COM |

View 4l |

' AIG_SG (28/08/7015); Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved [5$2695.00) - SLTS43Y - Claim Handiar: Mithoo Singh...
'+ AIG_SG (28/08/2019). SLTE43Y / OD / 18/08/2019 / Coverage & Excess update

= .
ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS view Al |  sesrecn Tasks | Crmats New Tase | Compiee |
Due Date  Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned Oy Complated On Created On Done?

No results

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=... 29/11/2019



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 2

Claim Documents

*SLTE43Y (21676855025G)
oD
Aug 1B 2019 3:30PM
[FAN YUAN WEI]
Premium Automoblles Pte Ltd

Upisod Docurnents | Uplosd Photos | Composs Wew Letter | upiowo vises | upiose Augio | View Useviewsr =
[Assesement Raports - 1 per page | B
Mo Finglized On LMK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) | Thumbnail | Print
| 1 23/08/1916:32 | Adjuster Immediate Advice o | | eaapTM |
Photos/images e Sewpge < | @
o | Relabel/Reorder |LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) | Thumbnail| Brint
|1 |23/0819 16:3) | General View (D | wedwc | @
7 | T3/06/19 16:33 | General View B B D | wedrs | F
3 20619 1633 General View | @ | eassrs | @
« 23/08/19 1633 | Genaral View 0 | icacwc | @
S 230019 1633 | General View O wwews | @
§ |2/08/19 16:33 | General View © iowaws | @
7 IN08/19 16:33 | General View O lcaarwc | @
B 2019 16:33 | Genersl View B | O | wedws 8
9 | 23/D8/19 16:33 | Genersl View O | asws | F
Documantation .  iperpage < | @
Mo | Aslabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - | Thumbnail | Print
1 [3Y08/1915:34 | SLY 643V GlA.pdt - PO

| 2 |33/08/19 16:34 DRIVING & CLpdf — = ——— — Load POF

|3 2W08/10 16:34 | ESTIMATE.pdf | Load POF

|4 23/10/1811:31  ESTIMATE MARKED.pdf Load POF |

|5 I%11/1910:12  WORKSHOP INVOICE _ Load POF
6 29/11/1910:12  DISCHARGE VOUCHER Load POF

Linked Accident Report Documents

-
| Assessment Reports &
(Mo [Flaslizes 0n | Premium Automebiles Pre Ltd (UB) - i| print
1 19/08/1% 15:49 | Accident Statement | .
Photos/Images | @
Mo | Finsilzed On  Premium Automabiles Pte Ltd (UBT) Print
|1 |19/08/19 1547 | Accident Phota . - o o [
2 19/08/19 15:47 Accident Phots B (1] L4
3 19/0R/19 1547 Accident Photo o |
4 10818 1547 Accident Photo - B - O wwwc | @
S 19/08/19 15:47  Accident Photo 0 oadieg | il
6 19/08/19 15:47  Accident Photo D ledies | [ |
7 190818 1547 Accldent Photo B o © | osmrc | @
8 ::II.!M.FWI!:IT Accident Phote O iivs | B
|3 1908151547 Accdent Phote @] s L 0
10 19/08/19 15:47  Accident Photo ©  loxrwc | @
11 19/08/19 1547  Accident Photo © tiedvs | 7
Dot —l e %
Wo_Finaiized On Premium Autemobiles Pte Ltd (UBI) —=——= __ Thumbnail Print|
4 AG/DB/15 1549 Skatch Plan O todrws | [F |
2 19/08/19 15:49  SketchPlan#2 O toadirs |

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp... 29/11/2019



Merimen e-Claims Page 2 of 2

Documents Checklist

DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST
“There are ne decermant checklists wnl‘lm.ml_ﬂ

Our Checklist Remaris - LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid (HG)

Show Remarks To: [ Handling Insurer
Hipte ey gre provale geiees wsg sfow 8 Yo ol AT

https:/singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc & fuseaction=dsp... 29/11/2019



Adjuster Report

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coreg e 1sssorises;

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park

Singapore 408933

Page | of 3

Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Emall: sur@lkkauto.com;assignmentsi@|kkaulo.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid. Our File No: CC3/AIG19014B889/ASFIN2
AlG Bullding, 78 Shenton Way #08-16
Singapare 079120 Date: 24/11/2018
REFERENCE
Insured/Claimant: FAN YUAN WEI Policy No: 170006476101
Date of Loss: 1B/08/2019 Nature of Claim: oD Claim No: 21676855025G
IPTI IDENTIFICATION OF VEHIC
Reg No: SLTE43Y
Make & Modal: AUDI A4, 1.4 TFSI S TRONIC [A) Engine No: CVNO44160
Reg. Date: 16/10/2017 (Man. Year: 2017) Chassis No: WAUZZZF44JA010B65
Colour: White Odometer: 29659 km
Engine Capacity: 1395 cc
Market Value/New Car  $5113,000.00
Sum Insured (55): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 205/60R16 Rear Tyre Size: 205/60R16
Front Left Side: Conlinental & mm Rear Left Side: Conlinental & mm
Front Right Side: Conltinental 6 mm Rear Right Side: Conlinental & mm
Tha above vilues represent the emairnng tyre ireeds depth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference Diff %
Parts 5,664.00 BAZ.40 4,781.60 B4 .42
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 2,502.00 1,602.00 900.00 35.97
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S§) 8,166.00 2,484 .40 5,681.60 69.58
- Excess (53) 600.00 &00.00 0.00 0.00
(5%) 7.566.00 1.884.40 5,681.60 75,09
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S%) 529.62 131.01 3\r.n 75.09
Nett Amount (55) B,085.62 2,016.31 6,079.31 75.09
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 23/08/2018
Date Inspected: 23/08/2018 Inspected At; Premium Automobiles Pte Lid (UBI)

Estimated Period of Repair: 3.0 days

55 Ubi Road 1

Singapore 408699

Adjuster: ADRIAN LING

Manager: Hiew May Fung

NOTE: This repart represents our findings at the time and place of inspection stated herein. Such inspeclion has been camed out fo the best of ow
knowiedge and bty but any offver labilty undar any other crcumstances i3 horedy axpresaly sxciuded

https://singapore.menmen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=... 29/11/2019



Adjuster Report

REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

Page 2 of 3

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

1 1 *FRONT BUMPER Repalr 1,846.00FS *-FS
2 1 *FRONT BUMPER FIXING PARTS Mol Necessary 258.00Fs ~FS
3 1 *FRONT BUMPER GRILLE-CENTER Nol Necessary 178.00FS -FS
4 1 *FRONT BUMPER CLOSING ELEMENT Mot Necessary 191.00FS “.FS
5 1 *RADIATOR GRILLE Cracked 1,053.00FS “B4240FS
B 1 *FRONT BUMPER AIR GUIDE GRILLE-RH Not Necessary 123.00FS *-FS
7 1 *FRONT BUMPER FOAM FILLER PIECE Not Necessary 113.00FS *-FS
8 1 “FRONT BUMPER CARRIER Mot Necaessary T33.00FS *-FS
] 1 *FRONT BUMPER COVER Not Necessary 116.00F3 *-FS
m1 *CAUTION SIGN Mot Necessary 13.00FS *-FS
"1 *STICKER FOR AIR CONDITIONER Mol Necessary TO0FS *.FS
1 *FRONT BUMPER BRACKET Mot Necessary 125.00FS “FS
13 2 *FRONT BUMPER SUPPORT-LH/RH Not Necessary 52.00Fs *-FS
14 1 "HORN-RH LOW TONE Nol Necassary 262.00FS *-F5
15 1 *HORN SPRING SHACKLE-RH Mol Necessary 26.00FS *-FS
18 1 *HEADLIGHT WASHER LIFT CYLINDER-RH Mot Necessary 182.00FS -FS
17 1 *RADIATOR AIR GUIDE GUIDE-RH Mol Necessary 2500Fs *-F5
18 1 *RADIATOR INNER DUCT Mol Necessary 11.00FS *-FS
19 1 *FRONT NO PLATE Mecessary 4000FS *40.00FS
20 1 *SUNDRIES Mot Necessary 20000FS *-FS
FeFranchise part S=Spohetl —

Total Parts (55)  5.664.00 882.40

Repor was unsubmitted during this print-oul.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 29/11/2019



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 3
Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscellaneous items selected.
Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour lems
1 TO REMOVE,CHECK AND REINSTALL FRONT WIRE Naw 360.00 360.00
HARNESS FOR HEADLIGHTS, HORNS, OUTSIDE
TEMPERATURE SENSOR AND HEADLIGHT WASHER
ASSY
2 TO DISMANTLE AND RENEW FRONT BUMPER.RE- New 1.050.00 500.00
ORGANISE CRASH MANAGEMENT
COMPONENTS.REINSTALL ALL PARTS REMOVED
3 TO RESPRAY FRONT BUMPER New 800.00 550.00
4 TO CARRY OUT DIAGNOSTIC CHECK New 182.00 162,00
Gross Labour Cost (S$) 2,502.00 1,602.00

[ Report was unsubmilled during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=...

29/11/2019



