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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

-
From: Ong Zi Hui <zihui_ong@sg.msig-asia.com>
Sent: Thursday, 22 August 2019 451 PM
To: assignments@Ilkkauto.com; admin-d@Ilkkauto.com
Cc: Crystal Lee
Subject: Survey Request - Manual Assigned

3rd party claims SGJ6335) DOA: 18/08/19 SKJ1968T (MSIG)

Manual Assigned

Dear LKK,
Refer to the email below, please survey the vehicle.
We'll assign via Merimen once we receive the assignment from Motor Team.

Please contact us ASAP if you cannot attend this assignment

Thank you.

Ong Zi Hui
Admin Officer, Claims Serivces
D: +65 6643 1320 | F: +65 6225 7402 | zihui_ong@sg.msig-asia.com

MSIG
MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Building, Singapore 048581 | T: +65 6220
9644 | F: +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | msig.com.sg ©

AMember of JITANRE INSURANCE GROUP

From: Helene Phua

Sent: Thursday, 22 August, 2019 4:03 PM

To: 'lohheng0308@yahoo.com.sg' <lohheng0308 @yahoo.com.sg>

Cc: Monica Chung <Monica Chung@sg.msig-asia.com>

Subject: RE: 3rd party claims SGJ6335) DOA: 18/08/19 SKJ1968T (MSIG)

Hi Danny,

Thank you for your selection.

We will proceed to assign LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd via Merimen at our end and update you upon confirmation.
Please do not contact them directly to prevent confusion.

Please be informed that our surveyor will also be conducting a post repair inspection within the stipulated timeline
under the protocol.



Have a great week ahead!

Helene Phua
Admin Assistant, Claims Services
D: +65 6594 2493 | F: +65 6225 7402 | helene_phua@sg.msig-asia.com

MSIG

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Building, Singapore 048581 | T: +65 6220
9644 | F: +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | msig.com.sg 0 @ @

AMember of BUKTANSE INSURANCE GROUP

From: Danny Loh [mailto:lohheng0308 @yahoo.com.sg]
Sent: Thursday, 22 August, 2019 2:33 PM

To: Helene Phua <helene phua@sg.msig-asia.com>
Subject: RE: 3rd party claims SGJ6335) DOA: 18/08/19 SKJ1968T (MSIG)

EXTERNAL EMAIL: Be careful when you click any links or open any attachment(s).

Hi Helene,
We prefer LKK Auto Consultants to survey the accident vehicle at our workshop.

Thanks
Danny

Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android

On Thu, 22 Aug 2019 at 11:16, Helene Phua
<helene phua@sg.msig-asia.com> wrote:

Hi Danny,

We refer to your email dated 22/08/2019.

Please choose one surveyor from the list that you wish for us to appoint to conduct the pre-repair
inspection:

1)  LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
2)  Formteam Consultancy Pte Ltd
3)  Automobile Inspection Services Pte Lid

4)  STA Inspection Pte Ltd



5) . MSIG In-House Surveyors

*This Fast-Lane settlement option is for clear-cut liability which MSIG will expedite offer @ 100% with
express payment. Priority will be given to those opted for our in-house surveyor®

To facilitate an expeditious claim settlement, we hope you are agreeable for the above surveyor to be the
SJE (Single Joint Expert).

If not, you may wish to nominate any of the 10 surveyors listed below as the SJE, depending on their
availability:

1) Kalvin Ang 6) Frankie Pang
2) Kenneth Kong 7) Ng You Han

3) Marcus Chua 8) Gary Soon

4) Henry Ng 9) Chow Bo Xiong
5) Lau Kwok Kwong 10) Axel Lee

NB:
(a) *Fastlane settlement is not applicable for cases that liability is in dispute*

(b) If both of us could not agree with each other's list of nominated SJE, we may still proceed to
appoint a motor surveyor to conduct a pre repair survey & post repair inspection within the timeline
stipulated under the NIMA protocol.

We have created a dedicated motor survey mailbox for your motor survey request and pre-repair
inspection. Moving forward, please email your survey request to motorsurvey@sqg.msig-asia.com

Thank you

Have a great week ahead!

Helene Phua

Admin Assistant, Claims Services

D: +65 6594 2493 | F: +65 6225 7402 | helene phua@sg.msig-asia.com



MSIG

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Buil
6220 9644 | F: +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | msig.com.sqg o

AMember of INANALNNE INSURANCE GROUP

From: Danny Loh [mailto:IohheanSOB@yahoo.com.sg|
Sent: Thursday, 22 August 2019 9:42 AM

To: Motor Survey <motorsurvey@sg.msig-asia.com>
Subject: Fw: 3rd party claims SKJ1986T

ding, Singapore 048581 | T: +65
®0

EXTERNAL EMAIL: Be careful when you click any links or open any attachmehi(s).

Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android

From: "Danny Loh" <lohheng0308@yahoo.com.sq>

To: "claims@sg.msig-asia.com" <claims@sg.msig-asia.com>

Cc:
Sent: Tue, 20 Aug 2019 at 13:11

Subject: 3rd party claims SKJ1986T

Hi motor claim,

we attached a 3rd party claims for SKJ1986T for your perusal.

Kind regards,



Loh Heng

Daﬁny

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE

This e-mall (including any attachments) may contain information that is privileged or confidential. The sending of this e-mail to any person other than the
intended recipient Is not a waiver of the privilege or confidentiality that attaches to it. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender
immediately delete the email and do not copy, distribute or disclose its contents.



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coRregno:19s607188R)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@Ikkauto.com;assignments@Ilkkauto.com

To: MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. From: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
4 Shenton Way 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25
#21-01 SGX Centre 2 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 068807 Singapore 408933

Attn:  Monica Chung Pei Zhen Date: 27 Aug 2019

Preliminary Advice

Insured Vehicle No : SKJ1968T

TP Vehicle No : SGJ6335J Accident Date : 18/08/2019
Make : TOYOTA COROLLA ALTIS Assignment Date : 23/08/2019
Date of Inspection  : 23/08/2019 Est. Duration of Repair : 3days
Inspection At : Loh Heng (HQ)

176 Sin Ming Drive, #03-08 Sin Ming Auto Care

Singapore 575721

Point of Impact / General Description of Damages
The vehicle sustained impact / damages front ofs portion and parts claimed are consistent to the accident.

Repairer's Estimate (Gross) :S$ 2,000.80
Revised Amount :S$ 1,316.08
Check Items (Estimated) :S$ 0.00
Total :S% 1,316.08
Lump Sum Repair :S$

Total Loss Consideration

New for Old Value :S$
Pre-Accident Value :S§
COE / PARF Rebate :S$
Salvage Value :S$
Margin for Repair :S$

Remarks
( ) The vehicle is economical/not economical for repair.

( X ) The above survey was conducted on a 'without prejudice’ basis.



4 MFA119108726 / Falcon-Air Auto Services Pie Lyt - Sim Mlimg
ENTRY DATE & TIME: 19/08/2019 15:11
SUBMITTED BY: Florence Loh Fui Fong

¥ SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report correctly the details of the acodent 1o spess ap e ciems process

2. This Form must be completed by the Policyhoiider andior e Aulorised Driver

3. Information provided must be as truthful and acourate == possible Any wilid misrepresentation or witholding of material facts may allow insurance companies to
repudiate policy liability. 1= =

4. The issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies & mot 2n admession of policy liability on the part of the insurance companies.

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for

6. This report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GiA Recosds Manasement Centre established by the General Insurance Association of Singapore (GIA) for
archiving and that copies of this report will, for a fee. be made avaiable wpon apoicaton by interested parties.

7. By the lodgement of this report to the insurers, you hereby consent o Fe archiving of this report at the centre and to copies of the report being made available

aforesaid.
 scomewtsTamwew
Date Of Report 19/08/2019 16:11
Date Of Accident 18/08/2019 13:00
Exact Location Of Accident BUGIS PLUS CAR PARK (LEVEL 3)
Country/State of Loss SINGAPORE
DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE
Vehicle Registration Number

SGJ6335J

Name Of Registered Owner FUN SIEW MOl @ YONG SIEW MOI

NRIC No S$2183290A
Email Address NOEMAIL
Mobile Phone No (LOCAL) +65-96408682

-

Alternative Phone No OTHERS-NOPHONE

Manufacturer TOYOTA
Model COROLLA ALTIS-1.6 (A)

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy

for repair to your vehicle? NO
If No, Please state action to be taken THIRD PARTY
Vehicle Category PRIVATE CAR

Name of Insurance Company INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PTE LTD

Type Of Coverage THIRD PARTY FIRE AND/OR THEFT
Flest Poiicy NO

Paolicy Number D18MPC000480

Cower Note Number

Name of Driver LOH WAI CHEOONG

NRIC No S$1302562B

Date Of Birth 07/10/1958

Occupation INDOOR

Date Of Driving Pass 311101977

Driving Experience 41 YEARS AND 9 MONTHS
Gender MALE

Mobile Number (LOCAL) +65-96408682
Fax Number

Contact Number OTHERS-NOPHONE

EMail Address LOHHENGO0308@YAHOO.COM.SG

Page 1 0of 6
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¥ Address BLXSDLOR £ TOA PAYOH #22-115
Postcode Fmoso
W.as driver an employee of the Insured’s Compamy ND
If No, Relationship of the Driver with the insuwred = SPOUSE

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own -
Vehicle =

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehide -

Type Of Accident COLLIDED INTO PARKED VEHICLE
Weather Conditions CLEAR
Road Surface DRY

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident? NO
Number of vehicles (including own vehicle)

involved in the accident @
Was any body injured in the Accident? NO
Was any injured conveyed to hospital by

ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged? YES
I have been approached by unknown person(s) NO
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

Number of Passengers (Including Driver) 0

Was the accident reported to the police?
i Yes, Please state which Police Station
Was notice of intended Prosecution given? NO

¥ Yes.against whom?

P SR SESEES W SR

refier 0 skeich plan.

Are acodent photos avaiiable for attachment? YES

Was there any video captured by Car Camera? NO

i DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1

Was There any audio recorded? NO

'Vehicle Registraion Number SKJ1968T
Vehicle Make/Model/Colour

Details Of Properties

Vehicle Category PRIVATE CAR
Name of Driver MAHESH NAIR
NRIC/Passport Number

Contact Number 98231602
Address

Postcode

Insurance Company Name
Nature Of Damage
No. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

Page 2 of 6



Date of accident: | €] #¥{20(4 Time £3:30  Location: Buaia Plwm o:wpdwh. (1evel 5)

Veh A: SGICH3D5T veh s SWI 149887 mocfpax O Weathér- Clear/dry “Rain/Wet
SKETCH PLAN \_)

e |
S — ]

f[J

DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT

1 had paviced M\J\_Vb\f\wl!, ak bw,vs Plus Shoppt./w\ Curnive
ca¥ pavie LVl 5. VAU AL WAL ntmed - " WnTn L came
'0“-‘-'“- 40 IWU\ vilwiele ,]—Jaumol a noHe on ww1 AV }VOM

W gL vin ﬂrLM's fv'om VN b AV

Vi b dnivir MYOWSLA At he had it ko .vvq velielt
W da A pmkwi biad WV\/\ Ay whitn e W)M ﬂ"OlM

ok

0. T82%L02 . malhivsh Nadr:

[Jciaim OD/TP at Falcon-Air /E-daimoonP at otherworkshop ] Reporting Only

Remarks : Please forward a copy of my efile accident report to:
My workshop :

Emall address :
ampsett | :S21BBIA0A | ALrodLin
Emaladdress ¢ AL b6 LIOY

Note: Please take note that your Insurer have 14 days timeframe for you to submit own damage claim under
you own policy. Kindly check with your own insurer for more information. /
(1} &F

+ (‘;

DECLARATION
|/We declare the foregolng particulars are true in every respecL

A |

Aém

Reporting Centre Personnel’s Signature

Policyholder's Signature Driver's Sjgnature
Date & Time: (IF &rivr is not the policyholder) Name:
Date & Time: NRIC/FIN No.:

Page 4 of 6



Q-Autornotlve Repair Services ! ‘
Accident Insurance Claims
18/08/2019
MSIG INSURANCE Ltd
Singapore
Attn. : Motor Claim Department
Re : Estimated Quotation
Vehicle No. :SGJ6335J Toyota Altis
SIN Description Amount (S$)
A |PART REPLACEMENT
Front bumper 1957y ﬁ, 3 793.00
Front bumper retainer $£27 48.00
Front right headlamp 375 o 7B 685.00
5 $ 1,526.00
Less20% /21 $ 122080
B |LABOUR CHARGES
To remove and replace front right damaged parts $ 380.00
To respray + putty on the replacement parts $ 400.00
GRAND TOTAL OF A & B - m $  2,000.80
[\
W
Y

S @054

/4"""'7 At P,
3oy,

&

Block 176 #03-08 Sin Ming Autocare
Sin Ming Drive
Singapore 575721
Tel : 64532237 / 64530797
Fax : 64556384

R\

Fozy

Z2e¢



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 1

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
Case Notified Est Submitted Adj Assigned Adj Rpt Adj Submitted Ins Auth'ed Status
23 Aug 2019 Pending for Survey
Edit Adj Rpt | s Cancel Case |

Reference Claim Details Documents Show All

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS

|[Created by insurer]

Insured:

FRESENIUS MEDICAL CARE SINGAPORE PTE LTD, Co. Reg. No.: 199700372D

Main
Claimant:

FUN SIEW MOI @ YONG SIEW MOI, ID: S2183290A

Vehicle Reg.
No.:

18/08/2019 13:00 - :59

$GJ6335) [157 Months and 1 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man Yr)]

Date of Loss:

Claim Type:

Policy/Cover
Note No.:

27466101 (Comprehensive)

TP / 603296 Coverage: 28/02/2019 - 27/02/2020

Vehicle Reg.
No.
(Insured):

Policy No.

SKIL0oEY (Claimant):

Excess: 5$1,000.00

Repairer:

Loh Heng (HQ) 176 Sin Ming Drive, #03-08 Sin Ming Aute Care, 575721 Sin Ming - Tel: 64532237

Handling
Insurer:

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: +65 6827 7888 .., [Handled by Monica Chung Pei Zhen - 6594 2552]

Adjuster:

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ... [Handled by KENNETH KONG] ... [Final Rpt due 22/09/2019]

Driver/Custo
dian
(Insured):

MAHESH NAIR (61 / Male) , NRIC: G5343672U, Tel: +6598231602 Email:

Adj Asg.
Remarks:

on WP. (Manual Assign). Liab: 100%. Agree on SJE. Assign: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd. Contact: Danny @ 9011 1432, Manual
assigned to LKK via email on 22/08/19.

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED

View All I Compose Case Mall I

There are no mail for this case.

Due Date
No results,

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS=

View All I Search Tasks | Create New Task Complete |

Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_c... 6/9/2019



Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*S$GJ6335) (603296)
[SKJ1968T]
™

FUN SIEW MOI @ YONG SIEW MOI
Aug 18 2019 1:00PM
[FRESENIUS MEDICAL CARE SINGAPORE PTE LTD]
Loh Heng

Upload Documents ] Upload Photos ] Compose New Letter I

Page 1 of 2

View |View in Browser

Assessment Reports 1 per page @
No |Finalized On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 27/08/19 10:59 Adjuster Immediate Advice ﬁ Load HTM
Photos/Images 3 per page [V
No |Relabel/Reorder |LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 [03/09/19 10:19 General View o Load JPG
2 03/09/19 10:19 General View o Load JPG
3 |03/09/19 10:19 General View ) | Loadirc
4 03/09/19 10:19 General View o Load JPG IE
5 |03/09/19 10:19  |General View © | Ladirc | ¥
6 03/09/19 10:19 General View o Load JPG [
7 |03/09/19 10:19 General View © | LoadirG
8 |03/09/19 10:19  |General View © | adirc | M
9 03/09/19 10:19 General View e Load PG | 4
10 |03/09/19 10:19 General View € | LoadirG
11 |03/09/19 10:19 General View ° Load PG | ¥
12 |03/09/19 10:19 General View © | wadirc | M
13 [03/09/19 10:19 General View € | wadirc | &
14 |03/09/19 10:19 General View © | Load PG
15 |03/09/19 10:19 Reinspection Photo e Load JPG
16 |03/09/19 10:19 Reinspection Photo ﬂ Load IPG M
Documentation |1 per page
No |Finalized On MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
23/08/19 14:19 | PRI © | Load POF
2 23/08/19 16:19 Agree on SJE 9 Load PDF
No |Finalized On MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. (Internal Surveyor) Thumbnail | Print
1 23/08/19 17:08 Survey Request - Manual Assigned ﬂ Load PDF
Documents Checklist
DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST Reset | save | Print |

There are no document checklists configured.

Our Checklist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ)

Show Remarks To: O Handling Insurer
Note: Remarks are private unless you show It to other parties.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_docvi... 6/9/2019



Merimen e-Claims Page 2 of 2

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_docvi... 6/9/2019



Adjuster Report Page 1 of 4
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (Co.Reg.No:199607198R)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@Ilkkauto.com
VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT
Our File No: CS/MSG19014867/KSD3E2
Date: 06/09/2019
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Policy No: 27466101
Glaimant Vehicle 56 6335 Insured Vehicle No:  SKJ1968T
Date of Loss: 18/08/2019 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: 603296
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SGJ6335J
Make & Model: TOYOTA COROLLA ALTIS, 1.6 (A) Engine No: 32724580478
Reg. Date: 17/07/2006 (Man. Year: 2006) Chassis No: MRO053ZEC107123570
Colour: Metallic Silver Odometer: 162450 km
Engine Capacity: 1598 cc
Market Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (S$): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Madification: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 185/70R14 Rear Tyre Size: 185/70R14
Front Left Side: Nexen 9 mm Rear Left Side: Nexen 8 mm
Front Right Side: Nexen 9 mm Rear Right Side: Nexen 8 mm
The above values represent the remaining tyre treads depth
\COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference Diff %|
Parts 1,220.80 696.07 524.73 42.98
Miscellaneous Items 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 780.00 620.00 160.00 20.51
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S$) 2,000.80 1,316.07 684.73 34.22
Approved Total (Overridden) (S$) 1,050.00
Nett Amount (S$) 2,000.80 1,050.00 950.80 47.52
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 23/08/2019
Date Inspected: 23/08/2019 Inspected At: Loh Heng (HQ)
176 Sin Ming Drive, #03-08 Sin Ming Auto
Care
Singapore 575721
Estimated Period of Repair: 3.0 days
Adjuster: KENNETH KONG Manager: Hiew May Fung

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_p... 6/9/2019



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

NOTE: This report represents our findings at the time and place of inspection stated herein. Such inspection has been carried out to the best of our
knowledge and ability but any other liability under any other circumstances is hereby expressly excluded.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_p... 6/9/2019



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4

REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: MRM-SG Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 05 Sep 2019)

Parts: 143 TOYOTA COROLLA ALTIS 1.6 (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)
Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominated Standard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SGJ6335J)

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

|Further Info: ltems/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *.

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *FRONT BUMPER Bent 793.00FL *485.10FL
2 1 *FRONT BUMPER RETAINER Distorted 48.00FL *48.00FL
3 1 *FRONT RIGHT HEADLAMP Cut 685.00 FL *395.00 FL

F=Franchise part. L=ListltemDisc.

Sub Total (S§) 1,526.00 928.10

- List Item Discount on L Items 20.00/25.00% (S$) 305.20 232.03

Total Parts (S$) 1,220.80 696.07

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. ]

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_p... 6/9/2019



Adjuster Report Page 4 of 4

Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

There are no new miscellaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour Items

1 TO REMOVE AND REPLACE FRONT RIGHT DAMAGED PARTS New 380.00 300.00

2 TO RESPRAY + PUTTY ON THE REPLACEMENT PARTS New 400.00 320.00
Gross Labour Cost (S$) 780.00 620.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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