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MS@FirstCapital

MS First Capital Insurance Limited Co.Reg No 1950001060 GST Reg. ho. M2-0001676-9
6 Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580
Tel: (65) 6222 2311 Fax: (B5) 6222 3547

Claims & Motor Underwriting Dept: 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877
Tel: (65) 6507 3848 Fax: (65) 6507 3849
www.msfirstcapital.com.sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location

Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
20-08-2019 Our Ref No. D19005395MFSH
19-08-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
SHC8338M Third Party Vehicle. SMG4564Y

15 FAN YOONG ROAD
NABILAH SENIN

62623377/ 0 Fax No. 62643151

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: LIABILITY UNCLEAR: CONFLICTING VERSIONS OF
REPORT, WAITING FOR INSURED VIDEO

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

NA Fax No. 68416315
NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTE
LTD

NA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA

Attention. NIL

JASON TEA CHEE KIAT

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.




Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Tan Yoong Wei <tanyw@mova.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 20 September 2019 12:50 PM
To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: FINALISE SMG4564Y

CLOSE

Best Regards,

Tan Yoong Wei

Estimator

Mova Automotive Pte Ltd

Tel: 6272 3892 Fax: 6270 8314

@MOVA ¢ o

Automolive Ptle Ltd

This message is confidential and is for the use of the intended recipient only. If you have received this message in error, please do not copy, disclose or use
its content. We would be grateful if you would notify us by email and delete the original transmission and any attachment from your system

Any attachment to this e-mail may contain software viruses that could damage your computer system. Although we will take reasonable precaution to
minimize this risk, we do not accept any liability resulting from software viruses. Please carry out your own virus checks before opening any attachment

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) [mailto:Rasul@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, 20 September 2019 12:18 PM

To: Tan Yoong Wei

Subject: RE: FINALISE SMG4564Y

Hi Yoong Wei,

Refer to attachment
Finalised amount is $ 6,300/ 5 days of lump sum
Kindly confirm

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)
F &R i

- -

SemRE=  mw Sgve the Earth Frint only when necessary

From: Tan Yoong Wei [mailto:tanyw@mova.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 20 September, 2019 9:08 AM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Veron Chen (LKKAuto); 'Nitha'; 'Suann’
Subject: FINALISE SMG4564Y

Hi
Good morning



Please advice whether we can finalise cost of repair lumpsum $6900 with 5 working days ?
TQ

Best Regards,

Tan Yoong Wei

Estimator

Mova Automotive Pte Ltd

Tel: 6272 3892 Fax: 6270 8314

@MOVA ¢ o

Automolive Ple Lid

This message is confidential and is for the use of the intended recipient only. If you have received this message in error, please do not copy, disclose or use
its content. We would be grateful if you would notify us by email and delete the original transmission and any attachment from your system.

Any attachment to this e-mail may contain software viruses that could damage your computer system. Although we will take reasonable precaution to
minimize this risk, we do not accept any liability resulting from software viruses. Please carry out your own virus checks before opening any attachment



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 30 August 2019 11:58 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'; assignments

Cc: 'Jason Tea'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19005395MFSH/1
Attachments: CSFCI19014807R1qd3.pdf

Dear Jason,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of SMG 4564Y.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 22 August 2019 3:22 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Jason Tea' <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19005395M FSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle is not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 21 August 2019 4:11 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Jason Tea <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19005395MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
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S1UBIAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: D19005395MFSH Date: 30 August 2019

Our Ref: CS/FCI19014807/R1qd3

The Motor Claims Department
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _SMG 4564Y .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 19/08/2019 at the premises of M/s MOVA. and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :S$  14.001.90

Revised Estimate Amount :S$  6.800.01

“Check” Items Amount : S§ 2.975.42

Market Value : S$ -

LTA Reimbursement Value :S§ -

Nett Value :S§ -

Description of Damage: —

The vehicle sustained damages —

at the o/s front portion. e @ front
offside

Yours faithfully

Rasul
Automotive Assessor



R/IANI2019 PARFICOF Rehate Fnmnire

- > Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner ID Type: Singapare NRIC

Owner ID: 793B

Vehicle No.: SMG4564Y

Vehicle to be Exported: No

Intended Deregistration Date: 30 Aug 2019

Vehicle Make: B.M.W.

Vehicle Model: 6401 GRAN COUPE 4DR SR LED DSC NAV HUD
Primary Colour: Brown

Manufacturing Year: 2012

Engine No.: 05578245N55B30A
Chassis No.: WBA6A02020DZ10663
Maximum Power Qutput: 235.0kW (315 bhp)
Open Market Value: $80,078.00

Original Registration Date: 24 Sep 2012

First Registration Date: 24 Sep 2012

Transfer Count: 1

Actual ARF Paid: $80,078.00

PARF Eligibility: Yes

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 23 Sep 2022

PARF Rebate Amount: $52,050.00

COE Expiry Date: 23 Sep 2022

COE Category: B - Car (1601cc & above)
COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: $80,191.00

COE Rebate Amount: $24,591.00

Total Rebate Amount; $76,641.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 30 Aug 2019

OK

Illtps:”vrhﬂigov.sg:|l-i:l.fVFl-‘aCI.IUI'IJtll'lqI.II!'Er‘BUHIHDY!"UDII{JDEIUI"BUBTEQI-l'lpl.ll fEUNLTIUIN,_IUSFUIUGUUY | |



MMOWV 19108286 / Mova Automotive Pre Lid - Bukit Merah
ENTRY DATE & TIME: 19/08/2019 11:32
SUBMITTED BY: Monitha Gunaseskaran

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report correc!lz the details of the accident to speed up the claims process.
2. This Form must be completed by the Palicyholder and/or the Autharised Driver.

3. Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or witholding of material facts may allow insurance companies to

repudiate policy liabllity,

4. The issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies Is not an admission of palicy liability on the part of the insurance companies.
5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

6. This report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance Association of Singapare (GIA) for
archiving and thal copies of this report will, for a fee, be made avallable upon application by interested parties.

7. By the lodgement of this report to the insurers. you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and to copies of the report being made avallable

aforesaid.

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report

Date Of Accident

Exact Location Of Accident
Country/State of Loss

19/08/2019 11:32

19/08/2019 09:10

IN FRONT OF CLIFFORD CENTRE (CLIFFORD RD)
SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

Vehicle Registration Number
Insured/Policyholder
Name Of Registered Owner
NRIC No

Email Address

Mobile Phone No

Alternative Phone No
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Model

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy
for repair to your vehicle?

If No, Please state action o be taken
Vehicle Category

Insurance Company

Name of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage

Fleet Policy

Policy Number

Cover Note Number

Driver

Name of Driver

NRIC No

Date Of Birth

Qccupation

Date Of Driving Pass

Driving Experience

Gender

Mabile Number

Fax Number

Contact Number

EMail Address

SMG4564Y

DENG LIN

S59280793B
DENGLINLYNN@GMAIL.COM
(LOCAL) +65-98414732
OTHERS-NOPHONE

BMW
6401 GRAN COUPE 4DR SR LED DSC NAV HUD

NO

THIRD PARTY
PRIVATE CAR

NTUC INCOME INSURANCE CO-OPERATIVE LTD
COMPREHENSIVE

NO

5106516728

HE GUANGXU
S92789784

06/11/1992

INDOOR

09/12/2017

1 YEAR AND 8 MONTHS
MALE

(LOCAL) +65-98414752

NOEMAIL

Page 1of 12



23 KEPPEL BAY VIEW
#06-72

Postcode 098414

Address

Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company NO
If No, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured SPOUSE

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own -
Vehicle E

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle -

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident COLLISION - CHANGE/CROSS LANE
Weather Conditions CLEAR

Road Surface DRY

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident? NO

Number of vehicles (including own vehicle)

involved in the accident 2
Was any body injured in the Accident? NO
Was any injured conveyed to hospital by

ambulance? g
Was any other material or property damaged? YES
| have been approached by unknown person(s)
saliciting/offering accident claims assistance. NO
Number of Passengers (Including Driver) 1
Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported to the police? NO
If Yes,Please state which Police Station

Was notice of intended Prosecution given? NO
If Yes,against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

Attachment(s)

Are accident photos available for attachment? YES

Was there any video captured by Car Camera? NO

Was there any audio recorded? NO
DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1
Vehicle Registration Number SHC8338M

Vehicle Make/Model/Colour
Details Of Properties

Vehicle Category PRIVATE CAR
Name of Driver LIM AH KAU
NRIC/Passport Number S0689429A
Contact Number 93745903
Address

Postcode

Insurance Company Name
Nature Of Damage

No. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

Page 2 of 12



Sketch Plan Pg. 1
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SKETCH PLAN

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report correctly the details of the accident to speed up the claims process.

2. This Form must be compl Pol | nd/or the Authorised Driver.
3, Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or withholding of material

facts may allow insurance companies to repudiate policy liability.

4. The issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies is not an admission of policy liability on the part of the insurance
companies.

S. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

6. The report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance
Association of Singapore (GIA} for archiving and that copies of this report will for a fee be made available upon application by
interested parties.

7. By the lodgment of this report to the Insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and to copies of
the report being made avalilable aforesaid.

8. Consent under the Personal Data Protection Act (PDPA)
I understand, acknowledge, agree and consent that:

{a) My insurer, my workshop and the General Insurance Association of Singapore (“GIA”) may/are permitted to collect, use,
disclose and/or process my personal data/personal information set out In this [form] and any other personal information
provided by me or possessed by my insurer (collectively the “Personal Information”) and disclose and transfer such
Personal Information to all insurer(s) who have insured vehicle(s) involved In this accident (all insurer(s) who have insured
vehicle(s) involved in this accident shall be collectively referred to as the “Insurers”), the Insurers’ lawyers/law firms, the
Monetary Authority of Singapore and any relevant government agency/authority (such as the police), for the purpose(s)
of :

(i} processing, handling and/or dealing with my claims including the settlement of the claims and any necessary
investigations relating to the claims;

(i) investigating the accident and/or my claims;
(ili) carrying out and/or dealing with my instructions or responding to any enquiries by me;

{iv) administering my claims {including the mailing of correspondence, statements, invoices, reports or notices to me,
which could involve disclosure of certain personal data about me to bring about delivery of the same as well as on the
external cover of envelopes/mail packages); and/or

{v) complying with applicable law in administering, processing, handling and/or dealing with my claims.{collectively the
“Purposes”)

{b) allinsurer{s) who have insured vehicle(s) involved in this accident and the Insurers’ lawyers/law firms, may/are permitted
to collect, use, disclose and/or process my Personal Information for one or more of the above Purposes; and

(c) my Personal Information may/can be disclosed by any of the Insurers and/or GIA to their third party service providers or
agents{including their lawyers/law firms), which may be sited outside of Singapore, for one or more of the above Purposes.

{d) my Personal Information will also be collected and used to compile claims history for the purpose of fraud detection,
Investigation and management in present and all future claims.

(e) the information so collected under (d) sbove may be shared / disclosed:

(i) toallinsurers and/or any other third parties that assist in evaluating, investigating, controlling or managing fraud,
regulators, law enforcement and government agencies as reasonably required for the purposes stated, or

{il) for complying with requirements under any regulations, laws or court orders.

' A T

/ Po!'icyhulder's Signature Driver's Sigtature Reporting Centre Personnel’s Siénature
Date & Time: (If driver ishot the policyholder) Name:
Date & Time: NRIC/FIN No.:

NELYE Aketa bEianf e

Page 3 of 12



Sketch Plan Pg. 2

SKETCH PLAN
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DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT 7

ucensepate: O MG 45 f.-;{/y

ACCIDENT DATE & TIME:  / ?/037/ 9 09:(0am

POy /(72

CONTACT NUMBER:

EMAL ADDRESS: OY219/11) [ ) B ma /- co

Location: /a ﬁf,,,,_;’ 0770 Cilr /%—rd Oeectre ( /e ,%nq//eaod)

[ Was &/6wily drivnyg on Fhe Fu [lerfon Road. dbleuly

fo,’('&/fc'93i9m] (q_/‘{ x-n_?ﬁ v /ane aka/r‘u'f Ot

e ﬁwzf RY $cle - Has Yere o a Yaxd gtaw e fe Froray

fo drep v pres3 gt & Hot ke ohsnged [ane. (fen

¢ Dp0fen o Ftx

741)&:' Arcver Re acee o {eﬁa?‘ Vieleg

Fitas::

NOTE: PLEASE NOTE THAT YOUR INSURER MAY HAVE 14 DAYS TIME FRAME FOR YOU TO SUBMIT AN

OWN DAMAGE CLAIM UNDER YOUR OWN POLICY. PLEASE CHECK YOUR POLICY FOR MORE INFORMATION

Please stala:

/

{ ) Claim Own Policy ) Caim Third Pary

( ) Claim ODJ/TP at other workshop

( )} Reparting Only

DECLARATION

|/We declare the foregoing particulars are true in every respect.

7l 4

i

W
Polityholder's Signature

Date & Time:

Driver’s Sfgnature

Date & Time:

FeleHEIsnTetm v

(If drivef is not the palicyholder)

Reporting Cer“ Personnel’s Signature
Name:
NRIC/FIN No.:

Page 4 of 12



@MOVA

Automotive FPte Ltd
e Main Office:
o Mova Building

No. 22, Jalan Kilang,
Singapora 158419

= Tel: (65) 6476 3333
Estimate i o GG o
WWW A.Com. 59
Veh # . SMG4564Y Workshop Dept:
21/08/2019 Biock 1008,
VVeh Model - BMW 6401 GRAN COUPE 4DR SR | Bukit Meran Lane 3
#01-04/06/08/94
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED Estimate# - CK419576 Singapora 159722
36 Robinson Road _ ' A (om)eurasses
&l i’ )14
#16-01 City House Claim # ) Co. Reg 198904033G
Singapore 068877. ACC. Date :- 19/08/19 GST Reg, M2-00B8BE4-2
Terms -~ C.O0D Days
Altention - XAD026 Remarks -
No.  Description Qty U.Price Amounts S$
LISTITEMS :
\.  FRONTFENDERRH Crh? - 1 PC 1.820.75 1,.820.75
2 FRONT FENDER LAMP RH ¥ 1 PC 325 45 325.45)x
3 FRONT FENDERRRIVETRH Ase 7~ 10 PCS 5.80 58.00
4 _FRONTWIPERTANKRH 7 o ~ 1 PC 193 40 193 40
5 FRONT WIPER TANK,HOSE RH  (/tn ~ 1 PC 68.30 68.30
6 FRONT DOOR RH 1 PC 2.391.40 2.301.40
7 FRONT DOOR HINGE RH Y~ ¥/ 2 PCS 113.05 226 10X
8 FRONT DOOR WEATHERSTRIP RH A% ' 1 PC 290.55 290.55
9, FRONT DOOR RIVET RH A8~ -~ 10 PCS 5.80 58.00
10. _ FRONT DOOR STICKER e 2S AN 2 PCS 68,00 136.00 X
14, VACUUM PUMP DOORRH - ¥ < 1 PC 496.70 496.?0J;
12, FRONT SIDE MIRRORRH D& $VC 1 PC 1.222 85 1.222.85 *
13, FRONT SIDE MIRROR COVER RH Y §vC 1 PC 185.45 195.45-
14 SIDE SKIRT RHSUE ~ _ - 1 _PC _§57.20 657.20
15 SIDE SKIRT CLIPS RH A2~ o 10 PCS 4.00 40.00
16 FRONT WHEELRIMRH SU& 7 1 PC 1.085 20 MI’“
L s X 3 ; *s_.;; :
17. FRONT WHEEL BEARING RH ‘ LV’ 1 PC 404 55 494 55,
18.  FRONT LOWER ARM RH - CHECK y3t Se1 1 PC
19, FRONT UPPER ARM RH - CHECK 1 PC
LIST TOTAL S8 SIL 10,759.90
5% DISCOUNT S§ 4 K 0| ’5 Mt -538.00
/"" S
10.221.90
SPECIAL NET ITEMS : - . 7 Sov
1. FRONT FENDER MATTE BLACK (3M) RH A% prie - )%00 1 PC 50000 %00 507D
2. FRONT DOOR MATTE BLACK (3M) RH A&~ "> 1 PC 60000 Jew 0
3 FRONT SIDE SKIRT MATTE BLACK (3M) RH s 1 PC 40000 2wy $T0
4 FRONT SIDE MIRROR MATTE BLACK (3M) RH ;(.‘\“\ 1 PC 150.00 150.00 X
SPECIAL NET TOTAL S$ 1,750.00

LABOUR :

TO REPAIR FRONT WHEELHOUSE RH, FRONT DOOR
INNER PILLAR TO REMOVE & REPLACE ALL

ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS. TO STRAIGHTEN &
RE-ALIGN ON ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS

TO SPRAY PAINT ON ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS

TO CHECK FRONT WHEEL ALIGNMENT

TO REMOVE FRONT WHEEL RIM & CONDUCT BALANCING
TO REMOVE FRONT SUSPENSION __’Q\\\m

TO REMOVE FRONT DOOR MECHANISM, DOOR LOCK &
OTHER ATTACHMENT PARTS

boo
bo wtt

20 fi
i)

o
\



Estimate

21/08/2019

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED
36 Robinson Road

@MOVA

Automolive Ple Lto

Main Office:

Mova Bullding

No. 22, Jalan Kilang

Singapore 150419

. Tel (65) 6476 3333

Page# - 1 135853 Bhl i ol ens
WWW.Imova,.com.sg

Veh# - SMG4564Y Workaiip Danst
Block 1008

Veh Model = BMW 6401 GRAN COUPE 4DR SR 8ukit Merah Lane 2
#01-04/06/08/94

Singapore 150722

3 41957
Estimate# - CK419576 Tel - (65) 6272 3892

. Fax: (65) 6270 B314
#16-01 City House Gan® Co R:q. ".-?r-.uc:a.-.:a;s;u:a
Singapore 068877. ACC. Dale :- 19/08/19 (ST Aeg. M2-0088864-2
Terms - COD Days
Attention - XA026 Remarks -
No Description Qty U.Price Amounts S$%
TO CHECK FRONT DOOR VACUUM DOOR & SETTING (o yﬁo‘ﬁ
LABOUR TOTAL S$ |\ 2.030.00
o~ W
E.&OE
NON-TAX AMOUNT &
AMOUNT S§ 14,001.90
GST@ 7% 980.13

Customer's Sianature/Co. Stamp MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

AMOUNT DUE S$

14,982.03

$29372 Hp Qoo Lov 6¥
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL:

6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCI19014807/R1qd3e2
i?ech%Btl:TTS\? H&?SAEDSINGAPORE 068877 Date  24-09-2019 I”"I“"I"MII"”II"“
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC 8338M Veh. Inspected SMG 4564Y
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D19005395MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  JASONTEA Assign Date 21/08/2019
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model B.MW. 6401 GRAN COUPE c.c 2979
4DR
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2012
Chassis No. WBABAD2020DZ10663 Colour BLACK
Odometer 148909 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre [245/40 R19 GOODYEAR 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |245/40 R19 GOODYEAR 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |245/40 R19 GOODYEAR 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre 245/40 R19 GOODYEAR 6 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  19/08/2019 ]Inspection Date 29/08/2019
Survey held at MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
15 FAN YONG ROAD
SINGAPORE 629792
5a. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

5 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:1of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SMG 4564Y
[Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition |\ Cron (g)) '_(Sj)

REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT FENDER RH CRACKED 1,920.75 1,920.75
1|FRONT FENDER LAMP RH SERVICEABLE 325.45 -
10|FRONT FENDER RIVET RH @%5.80 NECESSARY 58.00 58.00
1|FRONT WIPER TANK RH DEFORMED 193.40 193.40
1|FRONT WIPER TANK HOSE RH CRACKED 68.30 68.30
1|FRONT DOOR RH BENT 2,391.40 2,391.40
2|FRONT DOOR HINGE RH @%113.05 SERVICEABLE 226.10 -
1|FRONT DOOR WEATHERSTRIP RH NECESSARY 290.55 290.55
10|FRONT DOOR RIVET RH @%$5.80 NECESSARY 58.00 58.00
2|FRONT DOOR STICKER @$68.00 NOT NECESSARY 136.00 -
1|VACUUM PUMP DOOR RH SERVICEABLE 496.70 -
1|FRONT SIDE MIRROR RH SERVICEABLE 1,222.85 -
1|FRONT SIDE MIRROR COVER RH SERVICEABLE 195.45 -
1|SIDE SKIRT RH SCRATCHED 657.20 657.20
10|SIDE SKIRT CLIPS RH @%4.00 NECESSARY 40.00 40.00
1|FRONT WHEEL BEARING RH SERVICEABLE 49455 -
1|FRONT LOWER ARM RH (NPA) SERVICEABLE - -
1|FRONT UPPER ARM RH (NPA) SERVICEABLE - -
LESS 5% DISCOUNT -438.74 -283.88
8,335.96 5,393.72
1[FRONT WHEEL RIM RH (SN) SCRATCHED 1,985.20 500.00
LESS 5% DISCOUNT -99.26 -
1,885.94 500.00

SPECIAL NETT ITEMS

1|FRONT FENDER MATTE BLACK (3M) RH (SN) NECESSARY 600.00 300.00
1|FRONT DOOR MATTE BLACK (3M) RH (SN) NECESSARY 600.00 300.00
1|FRONT SIDE SKIRT MATTE BLACK (3M) RH (SN) NECESSARY 400.00 200.00
1|FRONT SIDE MIRROR MATTE BLACK (3M) RH (SN) NOT NECESSARY 150.00 -
1,750.00 800.00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI119014807/R1qd3e2
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Description of Parts Condition Estimate By | Our Adjusted
S P Workshop (5)| ___ (5)
LABOUR
TO REPAIR FRONT WHEELHOUSE RH, FRONT DOOR 600.00 400.00
INNER PILLAR. TO REMOVE & REPLACE ALL ACCIDENT
DAMAGED PARTS. TO STRAIGHTEN & RE-ALIGN ON
ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS.
TO SPRAY PAINT ON ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS. 750.00 600.00
TO CHECK FRONT WHEEL ALIGNMENT. 80.00 60.00
TO REMOVE FRONT WHEEL RIM & CONDUCT 50.00 30.00
BALANCING.
TO REMOVE FRONT SUSPENSION. NOT NECESSARY 250.00 -
TO REMOVE FRONT DOOR MECHANISM, DOOR LOCK & 150.00 60.00
OTHER ATTACHMENT PARTS.
TO CHECK FRONT DOCR VACUUM DOOR & SETTING. 150.00 60.00
2,030.00 1,210.00

GRAND TOTAL 14,001.90 7,903.72
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 6,300.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19014807/R1qd3e2

MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS ADRIAN LING WAI PING

Automotive Assessor B.Eng,AMSOE,AMIRTE AMSAE-A,M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.




