Asher Sna {I.I(I(Autn!

From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail com>

Sent: Friday, 30 August 2019 5:58 PM

Ta: Admin A; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMA 9074 T 8 SMN 1194 P ON 21 AUGUST 2019 - CALL
FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Attachments: SMAS0TAT _estimate_finalisation.pdf; SMASOTAT nvoice. pdf;, SMASOT4T_report.pdf;

SMN1194P_ins_search.pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Completed

Your Ref:
Our Ref: SMAS074 T

30 August 2019

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd PROPERTY CLAIM

AIG Building, (WITHOUT PREJUDICE
78 Shenton Way TO: Any Personal Injury
#07-16 Claims)

Singapore 079120

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park,
Ubi Avenue 1,

#02-25

Singapore 408933

Attn: Claims Department

Dear Sir/Mdm,

As proposed by our Single Joint Expert, LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD, of Cost of Repair at $5,400, we are
pleased to inform that we are agreeable to the amount proposed.

As such, we are writing to your kind office to call for a direct settlement, in relation to the accident involving SMA 9074 T
& SMN 1194 P on 21 August 2019. We will like to know If your company is prepared to settle for the amount as stated
below:

Cost of Repair (amount as proposed by SJE) : $5,400.00

Loss of Use (repair days as proposed by SJE) 1% 560.00 ($140/day X 4 days)
Loss of Use (for PRI from 21/08/2019 to 22/08/2019) $ 140.00 ($140/day X 1 day)
LTA Search % 745

Total: :$6,107.45

We seek your kindest assistance in letting us know whether your kind office is agreeable to the above within the next 7
days and we look forward to you forwarding us the DV (without prejudice to any personal injury claims), if required, so
that we can expedite on its return for an amicable settlement to the matter.
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Asher Sna (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 5 September 2019 12:53 PM

To: DARRYLCHIAMI3@GMAIL.COM

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMN 1194P AND SMA 90747 ON 21/08/2019

Our Ref: CCHYAIGI9014796/Ueald

05 SEPT 2019

CHIAM CHYE MENG / CHIAM CHOON KAI DARRYL

Dear Sir'Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMN 1194P AND SMA 9074T ON 21/08/2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pie Lid to resolve the claim
against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to
negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact
us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for
commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim, However, if your policy has a NCD
protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Asher

Case Handler
DID: 6841 6051
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: Ashersng @ lkkauto.com

. AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid
{Maror Claims Dept]



To:  Asia Motorsports Solution Pre Lid WITHOUT PREJUDICE
37A Everitt Road TO: ANY PERSONAL INJURY
Singapore 428586 CLAIMS

In the maner of an accident mvolving vehicles Sﬂiﬁqﬁ*HT & SMNIIFHF on Al Aujus—i 4014

vwe MARK LIm JI7 SING the owner of vehicle registration no.  SMAGOF4T
hereby do authorize you to commence repairs to my shovementioned vehicle.

I/'We confirm that you are hereby autharized to handle the repairs of my vehicle and/or to
negotiate and settle any claims relating to the above accident which |/we may have against the

third party/parties or insurers and/or to instruct lawyers on my/our behalf 1o facilitae the third
party claim for mefus

Youare hereby authorized as my attomey 1o execute and/or sign any documents/discharge
vouchers/discharge agreement regarding my/our claim for my convenience.

In the event that ['we am/are requured to attend at a:l_yfmr solicitors’ office or to antend coun in
connection with my/our claim, Vwe shall render full co-operation.

| confirm that in the event of an unsuccessful claim against the negligent party and/or my own
insurer for the damages caused o my vehicle, | agree 10 pay all repair cost, survey fee and any
incidental expenses incurred by you or to lodge an own damage claim (only for comprehensive
cover) to cover the expenses incurred

| undertake not to independently make negotiate or settle any claim in respect of the abne
accident without first giving you 7 days notice m writing 2nd upon so doing, | further underiake
o pay 10 you immediately your administrative charges for work done and time expended in
managing my claim herein. For the purpose of clarification, the aforesaid administrative charges
shall not include any work done or sum expended towards repairs to my said vehicle and i the
event that repair workss has commenced before the giving of the above notice, | hereby underake
to pay to you the full sum of the costs of repairs as shall be recommended by a licensed survevor

Dated the | day of August 2019

S SRS

Owner (signature) Witness (signature)
MARK LIM JI7 SING LoD (HENG (HUAN

Owmer (name) Witness (name)
$33039420 SHEYERIC

NRIC No, NRIC No.



RELEASE VOUCHER
(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim) .
WITHOYT PREJUPICE
To: ANY PERSONAL INTURY (LATMS
“"We/l. ASIA MOTORSPORTS SOLUTION PTE LTD (“the workshop™) hereby confirm that
we/l have reached an agreement with the appointed surseyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurunce Pre Lid
LEKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (nume of surveyor) with respect 10 1he amoum climed
for S$2.700.00 (Repair Cost), S$150.00 (Loss of Use/Rentat), S$7.45 (Disbursement) for vehicle no.
SMA 2074T that was damaged pursuant 1o the accident which occurred on 21/08/2019 daie) along
SARACA RD TWDS SUNFLOWER IKID CHILDCARE (location) involving vehicle no/s SMN
LI94P,

This is pursuant 1o the inspection conducted on 22/08/2019 (date) at “the workshop™.

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner MARK LIM JIT SING (LIN RIXIN) (“the
third party clumant”) of vehicle no. SMA 9074T muke the claim as set out in the ahove paragraph
and we/l have {ull authority 10 setile the matter on his/her behall in a manner that we/l deem fil. We/l
enclose herein the letter of authority given by “the third party elaimuant”

We/l further confirm that we/l wall indemmily AlG Asia Pacific Insurmnce Ple Lid for all damages.
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third purty claimant™
after the above said agreement lodges a further claim agaunst the former for any loss and expenses
suffered pertaining 1o costs of repairs andl/or rental and/or loss ol use purswant 1o the damage 10 SMA
9074T (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident

Well confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and Anal settlement of any claim of “the
third pany clamant™ pursuant 1o the seerdent and than Turther this settlement 1s reached on a withow
prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have
exclusive junsdiction over any dispute ansing out of the same.

/ :
Duted this 71 (day] of r‘:'fm}ll' {month) ZU_EL_ (year)

Z\
) s

Signed by appointed survevor Signed by “the workshop™ (with chop)




ASIA MOTORSPORTS SOLUTION PTE LTD

Specialise in sales of pew & reconditioned bikes

Co. Reg. No: 200007755N

MARK LIM JIT SING INVOICE NO: 2017/C172
S7308982D

DATE: 29/08/2019

VEHICLE NO: SMA 9074 T
MAKE : HONDA ENGINE NO : L15B4432905
MODEL : VEZEL L.5X CVT CHASSIS NO : RU11232901
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT

Total lump sum repair including supply of parts and labour

Adjusted total lump sum repair costs $$5,400.00

Total amount payable S$5,400.00

Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd



Land Transport §Q Authority

Land Transpor Authority

10 Sin Ming Drive

Singapore 575701

GST Registration Ma. : M4-0006529-2
Print Date/Time : 21 Aug 2018/ 18:57:05
Recaipt DateTime 21 Aug 2018/ 16:57:04

Tax Involce/Receipt

Receipt No. : [TNET-00000-190821-002632
Pravious Receipt No, ©

Result of Insurance Enquiry - SMN1184P
As at 21 Aug 2018/08:30:00
Insurance Co: AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD.

Insurance Co: LIBERTY INS P L
1 Insurance Enguiry - SMN1184P

ol M 7.00 0.48 7.48

20100821 1854126538268
SiDio 700 049 749
Tolal Before Rounding 7.00 0.49 7 48
Rounding Differsnc e
Total Amount Payabie 48
Paid By
Total 746
Cash Change a6
Tendered Amount 745
Excess Rafundable Amount 0,00

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE 0AY!




