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ELITE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
i 280 Woodlands Industrial Park E5, #01-17,

Harvest @ Woodlands Singapore 757322
Tel: 6339 7378 Fax: 6339 7475

Vehicle Number : GBH6287)
TOYOTA HIACE
Chassis Number : JTFHTO2PX00244122

Vehicle Model :

f' -

Estimated Repair Cost

.

SN Parts Description Oty List Price
1 TAILGATE ~ [V | 2925.75 192
2 TAIL GATE LOCK | 63255 T0l/
3  TAILGATE LOGO , /X | 77.85 /
4 TAIL GATE CENTER GARNISH x  P4f™ | 23955 1
5 TAIL GATE WEATHERSTRIP 7/ | 48255 1157
6 TAIL GATE INNER BOARD 114 1 632.55 1
7 TAIL GATE INNER BOARD CLIPS .~ /11 10 30.00 (T /7
8 TAILLAMPLH&RH ¥ ™ 2 964.50 -
9 TAIL LAMP LOWER CORNER PANEL LH ~ ({1 I 27885 1S/
10 REARBUMPER . ( [¥ 1 78225 h§77
Il REAR BUMPER CLIPS . /¢ § /(oI 10 75.00 J°/
12 REAR BUMPER INNER BRACKET | wr 1 9225 /
I3 ENDPANEL (INNER) X A 1 1082.10
4 ENDPANEL (OUTER) ¥ A 1 1048.95
IS END PANEL UPPER PANEL ¥ [ | 317.10 ¢
16 "TOYOTA HIACE" STICKER fr ] 905 O s
17 70 KM/H STICKER it 1 30.00 /¢
I8 CARSTICKER A | 3000 7« 7
S 9770.85 /951
Discount Less 25% § 24421 -V
List Prices Total S 328.14  Jf4f 0.
S/N Special Nett liems: Oy
| REVERSE SENSOR .~ [/| ] 350.00 770 /7
2 REARNUMBER PLATE WITH HOLDER X 41 IS 60.00 7
Special Nen Tomal b 410.00
S 7738.14

Spare Part’s Total Price

Tk
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ELITE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
280 Woodlands Industrial Park ES, #01-17.
Harvest @ Woodlands Singapore 757322

Tel: 6339 7378 Fax: 6339 7475

Vehicle Number : GBH6287]
Vehicle Model : TOYOTA HIACE
Chassis Number : JTFHT02PX00244122

S/N Labour Descriptions Charges

1 LABOUR CHARGES TOCUT & WELD WHERE $ 1800.00
NECESSARY: TO STRAIGHTEN & REPAIR REAR S
LUGGAGE FLOOR PANEL; TO REMOVE & REPLACE
PARTS AS LISTED ABOVE.

2 TOSPRAY PAINTING ON: TAIL GATE (INNER, OUTER). S 1800.00
END PANEL. REAR LUGGAGE FLOOR PANEL. REAR ( i1
BUMPER, REAR LHS CORNER PANEL.

3 TOREMOVE & TRANSFER TAIL GATE SCREEN TO NEW S 150.00 Sy
TAIL GATE AND PERFORM WEST TEST. '

4 TOREMOVE & TRANSFER TAIL GATE SERVICEABLE b 100.00
COMPONENTS & FITTINGS TONEW TAIL GATE & CHECK
FUNCTION

5 TOCHECK ELECTRICAL WIRINGS & REAR LIGHTS S 10000
FUNCTION

6 CHECK & CLEAR FAULT CODES AFTER NECESSARY S 280.00
NECESSARY ACCIDENT REPAIRS.

- 154672 L
. Labour Total § 4230.00
A= J v
g0 Parts & Labour Total  § 11968.14
439672
/¢ 0§
|Ill 1 B ! J { ;
T4 ()
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PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

1 "

¢

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

10of1

Vehicle Cwner Particulars
Owmar 1D Type:

Owener 10

Vehicle Details

Viakiicle N

Vehicle 1o be Exporied.
Intended Detogivtration Date:
Wehiche Make:

Wehicie Made|

Primary Cojour;
Manufacturing vear

Engne o

Chassis Mo

Maximurm Power Ouaput
Oipen tMaruet Valus

Criginal Regatration Diate;
Firer Repsrration Dere:
Tramier Count:

Actual ARF Pad

Intended PARF Rebate Detalls
FARF Edgibility,

PARF Eidgibility Expiry Date
FARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Detalls
COE Expiry Diane:

COE Category

COE Perod{vears)

QF Faier

COF Rebate Amouny

Total Rebate Amount

Comparry
Bane

GHHAZET)

Vies

31 Aug 201F

ToOVOTA

HIACE vaAMN TURBO SDA MT
White

528153000
&6 Jul 2018
28 Jul 3018
v

$1.407 10

e
$0.00

25 0N 2028

€ - Goods Vehicl & Bus
10

$32.007.00

25 60000
$25,600.00

The sriormation oomEamen fMerem (§oormeet a9 31 S0 hag JOLW

OK

hitps./ivtlita. gov. sgManrl/action/enguireRebateByPublicEel

8/20/2019. 7:42 PA



/2212018 Claim Portal

LK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP) « Menu
! Service Request Details
Claim
SFMO1IXPO
Reterence {l\dﬂv
None # F
B LES]

Loss Date 1 : e
August 19, 2019

v . Ouk
Report Date
Aug 22, 2019 10:31:00 AM E. \/

Request Date
August 22, 2019

Diue Date
August 29, 2019

Vendor Mame
LKK AUTO COMSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP

Type of Loss
Third Party Veehicle Damage

Services
Pending verification - Direct Settlement
Actions

MNext Step
Agree to perform service

T

Vehicle Information

Incident Viehicle Registration #
GBH&287

rmpr.mpmmmmmmmwmmuw-mmmmmnwmmnmmm 328T1 12



BI2212019 Claim Portal

LK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD (TR) »

MIOaE
HIACE-3.0 D TURBO 5 DR (M)

Service Address

Primary Contact/Insured

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No.2 ANG MO KIO STREET 63, 569111, Singapore

Claim Handler

KHONG Lynn
68804892
lynn khong@axa.com.sg

Additional Instructions

Mpcsapes Invoices History Documents Assessment Metrics Naotes

hitps:iivp. smartclaims axa.com mlmmuﬁmmmumwmmuﬂqmmmﬁUﬂmﬁ

a2



Catherine L‘hnna (LKK Auto)

From: Elite Automotive <elite.automotivel3@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 22 August, 2019 10:09 AM

To: 5G AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey

Cc: 5G AXA Insurance SM Claims Service Team

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Accident Invalving Of Vehicle No: GBH 6287) & SHFe10M
Attachments: 22082019100459 pdf

Categories: Raghav

Hi,

Good day! Kindly refer to attached and please arrange pre-repair inspection for vehicle no: GBH 6287). Thanks!

Regards,

Christy



Hsiao Tuna !LKI{Autu!

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 22 August 2019 5:32 PM

To: Elite Automotive

Cc: Admin A; assignments

Subject: RE: FW: [EXTERNAL] Accident Involving Of Vehicle No: GBH 6287) & SHF610M

J/LKK REF: CC4/ASM19014770/pb3

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both party, the liability is clear subject to
the BOLA guideline settlement.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to
your client's vehicle and admission of any liability to our Insured’s part. The final repair cost is subjected to the
consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the
number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor and approved by our principal.

**Kindly arrange for survey.
Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
fram this negotiation of terms/settiement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408033)

From: Elite Automotive <elite.automotivel3@gmail com>

Sent: Thursday, 22 August 2019 4:30 PM

To: Shu Pel [LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: FW: [EXTERNAL] Accident Involving Of Vehicle No: GBH 6287 & SHF610M

Hi Hsiao Tong,



Good day| Please assist to check liability on this case. Thanks!

Regards,
Christy
On Thu, 22 Aug 2019 at 16:10, Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Sir / Madam,

We have received assignment from AXA for this case.

Kindly note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Hsiao Tong at 6742 3197,

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

Thank you

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | emall: shupe|@ikkauto com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Elite Automotive <elite.automotivel3@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 22 August 2019 10:09 AM
To: 5G AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey <motor.survey@axa.com.sg>

2



Cc: 5G AXA Insurance SM Claims Service Team <cst@axa.com.sg>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Accident Involving Of Vehicle No: GBH 6287 & SHF610M

Hi,

Good day! Kindly refer to attached and please arrange pre-repair inspection for vehicle no: GBH 6287). Thanks!

Regards,

Christy



Regards,



arza2018 Claim Portal

Mandate IA> - SOMO1XPO [ACCIDENT INVOLVING
« SR Mandate 1A S PIORES BN T5)68/2019

Type
@ Question

Message

Liability: 100%. Insured driver rear-ended third party. Inform Ol about third party claim, Agreed to settle at
best. We seek your mandate at $5,208.45(all-in). TP-Mandate |A had been uploaded in Smartclaims. Kindly
let us have your approval/instruction. Hsiao Tong - 23-5ep-19%

hitps-/ivp smartclaims.axa com sglclaim-partal/htmilindex-vendar-service-requaests himi#service-requests/view-messageTserviceRequesthumbe in
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Campany Registration Mo VHHE0TTRER

Immediate Advice

To : AXA Insurance Pte Ltd

Survey Details:

Date of loss 19-Aug-19
Date of appointment 22-Aug-19
Date of survey 30-Aug-19
Location of survey ELITE AUTOMOTIVE
Vehicle Details:
Claim Type: Third party
Vehicle number GBH 62871
Make and Model TOYOTA HIACE VAN
Date of registration 26/7/2018
Excess
Market Value 570,000
Parf Rebate 525,600
Nett Loss 544,400
Repair details:
linitial Estimate |s 11,968.14 |
Proposed/Revised repair cost:
Parts S 4,240.28
Check ltems [estimate) 5 -
Labour 5 1,180.00
Total 5 5,420.28
Lump Sum|if applicable) 5 4,300.00
|Hurnbar of days for repair 4

VS RASRAERL FAY, oS adSad ik

Date: 23/09/2019



! I/ llr :::Lujurltl

B B = P Lo

SF LB AN o228 Ay A LR IS STRIAL PAKK. SINGATRE 408933 TE]

Remarks:

Compary Reglatration No, 133807 1RER

0ID rear-ended third party.

IME L RISAIERT FAN D ohd nl3adl s

Mandate:

Liability(TP) 100%

Proposed repair cost (w/GST) 5 4.601.00

Loss of use 5 £00.00 |{6days x 5100)
Loss of rental MIL |no. of days
Loss of income NIL |no. of days
LTA search fees S 7.45

Others MIL

Proposed Total S 5,208.45

It |_'|.

JI:I [Ilu Y ~]|'1



Hsiao Tnnﬂ [LKKAutn!

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 11 October 2019 9:36 AM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuULO)
Subject: RE: New message for service request 132871, vehicle number GBH628T
| ' 2382019
[] PENDING SURVEY LSF las357 Al
| 39/2018
(] 1A UPLOADED l1_s.|= 20409 PH
| . amz0te
1 ESTIMATE & SURVEYOR ASSGNMENT PAPER PASS TO HANDLER LSP :ﬂ.ﬂ!- 10

'l.lessauaL}ahilm 100%. Insured driver rear-andead third party, Inform Ol about thirg party

n lctaim Agreed to seftle at best We seek your mandate 31 $5,208 45(all-in) TP-Mandate 14 | CHT 231872019
{had been uploaded in Smartciaims_ Kindly 18t Uis have vour approvalinstrucion. Hslao { F10:50 AM
Tong - 23-36p-18

0 110/11/10 8:50 AM KHONG Lynn—Hi Hsiao Tong, Proceed. However, LOU 10 offer at 4 daps Lsp 11102019

isince recommendad 4 days. Thanks 92310 AM

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

——~QOriginal Message-—

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.coms>

Sent: Friday, 11 October 2019 8:57 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: New message for service request 132871, vehicle number GBHE287

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue
1, #02-25 | 5(408533)

——-Original Message-——

From: lynn. khong@axa.com.sg <lynn.khong@axa.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 11 October, 2019 8:52 AM

To: admin-d@lkkauto.com

Subject: New message for service request 132871, vehicle number GBHB287

AXA Insurance has sent you a message for claim number S9M01XPO.
Please click here https://vp.smartclaims.axa.com.sg/claim-portal/ to view the message in Vendor Portal.



¥

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by AXA except where provided forin a
written agreement between you and AXA. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or
partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.



Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

From: Elite Automaotive <elite.automotivel3@gmail.com=
Sent: Thursday, October 24, 2012 3:30 PM

To: Steve Chen (LEK Auto)

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: GBHG287) Finalize

Hi Steve,

Good day! We accept the offer. Thanks!

Regards,

Christy

On Mon, 21 Oct 2019 at 18:45, Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChenfalkkauto.com> wrote:
Dear Christine,

Kindly refer our finalize $3400 (L/S, before GST). 4 repair days.

Kindly confirm.

Thanks

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Assistant Automotive Assessor



Hsiao Tuna [LI(K.Autnl

From: Elite Automotive <elite automotivel3@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 24 October 2019 3:47 PM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Cc Hsiao Tong (LKKAUtG)

Subject: Re: GBHG287) Finaliza

Attachments: 24102019153802 pdf

Hi,

Good day! Kindly refer to attached LOD and please proceed necessary action. Thanks!

Regards,
Christy

On Thu, 24 Oct 2019 at 15:29, Elite Autormotive <glite.automotivel3@gmail.com> wrote:
Hi Steve,

Good day! We accept the offer. Thanks!

Regards,
Christy
On Mon, 21 Oct 2019 at 18:45, Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <5teveChen@|kkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Christine,

Kindly refer our finalize $3400 (L/S, before GST). 4 repair days.

Kindly confirm.



Thanks

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: SteveChen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

Regards,

Regards,



Hsiao TDHE {LK KAI.II:Q} — — —_—

From: Elite Automative <elite. automotivel3@gmall.com>

Sent: Thursday, 31 October 2019 12:55 PM

To: Hsiao Tang (LKKAuto)

Cc: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: GBHB2B7) Finalize //LKK REF: CC4/ASM19014770/Epb3
Hi Hsiao Tong,

Good day! We accept the offer, please proceed DV. Thanks!

Regards,
Christy
On Thu, 31 Oct 2019 at 07:56, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter,

We propose settlement at a global sum of $3,960.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of llability on our part and/or that of our palicyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice
engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter{s) In respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other related
claims.”



Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-1197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51. Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | Slao8933)

From: Elite Automotive <glite.automotivel mail.com
Sent: Thursday, 24 October 2019 3:41 PM
To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveC | to.cam>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: GBHB287) Finalize

Hi,

Good day! Kindly refer to attached LOD and please proceed necessary action. Thanks!

Regards,

Christy

On Thu, 24 Oct 2019 at 15:29, Elite Automotive <elite.automotivel3@gmail.com> wrote:

Hi Steve,



Good day! We accept the offer. Thanks!

Regards,
Christy
On Mon, 21 Oct 2019 at 18:45, Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen(@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Christine,

Kindly refer our finalize $3400 (L/S, before GST). 4 repair days.

Kindly confirm

Thanks

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Assistant Automotive Assessor



LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 Email: SteveChen®@Ikkauto com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{4D8933)

Regards,

Regards,

Regards,



Statement_Of_Claim

ELITE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

280 Woodlands Industrial Park ES, #01-17 Harvest @ Woodlands (8) 757322
Tel : 63397378/ 86606722 Fnx: 63397475

Reg No: 201700196D GST Reg No: 2017001960

Dare : 2441072019
(UK KEF : TPGBH 6258704119

M/S @ AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD
HSHENTON WAY

#27-01

SINGAPORE 068511

Statement Of Claim On Veh No :GEBH 62871
MODEL : TOYOTA HIACE

LUMP SUM OF REPAIR

INCLUDING SUPPLY OF PARTS & LABOUR

PANEL BEATING & SPRAY PAINTING $3,400.00
7%GST $238.00

$3,638.00

LOSS OF USE ($180 X 6DAYS) $1,080.00

‘PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION

*INCLU WEEKEND

‘POST REPAIR

LTA SEARCH $7.45

TP REPORT $29.00
$4,754.45

Page 1



1‘5\@\ Elite
\._,. AUTOMOTIVE Pte Ltg  awssseavices

Co Aegn No. 2017001960
280 Woodlands Industrial Park ES #01-17 Harvest@Woodlands (S) 757322 GST.Reg.No: 2017001960
Hotline: B6B0 6722 Tel: 6339 7378 Fax: 6339 7475 Email; elite_automotivel3 @gmail.com

TAX INVOICE ND : EA1912-600

Messrs  © AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD Date . 11/12/2019

Address : B SHENTON WAY, #27-01
SINGAPORE OGEE11

Emall Mobile Home/Office Tal |
Ne Descripuion Qty Amount
UR REF : TP/GBH 62871/19
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH 6287) AND SHF 610M ON 19/8/19
END: GBH 6287) [TO' A
1 |COST OF REPAIR 1 |$ 3,400.00
S 3,400.00
GST| 7% |5 238.00

Total [ § 3,638.00

Elile Automative Ple Ltd Customer Signature & Company Stamp



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6255 4315

Reg No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated ta Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automoblle

AXA INSURANCE PTELTD

Rel CC4/ASM19014770/Epb3q2

ORGP R o owe: razoe | [N
ATTMLYNN Code: ASM
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHF 610M Veh. Inspected GBH 62B7J
Policy No. VFX/P1680520 Coverage (§) 0,00
Claim No. SBMD1XPO Excess (§5) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 22/08/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA HIACE C.C 2882
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. JTFHTO2PX00244122 Colour WHITE
Odometer 23691 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOOD
3. ' Conditions of Tyres I -]
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185R15C BRIDGESTONE 5 mm
L/H Front Tyre |195R15C BRIDGESTONE 5 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |[195R15C BRIDGESTONE 5 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |[195R15C BRIDGESTONE 5 mm
4, 'Description of Damages o il
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. | ~ TR Genersl Information Esr S ERIT LSRN (el
Accident Date  19/0872018 Inspection Date Joioasz018
Survey held at ELITE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
280 WOODLANDS INDUSTRIAL PARK ES #01-17 HARVEST@WOODLANDS
SINGAPORE 757322
5a. Remarks RS W A
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS. B
5b. . Estimate DaysofRepar i 1N IGLE )
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days
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ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GBH 6287J
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1|TAIL GATE (CONSISTENT) DENTED 292575 1,925.00
1|TAIL GATE LOCK (CONSISTENT) BENT 832 55 388,00
1|TAIL GATE LOGO (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 77.85 77.85
1|TAIL GATE CENTER GARNISH (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 239.55 .
1|TAIL GATE WEATHERSTRIP (CONSISTENT) TORN 482 55 395.00
1|TAIL GATE INNER BOARD (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 632 55 .
10| TAIL GATE INNER BOARD CLIPS (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 30.00 15.00
2|TAIL LAMP LH & RH (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 964 50 -
1|TAIL LAMP LOWER CORNER PANEL LH (CONSISTENT) |CRUSHED 278.85 115.00
1|REAR BUMPER (CONSISTENT) CRUSHED 78225 687.00
10|REAR BUMPER CLIPS (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 75.00 30.00
1|REAR BUMPER INNER BRACKET (RETAINER) LH BROKEN 82.25 0225
(CONSISTENT)
1|END PANEL {INNER) (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 1,082.10
LABOUR
1|END PANEL (OUTER) (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 1,048.95
LABOUR
1|END PANEL UPPER PANEL (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 317.10
LABOUR
1| TOYOTA HIACE’ STICKER (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 48.05 30.00
1| 70KM/H STICKER (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 30.00 20.00
1|CAR STICKER (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 30.00 20.00
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -2,442.71 048,78
7,328.14 2,846 32
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
2|REVERSE SENSOR (SN) (CONSISTENT) BROKEN 350.00 200.00
1|REAR NUMBER PLATE WITH HOLDER (SN) NOT NECESSARY 60.00
(CONSISTENT)
410.00 200.00
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e s | Yy a -~ 188
Description of Parts |  Condition
— - .

LABOUR CHARGES TO CUT & WELD WHERE 1.800.00 500.00
MECESSARY ,TO STRAIGHTEN & REPAIR REAR
LUGGAGE FLOOR PANEL,TO REMOVE & REPLACE
PARTS AS LISTED ABOVE.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR
OF END PANEL (INNER).END PANEL (OUTER) AND END
PANEL UPPER PANEL

TO SPRAY PAINTING ON TAIL GATE 1,800.00 B00.00
(INNER ,OUTER),END PANEL REAR LUGGAGE FLOOR
PANEL .REAR BUMPER .REAR LHS CORNER PANEL

TO REMOVE & TRANSFER TAIL GATE SCREEN TO NEW 150.00 50.00
TAIL GATE AND PERFORM WEST TEST,
TO REMOVE & TRANSFER TAIL GATE SERVICEABLE NOT NECESSARY 100.00 -
COMPOMENTS & FITTINGS TO NEW TAIL GATE & CHECK
FUNCTION.
TO CHECK ELECTRICAL WIRINGS & REAR LIGHTS 100.00 30.00
FUNCTION.
CHECK & CLEAR FAULT CODES AFTER NECESSARY NOT NECESSARY 280.00 -
ACCIDENT REPAIRS.

4,230.00 1,180.00
GRAND TOTAL 11,968.14 4,226.32

= — —_— — - - T

F LUMP SUM REPAIRS | | 3,400.00
CONDITION) ] |

Report Ref No. CC4/ASM19014770/Epb3q2

CHEN TSUE YEE HO LEONG CHUAN
Automotive Assessor Automotive Assessor

DISCLAIMER OF LLABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Repan s made solely for ihe use snd bareil of the Cllent named on the front page of this Repert.
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