Vic (LKKAuto)
From:

Sent:

To:

Subject:

Attachments:

Dear All,

We guantify our claim as follows:-

Tan Lee Gek [Auto Sves/Claims & [A/Claims & A Taxis) <LeeGek@smrt.com.sg>

Thursday, 3 October, 2019 2217 PM
S A Team, Admin A

LOD Re: Accident on 20/8/2019 involving SHD 6101L & SLR 9599T (AIG's insured)
Qur Ref: TAX/08/19/2066/1g
Img-X03140530-0001 pdf

Cost of Repair $1995.17
Loss of Rental §785.92 | 65 daysx 512091 |
Loss of Income 535000 | 65 dayx 56000 )
Total $3171.09

We enclose the following documents:

1) Repair invoice

2} Proof of rental rate

1) GlA report

4) Accident vehicle laid-up report

Please let us have your offer soon. Thanks

Regards

Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6866 2647)

Claime Department

SMRT Automotive Services Pre Ltd
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51 UBL AVE L #01-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (063) 62363361 FAN ; (085) a2564313

27 AUGUST 2018

OH DING YUAN By Post & By Email
31 BRIGHT HILL CRESCENT
SINGAPORE 579689

Dear SirfMadam,

OUR REF  : CC3/AIG19014750/Ehb3
YOUR REF :SLR 9599T

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLR 9589T AND SHD 6101L ALONG JURONG GATEWAY
ROAD ON 20.08.2019

We refer to the above subject matter, We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster
appointed by your motor insurer, AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third
party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from Body Repairer'Workshop acting on behall of the owner of
SHD 6101L against your motor insurance policy.

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had
amongst other information given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as
the appointed agent of your Insurers shall proceed lo negotiate for an amicable
settlement with third party claimant.

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD — if any) may be affected as a
result of the claim against your policy.

We shall proceed 1o deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according
to the rights afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection ol your
policy and seek to take conduct ol third party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your
own cost and delense, please reply to us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with
any of the Third Party(s} and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or
settlement without AlG's prior knowledge and consent.

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AlG of their rights to repudiate any
claim because of any breach of policy lerms and conditions you and/or your authorised
driver may have committed.



51 UBIAVE 1. #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) A2564115

In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), AIG shall keep
you informed of the final indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).

If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us at 6841 2096 or email us
at vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com.

Please quote the claim reference when you contacl us that we can assist you more
effectively.

Yours sincerely,

Alpeh
Handler

ID: 6841 2096

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com
c.c. AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

(Mator Claims Dept)
Dingyuan.oh@gmail.com / lldm_ton@hotmail.com

(Email)



Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vie [LKKAuUto)

Sent: Tuesday, 27 August, 2019 2:05 PM

To: Dingyuan.oh@gmail.com

Cc: lldm_tan@hotmail.com; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: YOUR REF: SLR 9599T_ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLR 9599T AND SHD 6101L ALONG

JURONG GATEWAY ROAD ON 20.08.2019
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51 UBLAVE 1, 501-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 6256415

27 AUGUST 2019

OH DING YUAN By Post & By Email
31 BRIGHT HILL CRESCENT
SINGAPORE 579689

Dear Sir/Madam,

OUR REF : CC3/AIG19014750/Ehb3
YOUR REF : 5LR 9599T

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLR 9599T AND SHD 6101L ALONG JURONG GATEWAY ROAD ON 20.08.2019

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor
insurer, AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from Body Repairer/Workshop acting on behalf of the owner of SHD 6101L against your
motor insurance policy.

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had amongst other information given
us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to
negotiate for an amicable settlement with third party claimant.

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD - if any) may be affected as a result of the claim against your
policy.

We shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according to the rights afforded under
the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your policy and seek to take conduct of third party claim(s)
arising from this incident, at your own cost and defense, please reply to us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with any of the Third Party(s)
and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or settlement without AlG's prior knowledge and
consent.

This letter should not be regarded as a walver by AIG of their rights to repudiate any claim because of any breach of
policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised driver may have committed.



In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), AIG shall keep you informed of the final
indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).

if you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us at 6841 2096 or email us at vicalpeh@lkkauto.com.

Please quote the claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more effectively.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)

This e-mall contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the Intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached jtems. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mall, all attachments and any coples thereof, Thank you,



AUTHORIZATION TO ACT
(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

I, SMRT _TAXIS PTE LTD (the third party claimant”) of 60 WOOD STRIAL
P E4 (5)757705 (address), owner of SHD 6101L (vehicle no.) hereby authorize SMRT

AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD (“the workshop”) 1o act for me with respect to my claim
for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use (“claim™) for my vehicle no SHD 61011 that was

damaged pursuamt 1o the accident which occurred on 20/08/2019 (date) along JURONG
GATEWAY ROAD (location) involving vehicle no/s SLR 9599T (“the accident™).

| further authorize the workshop 1o settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that they deem fit

and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to settlement of my claim with

payment cheque/s being made in favour of SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD.

I further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driver/owner/insurers of the other

vehicle/s is concerned.

Datedthis 19 (day)of __MNoy  (month) 2019 (year)

Signed by “the third party claimant™ Signed by “the workshop™
(with chop if applicable) {with chop)



RELEASE VOUCHER
Al Pacific - Expr ird Par

“We/l, SMRT AUTO S LTD (*“the workshop™) hereby confirm that we/l
have reached an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid LKK

0 ULTANT (name of surveyor) with respect 1o the amount claimed for
§$3,080.00 (Global Sum — all in) for vehicle no. SHD 6101L that was damaged pursuant to the

accident which occurred on 20/08/2019 (date) along JURONG GATEWAY ROAD (location)
involving vehicle no/s SLR 9599T. This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 21/08/2019 (date)

at “the workshop™.

We/l confirm that we/l arefam authorized by the owner SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD (“the third party
claimant™) of vehicle no. SHD 61011 make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l have
full authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/l deem fit. We/l enclose herein
the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant”.

We/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party claimant”
after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and expenses
suffered pertuining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the damage 1o SHD
6101L (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant™ pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have

exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Dated this 3-0 (day) of M&] (month) 2019 (year)

© O
\—_ /0ty e, &

Signed by appointed surveyor Signed by “the workshop™ (with chop)
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EHMRT Automotive Sarvices Pte Ltd
251 Morth Bridge Road Singepors 179103
Tel: 65 63311000 Fax: 65 63340247

Tax Invoice

Cus tmer Code: 3000063 GST Reg No. : MR-BS00001-7
CHN : 1990042802
SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD Invoice No. : IV1S909004E4
Date : 25.09.2019
Bloct Unit Vehicle No. : SHDE101L
Your Ref No. : TRX/0B/19/2066
60 WIXDLANDE IMDUSTRIAL PARK E4 Qur Ref NWo. : 24102%29
SINGHPORE 757705 Terms ¢ 30 Days
Description oty Unit Add i (Discount) Amount
Caost L Amount
Parts
PIXEL STICKER 2.00 § #&0.00 0.00 5 0.00 5 120.00
COVER, RR BUMPER ASSY 1.00 § 423,90 (25.00 ) $ 105.97 5 317.93
REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT 0.00 s 318.80 0.00 s 0.00 s 0.00
RETAINER, RR BUMPER, R®H 1.00 § 112.70 125.00 ) 5 28.17 S B4.53
RETAINER, AR BUMPER, LH 1.00 § 111.50 {25.00 ) 5§ 27.87 5 B3.63
SEAL, HR BUMPER , RH 0.00 5 85.20 0.00 £ Q.00 | 0.00
SEAL, RR BUMPER , LH 0.00 § 85,20 Q.00 5 0.00 S 0.0aa
CLIPS PIECE, FRT & RA BUMPER 10.00 5 1.50 {25.00 | s 3.75 5 11.25
GUARD, RR BUMPER, LOWER 1.00 5 558.30 {25.00 ) 5§ 139.57 -3 418.73
FILLER, RR BUMPER , RH 0.00 5 119.390 0.00 5 0.00 5 0.00
FILLER, AR BUMPER , LH 0.00 % 11%.90 0.00 5 0.00 5 .00
LENS & BODY ASSY , RR BUMPER , LH D.00 % 486.B0 0.00 5 0.00 5 0.00
LENS & BODY, HEAR COMBINATION LAMP 0.00 % 438.10 0.00 $ 0.00 s 0.00
 LH
TAIL GATE BACK DOOR OUTSIDE GARNISH 1.00 5 891.20 {100.00) 5 891.20 5 0.00
SUB-ASSY
ANTENNA, ELECTRICAL KEY 0.00 & 8&0.30 .00 5 0.00 s 0.00
SENSCR REVERSE 0.00 % 180.00 0.00 - 0.00 5 0.00
REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT 1,00 5 318.80 |25.00 ) 5 7%.70 5 239.10
SEMSOR REVERSE 1.00 5 180.00 0.00 g 0.00 g 180.00
Sub-Total 5 1455.17
Labour
TO REPAIR REAR PORTION 1.00 s 200.00 0.00 5 0.00 5 200.00
Others
TO WASH AND VACUUM 0.00 5 €0.00 0.00 s 0.00 5 0.00

fage 1/2
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Authorised Signature
for SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

E. &§ 0.
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SMAT Autoamctive Services Pte Led

251 Worth Bridge Road Singspors 179102
Tal: §5 S3311000 Fax: 65 63340247

Tax Invoice

Customer Code: 3000063 GST Reg No. : MR-8500001-7
CRN : 1990042802
SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD Invoice Ne. : IV190900484
Date : 25.09.2019
Block UOnit Vehicle He. : SED6101L
Your Ref No. : TAX/0B/19/2066
B0 WOODLANDS IMDUSTRIAL PARE Ed Our Ref No. : 24102929
SINGRPORE 757705 Terms : 30 Days
Description aty Unit Add iscount Amount
Cost L ] Amount
TO CHECK WIRING AND SYSTEM FUNCTION 1.00 5 20.00 0.00 5 0.00 5 20.00
TO REFLACE SUMDRY PARTS 1.00 5 20.00 0.00 5 0.00 5 20.00
TO TEST AND REFIX REVERSE SENSOR 0.00 5 120.00 0.04q 8 0.00 5 0.00
SYSTEM
TO RESPRAY REAR BUMPER 1.00 5 200.00 0.00 5 0.00 5 200,00
TO RESPRAY FILLER RR BUMPER LH 0.00 § 180.00 0.00 5 0.00 5 0.00
TO RESPRAY FILLER RR BUMPER EH 0.00 5 180.00 0.00 s 0.00 -1 0.00
TO RESPRAY BUMPER BEAM 0.00 5 180.00 0.00 5 0.00 5 0.00
TO BESPRAY TAILGATE OUTSIDE GARNISH 1.00 s 100.00 0.00 5 0.00 5 100.00
GRAND TOTAL 5 1,995.17
Remark :
Make/Model : PRIUSY
Accldent Date : 20.0B.201%9
H.B. Fayment by chequs should be crossed and
sade payable to 'SMRT Automotive BServices Pes Led:
Iﬂtlﬂiﬂ!ﬂ]hhluﬂmlﬂlmm, ?\/.
et B |
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Ruthorised Signature
for SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

E. 4 O.E
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TAXIS

SMRT Taxis Pte Ltd MEMORANDUM
To: Claims Dept Our Ref:  TAX/08/192066
From: SMRT Taxis Pte Ltd Date: 22/08/2019

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD6101L AND SLR9599T ON 20/8/2019
12:00 PM ALONG JURONG GATEWAY ROAD (J CUBE).

This is to confirm that the dally rental rate for SHD6101L is $120.91
per day

Please proceed to recover any rental loss from the third party as a result of the
above accident.

Thank you.

Yours sincerely
SMRT TAXIS PTELTD

| i
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