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Niwvitha (LKK Auto)
“

From: Claims <claims@ premiumauto.com.sg=

Sent: Maonday, 19 August 2019 3:33 PM

To: "Admin A" ‘Admin-D (LKKAuto)'; 'SUR'

Cc: 'Claims’

Subject: OD CLAIM FOR 5KJ 9136 A ON 19/8/2019

Attachments: SKJ 9136 A - 15082019.PDF; SAftersales19081915330_0002 jpg;

SAftersales19081915330_0001 jpg

Dear All,

Kindly register OD claims for this vehicle. Attached is GIA report for your reference.
We will forward you the estimate once is available.

Please arrange survey on 21/8/2019, 10.30am. Vehicle is in workshop.

Best Regards,
Syafig
Claims Admin Assistant

Premium Automobiles Pie Lid (Reg No 199902271W)

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p. t05 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9911 f +65 6841 1183
e._claims@premiumauto.com.sg  w._www. audi.com.sg
Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singa

WELCOME TO THE==i [
8TH DIMENSION.

THE ALL-NEW-AUDL Q8!

pore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223

| i FIND OUT MORE l
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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 19 February 2020 4:12 PM

To: Carrine Leong; SUR

Cc: '‘Boo seng yak'; 'Chang Chee Sing'; jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg

Subject: RE: FINAL REVISION - SKJ9136A - OD AIG - SURVEYED 271 AUG 2019 RE-SURVEYED
19 SEP 2019

Dear Carrine,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Repair limit $13,000.00.
Repairer agreed to repair at 516,500.00.
Balance of $3,500.00 will be bear by Insured and Insurance 50% each at 5$1,750.00.

Kindly expedite the discharge voucher and tax invoice to us for close case.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@]kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 3(408033)

From: Carrine Leong <carrine.leong@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 19 November 2019 10:53 AM

To: Adrian Ling (LKKAuto) <adrianling@lkkauto.com>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ilkkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com=

Cc: 'Boo seng yak' <boojohnny@gmail.com=; 'Chang Chee Sing' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>;

jiayee. yap@premiumauto.com.sg

Subject: RE: FINAL REVISION - SKJ9136A - OD AIG - SURVEYED 21 AUG 2019 RE-SURVEYED 19 SEP 2019

Hi Adrian/Shiau Chan,
Revised estimate is attached.

We wish to inform you that we have repaired the above vehicle on Limit recommendation of $16,500.00 @
14 days and 2 sundays

Please let us have your approval to submit our final repair bill for early closure.

Thanks & Best Regard
Carrine Leong
Claims Administrator

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd jreg se 10s0miw

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9925 f. +65 6841 1183

e. carrine.leong@premiumauto.com.sg  w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 155938 p. +65 6836 2223
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5 _AUDIT TRAIL

Merimen a-Claims

Claim Audit

|rNc-. Oon  Audit Remarks i By
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| 15:29 Changed ministrator
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https:singapore. merimen.com/claims/index. cfm?fusebox=MTRad]uster&fuseaction=dsp_viewhislory&caseid=856772&extid=314260&CFID=673...
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2M%/2020 Merimen a-Claims

5l AUDIT TRAIL o - - P
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29 2020 ::j.:ﬂ RPY  \r Rpt:Final Rpt. Cur Due Date:2019/08/30. Mandate Remarks: A Lt ?
| 19 Feb [1] ¥ah
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B/22/2018 Adjuster Immediate Advice

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd coregno1sssoriser)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408933
Tol: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com
To: AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid. From: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
AlG Building 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 079120 Singapore 408933
Attn:  Azlan, Syazairdina Date: 22 Aug 2019

Preliminary Advice

Vehicle No 1 SKJ9136A Accident Date
Make :AUDI A3 Policy No.
Assignment Date : 21/08/2019 Excess
Date of Inspection  : 21/08/2019 Est. Duration of Repair
Inspection At : PREMIUM AUTOMOCBILES PTE LTD (UEI)
55 UBI ROAD 1

SINGAPORE 408699

Point of Impact /| General Description of Damages

: 19/08/2019
: 2100340203
: 5%$800.00

1 9.00

The vehicle sustained impact / damages front portion and parts claimed are consistent fo the accident.

Repairer's Estimate (Gross) :5% 33,710.00
Revised Amount :S% 18,518.00
Check Items (Estimated) 5% 6,044.00
Total 5% 24 562.00
Lump Sum Repair ot

Total Loss Consideration

MNew for Old Value 55
Pre-Accident Value 8% 58,000.00
COE /| PARF Rebate 5% 44 899.00
Salvage Value 5%
Margin for Repair 5% 13,101.00

Remarks

( ) The vehicle is repairable at our adjusted amount. We have also confirmed excess and policy coverage. Kindly

let us have your authorisation.

( ) Thevehicle is uneconomical to be repaired, you are advised lo invite tender for the wreck.

{ X } Other comments : REPAIRER ASKING REPAIR COST AT $16,500.00 ON LUMP SUM BASIS.

https:/isingapaore. merimen.comiclaims/index. cim*usebox=5VCdoc&fuseaction=dsp_viewersmartnoimgviewer=1&ftype=2&docid=435257 39&c0...

1M



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 22 August 2019 5:26 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto); nora khai@premiumauto.com.sg
Cc: SUR; 'Claims Dept’

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SKJ 9136 A ON 19/8/2019

Dear Shiau Chan,

Due to the extensive damages the vehicle suffered, we would like to counter propose 516,500.00 lump sum to
repair the vehicle.

Your urgent approval is well appreciated.

Thanks

Best Regards,
TRoy Goh
Claims Advisor

Premium Automabiles Pte Ltd jseg uo issanzamiw)

55 Ubi Read 1 Road Singapore 408600

p. +65 6388 2322 d, 465 676E 9828 f. +65 6841 1183

e, claims@premiumauto.com. g W, www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 158938 p. +65 6836 2223

CUUD). ey

“It comes in blue.”

The new Audi A7 Sportback. Do you really need a reason?
3 ¥

-

Find out maoare |

Email Dlsclaimer
This emall, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If you have recaived it In error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message fram your system

Ploasa do not copy it of use it for any purpose, o disclose its contents or any attachment Lo any other person, Thank you.

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) [mailto:siewsc@Ilkkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, 22 August 2019 10:33 AM

To: Claims; nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SKJ 9136 A ON 19/8/2019

Dear Syafiqg,
Kindly advise whether your workshop able to repair the 5KJ 9136A within repair limit $13,000.00.

Best Regards,
Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg=

Sent: Monday, 19 August 2019 3:33 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com=>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: OD CLAIM FOR SKJ1 9136 A ON 19/8/2019

Dear All,

Kindly register OD claims for this vehicle. Attached is GIA report for your reference.
We will forward you the estimate once is available.

Please arrange survey on 21/8/2019, 10.30am. Vehicle is in workshop.

Best Regards,
Syafig
Claims Admin Assistant

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 195502271W)

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 4086599

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9911 f. +65 6841 1183

e, claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223

WELCOME TO THE
8TH DIMENSION.

THE ALL-NEW AUDI Q8.

I FINR OUT HQH-E ]

S—

Email Disclaimer
This email, incleding any attachment, is confidential and may also be g

f you have recansed it inarror, please notity uS M

Please do not copy It or use it for any purpose, Or disciose 115 Contents or any attachment 1o any cther person Thank yodu



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuta)

Sent: Monday, 26 August 2019 12:11 PM

To: Claims; nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SKJ 9136 A ON 19/8/2019
Attachments: SKJ9136A UNDERTAKING LETTER pdf

Dear TRoy,

The message from insurance officer: “Repair limit at $13,000.00 is final. If Insured is insistent on repairing at
Premium kindly obtain a written agreement of the amount $16,500.00. AIG will pay $1,750.00 of the balance
$3,5000.00 and Insured will have to pay the other $1,750.00 before Excess and GST.” and send back the

undertaking letter as attached after signature and cop.

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SKJ 9136A at repair cost not more than
£16,500 on Lump Sum basis (Excess $800/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434
to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before
completion of the repair.

*Qur client reserve their right_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-2561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 26 August 2019 9:05 AM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>; nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg
Cec: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>=

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SKJ 9136 A ON 15/8/2019

Dear Shiau Chan,

As per a short conversation with my client, client insisted want his car to be repair. We would like to counter
propose

again 516,500 lump sum to repair the vehicle.

Thanks

Best Regards,

TRoy Goh

Claims Adwvisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd jreg no sz



55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9828 f. +65 6841 1183

e. claims@premiumauto.com.sg w., www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road 5Singapore 159538 p. +65 6836 2223

€11y,

“Tt comes in blue.” ==

The new Audi A7 Sportback, Do you really need a reason?

| Find out more
S —

Emall Disclaimer

This email, including any attachment, is contidential and may also ba priviteged

I you have recelved it in errar, please potify us immediately by reply emall and than delete this message from your systam
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpase, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you,

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) [mailto:siewsc@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, 23 August 2019 2:24 PM

To: Claims; nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sq

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SKJ 5136 A ON 19/8/2019

Dear TRoy,
As spoken with you.

Kindly advise whether your workshop able to repair SKJ 9136A within repair limit $13,000.00 as instruction by
insurance.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 22 August 2019 5:26 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com=>; nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; 'Claims Dept’ <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>
Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SKJ 9136 A ON 19/8/2019

Dear Shiau Chan,

Due to the extensive damages the vehicle suffered, we would like to counter propose 516,500.00 lump sum to
repair the vehicle.

Your urgent approval is well appreciated.

Thanks

Best Regards,



TRoy Goh
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (seg ne 1omeiriw

55 Lbi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 53238 f. +65 6841 1183
e. claimsE premiumauto. com.Sg W, Wwiw.audi.com.sg

§ ] T —

“Tt comes m b“l.t“;le'T

The new Audl A7 S thack. Do you really need a reasony

Find cut more

Ermail Disclaimer
This emall, incleding any attachment, is confidantial and may also be privileged
If you have recaived it in error, please notify us immediately by reply emall and then delete this message from your systen

Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other parson. Thank you.
¥ pUry ¥

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) [mailto:siewsc@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, 22 August 2019 10:33 AM

To: Claims; nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sq

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SKJ 9136 A ON 19/8/2019

Dear Syafiqg,
Kindly advise whether your workshop able to repair the SKJ 9136A within repair limit $13,000.00.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewse@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 19 August 2019 3:33 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Claims’ <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: OD CLAIM FOR SKJ 9136 A ON 19/8/2019

Dear All,
Kindly register OD claims for this vehicle. Attached is GIA report for your reference.
We will forward you the estimate once is available,

Please arrange survey on 21/8/2019, 10.30am. Vehicle is in workshop.

Best Regards,
Syafiq
Claims Admin Assistant
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Merimen e-Claims

Claim Audit
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| Mariesa
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l 4 Z1AU9 2019 ¢y yeh Model Changed (202500) AUDI A3 1.8 TFSI (A). Kassim, Noor
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5 9741 Modified Setl. Type:3-=0, Claim Type:SC-=00, Rt
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|11 f;,ﬂ‘;g 2013 £|m Veh Model Changed (202500) -» (201401) AUDI A3 1.8 Sportback TFSI S-tronic (A). [“{#;EEGEU
| 21 Aug 2019 x [A] LEE 5U |
| 12 17:41 Adj Adjuster Assigned [Mone] -> ADRIAN LING THING |
22 Aug 2019 Clm Registration . . L [1] Azlan, |
i 13 09: 18 Modified Excess: -> B00.00. 2F Remarks: -> Not Applicable, G5T: -> 7.00. Syazairding |
22 Aug 2019 [A] SHIAU
14 09:58 Adj Rpt Initiated CHAN ‘
22 Aug 2019 - [A] SHIAU
15 05 s8 Cim Dtl Modified JP] Reg, Date: -> 2013/05/27. CHAN l
| - 22 Aug 2019 [A] SHIAU
16 09:58 Clm Details Notified CHAN |
22 Aug 2019 Adj Im. Advice 2 : [A] SHIAU
17 10:45 Submitted Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2019/08/30 CHAN i
22 Aug 2019 Cur.Req:0.00:DAMAGES CONSISTENT. PENDING REPAIR COST FROM REPAIRER, W [A] SHIAU
18 1045 Adj Mandate Request £\ e NOT AUTHORISE REPAIR. CHAN i
19 22 Aug 2019 Adj Mandate Request [A] SHIAU |
17335 Cancealled CHAN :
22 Aug 2019  Adj Im. Advice i . [A] SHIAU |
20 1357 Submitted Mext Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2019/08/30 i
22 Aug 2019 Cur.Req:24562.00:DAMAGES CONSISTENT. REPAIRER ASKING REPAIR COST AT $1 [A] SHIAU
21 17:37 Adj Mandate Regquest 6,500.00 ON LUMP SUM BASIS, (MARGIN OF REPAIr: $13,101.00) WE HAVE NOT A CHAM
X UTHORISE REPAIR.
23 Aug 2019 ; [A] Merimen
22 11:29 Label Added (20226): Coverage Confirmed. Adeinistrator
23 Aug 2019 Mext Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2019/08/30. Mandate Remarks: Repair limit at 513,00 [1] Koh
23 12_,359 Adj Next Rpt Changed  0.00, Kindly check with repairer if they are able to repain Re-inspection to be done Uimrc’}(
’ for damage check and supplementary Items / labour.
23 Aug 2019 Approved: 13000,00: Repair limit at $13,000.00. Kindly check with repairer if they a [1] Kah
24 5. g Adj Mandate Set re able to repair. Re-inspection to be done for damage check and supplementary ite g
12:05 d Victor-CK
[ ms / labour, Reinsp:Yes,
Cur.Req:16500.00:According to the repairer, the owner Insist want to repair his veh
| 25 2E.Aug 2019 Adj Mandate Request  icle and they counter propose again the repair cost at $16,500 on Lump Sum basis 1A] ShIall
09:24 : 4 * CHAN
[ to repair the vehide, Kindly advise,
! 26 ﬁ?;g 2019 4 dj Next Rpt Changed  Cur Rpt:Final Rpt, Cur Due Date:2019/08/30. Mandate Remarks: Refer ta email. Jlﬁ;f:;k
26 Aug 2019 . y " [I] Koh,
. 27 11:33 Adj Mandate Set Manitilned.ﬂefer to email, Victor-CK
Date From 4|7 »| pate To 4] TF ] Audit Type None v/ oo
ACTIVITY o o - -
Mo recard N - S
'Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History . . 1
I Bill Ref Mo Bill Date Aot T . Acc T - .rfﬂ.-l. i
LKK Auta LKK Auto | |
2253498 22;5:,";1;19 Mater Consultants Pte | Consultants Pte SKI9136A 11.77
; | Ltd | Ltd (HQ) :

https:/fsingapore merimen.com/claimsfindex.cfmHusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_viewhistory&caseid=85677 2&extid=314260&CFID=580...
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8/22/2019 Adjuster Immediate Advice
Mote: This document has not been finalised.

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregno 1ass071s8m)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

To: AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid. From: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Al Building 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 079120 Singapore 408933
Altn:  Azlan, Syazairdina Date: 22 Aug 2019

Preliminary Advice
Yehicle Mo : SKJ9136A Accident Date : 19/08/2019
Make T AUDI A3 Palicy No. : 2100340203
Assignment Date »21/08/2019 Excess 1 85800.00
Date of Inspection  : 21/08/2019 Est. Duration of Repair : 8.00
Inspection At : PREMIUM AUTOMOBILES PTE LTD (UBI)
55 UBI ROAD 1

SINGAPORE 408699

Paint of Impact / General Description of Damages
The vehicle sustained impact / damages front portion and parts claimed are consistent to the accident.

Repairer's Estimate (Gross) 5% 33,710.00
Revised Amount 55 18,518.00
Check Items (Estimated) 55 6,044.00
Total 5§ 24 562.00
Lump Sum Repair 5§

Total Loss Consideration

New for Old Value 5%
Pre-Accident Value 5% 58,000.00
COE [ PARF Rebate g2 44 899.00
Salvage Value 55
Margin for Repair 5% 13,101.00

Remarks

( } The vehicle is repairable at our adjusted amount. We have also confirmed excess and policy coverage. Kindly
let us have your authorisation.

[ ) The vehicle is uneconomical to be repaired, you are advised o invite tender for the wreck,

( X ) Other comments : PENDING REPAIR COST FROM REPAIRER.

hitps:/fsingapare.merimen.comiclaimsindex.cfmPlusebox=5VCdoc&fuseaction=dsp_viewersmart&docid=43506006&praview=1&nolayout=1&CFI...
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Cwner 1D Type; Singapore NRIC
Crwiner ID: 892)
Vehicle Mo.: SKI91344
Vehicle to be Exported: Yes
Intended Deregistration Date: 21 Aug 2019
Vehicle Make; AUDI
Wehicle Model; A3 SPORTBACK 1.8 TFSI
Primary Colour: White
Manufacturing Year: 2012
Engine Na.: CDA293330
Chassis No.: WALZZZBPOCA122534
Maximum Power Qutput: 118.0 kW {158 bhp)
Open Market Value: $30,791.00
Original Registration Date; 27 May 2013
First Registration Date: 27 May 2013
Transfer Count: ]
Artual ARF Paid: $30,108.00
PARF Eligibility: Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date; 26 May 2023
PARF Rebate Amount: $19.570.00
e O e e e ey
COE Expiry Date: 26 May 2023
COE Category: B - Car {1601cc & above)
COE Peripd(Years): 10
QP Paid: $67.304.00
COE Rebate Amount: $25,329.00
Tatal Rebate Amount: %44 899.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 21 Aug 2019

OK
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CONNECTING CAR BUYERS & SELLERS.

We'll handle your loans, insurance & other paperwork for FREE.

Post an Advertisement
Soll it yourselfl Advertice it Bt just

$58 until it's SOLD!

bl ero coo ~ [l Miese ~ [l ven e+ [l - B

audi a3 Ay Any 1013 Any By Aery Available

l:l Audi A3 Sportback 1,44 TFSI $51,600 511,130 fyr J0-Mar-2013 1390 ¢ b5, 650 krm Hatchback Available

$0 Drive Away! New Arrhvall Very Good Condition! Low Milzage Done! Hasshe Free! 100% Accident Free! 100% Loan Approwall Bank Loan
Or In House Loan Availablel Original Conditicn! Mo Modification! Fast Yet Fuel Economéc! Call Now To View The Car Before It's Sold! T

Viking Motar Pre Lid

D Audi A3 Sportback 1.8A TFSI $61,B88 | 411,640 fyr J0-Aug-2013 1,798 o 56, 000 km Hatchback Availabie
Cheapest In The Market! Flexitie Loan Options/High Trade-Ins Avallable! Sporty Yet Fuel Efficient Hot Hatchback, Meticulously Maintained

Linlt By Cwner, Always Shelter Parked, Kan-Smaoking, Accident Free, Call Us MHMWWMM&MW m
Cars 88 Pte Ltd
* [ m———" i i o a3 A L
[] Audi A3 Sportback 1.44 TFSI $56,000 $11,520 fyr 27-Now-2013 1,395 oc 62,000 km Hatchback Available
S-tronic Ambiente
This Sleek Yet: Punchy Audi A3 Hatchback! Very Compatitively Priced! Nice Registration Piate, Rare Beluga Brown Metallic, Wel Maintained
By Previous Chwner With No Repairs Needed With Record! STA Evaluation Welcome! High Fuel Economy. Sharp Handling Paired With Tur... (" rexiiusni ap |

Car Buyers Automative Pte Ltd

D Audi A3 Sportback 1,44 TFSI §58,989 $11,830 fyr 10-Dec-2013 1,395 cc 40,000 km Hatchback Available
S-tronic Ambition

1 Matioulous Ownes, Excellent Condition, Fully Maintained By Agent, Comes With A Comprehansive 120 Points Chedk And & Manths
Warranty And 1 Freq Servicing Package From MBM Wheelpower, Law Mileage Done, Low Bank Interest Rate, In Houss Loan Finance Ay,

E Car Buying » a‘ Car Seiling » P Car Ownership » i
- For Sale! P
E‘ Car Aftermarker » m On The Mova » 1 Lifesbyle » = : ____|

D Audi A2 Sportback 1.4A TF5I 553,800 $10,630 fyr 1-Dec-=2013 1385 e 80,000 km Hatchback Available
S-tronic Ambition

The Audi A3, A Papular Car Which You mWﬂTﬂhSBenDﬁvlﬁg In.'u'-"rm.anrbodwgm La-Litré Engine Under The Hood Producting
120bhp You Can Be Assured This Will Bring Out The Sportiness In You Without Compromising The Lusurious Feel, This Unit Ts Well-Mal,

Bidded Carplates ]

Posbed: XJul- 3015 Bgs] - d013 Auch AL, 2013 ] 23, A A3, sudi 331 Audi A 3, Lissd A

Save this search criteria, to get email aleris whenever o match is found, i T 0 |

For old advertisements, view Expired ads 20 T resubts/page

Home | New Cars | Used Cars | Sell My Car Directory | Products | Insurance | Article | Forum | Resources
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