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LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (CD) ~ Menu

&« Service Request Details
Claim
S9MO1UPF

Reference
None &

Loss Date
July 19, 2019

Report Date
Jul 22, 2019 2:42:08 PM

Request Date
August 20, 2019

Due Date
August 27, 2019

Vendor Name
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (OD)

Type of Loss
Own Damage

Services
Accelerated survey and authorize
Actions

Next Step
Agree to perform service

Decline Work Accept Work

Vehicle Information

Incident Vehicle Registration #
SLH2681L



LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (OD) = Menu

viuuci

S60 D4

Service Address

Primary Contact/Insured

CUPPACHOICE INTERNATIONAL PTE LTD

15 JALAN TEPONG, #05-03 JURONG FOOD HUB, 619336, Singapore
68972822

FECELIA@DAGLEN.COM/CS@DAGLEN.COM

Claim Handler

CHAN Kian Chuan
68805444
kianchuan.chan@axa.com.sg

Additional Instructions
XS $0.00 WS: CAS GARAGE PTE LTD

Messages Invoices History Documents Assessment Metrics Notes

[N P AA -~ P
New Message
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LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS F

Re:RE: Re:Al uploaded SLH 2681H

Type
© Question

Message
PLS PROCEED TO AUTHORIZED REPAIRS




LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (OD} -

Iviguci

S60 D4

Service Address

Primary Contact/Insured

CUPPACHOICE INTERNATIONAL PTE LTD

15 JALAN TEPONG, #05-03 JURONG FOOD HUB, 619336, Singapore
68972822

FECELIA@DAGLEN.COM/CS@DAGLEN.COM

Claim Handler

CHAN Kian Chuan
68805444
kianchuan.chan@axa.com.sg

Additional Instructions
XS $0.00 WS: CAS GARAGE PTE LTD

Messages Invoices History Documents Assessment Metrics

Notes

New Message

TYPE (7]

SENT 8/26/19 1:42 PM

FROM CHAN Kian Chuan

SUBJECT Re:RE: Re:Al uploaded SLH 2681H

BODY PLS PROCEED TO AUTHORIZED REPAIRS
L o

TYPE ]

SENT 8/26/19 1:32 PM



Denise Tax (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 26 August 2019 5:02 PM
To: Allan Goh; SUR

Cc: Nicole Chong

Subject: RE: Scan Data from FX-C8F072
Dear Sir,

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SLH 2681H (Excess $0.00/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434
to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before
completion of the repair.

*Qur client reserve their right not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Allan Goh <allangoh.cas@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 22 August 2019 6:19 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Nicole Chong <nicolechong.cas@gmail.com>
Subject: Fwd: Scan Data from FX-C8F072

Hi Sur,
Please refer to the cost price estimate for Volvo S60 SLH2681L .
We would like to request for lumpsum repair.

Thank you

Regards,

Allan Goh

CAS Garage Pte. Ltd.
No.1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6
#02-22

Singapore 417883
UEN: 201828067M
Tel: 6484 2220
Mobile: 8782 7171
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LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (OD) ~

Re:Al uploaded SLH 2681H

Type
© Question

Message
PLS CLARIFY ON THE COR & SEEK MANDATE FOR AUTHORIZATION OD CLAIM UNABLE TO HOLD.

Reply




K

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (OD) -

Al uploaded SLH 2681H

Type
© Question

Message

Dear Kian Chun, Please be inform that the Damage Consistent, Repair cost economical, Pending cost price,
Repairer is asking of lump sum, We did not authorize repair. Regards Denise




LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (OD) ~

viuuci

S60 D4

Service Address

Primary Contact/Insured

CUPPACHOICE INTERNATIONAL PTE LTD

15 JALAN TEPONG, #05-03 JURONG FOOD HUB, 619336, Singapore
68972822

FECELIA@DAGLEN.COM/CS@DAGLEN.COM

Claim Handler

CHAN Kian Chuan
68805444
kianchuan.chan@axa.com.sg

Additional Instructions
XS $0.00 WS: CAS GARAGE PTE LTD

Messages Invoices History Documents Assessment Metrics Notes
New Me
TYPE (7]
SENT 8/23/19 9:48 AM
FROM LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (OD)
SUBJECT Al uploaded SLH 2681H
BODY Dear Kian Chun, Please be inform that the Damage C...
*«
TYPE (7]

SENT 8/21/19 2:44 PM



KADRI Mateen

=== e ——— ——— e
From: Nicole Chong <nicolechong.cas@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, August 20, 2019 10:29 AM
To: SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey
Cc: Allan Goh; Cher Yip
Subject: [EXTERNAL] PRI - SLH 2681L DOA 19.07.2019 (OWN DAMAGE CLAIM)
Attachments: 2681lest.pdf
Categories: Mateen
Dear Sir /Madam,

Please find the attached estimate.

Kindly arrange survey our client's vehicle.

Do let us know when is the available date and time for inspection of the vehicle at:

CAS Garage Pte. Ltd.
Addr: 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, #02-22

Autobay. Singapore (417883)

Once arranged, please contact Allan Goh at 8782 7171 during the inspection.

Thank you and have a nice day! Hope to hear from you soon

Regards,

Nicole Chong

CAS Garage Pte. Ltd.

Addr: 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, #02-22
Autobay. Singapore (417883)

Hp: 9791 6119

Office: 6484 2220

UEN: 201828067M
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= Consultants
Bl A B Pte Lid

51 UBI AVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL

Immediate Advice

To : AXA Insurance Pte Ltd

Survey details

Date of loss 19-Jul-19

Date of appointment 22-Aug-19
Date of survey 22-Aug-19
Location of survey CAS Garage

Vehicle Details:

Claim Type: Own Damage
Vehicle number SLH 2681L
Make and Model VOLVO Se0 D4
Date of registration 27/10/2016
Excess 0.00
Market Value $80,000
Parf Rebate $54,187
Nett Loss $25,813

Repair details

[initial Estimate $23,185
Proposed/Revised repair cost:

Parts 511,869
Check item S0
Labour $780
Total $12,649
Lump Sum(if applicable) $10,200
[Number of days of repair 4

Remarks:

< (065) 62563561 FAX : (063) 62564315

Date: 23/8/2019

Damage Consistent
Repair cost economical
Pending cost price

Repairer is asking of lump sum




712312019 PARF/C.OF Rehate Fnoniry
5 Ba _
“+ . >Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type: Company

Owner ID: 1347

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: SLH2681L

Vehicle to be Exported: No

Intended Deregistration Date: 24 Jul 2019

Vehicle Make: VOLVO

Vehicle Model: S60 D4

Primary Colour: Red

Manufacturing Year: 2016

Engine No.: D4204T141759831
Chassis No.: YV1FSA8CDH2426336
Maximum Power Output: 140.0 kW (187 bhp)
Open Market Value: $27,841.00

Original Registration Date: 27 Oct 2016

First Registration Date: 27 Oct 2016
Transfer Count: 0

Actual ARF Paid: $20,978.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: Yes

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 26 Oct 2026

PARF Rebate Amount: $15,733.00
Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 26 Oct 2026

COE Category: E - Open Category
COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: $54,200.00

COE Rebate Amount: $38,454.00

Total Rebate Amount: $54,187.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 23 Jul 2019

nllps:nvn.na.gov.sgnlarvruacuonrenqmrenenatenyruuucneroreuereglnpm.fruwt, HIUN_ID=rusu4uuydi |

i



\7123/2019 Used Volvo S60 Car for Sale in Singapore, Carsmart Pte Ltd - sgCarMart
" - '
L SGCAaRMART.COM Login  Sign up
New Cars Sell My Car Directory Products Insurance Articles Forum Resources

Get More Cash for Your Car, Post an Ad Today

Receive a higher selling price by selling your car yourself.

Advertise it for sale at just $58, list till sold.

Valve 560 Price Range v Depreciation ¥ 2016 v Vehicle Type v N
Home » Used Cars » Carsmart Pte Ltd » Volvo S60 Diesel D4
Volvo S60 Diesel D4
Financial Insurance Accessories Similar Research Photos Map
Price Diesel (Euro 5 Engine and
00 Fuel
$85,0 uel Type Above)
Depreciation $10,830 /yr Reg Date 21-Jun-2016
View models with similar depre (6yrs 10mths 28days COE left)
Mileage 61,000 km (19.8k /yr) Manufactured 2016
Road Tax $1,864 [yr Transmission Auto
Dereg Value $48,101 as of today (change) oMV §27,316
COE $47,604 ARF $20,243
Engine Cap 1,969 cc Power 140.0 kW (187 bhp)
Curb Weight 1,615 kg No. of Owners 2
Type of Vehicle Luxury Sedan e
sar
Features focan a0
Powerful Yet Economical 2L Inline 4 Cylinders Twin Turbo 187 Bhp, 400NM Of Torque, 0 To 100 Km At 7.6 Secs,
8 Speed Automatic Transmission. View specs of the Volva S60 Diesel (2013-2017) Shortlist Compare Add note
Report Error More Actions

Accessories
Digital Display, Multi-Function Steering, Cruise Control, Keyless Entry/Start, Rain Sensors, Bluetooth Connectivity,
Power Memory Seats.

_ Company Carsmart Pte Ltd
Description » dealer's pricelist
Consignment Unit! 1 Owner Only! Agent Warranty With Fully Agent Serviced! 1 Remaining Servicing. Well Known » 5 vehs sold | 7 vehs available
For Its Stability And Safety! Original BBS Rim, New Battery & Tyres! Front/Back Camera! Owner Changing Car To
7 Seaters MPV Due To Family Expansion. Car Number Plate Will Be Retained By Existing Owner. STA/VICOM/AA Address 21 Woodlands Close #05-15
Evaluation Friendly. Welcome Trade-in. Bank Loan And In House Loan Supported! Search cars nearby this location

Location Primz Bizhub
Category
PARF Car Office No 62006351
Contact Person(s)  Tony 88213020
Status Vince 86878866
Available
Resources
sm Vehicle Evaluation
e e Afraid of lemons? Request to have this car evaluated professionally. Find out more
@ Car Valuation - Free
o . Find out the market value of your existing car for free. Get started
Posted on: 29-Jun-2019 | Last Updated on: 29-Jun-2019
™ ~
https://www.sgcarmart.com/used_cars/info.php?ID=824057&DL=3540
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MSME 18084842 / SME Motar Pte Lid - Kaki Bukit
ENTRY DATE & TIME: 20/07/2018 11:10
SUBMITTED 8Y: Wen Ying

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report cunfectlx the details of the accident to speed up the claims process

2. Tnis Form must be completed by the Policyholder and/or the Authorised Driver

3. Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any wilful misrspresentation or witholding of material facts may allow insurance companies lo
repudiate policy liability.

4. The issue and acceptance of this Farm by insurance companies is not an admission of policy liability on the part of the insurance companies.

. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

8. This report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance Assaciation of Singapore (GIA) for
archiving and that copies of this repert will, for a fee, be made available upen application by interested parties.
7. By the lodgemaent of this report lo the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and to copies of the report being made avallable

aforesaid.
ACCIDENT STATEMENT
Date Of Report 20/07/2019 11:10
Date Of Accident 19/07/2019 15:15
Exact Location Of Accident CROSS JUNCTION OF BOONLAY WAY CORPORATION ROAD.
Country/State of Loss SINGAPORE
DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

Vehicle Registration Number SLH2681L

Insureddelicyholdéi-z = B el
Name Of Registered Owner CUPPACHOICE INTERNATIONAL PTE LTD

Co Reg No 2001051342

Email Address NOEMAIL

Mobile Phone No

Alternative Phone No OFFICE-82288202

Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer VOLVO

Model S60 D4

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy

for repair to your vehicle? VES
If No, Please state action to be taken
VVehicle Category PRIVATE CAR

Iinsurance Company = = = : ==t

Name of Insurance Company AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD

Type Of Coverage
Fleet Policy

Policy Number
Cover Note Number
Driver

Name of Driver |
NRIC No

Date Of Birth
Occupatian

Date Of Driving Pass
Driving Experience
Gender

Mobile Number

Fax Number
Contact Number
EMail Address

COMPREHENSIVE
NO
GA4041901

CHONG SING RUI
S8607207D

07/02/1996

INDOOR

04/04/2017

2 YEARS AND 3 MONTHS
MALE

(LOCAL) +65-83380086

NOEMAIL

Page 1 of 14
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Address

Postcode

Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company
If No, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own
Vehicle

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle

General Information. of the Accident

Type Of Accident

Weather Conditions

Road Surface

Other Information

Was any foreign vehn:le |nvolved in this accident?

Number of vehicles (including own vehicle)
involved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident?

Was any injured conveyed to hospital by
ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged?

| have been approached by unknown person(s)
saliciting/affering accident claims assistance.

Number of Passengers (Including Drlver]
Details of Police Action’ '

Was the accident reported to the police?

If Yes, Please state which Police Station
Was natice of intended Prosecution given?
If Yes,against whom?

Clrt:umstances o‘f Acc!derlt

BLK 666A JURONG WEST ST 85 #03-191

541666
YES

COLLISION - HEAD TO REAR

CLEAR
DRY

NO
2

NO

YES

NO

NO

NO

ON 18th JULY 2019 AT ABOUT 1515HRS AT THE CROSS JUNCTION OF BOON LAY WAY AND CORPORATION ROAD. |
WAS TURNING RIGHT TOWARDS CORPORATION ROAD. AS | MOVED OFF, VEHICLE B SLX6723P SLOWED DOWN

INFRONT OF ME. | DID NOT STOP MY VEHICLE IN TIME CAUSING MY VEHICLE A (SLH2681L) TO HIT THE REAR
PORTION OF VEH!CLE B THERE WERE NO PASSENGER IN BOTH VEH!CLES AS THE ACCIDENT HAPF’ENED

Attachment( :

Are accident photos avallable for attachrnenl?

Was there any video captured by Car Camera?

Was there any audio recorded?

DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1

Vehicle Registration Number
Vehicle Make/Model/Colour
Details Of Properties
Vehicle Category

Name of Driver
NRIC/Passport Number
Contact Number

Address

Postcode

Insurance Company Name
Nature Of Damage

No. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

YES
NO
NO

SLX6723P

VEHB

PRIVATE CAR
TIAR NAN CHEAN
S7106150G
82087171

Page 2 of 14
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Accident Sketch Plan Pg. 1

IMPORTANT NOTICE

ease fepot torrectiy e Geldas of the acciosnt (o speed up the clalms arocess

& Tios Foum mvese ne completnd

wh

IwformEtien pravides must ve as ruthlul and scouraie 65 possiole. Any wiliyl misragretentation cr withhalsing of matarial

facts mav ailow insurance companies to repudiate palicy Uabiling,

4 The isue and accaptance of this Form by insurance compenies is nat an samissian of oolicy Uaalilty on the pare of the theurance
iomDanet

5. Any laise revorting way b referred tothe Sehee for investipsiian,

& The repoer will 52 fonsarded by 1he :nsurets of Whe Gil Recards Manzgement Cenire estanliched by the Genersl Insurance

Associaion of Singapare [GIA) for archiving and that capiss af this caficrt will for 3 fee be made available upen application by
interesred parties,

7. 3y the cdgmant of this reger: o tae incurars, you Reraby wonsent (e he archiving of this ceport a: the cantre na 1o topies of
thie r2apost balng made svailsbie sioresars

"

Tuaigri under ine Pecsonal Rata ratection fiet (PDFA]
undinsiyed, wknovdedge, sgree 30 sansent thas:
2] v nzdre ey wAINSNep 204 tne Ganacal Insurance Assocseiion of Smgapore (“GIAY] mey/are peemitted to collacs, Jse,
Sutiace andfor pracess my carsanst dete/parsoral irinrmatian s2t 2wt ln thls llerm) and v 0iher pecsoaal Infarmation
arovided By me 31 posseised oy My thedier (cofiectively the “Farsonas informatina”) and disclose snd transfer such
| Fersonal Information to sl Incurerls) who have Insured vehizie(s) tavelved in this zccident fall ‘nourer(s) whe have insured
wehicle(t] Involvee in this accident shad be cuilzctively reirrred to 35 the “insurers®), the Insurers’ lswyers Faw florns,

Morgtary Authority of Slngzpars 2ad any relavant Esunsnssenl Speacy/iythoriny (such 25 the poiice), for the purposelsy
ﬂ" -

{i} precesung, REnding aad/es d2aling with my ¢laim: Incivding the setttement of the clalms and sny necessary
investigations relating 1= the cizims:

(i} investignting the acsident and/ar my daims:
(i} carrying our and/ar daaling with my Instructions or responding o 2ay eaguities by ne;

viatminstaring my claims tintlucing the mailing of curtaspondence, state mants, invnices, raports o notieas o ma,
“hich coule invoive disciasure of cevtain parsone cata sbout Me 16 Sring s2eul delivery of the same ag weii 35 onthe
erteinal cover of envelopes/msil zatkages), and/or

Wl remplying with applicabla law SaMiEtenng, processing. handling andjor dealing with my claims.{zef'ectivaly tha
TPurzuses™)
bl anwsurerts) whn have msuree vehiclati} Invalved in th aceigeni and the iniures” awyers/law irms, may/er: permicied
e collecl, use, Shiclose 2ad/ar precess my Persanal Infarmatiorn fo- ons oy more of the abows PFurgases; and
2} v Personas Intarmation mavfesr be disciased by any of tha Insurars and/ur GI& 10 thelr third p2riy service nroviders or
sgentsfinchiding halr lswveinlaw linmsj which may ba sited spteide of Singeprre, fur azie ot more of e aocve Furgoses.
9} my Persanal Infarmation wilf zleo be 2obertad and Used 1o zorrpile tlaims istory for the purpose of fravd Zetechon,
(NURATIRRENN 208 Mansgament in fArasentznd all fulure zisims
Maialarmation wo sQiledted unigar {B) avave may be shared 7 distaged:

U to 2l insurers andjor eny grrer tair
faguistors, Jaw enforzement snd

:'E& that easlatin pveliating, bwestgsting, contreiiing ar managing fraud,

s, N1 BYANCIR: as rezsonably raquired for the CUrpotes sated, or

g W reguirsmenisfunder sn? FERJIILILNEL, 13ws 7 Loun Gréers.

\_

R Ny /A |
v e . T e ——
Policdholder s Signaturs Cilvers W \4 Pegorting Centre Parsonna's Signature
Diare & Tirma: UF driver iSnefths oonz Roleer; Name:
Cate & Time: MRIC/RIN Mg,

(RGdty
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Accident Sketch Plan Pg. 1

DESCRIBE CIRCUNISTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT

| On_i8m Hum 264 kot

FSIE_HQS ad- e ﬁmé’é’ppnc}mn

radion

_obd__Corppradion Read - T wa g

90(6333? pred _down

A6 T moved off , Vowrds
infrort of me. I drd nof

vehale

W HME paudInA  mu iele ol L
Yo kit W war povtion_of _vebicle (g9

Mag  wee no précenden

in _bolh \plyclee a8 Ha pead et

v

o -

; 7
= Jed faregaing partizdiars are e n 7‘@19 res v:(f
/ /Jl

.-DW Signature

S " ey st}\nm\.rqyﬁ [ Repsrilng Cantre Personnal’s Sisnature
{H driver is'nar o calldfhotder Name. )
Oate & Time:

NRIE/FIN g -
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Accident Sketch Plan Pg. 1
LETTER OF UNDERTAKING
e, Chipgy C‘WE Qy , iae owner of vehicie no. S 20eL

Ay/Our Insurance is under M/s AXA insurance Pte Lid, Irwe shall decide wheiher
claim under my/our Po'icy or agairst the Third Party and if the former shall submii
such a claim to M/s AXA Insurance Pe Ltd with all relevant facts enc documenis
within 14(fourteen) days of occurrence or discovery of damage. __

MWOU: Third Party claim is handle by my/our preferred workshop, (08 el

Signed and Atknowledge by:

Wl o 2 ard e 1é :
hTic 0. & signature of policyholder Company stamp Laie
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%) CAS GARAGE PTE LD

¥a7M)

p (Reg No:
el
‘ ' 1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6, #02-22 AUTOBAY, SINGAPORE 417883

VEHICLE REPAIR ESTIMATE

Insurance Company: AXA INSURANCE

Address: NO 8,SHENTON WAY #24-01

AXA TOWER ,S(068811)
Telephone: 68804888 Fax: 68804740 Email: motor.survey@axa.com.sg
Make/ Model : VOLVO S60 D4 Date: 16.08.2019
Chassis No : YVIFSA8CDH2426336 Vehicle No: SLH2681L
Date/Time of Accide 19.07.2019/1515 Reg date : 27.10.2016

Materials Cost/ Spare Parts Cost

TO BE COMPLETED BY SERVICE ADVISOR

ITEMS PARTS DESCRIPTION QTY |COST PRICE $|COST PLUS | FINAL PRICE $
1 FRONT BUMPER \ 1 | $_ 1.856.00 10% $ 2,041.60
2 FRONT BUMPER RETAINERS | 2 120 65.00 10% 3 143.00
3 FRONT BUMPER LOWER BRACKETS V7 \ovifl2 1 | §¢ 7 85.00 10% S 187.00
4 FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT COVER ¢ i1’ | § 285.00 10% $ 313.50
5 FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT . GV E 450.00 10% $ 495.00
6 FRONT BUMPER DAYLIGHT e 2 [$ ~ 350.00 10% S 770.00
7 FRONT BUMPER DAYLIGHT COVER 2 |[§ .~ 105.00 10% § 231.00
8 FRONT BUMPER DAYLIGHT COVER GARNISH Y 211 8 65.00 10% $ 143.00
9 FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE .~ , "/ | 1 |S 90.00 10% $ 99.00
10 FRONT BUMPER LOWER COVER 1 [§  350.00 10% $ 385.00
11 FRONT RADIATOR SUPPORT GUIDE 218 18500 10% $ 407.00
12 FRONT SUPPORT PANEL 1| 750.00 10% $ 825.00
13 FRONT CONDENSER 1 |8 480.00 10% $ 528.00
14 FRONT INTERCOOLER 1 ['§ (1,380.009  10% $ 1,518.00
15 FRONT RADIATOR GRILLE 1 |$ 74580 10% $ 820.38
16 FRONT RADIATOR GRILLE LOGO RE 55.00 10% $ 60.50
17 FRONT BONNET ; 1 |$  2,235.00 10% $ 2.458.50
18 FRONT FENDER INNER COWLING 2 % 125.00 10% $ 275.00
19 FRONT HEADLAMP ; 2 | $1340 920.00 10% $ 2,024.00
20 FRONT HEADLAMP BRACKETS- 2 % 60.00 10% g 132.00

Total List Price Cost §  13,856.48




SPECIAL NETT PARTS DESCRIPTION QTY PRICE § FINAL PRICE §
1 FRONT NUMBER PLATE WITH CASING ¥ewf |1 SET| § 50.00 v $ 50.00
2 FRONT BUMPER UNDER COVER CLIPS @ |1 SET| § 30.00 e $ 30.00
3 FRONT BUMPER CLIPS ~Nec 1SET| $ 30.00 o $ 30.00
Total Special Nett Items 3 110.00
Labour Works/ Panel Beating Related Works
Job Scope Quotation
TO RENEW DAMAGED PARTS, REPLACE,BEAT ,WELD , REALIGN ,STRAIGHTENED MEMBER $ l,ﬂllf()()
500
Spray Painting
Job Scope Quotation
TO RESPRAY AFFECTED AREAS $ 1,260.00
2.5V
Others Cost (Accident Repair Related Expenses)
Job Scope Quotation
TO TUFFCOAT AFFECTED AREA $ 150.00
TO REMOVE/ REFIT WIRING CHECKS FOR FRONT HEADLAMPS AND RESET $ 2 12070
TO REMOVE/ REFIT FRONT CONDENSER AND TOP UP AIR CON GAS $§ = 120.00
TO APPLY UNDERCOATING ON REPAIRED AND REPLACED PANEL $ ¥ 20000
Total Others Cost b 590.00
GRAND TOTAL $ 17,356.48

CAS GARAGE PTE LTD

UEN 201828067M .
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6, #02-22 AUTOBAY,
SINGAPORE 417883

CAS GARAGE PTELTD

Person Incharge: Allan

Direct Contact; +65 8782 7171
Email: allangoh.cas@gmail.com
Fax : 6509 9501

TEL: 64842220




VEHICLE REPAIR ESTIMATE

Insurance Company:

AXA INSURANCE

Address: NO 8,SHENTON WAY #24-01

AXA TOWER .S(068811)
Telephone: 68804888 Fax: 68804740 Email: motor.survey@axa.com.sg
Make/ Model : VOLVO S60 D4 Date: 16.08.2019
Chassis No : YVIFSASCDH2426336 Vehicle No: SLH2681L
Date/Time of Accide 19.07.2019/1515 Reg date : 27.10.2016

Materials Cost/ Spare Parts Cost

TO BE COMPLETED BY SERVICE ADVISOR

ITEMS PARTS DESCRIPTION QTY | LIST PRICE $ FINAL PRICE $
1 FRONT BUMPER W4~ 1 |[$ 295630 P 2.956.30
2 FRONT BUMPER RETAINERS ~ ree 2 % 121.50 i E 243.00
3 FRONT BUMPER LOWER BRACKETS % # ™4[ 2 | 135.60 35¢o| $ 27120
4 FRONT REINFORCEMENT ABSORBER %{< | 1 |$ 435.60 | & 435.60
5 FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT “E2-4- TE 580.90 18 580.90
f FRONT BUMPER DAYLIGHT 4 2 |8 498.70 x| $ 997.40
7 FRONT BUMPER DAYLIGHT COVER A ¥~ 2 |$ 157.50 FE 315.00
8 FRONT BUMPER DAYLIGHT COVER GARNISH~- 2 [§ 97.80 K 195.60
9 FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE et i T 145.80 FaE 145.80
10 FRONT BUMPER LOWER COVER /el o 1 |$ 367.50 18 367.50
11 FRONT RADIATOR SUPPORT GUIDE sl C55 [ § 284.20 2548 . 56840
12 FRONT RADIATOR GRILLE ( acd{_cJ 1 |[$ 1.354.80 18 1.354.80
13 FRONT RADIATOR GRILLE LOGO x4 TE 95.60 —1$ 95.60
14 FRONT SUPPORT PANEL ¢ 1 [$ 1,012.80 B 1.012.80
15 FRONT CONDENSER  Alrt pA- HE 650.30 X|$ 650.30
16 FRONT INTERCOOLER  p= Benttc - 1 |[$ 198560 13 1,985.60
17 FRONT BONNET Nt i 1 |$ 3.587.60 M 3,587.60
18 FRONT FENDER INNER COWLING Mt . 2 |$ 198.60 ME 397.20
19 FRONT HEADLAMP  (aC 2 | $  1.659.80 — s 3,319.60
20 FRONT HEADLAMP BRACKETS A& o 2 |s 102.60 < |$ 205.20

Total List Price Cost $ 19.685.40
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SPECIAL NETT PARTS DESCRIPTION QTY PRICE § FINAL PRICE §
1 FRONT NUMBER PLATE WITH CASING ¢ |1 SET] $ 50.00 $ =~ 50.00
2 FRONT BUMPER UNDER COVER CLIPS /" |1 SET| § 30.00 $ .~30.00
3 FRONT BUMPER CLIPS Al 1 SET| § 30.00 $ . 30.00
Total Special Nett Items $ 110.00
Labour Works/ Panel Beating Related Works
Job Scope Quotation
TO RENEW DAMAGED PARTS, REPLACE,BEAT .WELD , REALIGN .STRAIGHTENED MEMBER $ 1,600.00
Sv0
Spray Painting
Job Scope Quotation
TO RESPRAY AFFECTED AREAS $ 1,2100./00
2L 50
Others Cost (Accident Repair Related Expenses)
Job Scope Quotation
TO TUFFCOAT AFFECTED AREA $ > 150.00
TO REMOVE/ REFIT WIRING CHECKS FOR FRONT HEADLAMPS AND RESET $ 2 120000
TO REMOVE/ REFIT FRONT CONDENSER AND TOP UP AIR CON GAS § > 120.00
TO APPLY UNDERCOATING ON REPAIRED AND REPLACED PANEL $ > 200.00
Total Others Cost 5 590.00
GRAND TOTAL $ 23,185.40
fdo.. e
L/s l..’./d.‘;/!%
CAS GARAGE PTE LTD O4 D ‘V}/J.
Person Incharge: Allan
Direct Contact: +65 8782 7171
Email: allangoh.cas@gmail.com r
Fax : 6509 9501
TEL: 64842220 LKK Auto Consultants hence notify
the Repairer of the following:
» To resurvey beforesatier spray painting
» To display daimaged part(s| during resurvey
« Parts prices are subject to confirmation
» Third party survey /s on a "Withcu! Prejudice” basis

« No illegal modification(s) is allowed
 Supplementary item(s) must be resurveyed and
is subject to final approval from Insurance Company

Acknowledged by Repairer

Signature:
Date:
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