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HUA MENG SPRAY PAINTING WORKSHOP

1, Kaki Bukit Avenue 6, Blk C #01-61 / 01-34, Singapore 417883
Autobay @ Kaki Bukit
Tel: 6747 8064, 6746 5519 / 9666 9680 Fax: 6743 4896

ESTIMATE glay ol
CELESTE WONG Date :24.08.2019
BLK 165 HOUGANG AVE 1 Vehicle No SMK 8207 G
#10-1602 Make/Model :HONDA FREED
$ 530165 Accident date :20.07.2019
No DESCRIPTION Qty Amount (S$)
List Items _

1 Rear windscreen rubber "'« 1 S 88"

2 Rear tallgate o.dte 1 » 132

3 Rear tailgate hinges @ $ 82.50 © ~* 2 S 165

4 Rear tailgate upper lock |, .. 1 $ 231~

5 Rear tallgate lower lock | 1 S 512~

6 Rear tailgate weather strip -4 1 S 143~

7 Rear tailgate inner board 1< s 1 S 41Bx

8 Rear tailgate shock absorber @ 5 165.00 " % 2 S 330«

9 Rear tailgate H emblem - 4, 1 $ 682
10 Rear tailgate Freed emblem 1 S 682~
11 Rear tailgate Hybrid emblem » 1 S 49
12 Rear tailgate reflector @ § 748.00 /+ r+- 2 S 149 ~
13 Rear tallgate handle »ofrs 1 S 198 - /
14 Rear bumper o fofeed 1 s 1155
15 Rear bumper side holder @ S 60.50 “r. 2 s 121-

16 Rear bumper reverse sensor (1 set) - 1 S 418 ¢
17 Rear bumper clips (1 set) . =2 _ 1 $ pbio
18 Rear end panel oo Tk 9 3 S 528 -
19 Rear end panel top garnish »iv .« 1 Bl 1 S 198y
20 Rear bumper LH inner side garnish =« ) 1 $ 418 TS
SN & $ 75515
Less 20% Disc $ 15103
Total 5 60412
Labour Cost

1 To supply rear windscreen sealant 5 50 -

2 Remove & reinstall rear windscreen _ é $ 15w

3 Remove & reinstall reverse sensor 4 1' ) 5 ',1..53’5 2

4 Remove & reinstall bootlid inner garnish $ 200 A0

5 Remove ,replace & repair consistent to the accident 5 I.!-Dﬂ"? e

6 Respray painting [ _uog»? 3

7 Ti‘uff kote $ 1007 ¢

Total $ 3150
Grand Total $ 91912
o .+, | LI 6




Jia Le (LKK Auto)

To: Syed-Yusoff, Saliha
Subject: RE: AIG ref: 45254102715G-003 Il y/r ref: SMKB207G (DOA: 20/07/19)
Attachments: IMG_4732JPG; IMG_4733.JPG; IMG_4734 JPG; IMG_4735.JPG; IMG_4736JPG; IMG_

4737JPG; IMG_4738.PG; IMG_4739.JPG; IMG_4740.PG; IMG_4741.JPG; IMG_
4742 JPG; IMG_4743 IPG; IMG_4744.1PG; IMG_4745.JPG; IMG_4746.JPG; IMG_
4747 JPG; IMG_474BJPG

Dear Saliha,

We have inspect the insured’s vehicle and attached the inspect photos for your reference.

I
it

Our investigator comments that there is no damages found on the insured’s vehicle.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Chan Jin Le | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenuoe 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Syed-Yusoff, Saliha [mailto:Saliha.Syed-Yusoff@aig.com)

Sent: Friday, 28 February 2020 3:11 PM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: AIG ref: 45254102715G-003 Il y/r ref: SMKB207G (DOA: 20/07/19)

Dear lia Le,

Please proceed with rejection unless TP able to prove damage was caused by Ol.

Was there any inspection made to OI's vehicle?

Kind Regards,
Saliha

Saliha Syed Yusoff

AlIG

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd

AlG Building, 78 Shenton Way #08-16, Singapore 075120

Tel +(65) 6419 1917 |
www.aig sg

IMPORTANT NOTICE:




Jia Le !Ll(l{ Autn!

From: Syed-Yusoff, Saliha <Saliha.Syed-Yusoff@aig.com>

Sent: Friday, 28 February 2020 3111 PM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: AIG ref: 45254102715G-003 Il y/r ref: SMKB207G (DOA: 20/07/19)
Dear Jia Le,

Please proceed with rejection unless TP able to prove damage was caused by Ol.

Was there any inspection made to Ol's vehicle?

Kind Regards,
Saliha

Saliha Syed Yusoff

AlG

Senior Complex Clalms Examiner

Claims | AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd

AIG Bullding, 78 Shenton Way #08-16, Singapore 079120
Tel +{65) 6419 1917 |
Www.alg.sg

IMPORTANT NOTICE:;

The information in this emall (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by
"Reply” command and permanently delete the original and any capies or printouts thereof. Although this email and
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) [mailto:JiaLle@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, February 20, 2020 3:11 PM

To: Syed-Yusoff, Sallha <Sallha.Syed-Yusoff@aig.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: AIG ref: 45254102715G-003 |l y/r ref: SMKB207G (DOA: 20/07/19)

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

Dear Saliha,

We have spoken to insured driver and she did not receive any letter from t/police. She mentioned that she did not
hit TP vehicle and there was no damages on TP vehicle.




We have request the video footage/evidence from TP. However, they did not have any.

Qur surveyor have review the matter and comment that there were damages to TPV to suggest impact force onto
it's rear, However, there is unable to conclusive as certain caused by Ol,

Kindly let us have your comments/instruction.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6740 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park. Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Syed-Yusoff, Saliha [mailto:Saliha.Sved-Yusoff@aig.com|
Sent: Friday, 13 September 2019 10:51 AM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)
Subject: AIG ref: 45254102715G-003 |l y/r ref: SMKB207G (DOA: 20/07/19)

Dear Jia Le,
Woe refer to the above-captioned.

Please follow up with insured driver if she has received any letter from t/police and do inspect insured’s vehicle for
any damages since she's adamant no collision and TP reported injuries.

Kind Regards,
Saliha

Saliha Syed Yusoff

AlG

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd

AIG Bullding, 78 Shenton Way #08-16, Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1917 |

WWww.aIg.5e

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this emall (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the raecipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient,

2




Jia Le !I.I(K Auto)

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 11 March 2020 2:16 PM

To: Syed-Yusoff, Saliha

Subject: RE: AIG ref- 45254102715G-003 |l y/r ref: SMKB207G (DOA: 20/07/19)
Attachments: IMG_4732.JPG; IMG_4733.JPG; IMG_4734.JPG; IMG_4735.JPG; IMG_4736JPG; IMG_

4737 JPG; IMG_4738.PG, IMG_4739JPG; IMG_4740JPG; IMG_4741.JPG; IMG_
4T742PG; IMG_4743JPG; IMG_4744 JPG; IMG_4745.JPG; IMG_4746.JPG; IMG_
ATATIPG; IMG_4T48.UPG

Dear Saliha,
We have inspected the insured’s vehicle and attached the inspection photos for your reference.
Our investigator commented that there is no damages found on the insured’s vehicle.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lud

Phone: 6740 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S{408933)

From: Syed-Yusoff, Saliha [mailto:Saliha.Syed-Yusoff@alg.com]

Sent: Friday, 28 February 2020 3:11 PM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: AIG ref: 45254102715G-003 Il y/r ref: SMK8207G (DOA: 20/07/19)

Dear lia Le,

Please proceed with rejection unless TP able to prove damage was caused by Ol

Was there any inspection made to Ol's vehicle?

Kind Regards,
Saliha

Saliha Syed Yusoff

AlG

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd

AlG Building, 78 Shenton Way #08-18, Singapare 079120
Tel +(65) 64159 1917 |

WwWw . 3ig.sg



IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this emall (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by
“Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this emall and
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
responslibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affillates either jointly or
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) [mailto:liaLe@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, February 20, 2020 3:11 PM

To: Syed-Yusoff, 5aliha <Saliha.Sved-Yusoff@aig.com>
Subject; [EXTERNAL] RE: AIG ref: 45254102715G-003 Il y/r ref: SMK8207G (DOA: 20/07/19)
This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

Dear Saliha,

We have spoken to insured driver and she did not receive any letter from t/police. She mentioned that she did not
hit TP vehicle and there was no damages on TP vehicle.

We have request the video footage/evidence from TP. However, they did not have any.

Our surveyor have review the matter and comment that there were damages to TPV to suggest impact force onto
it's rear. However, there is unable to conclusive as certain caused by Ol

Kindly let us have your comments/instruction.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jinle@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Syed-Yusoff, Saliha [mailto:Saliha.Syed-Yusoff{@aig.com|
Sent: Friday, 13 September 2019 10:51 AM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Subject: AlG ref: 45254102715G-003 |l y/r ref: SMK8207G (DOA: 20/07/19)

Dear lia Le,

We refer to the above-captioned.

Please follow up with insured driver if she has received any letter from t/police and do Iinspect insured’s vehicle for

any damages since she's adamant no collision and TP reported injuries.

Kind Regards,
Saliha




Saliha Syed Yusoff

AlG

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd

AIG Building,78 Shenton Way #08-16, Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1917 |

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email {and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by
“Reply” command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient,
you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or
printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of
the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International
Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any
way from its use.




Jia Le (LKK Autuz

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 5 March 2020 1:55 PM

To: Hua Meng

Subject: RE- AIG INSURED: SMJ 4132 U OUR REF: SMK 8207 G D.O.A: 20.07.2019
Wilthout Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMJ 4132U & SMK 8207G ON 20/07/2019

We refer to the above matter.

There is no evidence to prove that our insured had collided onto your client's vehicle.

In view of the above, we have our principal instruction fo deny liability and unable fo look info your client’s
claim.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Chan Jia Le | Case Handler
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5702 | email: Jigle@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Uhi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Hua Meng [mailto:huameng@live.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 17 February 2020 6:13 PM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: AIG INSURED: SMJ 4132 U OUR REF: SMK 8207 G D.0.A: 20.07.2019

Dear lia Le

We didn't have video footage or scene photo.
Kindly let us have your offer.

Thank You.

Regards,

ling Yee

Hua Meng Spray Painting Workshop
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 Blk C
#01-34/#01-61

Singapore 417883

Tel : 6746 5519 Fax : 6743 4896

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@|kkauto.carm>
Sent: Friday, November 22, 2019 11:35 AM




To: Hua Meng <huameng@live.com.sg>
Subject: RE: AIG INSURED: SMJ 4132 U OUR REF: SMK 8207 G D.0.A: 20.07.2019

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
ACCIDENT IN 41320U(Al 7/2019
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that liability is unclear for this matter. Enclosed herewith in this email is a copy of our insured's
accident report for your perusal,

We are in a course of investigating into the circumstances of the accident. After verifying further with our Ol we will
revert with our opinion on the cause of the accident. Kindly do not refer to any party for legal assistance until you
heard further from us,

Meanwhile, we would like to request a copy of video footz
to look into the matter.

We shall revert upon hearing from you.

Thank You.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole Intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liabllity, whatsoever, should be deemed [ inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party ks not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le | Caze Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jisle@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S$(408933)

From: Hua Meng [mallto:huameng@live.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 22 November 2019 11:10 AM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: AIG INSURED: SM) 4132 U OUR REF: SMK 8207 G D.O.A: 20.07.2019
Importance: High

Dear Jia Le
We refer to our emall dated 26.10.2019.
We had yet to get your reply.

Kindly let us have your offer soonest,

Thank You.




Regards,

Jing Yee

Hua Meng Spray Painting Workshop
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 BIk C
#01-34/#01-61

Singapore 417883

Tel : 6746 5519 Fax : 6743 4896

From: Hua Meng
sent: Saturday, October 26, 2019 12:56 PM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@|kkauto,com>
Subject: AIG INSURED: SMJ 4132 U OUR REF: SMK 8207 G D.0.A: 20.07.2019

Dear Sir/Madam

We refer above mentioned accident.

We would like to inform that we have finalized with your surveyor.
Kindly revert your offer within 14 days.

Your prompt reply will be appreciated by us.

We enclose relevant documents for your attention.

Thank You.

Regards,

Jing Yee

Hua Meng Spray Painting Workshop
Tel: 67465519  Fax: 6743 4896

Virus-free. www.avg.com
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...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Revphed | No seitiement
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Insured: MAJESTY EXPRESS PTE.LTD. Co feg No: 2013121610

Main ¥
rh : CELESTE WONG, [D: 81064038
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P 57478064, 67465519
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Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*SMKB207G (45254102715G)
[sMI4132U]

CELESTE WONG
Jul 20 2019 9:00PM
[MAJESTY EXPRESS PTE. LTD.]
Hua Meng Spray Painting Workshop

Page 1 of 2

Upined Decuments |  Upiosd Protas | Composs New Lemer | usiosd vises | Upined suais | View [view in Browser| « |
‘o | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1| 15710718 16:15 | General View 0| waws | B
2 |15/10/19 16115 | Genaral View 0 wxrs | HA
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B | 15/10/19 16:15 | General View © | owws | &
5 | 15/10/19 16:15 Ganeral View D | loadies | 4
10 | 15/10/19 16:18 | General View i wnad 06 | BB
11 | 15710719 16:15 Ganeral View i loed 76 | BB
12 |15/10/19 16:15 | Genaral View Q| s |
3 15/10719 16:15 | Geners! View Q| oawrs | &
14 | 15/10/19 16:15 General View ﬁ Load 306 | B
15 |15/10/18 16:15 | General View 0| earc | A
16 | 15710419 16:15 Genaral View ﬁ Load 76 | B
17 |i5/10/19 16:15 | Genars! View ﬁ Losd PG |
18 | 15/10/19 16:15 General View 0| oedrc | M

15 |15/10/18 16:15% | Genersl View @ | Load pG & |
|20 |15/10/19 16:15 | General View Q| evc | &
{21 |15/10/18 16:156 | Genaral View 0| eedec | &
72 |15/10/19 16:15 | Reinspection Photo 0| wars | A
23 | 15/10/19 16:15 | Reinspection Photo O | weews | &
24 |15/10/19 16:15 | Reinspection Photo 0| toades | @
25 |15/10/19 16:15 | Reinspection Photo | Leserc | B
6 | 15/10/19 16:15 | Reinapection Phots 0 s | H
|27 |1S/10719 16115 Reinspection Photo ﬁ oed G | B
28 |15/10/16 16:15 | Reinspection Photo 0 icecc | A
29 | 15/10/19 16:15 Reinspection Photo D lwdrc | A
{30 [15/10/18 16:15 | Reinspection Phots O cuns | R
131 [15/10/19 16:15 | Reinspection Photo O werc | A
i:ﬂ 15/10/19 16:15 | Reinspection Phota 0 | oaws E
33 |15/10/1916:15 | Reinspection Photo O wears | B
34 | 15/10/1% 16:18 Reinspection Photo | teadrc | &
35 | 13/03/20 14:15 Inspection Phato (O1) i Load G | B
36 | 11/00/20 14:35 | Inspection Photo (O1) O eews | A
37 | 13/03730 14:35 Inspection Photo (O1) i Loed 3G | B
38 | 11/03/20 1435 Inapection Photo (O1) i wea s | B
39 |11/03/20 14:35 | Inspection Phote (O1) O 2awc | A
40 | 11/03/20 14:35 | Inspection Photo (O1) 0| e | A
@1 |11/03/20 14:35 | Inspection Photo (01) O waic | A
&1 |11/03/2014:35 | Inspection Photo (OT) 0 wdws | H
43 | 11/03/20 14:35 Inspection Photo (01) 0| wews | A

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_... 16/3/2020



Merimen e-Claims Page 2 of 2

Photos/ Images @ E =
Ho | Relabel/Rearder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
(44 [11/03/20 14:35  |Inspection Photo (OT) O ers | A
45 [11/03/20 14:35  |Inspection Photo [O1) @ | warws | H
46 |11/0W20 14:15 | Inspection Phote (O1) @ | st | A
47 | 11/D3/30 14:35 Inspection Phato [OT) “ oed G | B
48 |11/00/20 14:35 Inspection Phato (01) 0| cews | A
{#8 |13/03/20 14:35 | Inapection Photo (OI) 0| wuws | B
|50 | 11/83/20 14{35% Inspection Photo (01) 0| wawc | B
51 | 10/00/20 14:35 Inspection Photo [OT) ) | Load G gﬂ
Documantation 1 per page E ﬂ
Mo | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
| |21/08/19 15:04 | TP GIA REPORT. @) | Load poF

2 |11/03/20 16:10 | EMAIL TO AIG ON 11032020 a Lasd PDF

3 1403720 16:10 EMAIL TO TP TO REJECT Load PDF

No | Finalized On AlG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd. (SG) Thumbnail | Print
1 | 42/08/19 16:5) 01 GIA REPORT Load POF

Documents Checklist
DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST Reset | Save | Pt ||

There are no document checklists configured

Show Remarks To: Dﬂmmmlhw
Wabe: Bamares are srivabe eiems you abow It N piSer peried.

hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_... 16/3/2020



Adjuster Report Page | of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregno 1ssso71s8r)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3581 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto com;assignments@Ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CCE/AIG19014634/ADS5302

Date: 16/03/2020
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid.  Policy No:
Claimant .
Vehicle No : SMKEB207G Insured Vehicle No : SMJ41320
Date of Loss. 20/07/2018 Nature of Claim TP Claim No: 4525410271586
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SMKB207G
Make & Model: HONDA FREED HYBRID, 1.5 G (A) Engine No: LEB5617389
Reg. Date: 25/04/2018 (Man. Year: 2018) Chassis No: GB71080931
Colour Biue Odometer: 22001 km
Engine Capacity: 1496 cc
Market Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (SS): Market Value/Mew Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steenng (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Mo Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 185/65 R15 Rear Tyre Size: 185/85 R15
Front Left Side: Yokohama 6 mm Rear Lefi Side: Yokohama B mm
Front Right Side: Yokohama 8 mm Rear Right Side Yokohama 8 mm
The sbove values reprase! the remaming lyre imads depth
|COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  DIff %|
Parts B,041.20 307484 2,566 .56 4811
Misceilaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 3,150.00 2,160.00 290.00 3143
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S§) 9,191.20 5,234,864 3,956.56 43.05
Approved Total (Overridden) (S§) 4 200.00
Nett Amount (5§) 9,191.20 4,200.00 4,991.20 54.30
Global Sum Settlement (S5) 0.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 20/08/2018
Date Inspected: 20/08/2018 Inspected At: Hua Meng Spray Painting Workshop
(HQ)
MNo 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 8, #01-81
Autobay@Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883
Estimated Penod of Repair: 6.0 days
Adjuster: ADRIAN LING Manager: CHAM JIA LE

NOTE: This report represents our findings af the firme and place of inspection stated hersin, Such inspection has been carmed out ko the bas! of our
knawledge and abiiity but any othaer lability under any olher creumstances s heraby axpresely excluded
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Adjuster Report

REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

Page 3 of 4

No. Qty PartNo. Partlculars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *REAR WINDSCREEN RUBBER Mot Necassary 88.00FL *.FL
2 1 *‘REAR TAILGATE Denled 1,320.00FL *1,32000FL
3 2 *REAR TAILGATE HINGES Not Necessary 165.00 FL ~FL
4 1 *REAR TAILGATE UPPER LOCK Not Necessary 231.00FL *-FL
5 1 *REAR TAILGATE LOWER LOCK Not Necessary 57.20FL =FL
B 1 "REAR TAILGATE WEATHERSTRIP Cut 143 00FL *143.00FL
7 1 *REAR TAILGATE INNER BOARD Not Necassary 418.00FL *FL
8 2 *REAR TAILGATE SHOCK ABSORBER Not Necassary 330.00FL *-FL
a 1 *REAR TAILGATE H EMBLEM Necessary BA.20FL *68 20FL
10 1 *REAR TAILGATE FREED EMBLEM Necessary 6B 20FL *68 20FL
11 1 *REAR TAILGATE HYBRID EMBLEM Mecessary 64 90FL *64 80 FL
12 2 “REAR TAILGATE REFLECTOR Not Necessary 1,496.00 FL = FL
13 1 *REAR TAILGATE HANDLE Not Necessary 188.00FL *-FL
14 1 *REAR BUMPER Deformed 1,165.00FL *1,155.00FL
15 2 *REAR BUMPER SIDE HOLDER Necessary 129.00FL  *"121.00FL
1B 1 *SET REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR Damaged 334 40F5 *200.00FS3
17 1 *SET REAR BUMPER CLIPS Necessary 66.00 FL *30.00FL
18 1 *REAR END PANEL Dented 528 D0FL  *52B.0O0FL
19 1 *REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH Not Necessary 188.00 FL “FL
20 1 *REAR BEUMPER LH INNER SIDE GARNISH Deformed 418.00FL *85,00 FL

F=Franchiae part S5=SpcNett. L=ListhemDisc

Sub Total (S§) 7.467.90 3,793.30

- List Item Discount on L ltems 20.00/20.00% (58) 1.426.70 718.68

Total Parts (S§)  6,041.20 3,074.64

Report was unsubmitted during this prnt-out
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Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

There are no new miscellanecus items selected.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

Ne Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 TOSUPPLY REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT MNew 50.00 50.00
2 REMOVE & REINSTALL REAR WINDSCREEN MNew 150.00 120.00
3 REMOVE & REINSTALL REVERSE SENSOR New 150.00 50.00
4 REMOVE & REINSTALL BOOTLID INNER GARNISH New 200.00 60.00
5§ REMOVE,REPLACE & REPAIR CONSISTENT TO THE Naw 1,300.00 B00.00
ACCIDENT
6  RESPRAY PAINTING New 1,200.00 800.00
7  TUFF KOTE New 100.00 80.00
Gross Labour Cost (S§) 3,150.00 2,160.00
[ Report was unsubmitied during this print-out,

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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