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Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@lonpac.com>
Sent: Friday, December 13, 2019 4:45 PM
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)
Cc: Admin A; MT_Claim_SG
Subject: RE: Mandate Request - Accident involving  SGQ 116C (TP) & GBA 7196T (OI- Lonpac) on 

20/08/2019 [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential 
Dear Khanchna  
 
Please proceed as per your recommendations.  
 
Thank you.  
 
Best Regards 
 
Kenny Lim  
Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
DID: 6279 9256 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 

 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only. 
 
From: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE  
Sent: Wednesday, 4 December 2019 9:03 am 
To: 'Khanchna (LKK Auto)' <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: Mandate Request - Accident involving SGQ 116C (TP) & GBA 7196T (OI- Lonpac) on 20/08/2019 [External 
Confidential] 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential 
 
Dear Khanchna  
 
Thank you for the docs and we shall revert to you shortly.  
 
Best Regards 
 
Kenny Lim  
Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
DID: 6279 9256 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
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Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only. 
 
From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 3 December 2019 5:26 pm 
To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Mandate Request - Accident involving SGQ 116C (TP) & GBA 7196T (OI- Lonpac) on 20/08/2019 
 

Lonpac Ref: 19/19/19/VC05/022253 

LKK Ref: CC6/LPC19014628/Uka3q2 
 
 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 

We refer to the above matter. 

We have highlighted to your good office on 22/08/2019 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with our 
Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd. 

Insured driver move out of parking lot and Third party reversed. We opine that BOLA 24 (a) is applicable and 
liability is 50% against Insured. 
 
Summary to offer to third party repairer “FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD”  as follows: - 
 

  Claimed Amount Revised Amount 

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 12,869.96 $ 4,815.00 

2. Loss of Use (5 days x $ 60)  $    300.00 $   300.00 (5 days x $60) 

                                                               Total $ 13,169.96 $ 5,115.00 

                                                                50%  $ 2,557.50 

3. LTA Search Fee  $      2.00 $    2.00 

Total $ 13,171.96 $  2,559.50 

**04 days recommendation for repair + 1 Sunday = 5 days 

The above is for your approval. 

Thank you. 

 
 
Best Regards, 
Khanchna| Case Handler 
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 


