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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>

Sent: Thursday, 22 August, 2019 2:25 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto); Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO GBE 4018 Z & YN 7687 C on 03/08/2019 @

17:30:00 Our Ref: 19/19/19/VC05/022220 [External General]

Attachments: YN7687C 110819 (2).PDF

Categories: HMK

Lonpac External - General 
Dear Mei Kwan 

 
Attached is for our Insured’s GIA report with addendum to include the Police report. 
 

Please confirm the date of accident with Insured/TP and reply to us. 
 

 
Regards, 
Ong Li Li 

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555 

Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706 

 
 
Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use. 

 

From: ONG LI LI  

Sent: Wednesday, 21 August, 2019 2:29 PM 

To: 'Admin-D (LKKAuto)'; assignments 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A 

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO GBE 4018 Z & YN 7687 C on 03/08/2019 @17:30:00 Our Ref: 
19/19/19/VC05/022220 [External General] 

 

Lonpac External - General 
Dear Nivitha 
 
Attached is our Insured’s GIA report. 

 
Please inform the case handler to confirm the date of accident (different from TP). 

 
Regards, 
Ong Li Li 

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555 

Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
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Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use. 

 

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Monday, 19 August, 2019 3:16 PM 

To: ONG LI LI; assignments 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A 

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO GBE 4018 Z & YN 7687 C on 03/08/2019 @17:30:00 Our Ref: 
19/19/19/VC05/022220 [External General] 

 
Dear Sir/Mdm, 

 

Thank you for the assignment. 

 

Please be informed that vehicle is not in the workshop, repairer will arrange. 

 
 

Best Regards  

 

G.NIVITHA 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
 
 

 

 

 

From: ONG LI LI [mailto:llong@lonpac.com]  

Sent: Monday, 19 August 2019 8:44 AM 

To: Kai Motor <kaimotor@gmail.com>; assignments@lkkauto.com; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO GBE 4018 Z & YN 7687 C on 03/08/2019 @17:30:00 Our Ref: 

19/19/19/VC05/022220 [External General] 

 

Lonpac External - General 
Dear Nivitha 

 
Please arrange Adrian Ling to conduct TP survey. 
 

Fyi, our Insured has not reported the accident yet. 
 

 
Regards, 
Ong Li Li 

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555 

Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
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Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use. 

 
From: Kai Motor [mailto:kaimotor@gmail.com]  

Sent: Friday, 16 August, 2019 5:14 PM 
To: ONG LI LI 

Cc: MT_Claim_SG 

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO GBE 4018 Z & YN 7687 C on 03/08/2019 @17:30:00 Our Ref: 
19/19/19/VC05/022220 [External General] 

 

Hi Sir, 

 

 

 

LKK 

 

5 Adrian Ling 

 

 

 

�Have a nice day w thanks. 

 

Ms Kym 

On Fri, 16 Aug 2019 at 16:29, ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com> wrote: 

Lonpac External - General 

  

Without Prejudice 

Save as to Costs 

  

Dear Sir/Mdm 

  

Our Insured has not reported the accident yet. 

  

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s/your customer’s 

vehicle jointly with your client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the motor 
surveyors named in the following list to conduct the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint 
expert. 

  

1 Kalvin Ang 
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2 Xing Guo Qiang 

3 Mohamad Taufikh 

4 Mohammed Rasul 

5 Adrian Ling 

6 Marcus Chua 

7 Kenneth Kong 

8 Bryan Ang 

9 Choo Beng Hai 

10 Nicholas Tey 

  

  

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of 
any of these motor surveyors as a single joint expert. 

  

  

Regards, 

Ong Li Li 

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555 

Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706 

 

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use. 

  

From: Kai Motor [mailto:kaimotor@gmail.com]  

Sent: Friday, 16 August, 2019 3:30 PM 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN; ONG LI LI 
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO GBE 4018 Z & YN 7687 C on 03/08/2019 @17:30:00 

  

         

    
KAI  MOTOR  TRADING 

    

    BLK 3007  UBI  ROAD 1     

    #01-440, SINGAPORE 408701     

    TEL: 67474006   FAX:67437591     

    E-mail : kaimotor@gmail.com      
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    REG NO: 44223100L     

    
 

    

Date : 16/08/2019   
 

    

         

Attn: The Motor Claims Department      

Your Insured veh no : YN 7687 C      

    Lonpac Insurance BhdLonpac Insurance BhdLonpac Insurance BhdLonpac Insurance Bhd       

300 Beach Road,300 Beach Road,300 Beach Road,300 Beach Road,            

#17#17#17#17----04/07 The Concourse04/07 The Concourse04/07 The Concourse04/07 The Concourse       

Singapore 199555Singapore 199555Singapore 199555Singapore 199555       

         

Dear Sir / Madam        

         

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO GBE 4018 Z & YN 7687 C on 03/08/2019 @17:30:00 

         

We  are writing  on  behalf  of            Bismillah Biryani Restaurant          the registered owner  

of  GBE 4018 Z B which was involved on the above mentioned accident between YN 7687 C. 

         

Investigation reveals that the motor vehicle number  YN 7687 C was insured with you at the  

material time of the said accident.      
 

        

As  a result of the accident  was  caused  solely  and  completely  by  the  negligence  of  your  

insured  vehicle number   YN 7687 C Therefore, our client is holding you liable for the repair  

costs and other consequential loss which was sustained by him/her/them.  

         

Kindly  arrange  your representative  to  survey  our client’s v ehicle at  KAI MOTOR TRADING  

Blk 3007, Ubi Road 1, #01-440, Singapore 408701 within MONDAY 19/08/2019 from the date  

hereof as   to avoid further losses incur.       

         

We enclosed hereby the GIA report of GBE 4018 Z for your kind attention.  

         

Failing  which,  our client  have no alternative but  to  proceed with the necessary repairs and  

the bill will be forward to you for reimbursement.    

         

Yours faithfully,        
 

        
 

        

  

--  

Have a nice day w thanks. 
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Ms Kym 

 

Kai Motor Trading 

 

Blk 3007 Ubi Rd 1 #01-440  

Singapore 408701  

Telephone: 6747 4006 

 

 

 

--  

Have a nice day w thanks. 

 

 

Ms Kym 

 

Kai Motor Trading 

 

Blk 3007 Ubi Rd 1 #01-440  

Singapore 408701  

Telephone: 6747 4006 
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