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Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 1

P W

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(New Assignment)

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING

_ Case | Notified | Est Submitted | Ad) Assigned | ) Ad) Rpt . Adj Submifted | Ins Authed | Starus
i 19 Aug 2019 20 .ﬁqu:JSZEI'Q : M Axsior "
il : ' Cancel Case |
AsEign I

Reference Claim Details

Insured: HO KAR FATT, ID: 574727820, Tel: +6594304913, Emall: KFHOBFOAMTEC.COM.5G
| 15/08/2019 07:00 - :59
Vehicle Reg. No.; SLS56857 Date of Loss: | [31 Manths and 14 Days From LTA
| Reg Date (Man ¥r)] -
| 29028868AVW (Comprahensive)
| Claim Type: oD / 602974 Policy/Cover Mote No.: | Coverage: 28/09/2018 -
' N /.11
|| Excess: |S$500.00 _
| Volkswagen Group Singapore Ple Ltd (-) 247 ALEXANDRA ROAD, 155934 Alexandra - Tel: 63057283
MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: 465 6827 7888 ... [Handied by Pang Xiu Shi - 6554
| 2586]
Adjuster: |LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ... [Imm.Advice due 21/08/2015]
Driver/Custadian: HO KAR FATT (45 / Male) , NRIC: 574727820, Tel: +6594304913 Email: KFHO@FOAMTEC.COM.SG
Adi Ada, Wemisrks: Survey appt 21/08/19, 10am, Owner walting at Alexandra w/shop. Survey B revert. Please contact us ASAP
| 5 i if you cannot attend this assignment. Please ravert. .

| CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS | [Created by insurer]

|} | Repalrer:

'_ Handling Insurer:

. ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED View All [ Compose Case Mall

.‘I't.u:re are_nu mail fclei-s ﬂisu.

. ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS Wiew AR | Search Tasks J Create New Task

Due Date Priority Type Task Group Subject Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Dane?
| | No results,

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=d... 20/8/2019



902572019 Mail - Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) - Cutlook

Re: [EXT] Re: SLS5685Z - FINALISE

Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)
Wed 25/9/2019 1:26 PM

To: Cheong Pearlyn (VGS - 5G/Singapore) <Pearlyn.cheong@vw.com.sg>
Cc: Kong Charmaine (VGS - 5G/Singapore) <charmaine kong@ww.com.sg>; Wong Meiy (VGS - 5G/Singapore)
<meiy.wong@vw.com.sg>; Foo John (VGS - 5G/Singapore) <John.Foo@wvw.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=

Hi Pearlyn,
Supplementary approved by MSIG.
Finalize amount confirmed.

Final invoice and all supporting documents sent over to MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Cheong Pearlyn (VGS - 5G/Singapore) <Pearlyn.cheong@vw.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 19 September 2019 12:35 PM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@kkauto.com>

Cc: Kong Charmaine (VGS - 5G/Singapore) <charmaine.kong@vw.com.sg>; Wong Meiy (VGS - 5G/Singapore)
=meiy.wong@vw.com.sg>; Foo John (VGS - 5G/Singapore) <John.Foo@vw.com.sg>; Rasul (LKKAuto)
<Rasul@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: [EXT] Re: SLS5685Z - FINALISE

FYl

Fearlyn Cheong
Insurance Service Advisor
Aftersales

Volkswagen Group Singapore Ple Lid
247 Alexandra Road

Singapore 159934

Direct line: +65 6305 7288
Main Line:  +65 6305 7299
Main Fax:  +65 6474 364
pearlyn.cheong@vw.com.sg
http:/iwww,vw.com,sg

hitps:foutiook. office 365 comimailinbox/id AAQKADUxOWNMYmY ZLTFhM2QtNDISMNy0SZWFILT ZIMzADOT lyM2MSHNwWACQAKT 965t 3Ir0RFIhNGudm...  1/4



9252018 Mail - Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) - Qutiook
Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: fz56-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408033)

¥ ESES -
m——mm e Soe Ehe Earthe Frintg only when gpecessary:

From: Cheong Pearlyn (VGS - SG/Singapore) [mailto:Pearlyn.cheong@vw.com.sq]

Sent: Monday, 16 September, 2019 5:45 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto); SUR; Admin A; Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Cc: Kong Charmaine (VGS - 5G/Singapore); Wong Meiy (VGS - 5G/Singapore); Foo John (VGS - SG/Singapore)
Subject: SLS5685Z - FINALISE

Dear Rasul,
Please confirmed

COR $3515.22 after less excess before G5ST

Pearlyn Cheong
Insurance Service Advisor
Aftersales

Volkswagen Group Singapora Pte Ltd
247 Alexandra Road
Singapore 159934

Direct line: +65 6305 7288
Main Line:  +65 6305 7299
Main Fax:  +65 6474 364
pearlyn.cheong@yvw.com.sg
http:/hwanw. vw.com.sg

More than /
meets

Internal

hitps:foutiook, office 365, comimailinboxid/AAQKADLUOWN Y mYzLTFRM2OINDISNy0SZWFILT ZIMzADO T lyMZMSNWAQAK TS5t Ir0RFIhNGUdm...  4/4



B/23/2018 Mail - Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) - Qutlook

“ Replyall ~ i Delete (& Junk Block

RE: [EXT] SLS 5685Z OD (MSIG) DOA - 15/08/2019

Wong Meiy (VGS - 5G/Singapore) <meiy.wong
@vw.com.sg>

Fri 23/8/2019 1:54 FM

Shirley Hiew (LKK Aute); Ong Germaine (VG5 - 5G/Singapore) <Germaine.ong@vw.comsg> +3 0

VAR A
]

L 6 6 >

Thanks Shirley.

Thanks and Best Regards,

Meiy
Insurance Service Advisor
Aftersales

Volkswagen Group Singapore Pte Lid
247 Alexandra Road
Singapore 159934

Direct line:  +85 6305 7216
Main Line: +B65 6305 7299
Main Fax:  +65 6474 3643

meiy.wong@vw.com.sg
https:/fwww.volkswagen.com.sg/

More than |
meets

It's not e-mail, if you print it. Think Blue.

Internal

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 23 August 2019 1:53 PM

To: Wong Meiy (VGS - SG/5ingapore) <meiy.wong@vw.com.sg>; Ong Germaine (VGS -
5G/Singapore) <Germaine.ong@vw.com.sg>; Tang 5hu Shi (VGS - 5G/Singapore)
<shushitang@vw.com.sg>; Chee Steven (VGS - 5G/Singapore) <steven.chee @vw.com.sg>
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: [EXT] 5L5 5685Z OD (MSIG) DOA - 15/08/2019

hitps:iiouticok.office. comimail'deeplink 7version=20192081203,18&popoutv2=1

1M1



8/23/2019 Mail - Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) - Outlook

% Replyall ~ i Delete (& Junk Block

RE: [EXT] SLS 5685Z OD (MSIG) DOA - 15/08/2019

Internal

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 23 August 2019 1:53 FM

To: Wong Meiy (VGS - 5G/Singapore) <meiy.wong@vw.com.sg>; Ong Germaine (VG5 -
5G/Singapore) <Germaine.ong@vw.com.sg>; Tang Shu Shi (VGS - 5G/Singapore)
<shushi.tang@vw.com.sg>; Chee Steven (VGS - 5G/Singapore) <steven.chee@vw.com.sg>
Ce: SUR =sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: [EXT] SLS 5685Z OD (MSIG) DOA - 15/08/2019

Dear Mety,

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SLS
5685Z (Excess $ 500/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment
Team at Tel: 6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from
insurance company before completion of the repair.

*Our client reserve their right_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before
repair.

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

hitps:ioutiook.office com/mall/deeplink ?version=2012081203.18&popoutvZ=1



9/25/2018 Merimen e-Claims

View Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SLS5685Z (602974)
oD
Aug 15 2019 7:00AM
[HO KAR FATT]
Volkswagen Group Singapore Pte Ltd

Reply | Reply All | Mark as Unread | Print Message | Delete Message | Forward |

From MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. (MSIG_5G), sent on 25/09/2019 09:39 AM.
To LEK_HDQ

Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$4015,22) - SLS5685Z - Claim Handler: Pang Xiu 5hi

request owner to file palice report (hit & run accident)

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY - -
There are no documents.,

https.singapore. merimen.com/claims/index . cfmfusebox=5VCmailkfuseaction=dsp_view&mode=1&iinboxid=1554944&iDomainld=11&10kjld=7...  1/2




823/2019 Merimen a-Claims

View Received Message

This mail is associated with :
*SLS5685Z (602974)
[8]a]

Aug 15 2019 7:00AM

[HO KAR FATT]
Volkswagen Group Singapore Pte Ltd

" Reply | Reply All | Mark as Unread | Print Message | Delete Message | Forward |

From MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte, Ltd. (MSIG_5G), sent on 23/08/2019 09:13 AM.
To LKK_HQ

Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$4649,21) - SLS5685Z - Claim Handler: Pang Xiu Shi

Approved:4649,21:check iterns of $459.83 to be verified. In order not to delay repair, we have authorised the repair, But payment of the claim is
subject to a copy of police report, Please request owner to file police report (hit & run accldent)

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY S i
There are no documents,

https:{/singapore.merimen.com/claimsfindex. cfm ?fusebox=5VCmail&fuseaction=dsp_view&mode=1&iinboxid=1537317& Domainld=11&i0bjld=7...  1/2



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (Co.Req.No 198607 196R)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@Ikkauto.com

Ta: MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. From: LKK Autoc Consultants Ple Ltd

4 Shenton Way 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25

#21-01 SGX Centre 2 Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 068807 Singapore 408933
Attn:  Pang Xiu Shi Date: 20 Sep 2019

Preliminary Advice

Vehicle No 1 SLS5685Z Accident Date C15/08/2019
Make :VOLKSWAGEN SPORTSVAN Policy No. : 29028868AWW
Assignment Date  : 20/08/2019 Excess : 55500.00
Date of Inspection  : 21/08/2019 Est. Duration of Repalr : 5 days
Inspection At : Volkswagen Group Singapore Ple Lid (-)

247 ALEXANDRA ROAD
Singapore 159934

Point of Impact /| General Description of Damages

The vehicle sustained impact / damages o/s front portion and parts claimed are consistent to the accident.

Repairer's Estimate (Gross) 5% 8,255.02 (inclusive supp)
Revised Amount 55 4,015.22 (inclusive supp)
Check Items (Estimated) 5% 0.00

Total 55 4.015.22

Lump Sum Repair 5%

Total Loss Consideration

New for Old Value 5%
Pre-Accident Value ot 77,000.00
COE / PARF Rebate prot: 48,160.00
Salvage Value 5%
Margin for Repair oty 28.840.00

Remarks

(%)

The vehicle is economical for repair. We have received supplementary from repairer. Our surveyor had
since checked and verified the supplementary paris and is of the view that the supplementary parts are
consistent to the nature of the accident and is economical to repair. Supplementary amount is 3 20.98,

The above survey was conducted on a ‘without prejudice’ basis.



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregno1sssoriasr)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

Ta: MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. From: LKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

4 Shenton Way 51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25

#21-01 SGX Centre 2 Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 068EQ7 Singapore 408933
Aftn:  Pang Xiu Shi Date: 21 Aug 2019

Preliminary Advice

Vehicle Mo : SLS56852 Accident Date : 15/08/2019
Make : VOLKSWAGEN SPORTSVAN Policy MNo. : 29028868AWVW
Assignment Date @ 20/08/2019 Excess : S5500.00
Date of Inspection  : 21/08/2019 Est. Duration of Repair : B days
Inspection At : Volkswagen Group Singapore Pte Lid ()

247 ALEXANDRA ROAD
Singapore 159934

Paint of Impact | General Description of Damages
The vehicle sustained impact / damages ofs front portion and parts claimed are consistent to the accident.

Repairer's Estimate (Gross) 55 8.234.04
Revised Amount 5% 4,649.21
Check ltems (Estimated) 5% 459.83
Total 5% 5,109.04
Lump Sum Repair 5%

Total Loss Consideration

New for Old Value 5%
Pre-Accident Value 5§ 77.000.00
COE ! PARF Rebate 8% 48,160.00
Salvage Value 55
Margin for Repair 55 28,840.00

Remarks
{ X ) The vehicle Is economical for repair,

{ ) The above survey was conducted on a ‘without prejudice’ basis.



MTTEODY Wasg Yar Mai

CIMPORTANT NOTICE

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

i 1. Plaase report comectly iha dotads ol tha accident to spead up 1he claime procoss
2. This Form must be compleled by the Policyhalder andlor the Maphorised Drives

"3, Information provided must be as truthlul and accurale as possiale. Any wilful mesrepresantation or wi

repudiate pohcy habdity.

~ Date Of Repon
Date Of Accident
Exact Location Of Accidant

L l',T?‘Il 8sue and scceplance of Ihis Form by meurance companies is nol an sdmistion of policy |
& Any false reparting may be referred to the Police for investigation,

- B, Thes report will ba lorwarded by the insurers al tha GlA
archiving and that copios of this roport wil, for a fee, be ma
7. By ha lodgemant of This repan 1a the insufers. you hereby consent o

. aforesaid.
3 ACCIDENT STATEMENT

15/08/2019 18:46
15/068/2019 07:30
MARSILING MARKET OPEN CARPARK LOT NO &2

Ruecords Managemen! Centrs established by the Ganaral Insuf
e available upon apphoaton by inlera sled paries.
¥ archeving of this report al the cente and 1o copies ol (he repor baing made avalable

tholding ‘of materal facts may allow insurance companies 1o
ability on (he pan of the insurance companies

anca Association of Singapore (GLA) for

Country/State of Loss SINGAPORE
DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

Vehicle Registration Number
_[!:u_g:un_e_-:lﬂ'dicyhulder
Mame Of Registered Owner
MNRIC No

Email Address

Motdle Phone No
Alternative Phone Mo
Vehicle Particulars
M;anufacturer

rodel

SLS5EBSZ

HO KAR FATT

574727820
KFHO@FOAMTEC.COM.SG
(LOCAL) +65-94304813
OFFICE-94304913

VOLKSWAGEN
SPORTSVAN 1 4CLBMT 82 TSI D7F

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used al oo ATE

time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy weg

for repair to your vehicle?

If No, Plaase state action to be taken
Vehicle Calegory

Insurance Company

Mame of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage

Fleet Policy

Palicy Number

Cover Note Number

Mame of Driver

NRIC No

Date Of Birth

Occupation

Date Of Driving Pass

Driving Experience

Gender

~ Mobile Number

F_é:r Number
Contact Number
~ EMail Address

PRIVATE CAR

MSIG INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) FTE. LTD.

COMPREHENSIVE
NO
A 20028868 AVW

HO KAR FATT
574727820
05/08/1974
INDOOR
14/01/1998

21 YEARS AND 7 MONTHS
MALE

(LOCAL) +65-94304913

ek e

OFFICE-94304913
KEHO@FOAMTEC.COM.SG

Pagg'lucd'lﬁ



APT BLK 523 WOODLANDS DRIVE 14
by H#OG-189
Erieacs 730523
Was driver an employes of the Insured's Company NO
OWHNER

if Mo, Relgbonship of tha Driver wilh the Insured
vehicle Registration Number of Dnvers Crwn
Vohicla

Insurance Company of Drver's Own Vehicle

General Infermation of the Accldent ; :
HIT AND RUN { VANDALISM [ DAMAGED WHILST PARKED

Type Of Accident
Wealthar Condilions CLEAR
Road Suiface DRY
Other Information
Was any forsign vehicle involved in this accident? NO
Humber of vehicles {including own vahicle) 2
involvad in the accident
Was any body injured in the Accident? NO
Was any Injured conveyed o hospital by
ambulance? ND
Was any other malenal or property damaged? YES
I have been approached by unknown person(s) NO
solicitingfoffaring accaden| claims assistance.,
Humber of Passengers (Including Driver) ]
Detalls of Police Action

YES

Was the accident reporied 1o the police?

If Yes Please state which Police Station
10 UBI AVENUE 3

Police Station Name
ROAD: 10 UBI AVENUE 3, POSTCODE: 408865 , COUNTRY:
Police Station Address SINGAPDRE
TEL NO: - FAX NO:

Paolice Station Contact

Was notice of infended Proseculion given? NG

If Yes,against whom?
Circumstances of Accident
MORE DETAILS PLEASE REFER TO POLICE REPORT
Adtachment(s) o L
Are accident photos avallable for allachment?
Was there any video captured by Car Camara?

YES
MO

Was there any audio recorded? MO
DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1
LINENOWHN

Vehicle Registration Number
Vehicle Make/Model/Colour
Details Of Properlies
Vehicle Category

Name of Driver
NRIC/Passpart Number

PRIVATE CAR

ccnilacl Number
Address
. Peslcode
A 'E'Iﬁsyrgﬁi‘:g Company Name

Earhundis S

Page 2 al 16






MVGES1E107145 | Volkswagen Centre Singapore - HO
ENTRY DATE & TIME: 15/08/2019 18:48
SUBMITTED BY: Weng Yer Mei

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT
IMPORTANT MOTICE

1. Please raport correclly the details of the accident fo spead up the claims process
2. This Farm must be completad by the Policyholder andior the Authorised Drver

3, Infarmation provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any witful misrepresantation ar witholdeng of materal facls may allow insurance companies to
regudiate policy labdity.

4, Tne igsue and acceplance of this Form by insurance companies 1§ nof an admission of pol cy kability on the part of the Insurance companses,

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation,

. This report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GlA Records Management Centre established by the Gensral Insurance Association of Singapara [GLA) for

archiving and that copies of this reparl will, for a fee, be made avaiable upon apphcation by inleresied parties

7. By the lodgemant af this réport fo the insurers, you hareby consent to the archiving af this repart at the centre and 1o copies of the regart be ng made avaikable

aloresaid.

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report
Date Of Accident
Exact Location Of Accident

Country/State of Loss

15/08/2019 18:48

15/08/2019 07:30

MARSILING MARKET OPEN CARPARK LOT NO 62
SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

Yehicle Registration Number
Insured/Policyholder
Mame Of Registered Owner
MRIC No

Email Address

Mohile Phone No
Alternative Phone No
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Model

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy
far repair to your vehicle?

If Mo, Please state action to be taken
WVehicle Category

Insurance Company

Name of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage

Fleat Policy

Policy Number

Cover Note Number

Driver

Mame of Driver

MNRIC No

Date Of Birth

Ocoupation

Date Of Driving Pass

Driving Experience

Gender

Maobile Number

Fax Number

Contact Number

Ehail Addrass

SLE5685Z

HO KAR FATT

574727820
KFHO@FOAMTEC.COM.SG
ILOCAL) +65-94304913
OFFICE-94304913

VOLKSWAGEN
SPORTSVAN 1.4CLBMT 92 TSIDTF

PRIVATE

YES

PRIVATE CAR

MSIG INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD.
COMPREHENSIVE

i n]

A 28028868 AVW

HO KAR FATT

§7472782D

05/08/1974

INDOOR

14/01/1998

21 YEARS AND 7 MONTHS
MALE

ILOCAL) +65-84304913

QOFFICE-94304913
KFHO@FOAMTEC.COM.5G
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Nature Of Damage
MNo. Of Passenger (Including Driver)
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Sketch Plan Pg. 2
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DECLARATION
I#We declare the foregoing particulars are true in every respact 1W
?nﬁcyhuldcr's.iuanttur? Driver's Signature Reporting Ceatra 5;ﬂ:r|_'1-l“f 5 Engna are
Daca & Tj’“E [1f driver 15 not the policybolder] Rame.
rg ?r'cf 3 L}ﬂ' Date & Time: NRICHFIN Mo,:
5 PM
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Crwner 1D

Vehicle Details

Vehicle Mo.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Madel:

Primary Colour;
Manufacturing Year:

Engine Mo.:

Chassis Na.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained hereinis correct as at 21 Aug 2019

Singapore NRIC
782D

SL556B52

No

21 Aug 2019
VOLKSWAGEN
SPORTSWVAN 1.4 AT AM13HZ CL
Black

2015

CZC084170
WVWZZZAUZGWS64040
F2.0kW (123 bhp)
$22,057.00

28 Sep 2017

28 Sep 2017

4]

$17,880.00

Yes
27 Sep 2027
71341000

27 Sep 2027

A-Carupto 1600ce & 97kW (130bhp)

10

$42,902.00
£34,750.00
$48,160.00



Accident Photo
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Accident Photo
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